

RFB 10036350-14-J - PAINT AND PAINT SUPPLIES

Section I - A Interior/Exterior Paints	ATLAS ADHESIVE TAPE	Colorama Paint & Supply		Dunn Edwards		Fastenal		Frazee Paint		HD Supply Facilities Maintenance		Jeyco		Pioneer Turf Services		Sherwin Williams		Vista	
1 - A/L FLAT - 1 GAL		\$17.99	\$1,799.00	\$19.99	\$1,999.00			\$15.50	\$1,550.00	\$15.79	\$1,579.00					\$13.00	\$1,300.00	\$13.80	\$1,380.00
2 - A/L FLAT - 5 GAL		\$89.95	\$4,497.50	\$98.49	\$4,924.50			\$70.00	\$3,500.00	\$76.78	\$3,839.00					\$65.00	\$3,250.00	\$65.95	\$3,297.50
3 - A/L - LS - 1 GAL		\$19.45	\$1,945.00	\$22.52	\$2,252.00			\$24.49	\$2,449.00	\$15.79	\$1,579.00					\$14.00	\$1,400.00	\$17.80	\$1,780.00
4 - A/L - LS - 5 GAL		\$96.75	\$4,837.50	\$109.92	\$5,496.00			\$114.95	\$5,747.50	\$76.78	\$3,839.00					\$70.00	\$3,500.00	\$89.00	\$4,450.00
5 - A/L - SG - 1 GAL		\$19.95	\$1,995.00	\$24.73	\$2,473.00			\$24.49	\$2,449.00	\$16.92	\$1,692.00					\$15.00	\$1,500.00	\$17.80	\$1,780.00
6 - A/L - SG - 5 GAL		\$103.50	\$5,175.00	\$125.97	\$6,298.50			\$114.95	\$5,747.50	\$82.87	\$4,143.50					\$75.00	\$3,750.00	\$89.00	\$4,450.00
7 - A/L(E) - FLAT - 1		\$22.90	\$2,290.00	\$21.89	\$2,189.00			\$19.30	\$1,930.00	\$22.56	\$2,256.00					\$15.00	\$1,500.00	\$17.10	\$1,710.00
8 - A/L(E) - FLAT - 5		\$99.95	\$4,997.50	\$108.54	\$5,427.00			\$89.00	\$4,450.00	\$105.51	\$5,275.50					\$75.00	\$3,750.00	\$85.50	\$4,275.00
9 - A/L(E) - SG - 1		\$28.97	\$2,897.00	\$27.03	\$2,703.00			\$24.49	\$2,449.00	\$24.25	\$2,425.00					\$16.00	\$1,600.00	\$18.35	\$1,835.00
10 - A/L(E) - SG - 5		\$135.95	\$6,797.50	\$132.59	\$6,629.50			\$114.95	\$5,747.50	\$113.41	\$5,670.50					\$80.00	\$4,000.00	\$91.77	\$4,588.50
11 - OIL(E) - SG - 1		NO BID		\$32.40	\$1,620.00			\$36.00	\$1,800.00	\$31.83	\$1,591.50					\$26.00	\$1,300.00	NO BID	
12 - OIL(E) - G - 1		NO BID		\$41.61	\$2,080.50			\$36.00	\$1,800.00	\$31.83	\$1,591.50					\$26.00	\$1,300.00	NO BID	
13 - WAU - SG - 1		\$40.95	\$8,190.00	\$52.77	\$10,554.00			\$42.00	\$8,400.00	NO BID						\$33.75	\$6,750.00	NO BID	
14 - WAE(E) - SG - 1		\$26.98	\$2,698.00	\$27.52	\$2,752.00			\$34.99	\$3,499.00	\$31.83	\$3,183.00					\$28.99	\$2,899.00	\$27.95	\$2,795.00
TOTALS	NO BID	\$48,119.00		\$57,398.00		NO BID		\$51,518.50		\$38,664.50		NO BID		NO BID		\$37,799.00		\$32,341.00	
Section I - B QUALCOMM STADIUM	ATLAS ADHESIVE TAPE	Colorama Paint & Supply		Dunn Edwards		Fastenal		Frazee Paint		HD Supply Facilities Maintenance		Jeyco		Pioneer Turf Services		Sherwin Williams		Vista	
1 - WHITE		\$58.95	\$8,842.50					\$55.00	\$8,250.00	\$86.74	\$13,011.00			\$43.00	\$6,450.00	\$47.25	\$7,087.50		
2 - BLACK		\$58.95	\$1,768.50					\$79.95	\$2,398.50	\$86.74	\$2,602.20			\$72.50	\$2,175.00	\$47.25	\$1,417.50		
3 - CHARGER BLUE		\$72.55	\$2,902.00					\$85.00	\$3,400.00	\$86.74	\$3,469.60			\$83.50	\$3,340.00	\$47.25	\$1,890.00		
4 - CHARGER GOLD		\$79.95	\$1,599.00					\$100.00	\$2,000.00	\$86.74	\$1,734.80			\$83.50	\$1,670.00	\$47.25	\$945.00		
5 - POWDER BLUE		\$66.55	\$1,331.00					\$69.95	\$1,399.00	\$86.74	\$1,734.80			\$83.50	\$1,670.00	\$47.25	\$945.00		
6 - AZTEC RED		\$81.55	\$1,631.00					\$89.95	\$1,799.00	\$86.74	\$1,734.80			\$83.50	\$1,670.00	\$47.25	\$945.00		
7 - AZTEC GOLD		\$79.95	\$1,599.00					\$79.95	\$1,599.00	\$86.74	\$1,734.80			\$83.50	\$1,670.00	\$47.25	\$945.00		
8 - CUSTOM COLOR		\$100.00	\$2,000.00					\$79.95	\$1,599.00	\$86.74	\$1,734.80			\$89.50	\$1,790.00	\$47.25	\$945.00		
TOTALS	NO BID	\$21,673.00		NO BID		NO BID		\$22,444.50		\$27,756.80		NO BID		\$20,435.00		\$15,120.00		NO BID	
Section I - C - STORE STOCK - BRUSHES & ROLLERS	ATLAS ADHESIVE TAPE	Colorama Paint & Supply		Dunn Edwards		Fastenal		Frazee Paint		HD Supply Facilities Maintenance		Jeyco		Pioneer Turf Services		Sherwin Williams		Vista	
1 - 22034873		\$0.17	\$25.50	\$0.16	\$24.00	\$0.1218	\$18.27	\$0.23	\$34.50	NO BID		\$0.16	\$24.00			\$0.20	\$30.00	\$0.16	\$24.00
2 - 22034882		\$0.25	\$50.00	\$0.20	\$40.00	\$0.1485	\$29.70	\$0.24	\$48.00	NO BID		\$0.17	\$34.00			\$0.25	\$50.00	\$0.16	\$32.00
3 - 22034891		\$0.31	\$24.80	\$0.63	\$50.40	\$0.1842	\$14.74	\$0.30	\$24.00	NO BID		\$0.19	\$15.20			\$0.55	\$44.00	\$0.16	\$12.80
4 - 22034897		\$0.37	\$370.00	\$0.30	\$300.00	\$0.2305	\$230.50	\$0.46	\$460.00	NO BID		\$0.24	\$240.00			\$0.35	\$350.00	\$0.31	\$310.00
5 - 22034898		\$0.45	\$225.00	\$0.80	\$400.00	\$0.3181	\$159.05	\$0.68	\$340.00	NO BID		\$0.36	\$180.00			NO BID		\$0.31	\$155.00
6 - 22034903		\$0.60	\$450.00	\$0.41	\$307.50	\$0.3509	\$263.18	\$0.90	\$675.00	NO BID		\$0.41	\$307.50			\$0.48	\$360.00	\$0.45	\$337.50
7 - 22034907		\$0.84	\$1,764.00	\$0.92	\$1,932.00	\$1.0123	\$2,125.83	\$2.00	\$4,200.00	NO BID		\$0.71	\$1,491.00			\$1.28	\$2,688.00	\$0.80	\$1,680.00
8 - 22034911		\$1.84	\$138.00	\$15.76	\$1,182.00	\$3.5050	\$262.88	\$18.00	\$1,350.00	NO BID		\$5.10	\$382.50			\$2.09	\$156.75	NO BID	
9 - 22034920		\$16.14	\$1,371.90	\$4.80	\$408.00	\$16.8500	\$1,432.25	NO BID		NO BID		\$5.10	\$433.50			\$4.25	\$361.25	\$8.85	\$752.25
10 - 22034869		\$0.15	\$39.00	\$3.60	\$936.00	\$0.2055	\$53.43	\$0.05	\$13.00	NO BID		\$0.14	\$36.40			NO BID		\$0.15	\$39.00
11 - 22035221		\$2.16	\$486.00	\$2.33	\$524.25	\$0.8550	\$192.38	\$2.00	\$450.00	\$1.15	\$258.75	\$1.12	\$252.00			\$2.17	\$488.25	\$2.55	\$573.75
12 - 22035222		\$2.64	\$660.00	\$2.45	\$612.50	\$0.8120	\$203.00	\$2.75	\$687.50	NO BID		\$0.82	\$205.00			\$2.45	\$612.50	\$2.69	\$672.50
13 - 22035223		\$1.70	\$170.00	\$2.80	\$280.00	\$1.0800	\$108.00	\$3.10	\$310.00	\$2.04	\$204.00	\$1.03	\$103.00			\$2.35	\$235.00	\$3.05	\$305.00
14 - 22035225		\$3.23	\$258.40	\$3.33	\$266.40	\$1.1760	\$94.08	\$7.50	\$600.00	NO BID		\$1.16	\$92.80			\$2.86	\$228.80	\$4.05	\$324.00
15 - 22035226		\$3.99	\$199.50	\$9.05	\$452.50	\$2.5000	\$125.00	\$8.80	\$440.00	NO BID		\$1.33	\$66.50			\$7.85	\$392.50	\$6.54	\$327.00
16 - 22035230		\$8.42	\$715.70	\$5.35	\$454.75	\$6.9900	\$594.15	\$7.00	\$595.00	NO BID		\$5.85	\$497.25			\$6.96	\$591.60	NO BID	

17 - 22035232			\$1.38	\$1,173.00	\$2.39	\$2,031.50	\$0.6549	\$556.67	\$2.20	\$1,870.00	NO BID		\$0.95	\$807.50			\$1.50	\$1,275.00	\$6.79	\$5,771.50
18 - 22034912			\$2.83	\$42.45	\$1.59	\$23.85	\$1.3000	\$19.50	\$11.55	\$173.25	NO BID		\$3.82	\$57.30			\$6.31	\$94.65	\$8.69	\$130.35
19 - 22034918			\$3.96	\$79.20	\$6.16	\$123.20	\$1.6779	\$33.56	\$7.66	\$153.20	NO BID		\$4.30	\$86.00			\$7.25	\$145.00	\$8.49	\$169.80
20 - 22034913			\$3.72	\$148.80	\$1.91	\$76.40	\$1.8155	\$72.62	\$12.15	\$486.00	\$9.52	\$380.80	\$4.65	\$186.00			\$6.81	\$272.40	\$9.12	\$364.80
21 - 22034914			\$6.25	\$500.00	\$3.66	\$292.80	\$3.1508	\$252.06	\$19.08	\$1,526.40	\$13.55	\$1,084.00	\$4.05	\$324.00			\$10.21	\$816.80	\$12.21	\$976.80
TOTALS	NO BID		\$8,891.25		\$10,718.05		\$6,840.83		\$14,435.85		\$1,927.55		\$5,821.45		NO BID		\$9,192.50		\$12,958.05	
Section I - D - STORE STOCK - PAINTING TOOLS	ATLAS ADHESIVE TAPE		Colorama Paint & Supply		Dunn Edwards		Fastenal		Frazee Paint		HD Supply Facilities Maintenance		Jeyco		Pioneer Turf Services		Sherwin Williams		Vista	
1 - 22035140			\$22.94	\$573.50	\$26.49	\$662.25	\$29.1000	\$727.50	NO BID		\$19.95	\$498.75					\$25.50	\$637.50	\$18.95	\$473.75
2 - 22035229			\$1.64	\$492.00	\$2.81	\$843.00	\$1.4000	\$420.00	\$4.00	\$1,200.00	NO BID						\$6.25	\$1,875.00	\$2.79	\$837.00
3 - 22035228			\$3.98	\$318.40	\$1.69	\$135.20	\$1.3500	\$108.00	\$5.00	\$400.00	\$3.77	\$301.60					NO BID		\$6.79	\$543.20
4 - 22035224			\$2.19	\$876.00	\$2.99	\$1,196.00	\$3.4000	\$1,360.00	\$3.03	\$1,212.00	\$2.66	\$1,064.00					\$2.15	\$860.00	\$2.39	\$956.00
5 - 22014525			\$3.50	\$350.00	\$1.21	\$121.00	\$2.1500	\$215.00	\$2.05	\$205.00	NO BID						\$1.85	\$185.00	\$1.89	\$189.00
6 - 22034908			\$3.50	\$525.00	\$1.50	\$225.00	\$2.9900	\$448.50	\$2.75	\$412.50	NO BID						\$2.75	\$412.50	\$1.58	\$237.00
7 - 22034909			\$4.99	\$4,491.00	\$3.03	\$2,727.00	\$5.2500	\$4,725.00	\$4.50	\$4,050.00	\$3.10	\$2,790.00					\$3.08	\$2,772.00	\$3.61	\$3,249.00
8 - 22034910			\$1.95	\$195.00	\$2.42	\$242.00	\$2.4400	\$244.00	\$0.50	\$50.00	\$1.34	\$134.00					\$1.00	\$100.00	\$1.09	\$109.00
9 - 22034960			\$1.09	\$21.80	\$0.94	\$18.80	\$1.4000	\$28.00	\$0.80	\$16.00	NO BID						\$0.72	\$14.40	\$1.03	\$20.60
10 - 22034961			\$1.28	\$25.60	\$1.08	\$21.60	\$1.5000	\$30.00	\$1.30	\$26.00	\$1.50	\$30.00					\$1.07	\$21.40	\$1.03	\$20.60
11 - 22077633			\$6.40	\$640.00	\$3.49	\$349.00	\$1.0500	\$105.00	NO BID		NO BID						\$2.45	\$245.00	\$0.77	\$77.00
12 - 22077634			\$5.90	\$590.00	\$4.11	\$411.00	\$1.1000	\$110.00	\$5.00	\$500.00	NO BID						\$5.25	\$525.00	\$0.83	\$83.00
13 - 22077631			\$2.99	\$299.00	\$3.90	\$390.00	\$2.9500	\$295.00	\$6.00	\$600.00	\$3.83	\$383.00					\$3.00	\$300.00	\$4.15	\$415.00
14 - 22030235			\$3.45	\$207.00	\$2.58	\$154.80	\$1.0800	\$64.80	\$3.75	\$225.00	\$2.80	\$168.00					\$2.41	\$144.60	\$2.97	\$178.20
15 - 22030236			\$3.50	\$175.00	\$2.76	\$138.00	\$1.2900	\$64.50	\$4.20	\$210.00	NO BID						\$2.99	\$149.50	\$3.11	\$155.50
16 - 22030237			\$3.25	\$81.25	\$2.68	\$67.00	\$1.0900	\$27.25	\$3.00	\$75.00	NO BID						\$2.41	\$60.25	NO BID	
17 - 22030365			\$4.99	\$374.25	\$3.09	\$231.75	\$2.5500	\$191.25	\$5.00	\$375.00	\$4.16	\$312.00					\$4.25	\$318.75	\$3.85	\$288.75
TOTALS	NO BID		\$10,234.80		\$7,933.40		\$9,163.80		\$9,556.50		\$5,681.35		NO BID		NO BID		\$8,620.90		\$7,832.60	
Section I - E - STORE STOCK - DROP CLOTHES	ATLAS ADHESIVE TAPE		Colorama Paint & Supply		Dunn Edwards		Fastenal		Frazee Paint		HD Supply Facilities Maintenance		Jeyco		Pioneer Turf Services		Sherwin Williams		Vista	
1 - 22034954			\$18.21	\$546.30	\$14.09	\$422.70			\$13.50	\$405.00	\$14.49	\$434.70					\$13.80	\$414.00	\$12.45	\$373.50
2 - 22034956			\$29.96	\$898.80	\$23.04	\$691.20			\$22.50	\$675.00	NO BID						\$20.00	\$600.00	\$22.81	\$684.30
3 - 22014472			\$35.90	\$359.00	\$25.50	\$255.00			\$28.00	\$280.00	\$36.33	\$363.30					\$28.63	\$286.30	\$32.99	\$329.90
4 - 22077622			\$16.67	\$833.50	\$9.60	\$480.00			\$11.50	\$575.00	\$16.60	\$830.00					\$9.50	\$475.00	\$10.99	\$549.50
5 - 22077617			\$3.35	\$335.00	\$1.90	\$190.00			\$2.00	\$200.00	\$3.08	\$308.00					\$1.59	\$159.00	\$1.99	\$199.00
6 - 22035236			\$10.99	\$109.90	\$8.61	\$86.10			\$11.99	\$119.90	\$8.15	\$81.50					\$7.50	\$75.00	\$10.00	\$100.00
7 - 22077610			DELETED		DELETED				DELETED		DELETED						DELETED		DELETED	
8 - 22077611			DELETED		DELETED				DELETED		DELETED						DELETED		DELETED	
9 - 22077612			DELETED		DELETED				DELETED		DELETED						DELETED		DELETED	
10 - 22077613			DELETED		DELETED				DELETED		DELETED						DELETED		DELETED	
11 - 22077621			\$9.00	\$225.00	\$9.28	\$232.00			\$8.75	\$218.75	NO BID						\$7.25	\$181.25	\$6.50	\$162.50
12 - 22077630			\$0.94	\$47.00	\$0.58	\$29.00			\$0.99	\$49.50	NO BID						\$0.45	\$22.50	\$0.54	\$27.00
13 - 22077632			\$34.58	\$1,729.00	\$21.00	\$1,050.00			\$20.00	\$1,000.00	NO BID						\$18.00	\$900.00	\$18.99	\$949.50
TOTALS	NO BID		\$5,083.50		\$3,436.00		NO BID		\$3,523.15		\$2,017.50		NO BID		NO BID		\$3,113.05		\$3,375.20	
Section I - F - STORE STOCK - TAPES	ATLAS ADHESIVE TAPE		Colorama Paint & Supply		Dunn Edwards		Fastenal		Frazee Paint		HD Supply Facilities Maintenance		Jeyco		Pioneer Turf Services		Sherwin Williams		Vista	
1 - 22035233	\$2.88	\$432.00	\$2.99	\$448.50	\$4.70	\$705.00	\$4.2300	\$634.50	\$3.28	\$492.00	\$3.42	\$513.00					\$2.90	\$435.00	\$3.78	\$567.00
2 - 22035234	\$4.38	\$810.30	\$4.59	\$849.15	\$6.83	\$1,263.55	\$6.3600	\$1,176.60	\$4.98	\$921.30	\$5.26	\$973.10					\$4.13	\$764.05	\$5.69	\$1,052.65
3 - 22035235	\$5.53	\$1,382.50	\$5.98	\$1,495.00	\$9.41	\$2,352.50	\$8.4800	\$2,120.00	\$6.58	\$1,645.00	\$5.94	\$1,485.00					\$5.21	\$1,302.50	\$7.49	\$1,872.50
4 - 22077618	DELETED		DELETED		DELETED		DELETED		DELETED		DELETED						DELETED		DELETED	
5 - 22077619	DELETED		DELETED		DELETED		DELETED		DELETED		DELETED						DELETED		DELETED	

6 - 22077620	DELETED		DELETED		DELETED		DELETED		DELETED		DELETED					DELETED		DELETED		
7 - 22077614	\$6.33	\$474.75	\$2.29	\$171.75	\$1.48	\$111.00	\$3.1900	\$239.25	NO BID		\$4.15	\$311.25				\$1.45	\$108.75	NO BID		
8 - 22077615	\$17.48	\$1,311.00	\$3.43	\$257.25	\$2.21	\$165.75	\$4.9000	\$367.50	NO BID		\$6.18	\$463.50				\$2.10	\$157.50	NO BID		
9 - 22077616	\$16.48	\$1,236.00	\$4.56	\$342.00	\$2.95	\$221.25	\$5.7300	\$429.75	NO BID		\$8.19	\$614.25				\$2.80	\$210.00	NO BID		
10 - 22035242	\$1.78	\$133.50	\$1.38	\$103.50	\$1.29	\$96.75	\$1.2450	\$93.38	\$1.30	\$97.50	NO BID					\$1.05	\$78.75	\$1.48	\$111.00	
11 - 22035245	\$2.68	\$335.00	\$2.01	\$251.25	\$1.95	\$243.75	\$4.7100	\$588.75	\$1.80	\$225.00	NO BID					\$1.50	\$187.50	\$2.12	\$265.00	
12 - 22035239	\$8.23	\$6,172.50	\$2.69	\$2,017.50	\$7.09	\$5,317.50	\$3.4500	\$2,587.50	\$5.75	\$4,312.50	NO BID					\$3.95	\$2,962.50	\$5.49	\$4,117.50	
TOTALS	\$12,287.55		\$5,935.90		\$10,477.05		\$8,237.23		\$7,693.30		\$4,360.10		NO BID		NO BID		\$6,206.55		\$7,985.65	
Section I - G - STORE STOCK - SPRAY PAINT	ATLAS ADHESIVE TAPE		Colorama Paint & Supply		Dunn Edwards		Fastenal		Frazee Paint		HD Supply Facilities Maintenance		Jeyco		Pioneer Turf Services		Sherwin Williams		Vista	
1 - 22035089			\$4.99	\$898.20	\$4.38	\$788.40	\$3.1500	\$567.00	\$3.88	\$698.40	\$3.64	\$655.20	\$2.16	\$388.80	NO BID		\$1.30	\$234.00	NO BID	
2 - 22035090			\$4.99	\$598.80	\$4.38	\$525.60	\$3.1500	\$378.00	\$3.88	\$465.60	NO BID		\$2.16	\$259.20	NO BID		\$1.07	\$128.40	\$4.69	\$562.80
3 - 22035091			\$4.99	\$1,497.00	\$2.64	\$792.00	\$3.1500	\$945.00	\$3.88	\$1,164.00	NO BID		\$2.16	\$648.00	NO BID		\$1.30	\$390.00	\$4.69	\$1,407.00
4 - 22035095			\$4.99	\$2,994.00	\$2.64	\$1,584.00	\$3.1500	\$1,890.00	\$3.88	\$2,328.00	\$3.60	\$2,160.00	\$2.16	\$1,296.00	NO BID		\$1.18	\$708.00	\$4.69	\$2,814.00
5 - 22035101			\$4.99	\$2,994.00	\$2.64	\$1,584.00	\$2.9197	\$1,751.82	\$3.88	\$2,328.00	\$3.59	\$2,154.00	\$2.16	\$1,296.00	NO BID		\$1.18	\$708.00	\$4.69	\$2,814.00
6 - 22035112			\$4.99	\$1,497.00	\$2.64	\$792.00	\$3.1500	\$945.00	\$6.51	\$1,953.00	NO BID		\$2.16	\$648.00	NO BID		\$2.68	\$804.00	\$6.69	\$2,007.00
7 - 22035113			\$4.99	\$239.52	\$4.38	\$210.24	\$3.1500	\$151.20	\$3.88	\$186.24	NO BID		\$2.12	\$101.76	NO BID		\$2.79	\$133.92	\$4.69	\$225.12
8 - 22035114			\$4.99	\$239.52	\$7.35	\$352.80	\$3.1500	\$151.20	\$3.88	\$186.24	NO BID		\$2.12	\$101.76	NO BID		\$2.55	\$122.40	NO BID	
9 - 22035118			\$4.99	\$4,790.40	\$2.64	\$2,534.40	\$2.9197	\$2,802.91	\$3.88	\$3,724.80	\$4.74	\$4,550.40	\$2.16	\$2,073.60	NO BID		\$1.18	\$1,132.80	\$4.69	\$4,502.40
10 - 22035119			\$4.99	\$1,796.40	\$2.64	\$950.40	\$3.1500	\$1,134.00	\$3.88	\$1,396.80	NO BID		\$2.16	\$777.60	NO BID		\$2.38	\$856.80	NO BID	
11 - 22035121			\$4.99	\$6,986.00	\$4.38	\$6,132.00	\$3.1500	\$4,410.00	\$3.88	\$5,432.00	\$4.78	\$6,692.00	\$2.16	\$3,024.00	NO BID		\$2.38	\$3,332.00	\$4.69	\$6,566.00
12 - 22035123			\$4.99	\$718.56	\$6.24	\$898.56	\$3.1500	\$453.60	\$6.51	\$937.44	NO BID		\$2.16	\$311.04	NO BID		\$3.80	\$547.20	\$6.69	\$963.36
13 - 22035132			\$4.99	\$2,694.60	\$3.98	\$2,149.20	\$3.0500	\$1,647.00	\$5.08	\$2,743.20	NO BID		\$2.11	\$1,139.40	\$3.55	\$1,917.00	NO BID		NO BID	
14 - 22035133			\$4.99	\$10,479.00	\$3.98	\$8,358.00	\$3.0500	\$6,405.00	\$5.08	\$10,668.00	NO BID		\$2.11	\$4,431.00	\$3.55	\$7,455.00	\$2.29	\$4,809.00	\$4.22	\$8,862.00
15 - 22035134			\$4.99	\$1,796.40	\$3.98	\$1,432.80	\$3.0500	\$1,098.00	\$5.08	\$1,828.80	NO BID		\$2.11	\$759.60	\$3.55	\$1,278.00	\$2.29	\$824.40	\$4.22	\$1,519.20
16 - 22035135			\$4.99	\$1,796.40	\$3.98	\$1,432.80	\$3.0500	\$1,098.00	\$5.08	\$1,828.80	NO BID		\$2.11	\$759.60	\$3.55	\$1,278.00	\$2.29	\$824.40	\$4.22	\$1,519.20
17 - 22035136			\$4.99	\$3,592.80	\$3.98	\$2,865.60	\$3.0500	\$2,196.00	\$5.08	\$3,657.60	NO BID		\$2.11	\$1,519.20	\$3.55	\$2,556.00	\$2.97	\$2,138.40	\$5.14	\$3,700.80
18 - 22035137			\$4.99	\$3,592.80	\$3.98	\$2,865.60	\$3.0500	\$2,196.00	\$5.08	\$3,657.60	NO BID		\$2.11	\$1,519.20	\$3.55	\$2,556.00	\$2.29	\$1,648.80	\$5.14	\$3,700.80
19 - 22035138			\$4.99	\$2,694.60	\$3.98	\$2,149.20	\$3.0500	\$1,647.00	\$5.08	\$2,743.20	NO BID		\$2.11	\$1,139.40	\$3.55	\$1,917.00	\$2.97	\$1,603.80	\$5.14	\$2,775.60
20 - 22035139			\$4.99	\$4,191.60	\$3.98	\$3,343.20	\$2.8478	\$2,392.15	\$5.08	\$4,267.20	NO BID		\$2.11	\$1,772.40	\$3.55	\$2,982.00	\$2.97	\$2,494.80	NO BID	
21 - 22035142			\$4.99	\$239.52	\$3.98	\$191.04	\$3.0500	\$146.40	\$5.08	\$243.84	NO BID		\$2.11	\$101.28	\$3.55	\$170.40	\$2.30	\$110.40	NO BID	
22 - 22035189			\$4.99	\$299.40	\$4.38	\$262.80	\$3.0500	\$183.00	\$3.88	\$232.80	NO BID		\$2.16	\$129.60	NO BID		\$2.30	\$138.00	NO BID	
23 - 22035192			\$4.99	\$2,994.00	\$4.80	\$2,880.00	\$3.1500	\$1,890.00	\$3.88	\$2,328.00	NO BID		\$2.16	\$1,296.00	NO BID		\$2.13	\$1,278.00	\$4.69	\$2,814.00
24 - 22035212			\$4.99	\$119.76	\$4.38	\$105.12	\$3.1500	\$75.60	\$3.88	\$93.12	\$3.03	\$72.72	\$2.16	\$51.84	NO BID		\$1.74	\$41.76	\$3.99	\$95.76
TOTALS	NO BID		\$59,740.28		\$45,179.76		\$36,553.88		\$55,092.68		\$16,284.32		\$25,544.28		\$22,109.40		\$25,009.28		\$46,849.04	