ITEMHKD -

011414 2030
(0-2020-64)

ORDINANCE NUMBER O- 21167 (NEW SER_IES)

DATE OF FINAL PASSAGE ___ jaN 9 8 2020

AN ORDINANCE AMENDING CHAPTER 9, ARTICLE 8,
DIVISION 5 OF THE SAN DIEGO MUNICIPAL CODE BY
AMENDING SECTION 98.0502; AMENDING CHAPTER 11,
ARTICLE 3, DIVISION 1 BY AMENDING SECTION 113.0103;
AMENDING CHAPTER 14, ARTICLE 2, DIVISION 6 BY
AMENDING SECTION 142.0640; AMENDING CHAPTER 14,
ARTICLE 2, DIVISION 13 BY AMENDING

SECTIONS 142.1302 AND 142.1303, BY ADDING NEW
SECTIONS 142.1304 AND 142.1305, BY AMENDING,
RENUMBERING, AND RETITLING SECTION 142.1304 TO
SECTION 142.1306, SECTION 142.1305 TO

SECTION 142.1307, SECTION 142.1306 TO

SECTION 142.1308, ADDING NEW SECTION 142.1309,
AMENDING AND RENUMBERING SECTION 142.1307 TO
SECTION 142.1310, SECTION 142.1308 TO

SECTION 142.1311, RENUMBERING SECTION 142.1309 TO
SECTION 142.1312, AMENDING AND RENUMBERING
SECTION 142.1310 TO SECTION 142.1313, AND

SECTION 142.1311 TO SECTION 142.1314; AMENDING
CHAPTER 14, ARTICLE 3, DIVISION 7 BY AMENDING
SECTION 143.0720; AMENDING CHAPTER 14, ARTICLE 3,
DIVISION 9 BY AMENDING SECTION 143.0915; AND
AMENDING CHAPTER 14, ARTICLE 4, DIVISION 5 BY
REPEALING SECTION 144.0508, RELATING TO
INCLUSIONARY AFFORDABLE HOUSING REGULATIONS.

WHEREAS, the City adopted an inclusionary housing program in 2003 to assist with
meeti;lg the City’s goals of providing affordable housing in a balanced manner; and

WHEREAS, the City’s original Inclusionary Housing Ordinance (Ordinance) was
adopted to address the City’s need for an increased supply of affordable housing and to combat
the adverse effects of sufficient affordable housing in new residential development; and

WHEREAS, the Ordinance gave developers the option to provide at Jeast ten percent of'
the dwelling units in new residential development at affordable rates for low to median income |

households or to pay an in lieu fee; and

-PAGE 1 OF 27-



(0-2020-64)

WHEREAS, in 2011, the City amended the Ordinance in response to several published
court opinions limiting local govefnmcnt authority to enforce inclusionary housing programs;
and |

WHEREAS, under the Ordinance, developers of rental residential development are
required to pay an inclusionary housing fee, and developers of for-sale residential development
may choose to either pay the inclusionary housing fee or provide ten percent of the total dwelling
units at prices affordable to median income households; and

WHEREAS, in September 2017, Assembly Bill 1505 (AB 1505), amending California
Government Code sections 65850 and 65850.01, was adopted with the stated intent of
“reafﬁrmting] the autho‘rity of local jurisdictions to include within these inclusionary housing
ordinances requirements related to the provision of rental units”; and

WHEREAS, state law supports the City’s ability to require that a portion of rental
residential development be made available for extremely low, very low, low, median and
moderate income households; and

WHEREAS, the City continues to experience increases in the cost of housing and
significant shortages in affordable housing; and

WHEREAS, according to the most recent Regional Housing Needs Allocation, required
by California Government Code section 65584 and prepared by the San Diego Association of
Governments, the City has a total housing need of 88,096 units through 2020, out of which
nearly 62 percent is for low and moderate income household_s (54,142 units); and

WHEREAS, of the affordable units attributed to the City in the Regional Housing Needs
Allocation: 10,988 units (13%) are for extremely low income households; 10,989 units (13%) are

for very low income households; 16,703 units (19%) are for low income households; and 15,462

-PAGE 2 OF 27-



(0-2020-64)

units (18%) are for moderate income households. These housing needs represent a significant
increase from the previous Regional Housing Needs Allocation; and

WHEREAS, an inclusionary housing program represents an extension of the City’s
police powers to regulate land use, ensuring that the limited supply of developable land provides
housing opportunities for households of all income levels; and

WHEREAS, the City continues to face a growing shortage of housing that is affordable
toa Wide range of its population and the lack of affordable housing is detrimental to the City’s
economic vitality and quality of life; and

WHEREAS, the lack of affordable housing is further detrimental to the health, safety,
and welfare of .the City’s residents, who may be forced to live in less than adequate housing, pay
a disproportionate share of their incomes to live in adequate housing, or commute significant
distances to their jobs from housing located outside the City; and

WHEREAS, affordable housing furthers geographic and community balance by
providing a range of housing opportunities throughout the City and supports the City’s Balanced
Communities Policies; and

WHEREAS, the City now desires to amend the Ordinance to help meet the City’s goals
of providing affordable housing in a balanced manner, to increase the supply of affordable
housing in the City, and to combat the adverse effects of sufficient affordable housing; and

WHEREAS, the City desires to establish an in lieu fee based on the estimated gap in the
cost required to provide inclusionary affordable units on a site different than the new market rate

residential development through the development of affordable units financed with low income

housing tax credits; and

-PAGE 3 OF 27-



(0-2020-64)

WHEREAS, the San Diego Housing Commission hired Keyser Marston Associates, Inc.,

to prepare a series of real estate financial feasibility analyses related to the Ordinance, which the

Council considered along with these amendments to the Ordinance; NOW, THEREFORE,

BE IT ORDAINED, by the Council of the City of San Diego, as follows:

Section 1. That Chapter 9, Article 8, Division 5 of the San Diego Municipal Code 1s

amended by amending section 98.0502, to read as follows:

§98.0502 Establishment of the San Diego Affordable Housing Fund

(a)

(b)

There is established a fund to be known as the San Diego Affordable
Housing Fund. The Affordable Housing Fund shall consist of funds
received from the commercial development linkage fees paid to the City
pursuant to Chapter 9, Article 8, Division 6 of the San Diego Municipal
Code; revenues from the Transient Occupancy Tax as provided in

Section 35.0128 of the San Diego Municipal Code; funds received from in
lieu fees paid to the City and revenueg received from promissory note
repayments, shared equity payments, or other payments ccﬂlected pursuant
to Chapter 14, Article 2, Division 13 of the San Diego Municipal Code;
and any other appropriations as determined from time to time by |
legislative action of the City Council. The Affordable Housing Fund shall
be administered by the San Diego Housing Commission pursuant to the
provisions of this Division, the appropriation ordinances and applicable
Council policies.

There is also established within the Affordable Housing Fund, a

San Diego Housing Trust Fund account. Except for funds received from in

lieu fees paid to the City and revenues received from promissory note

-PAGE 4 OF 27-



(c)

(0-2020-64)

repayments, shared equity payments, or other payments collected pursuant
to Chapter 14, Article 2, Division 13 of the San Diego Municipal Code, all
funds received by the Affordable Housing Fund, either from special funds
or general fund appropriations, shall be deposited in the Housing Trust
Fund account. The administration and use of monies from the San Diego
Housing Trust Fund shall be subject to all provisions under this Division
related to the Affordable Housing Fund.

There is also established within the Affordable Housing Fund, an
Inclusionary Housing Fund account. Funds received from in lieu fees paid
to the City and revenues received from promissory note repayments,
shared equity payments, or other payments collected pursuant to

Chapter 14, Article 2, Division 13 of the San Diego Municipal Code shall
be deposited in the Inclusionary Housing Fund account. The
administration and use of monies from the Inclusionary Housing Fund
shall be subject to all provisions under this Division related to the

Affordable Housing Fund.

Section 2. That Chapter 11, Article 3, Division 1 of the San Diego Municipal Code is

amended by amending section 113.0103, to read as follows:

§113.0103

Definitions

Abutting property through Marquee [No change in text.]

Median income means any household whose income does not exceed the median

income as adjusted for household size as defined by the U.S. Department of

Housing and Urban Development for the San Diego Standard Metropolitan

Statistical Area.

-PAGE 5 OF 27-



(0-2020-64)

MHPA through Multiple dwelling unit [No change in text.]

Net building area means the aggregate grossﬂoor area of all the unrestricted

dwelling units within a development, excluding areas outside the dwelling unit’s

habitable space such as garages, carports, parking areas, porches, patios, open

space, and excluding common areas such as lobbies, common hallways,

stairways, elevators, and equipment spaces.

Off-street parking space through Surface mining [No change in text.]

Target population through Yard [No change in text.]

Section 3. That Chapter 14, Article 2, Division 6 of the San Diego Municipal Code is
amended by amending section 142.0640, to read as follows:
§142.0640 Impact Fees for Financing Public Facilities

(a) [No change in text.]

(b) Payment of Fees
The payment of Development Impact Fees (as defined in California
Government Code Section 66000) shall be required prior to issuance of
any Building Permit in areas where Developmeﬁt Impact Fees have been
established by City Council resolution or ordinance. Notwithstanding the
above, the City Manager may also require the payment of Development
Impact Fees prior to issuance of any construction permit issued or
required for development that would increase demand for public facilities
and/or result in the need for new public facilities. Development Impact
Fees shall not be required for permanent supportive housing, transitional
housing facilities, companion unit or junior unit development.

Development Impact Fees shall not be required for inclusionary dwelling

-PAGE 6 OF 27-



(0-2020-64)

units provided pursuant t:o Chapter 14, Article 2, Division 13 if the
applicant has satisfied all the requirements of Division 13 for inclusionary
dwelling units on the same premises as the market-rate dwelling units. The
Development Impact Fee due shall be determined in accordance with the
fee schedule approved by the applicable City Council resolution in effect
upon the issuance of a Building Permit, or construction permit, as
applicable, and may include an automatic increase consistent with
Section 142.0640(c).

(c) through (f) [No change in text.]

Section 4, That Chapter 14, Article 2, Division 13 of the San Diego Municipal Code is
amended by amending sections 142.1302 and 142.1303, by adding new sections 142.1304 and
142.1305, by amending, renumbering, and retitling section 142.1304 to section 142.1306,
section 142.1305 to section 142.1307, section 142.1306 to section 142.1308, adding new
section 142.1309, amending and renumbering section 142.1307 to section 142.1310,
section 142.1308 to section 142.1311, renumbering section 142.1309 to section 142.1312,
amending and renumbering section 142.1310 to section 142.1313, and section 142.1311 to
section 142.1314, to read as follows:

§142.1302  When Inclusionary Affordable Housing Regulations Apply
This Division applies to all residential development of 10 or more dwelling units
and to all condominium conversion development of two or more dwelling units,
except as provided in Section 142.1303. The requirements of this Division shall
not be cumulative to state or other local affordable housing requirements where
those dwelling units are subject to an affordability restriction recorded against the

property by the state or local agency. To the extent that state or local regulations

-PAGE 7 OF 27-



§142.1303

§142.1304

(0-2020-64)

are inconsistent with the requirements of this Division for the amount of the fee,

length of the restriction or the level of affordability, the more restrictive shall

apply.

Exemptions From the Inclusionary Affordable Housing Regulations

This Division is not applicable to the following:

(a) [No change in text.]

(b)  Rehabilitation of an existing building that does not result in a net increase

of dwelling units on the premises.
(¢}  Density bonus units constructed in accordance with the provisions of
Chapter 14, Article 3, Division 7.

Inclusionary Affordable Housing Requirements

From July 1, 2020 through June 30, 2024, the requirements of subséctions (a) and

(b) of this Section 142.1304 shall be implemented incrementally as set forth in the

Inclusionary Affordable Housing Implementation and Monitoring Procedures

Manual on file with the San Diego Housing Commission (Procedures Manual).

Effective July 1, 2024, all residential development éubject to this bivision shall

include iﬁclusionary dwelling units as follows:

(a) Rental residential development.
At least 10 percent of the total dwelling units in the development shall be
made available for rent by very low income households or low income
households at a cost, including an allowance for utilities, that does not
exceed 30 percent of 60 percent of median inco;me.

(b)  For-sale residential development:

-PAGE 8 OF 27-



(c)

(d)

(e)

(0-2020-64)

(1) At least 10 percent of the total dwelling units in the ‘development
shall be made available for purchase at a cost affordable to median
income households; or

2) At least 15 percent of the total dwelling units in the development
shall be made available for purchase at a cost affordable to
moderate income households.

The applicant may propose a combination of inclusionary dwelling units

required by this Division. The proposal shall be considered by the

San Diego Housing Commission in accordance with this Division and the
Procedures Manual. The proposal shall be approved if the combination
provides substantially the same or greater level of affordability as required
by this Division and provides the same or greater number of inclusionary
dwelling units required by this Division.

For any partial inclusionary dwelling unit calculated, the applicant shall

pay a prorated amount of the Inclusionary In Lieu Fee in accordance with

Section 142.1306 or provide an additional inclusionary dwelling unit.

Development of inclusionary dwelling units shall be subject to the

following:

(1) The inclusionary dwelling units shall be constructed at the same
time as the market-rate dwelling units and receive final inspection
approval from the Building Official no later than the date that the
market-rate dwelling units receive final inspection approval from

the Building Official. The applicant may seek an alternative

-PAGE 9 OF 27-



(®

(g)

(2)

)

@

(0-2020-64)

development schedule in accordance with Section 142.1310 and
Section 142.1311.

The inclusionary dwelling units shall be comparable in bedroom
mix, désigm and overall quality of construction to the market-rate
dwelling units in the development, as determined by the San Diego
Housing Commission, except that the inclusionary dwelling units
shall not be required to exceed three bedrooms per dwelling unit.
The square footage and interior features of the inclusionary
dwelling units shall be good quality and consistent with current
building standards for new housing in the City of San Diego.

Sale or lease of the inclusionary dwelling units shall follow the
marketing requirements and procedures in the Procedures Manual.
Development of the inclusionary dwelling units shall follow all

other requirements in the Procedures Manual

Rental inclusionary dwelling units shall remain affordable for a period of

not less than 55 years from the date of final inspection for the development

or applicable phase of the development.

For-sale inclusionary dwelling units shall be owner-occupied and the

San Diego Housing Commission shall cause the for-sale inclusionary

dwelling units to be subject to documentation ensuring the following:

M

The owner and the San Diego Housing Commission shall share
equity in a for-sale inclusionary dwelling unit. For the purpose of
this Section 142.1304, equity shall be defined in the Procedures

Manual. Shared equity shall be measured by the difference

-PAGE 10 OF 27-



(2)

(3)

(0-2020-64)

between the unrestricted fair market value of the inclusionary
dwelling unit on the date of the first resale and the original
unrestricted fair market value of the inclusionary dwelling unit at
the time of its initial acquisition. Any equity calculation shall be
based on an appraisal approved by the San Diego Housing
Commission and shall consider the actual costs of any San Diego
Housing Commission-approved improvements to the inclusionary
dwelling unit. If the San Diego Housing Commission’s calculation
results in a negative number, the equity is deemed to be zero.

The owner and the San Diego Housing Commission shall share the
equity earned during -thc owner’s first 15 years of ownership at the
time of the first resale, refinance, or transfer of the for-sale
inclusionary dwelling unit in accordance with the table in the
Procedures Manual. The San Diego Housing Commission may
waive the requirement to share equity if the for-sale inclusionary
dwelling unit is sold to another median income household or
moderate income household in compliance with the Procedures
Manual.

Upon aﬁy sale or transfer of the inclusionary dwelling unit by the
original owner, whenever it occurs, the San Diego Housing
Commission shall also receive that sum calculated as the
difference between the original unrestricted fair market value of
the inclusionary dwelling unit and the restricted value of the

inclusionary dwelling unit at the time of the original sale, as

-PAGE 11 OF 27-



(h)

S

(5)

(0-2020-64)

determined by an appratsal approved by the San Diego Housing
Commission.

The owner shall sell the inclusionary dwelling unit at no less than
fair market value unless sold to another median income household
or moderate income household in compliance with the Procedures
Manual.

Unless otherwise required by law, all promissory note repayments,
shared equity payments, or other payments collected under this
Section 142.1304(g) shall be deposited into the Affordable

Housing Fund.

Residential development that intends to provide affordable dwelling units

as a condition of the development and has an application for a development

permit, for a subdivision, or for a Building Permit deemed complete before

July 1, 2020 shall be subject to the version of these Inclusionary

Affordable Housing Regulations in effect prior to July 1, 2020, as set forth

in the Procedures Manual.

§142.1305  Methods of Compliance

(a)

The requirement to provide inclusionary dwelling units may be met in any

of the following ways:

)
)

On the same premises as the development;

On different premises from the development, but within the same
community planning area, or within one mile of the premises of the
development, as measured in a straight line from the property lines

of the development premises to the property lines of the proposed

-PAGE 12 OF 27-



(0-2020-64)

premises where the inclusionary dwelling units will be constructed;

(3)  Ondifferent premises from the development that does not meet the
locational criteria in Section 142.1305(a)(2) but within the City of
San Diego, if the applicant provides five percent more inclusionary
dwelling units than required for the development pursuant to
Section 142.1304(a) or Section 142.1304(b);

(4) By payment of an Inclusionary In Lieu Fee in accordance with
Section 142.1306 in lieu of constructing all or a portion of the
inclusiqnary dwelling units required in Section 142.1304(a) or
Section 142.1304(b);

(5) By rehabilitation of existing dwelling units or SRO hotel rooms or
conversion of guest rooms in a motel or hotel to inclusionary
dwelling units in accordance with Section 142.1307; or

(6) By land donation in accordance with Section 142.1308.

(b)  When a residential development includes both for-sale and rental dwelling
units, the provisions of this bivision that apply to for-sale development
shall apply to that portion of the development that consists of for-sale
dwelling units, and the provisions of this Division that apply to rental
dwelling units shall apply to that portion of the development that consists
of rental dwelling units.

(c) Nothing in this Division shall preclude an applicant from using affordable
dwelling units constructed by another applicant to satisfy the requirements
of this Division, including contracting with an affordable housing

developer with experience obtaining tax-exempt bonds, low income

-PAGE 13 OF 27-



(0-2020-64)

“housing tax credits, and other competitive sources of financing, upon
approval by the San Diego Housing Commission pursuant to the standards

set forth in the Procedures Manual.

§142.1306  Inclusionary In Lieu Fee

(a)

(b)

()

From July 1, 2020 through June 30, 2024, the Inclusionary In Lieu Fee
requirements shall be implemented incrementally as set forth in the
Procedures Manual. Effective July 1, 2024, the Inclusionary In Lieu Fee
shall be $25.00 per square foot of net building area of unrestricted market-
rate residential development. The Inclusionary In Lieu Fee shall be
updated annually based on the annual increase in the Construction Costs
Index (CCI) published by Engineering News Record for Los Angeles, or
similar construction industry index selected by the City Manager if the
CClI index is discontinued.

Except as provided in Section 142.1306(c), the Inclusionary In Lieu Fee
shall be determined using the rate in effect at the time the applicant- s
development permit application, application for subdivision under the
Subdivision Map Act, or Building Permit application is deemed complete,
whichever is earlier. The Inclusionary In Lieu Fee shall be paid on or
before the issuance of the first residential Building Permit for the
development.

The Inclusionary In Lieu Fee applicable to residential development that
has an application for a development permit, for a subdivision, or for a

Building Permit deemed complete before July 1, 2020 shall be $12.73 per

-PAGE 14 OF 27-



§142.1307

(d)

(0-2020-64)

square foot multiplied by the net building area of the unrestricted market-

rate residential development.

All funds collected pursuant to this Section 142.1306 shall be deposited

into the Affordable Housing Fund.

Rehabilitation of Existing Dwelling Units, SRO Hotel Rooms, or Conversion
of Guest Rooms '

(a)

The requirements of this Division may be satisfied by the rehabilitation of

existing dwelling units for conversion to inclusionary dwelling units

affordable to very low income households or /low income households at a

cost, including an allowance for utilities, that does not exceed 30 percent

of 60 percent of median income, if the City Manager determines all of the

following:

(D

(2)

)

The San Diego Housing Commission is satisfied that the value of
each dwelling unit after the rehabilitation work is 25 percent or
more than the value of the dwelling unit prior to rehabilitation,
inclusive of land value. The Procedures Manual shall include
criteria for the determination of the value of the rehabilitation
work;

One dwelling unit shall be rehabilitated in lieu of each inclusionary
dwelling unit required pursuant to Section 142.1304(a) or
Section 142.1304(b),

The rehabilitated dwelling units are located in an appropriate
residential zone that can accommodate at least the number of

rehabilitated dwelling units required by this Division, and if those

-PAGE 15 OF 27-



@

(5)

(6)

(7

(0-2020-64)

rehabilitated dwelling units are located within a Transit Priority
Area, the number of dwelling units on the premises is at least 60
percent of the basg floor area ratio or density designated by the
zone in which the premises is located;

The applicant provides evidence that the existing structure has a
remaining useful life of at least 55 years from the approval of the
dwelling unit as an inclusionary dwelling unit;

The applicant provides evidence that the rehabilitation work
complies with California Building Code requirements to the
satisfaction of the Building Official,

The applicant provides a physical needs assessment to the
satisfaction of the City Manager and the San Diego Housing.
Commission for each dwelling unit to be rehabilitated, for the
premises where the dwelling units are located, and for any
associated common area. All items identified in the physical needs
assessment needing repair or replacement at the time of the
assessment or that will likely require repair or replacement within
three years of the assessment shall be completed by the applicant
during the rehabilitation work; and

On or before the time the applicant’s application is deemed
complete, the applicant complies with the State Relocation Act
codified in California Government Code Section 7260 and
provides all-costs of notice to, and relocation of, any existing

residents occupying the dwelling units to be rehabilitated.

-PAGE 16 OF 27-



(b

(0-2020-64)

The requirements of this Division may be satisfied by the rehabilitation of

existing dwelling units that are restricted for use and occupancy for very

low income households or low income households eaming up to 60 percent

of the median income by agreement with a federal, state, or local

government agency, if the City Manager determines all of the following:

§)) The agreement restricting the use and occupancy of the dwelling
units for very low income households or low income households
expires within 10 years of completion of applicant’s rehabilitation
of the dwelling units,

2) One restricted dwelling unit shall be rehabilitated in lieu of each
inclusionary dwelling unit required pursuant to
Section 142.1304(a) or Section 142.1304(b);

(3)  The applicant provides evidence that the rehabilitation work
complies with California Building Code requirements to the
satisfaction of the Building Official;

(4)  The applicant provides evidence that the existing structure has a
remaining useful life of at least 55 years from the approval of the
dwelling unit as an inclusionary dwelfing unit, and

(5)  The applicant provides a physical needs assessment to the .
satisfaction of the City Manager and the San Diego Housing
Commission for each restricted dwelling unit to be rehabilitated,
for the premises where the dwelling units are located, and for any
associated common area. All items identified in the physical needs

assessment needing repair or replacement at the time of the

-PAGE 17 OF 27-



(c)

(0-2020-64)

assessment or that will likely require repair or replacement within
three years of the assessment shall be completed by the applicant

during the rehabilitation work.

The requirements of this Division may be satisfied by the rehabilitation of

existing SRO hotel rooms affordable to very low income households, if the

City Manager determines all of the following:

)

(2)

3)

G

&)

()

The San Diego Housing Commission is satisfied that the value of
each SRO hotel room after the rehabilitation work is 25 percent or
more than the value of the SRO hotel room prior to rehabilitation,
inclusive of land value. The Procedures Manual shall include
criteria for the determination of the value of the rehabilitation
work;

One SRO hotel room shall be rehabilitated and affordable to a very
low income household in lieu of each inclusionary dwelling unit
required pursuant to Section 142.1304(a) or Section 142.1304(b); _
All of the SRO hotel rooms located in the SRO hotel shall be
rehabilitated by the applicant,

The SRO hotel is located in an appropriate residential zone;

The applicant provides evidence that the existing SRO hotel has a
remaining useful life of at least 55 years from completion of the
rehabilitation work;

The applicant provides evidence that the rehabilitation work
complies with California Building Code requirements to the

satisfaction of the Building Official;

-PAGE 18 OF 27-



(d)

Q)

8

(0-2020-64)

The applicant provides a physical needs assessment to the
satisfaction of the City Manager and the San Diego Housing
Commission for each SRQ hotel room to be rehabilitated, for the
SRO hotel where the SRO hotel rooms are located, and for any
associated common area. All items identified in the physical needs
assessment needing repair or replacement at the time of the
assessment or that will likely require repair or replacement within
three years of the assessment shall be completed by the applicant
during the rehabilitation work; and

The applicant complies with the State Relocation Act codified in
California Government Code Section 7260 and provides all costs
of notice to, and relocation of, any existing residents occupying the
SRO hotel rooms to be rehabilitated at the time the application is

deemed complete.

The requirements of this Division may be satisfied by the conversion of

existing guest rooms in a motel or hotel to inclusionary dwelling units

affordable to very low income households or low income households at a

cost, including an allowance for utilities, that does not exceed 30 percent

of 60 percent of median income, if the City Manager determines all of the

following:

M

One guest room shall be converted to an inclusionary dwelling unit

in liev of each inclusionary dwelling unit required pursuant to

Section 142.1304(a) or Section 142.1304(b);

-PAGE 19 OF 27-



(0-2020-64)

(2)  The motel or hotel is located in an appropriate residential zone that
can accommodate at least the number of converted guest rooms
required by this Division, and if the mote! or hotel is located within
a Transit Priority Area, the number of guest rooms in the motel or
hotel is at least 60 percent of the base floor area ratio or density
designated by the zone in which the motel or hotel is located,

(3)  The applicant provides evidence that the existing structure has a
remaining useful life of at least 55 years from conversion of the
guest roaoms,

(4) The applicant provides evidence that the construction or
rehabilitation work complies with California Building Code
requirements to the satisfaction of the Building Official; and

(5)  The applicant prov'ides a physical needs assessment to the
satisfaction of the City Manager and the San Diego Housing
Commission for each guest room to be converted, for the motel or
hotel where the guest rooms are located, and for any associated
common area. All items identified in the physical needs assessment
needing repair or replacement at the time of the assessment or that
will likely require repair or replacement within three years of the
assessment shall be completed by the applicant during conversion
of the guest rooms.

(e) Any inclusionary dwelling units or rehabilitated SRO hotel rooms
provided pursuant to this Section 142.1307 shail be completed no later

than the date the applicant s market-rate dwelling units receive final

-PAGE 20 OF 27-



§142.1308

®

(g)

(0-2020-64)

inspection approval from the Building Official. The applicant may seek an
alternative development schedule in accordance with Section 142.1310
and Section 142.1311.

Inclusionary dwelling units and rehabilitated SRO hotel rooms provided
pursuant to this Section 142.1307 shall remain affordable for a period of
not less than 55 years from the date of final inspection or the date accepted
by the San Diego Housing Commission.

The affordability of inclusionary dwelling units and rehabilitated SRO
hotel rooms provided pursuant to this Section 142.1307 shall be secured
by a Declaration of Covenants, Conditions and Restrictions in favor of the
San Diego Housing Commission, recorded against the market-rate
residential development and the premises where the inclusionary dwelling
units or rehabilitated SRO hotel rooms are located. The Declaration of
Covenants, Conditions and Restrictions shall comply with the provisions
of Section 142.1313 and shall include the method by which a capital
reserve fund for repair, replacement, and maintenance of the inclusionary
dwelling units or rehabilitated SRO hotel rooms shall be maintained with
provision for sufficient initial capitalization and periodic contributions to

the capital reserve fund.

Land Denation

. The requirements of this Division may be satisfied by the donation of land, if the

donation is completed in accordance with California Government

Section 65915(g) and Chapter 14, Division 7, Article 3 of the San Diego

Municipal Code and if the value of the land on the date of donation is equal to or

-PAGE 21 OF 27-



(0-2020-64)

greater than the Inclusionary In Lieu Fee applicable to the applicant’s

development on the date of donation.

§142.1309  Incentives for On-Site Inclusionary Dwelling Units

(a)

(b

An applicant may submit a written request for density bonus, waiver, or
incentives pursuant to California Government Code Section 65915 and
Chapter 14, Division 7, Article 3 of the San Diego Municipal Code if the
development meets the minimum thresholds for density bonus pursuant to
California Government Code Sections 65915 — 65918.

If an applicant has complied with this Division by providing all the
inclusionary dwelling units required by this Division on the same premises *
as the market-rate dwelling units, then the inclusionary dwelling units shall
be exempt from the payment of Development Impact Fees pursuant to

Section 142.0640 of the San Diego Municipal Code.

§142.1310 Variance, Waiver, Adjustment or Reduction of Inclusionary
Affordable Housing Regulations

(a)

(b)

A variance, adjustment, or reduction from the provisions of this Division
may be requested and decided in accordance with Process Four. A waiver
from the provisions of this Division may be requested and decided in
accordance with Process Five. Any variance, waiver, adjustment or
reduction shall require either that the findings in Section 142.1311(a) or in
Section 142.1311{b) be made.

[No change in text.]

-PAGE 22 OF 27-



§142.1311

§142.1312

§142.1313

(0-2020-64)

Findings for Variance, Waiver, Adjustment or Reduction Approval

(a)
(b)

[No change in text.]

The decision maker may approve or conditionally approve an application
for a variance, waiver, adjustment, or reduction to the provisions of this
Division if the decision maker makes findings that applying the
requirements of this Division would take property in violation of the

United States or California Constitutions.

General Rules for Inclusionary Affordable Housing Regulations

(a) through (b) [No change in text.]

Declaration of Covenants, Conditions and Restrictions

All development of inclusionary dwelling units pursuant to this Division shall be

subject to the following;:

(a)

(b)

Each inclusionary dwelling unit and the applicable portions of the
premises shall have recorded against them a Declaration of Covenants,
Conditions and Restrictions approved by and in favor of the San Diego
Housing Commission.

Any Declaration of Covenants, Conditions and Restrictions required by
this Division shall enjoy first lien position and shall be secured by a deed
of trust in favor of the San Diego Housing Commission recorded against
the applicable portions of the premises and dwelling unit, prior to

construction or permanent financing.

-PAGE 23 OF 27-



(0-2020-64)

§142.1314 Reporting Requirements

The San Diego Housing Commission shall annually report to the City Council and

the Housing Authority of the City of San Diego on the results of implementing

this Division, including the following:

(a)

(b)

(c)

The number of applicants and location of developments that came before
the City for ministerial or discretionary approval and the number of
applicants and location of developments that were subject to the
requirements of this Division;

The number of applicants and location of developments that applied for a
waiver, variance, reduction, or adjustment in accordance with this
Division, and fhe number of applicants and location of developments that
were granted a waiver, variance, reduction, or adjustment and the terms of
each; and

The number of market-rate units developed subject to this Division, the
number of inclusionary dwelling units along with their location, the
methods of compliance with this Division, and the total Inclusionary

In Lieu Fees paid.

Section 5. That Chapter 14, Article 3, Division 7 of the San Diego Municipal Code is

amended by amending section 143.0720, to read as follows:

§143.0720  Density Bonus in Exchange for Affordable Housing Units

(a)
(b)

[No change in text.]
The density bonus dwelling units authorized by this Division shall be
exempt from the Inclusionary Housing Regulations set forth in

Chapter 14, Article 2, Division 13.

-PAGE 24 OF 27-



(0-2020-64)

(c) through (i) [No change in text.]
Section 6. That Chapter 14, Article 3, Division 9 of the San Diego Municipal Code is
amended by amending section 143.0915, to read as follows:

§143.0915  When Supplemental Neighborhood Development Permit Regulations Apply
for Affordable Housing, In-Fill Projects, and Sustainable Buildings

These regulations apply to the following types of development:
(a) Affordable housing, which is any of the following:
(1) Residential development (including both for-sale and for-rent
inclusionary dwelling units) in accordance with Chapter 14,
Article 2, Division 13,
(2) through (6) [No change in text.]
(b) through (c) [No change in text.} -

Section 7. That Chapter 14, Article 4, Division 5 of the San Diego Municipal Code is
amended by repealing section 144.0508.

Section 8. That a full reading of this Ordinance is dispensed with prior to passage, a
written copy having been made available to the Council and the public prior to the day of its
passage.

Section 9. That this Ordinance shall take effect on July 1, 2020, except that the Ordinance
shall be implemented incrementally from July 1, 2020 through July 1, 2024, as provided in
Section 13, and except that the provisions of this Ordinance applicable inside the Coastal
Overlay Zone, which are subject to California Coastal Commission jurisdiction as a City of
San ]jiego Local Coastal Program amcndment; shall not take effect until the date the California
Coastal Commission unconditionally certifies those provisio-ns as a local coastal program |

amendment.

-PAGE 25 OF 27-



(0-2020-64)

Section 10. That the San Diego County Regional Airport Authority (SDCRAA) has
determined that this Ordinance does not require a consistency determination.

Section 11. That no permits shall be issued for development that is inconsistent with the
provisions of this Ordinance unless the applicant’s application for a development permit, for a
subdivision, or for a Building Permit, whichever is earlier, is deemed complete prior to the date
on which the applicable provisions of this Ordinance, as incrementally implemented, become
effective.

Section 12. That Ordinances O-21118, O-21114, O-211135, O-21116, and O-21117 have
been recently considered by the City Council and that Ordinances 0-2020-3, O-2020-9,
0-2020-60, 0-2020-65, 0-2020-66, and 0-2020-68 will be considered by the City Council in the
near future which amend San Diego Municipal Code sections also amended by this Ordinance;
therefore, the City Clerk, with the written approval and concurrence of the City Attorney, is
authorized to reconcile the numbering of sections and placement of text within these sections
upon the final passage of the Ordinances, without further action by the City Council, pursuant to
San Diego Charter section 275.

Section 13. That this Ordinance shall take effect and be in force on July 1, 2020 and sh;ll
be implemented incrementally so that it is fully effective by July 1, 2024. From July I, 2020
through June 30, 2021, developers will be required to provide 20 percent of the total percentages
of required inclusionary dwelling units in Section 142.1304 or pay the Inclusionary In Lieu Fee
of $15.18 per square foot. From July 1, 2021 through June 30, 2022, developers will be required
io provide 40 percent of the total percentages of required inclusionary dwelling units in
Section 142.1304 or pay the Inclusionary In Lieu Fee of $17.64 per square foot. From July 1,
2022 through June 30, 2023, developers will be required to provide 60 percent of the total

percentages of required inclusionary dwelling units in Section 142.1304 or pay the Inclusionary

-PAGE 26 OF 27-



(0-2020-64)

In Lieu Fee of $20.09 per square foot. From July 1, 2023 through June 30, 2024, developers will
be required to provide 80 percent of the total percentages of required inclusionary dwelling units
in Section 142.1304 or pay the Inclusionary In Lieu Fee of $22.55. Beginning on July 1, 2024,
developers shall comply with all of the requirements of this Ordinance. Any requirement in the
Ordinance to provide additional inclusionary dwelling units as a condition of electing an
alternative method of compliance shall apply, without reduction, from the effective date of this
Ordinance. The Inclusionary Affordable Housing Implementation and Monitoring Procedures

Manual shall provide additional detail about implementation of this Ordinance.

APPROVED: MARA W. ELLIOTT, City Attorney

By

Heather M. Ferbert
Deputy City Attorney

HMF:soc

11/25/2019

Or. Dept: Council District 9
Doc. No.: 2212622

I hereby certify that the foregoing Ordinance was passed by the Council of the City of
San Diego, at this meeting of JAN 1 47020

ELIZABETH S. MALAND
City Clerk

. By s 'r
Approved: llzﬁllow z é:;: E :Z

(date) IN L. FAULCONER, Mayor

Vetoed:

(date) KEVIN L. FAULCONER, Mayor

-PAGE 27 OF 27-



ey
et
(O-2020-64)

STRIKEOUT ORDINANCE

OLD LANGUAGE: StruekOut
NEW LANGUAGE: Double Underline

§98.0502

ORDINANCE NUMBER O- (NEW SERIES)

DATE OF FINAL PASSAGE

AN ORDINANCE AMENDING CHAPTER 9, ARTICLE 8,
DIVISION 5 OF THE SAN DIEGO MUNICIPAL CODE BY
AMENDING SECTION 98.0502; AMENDING CHAPTER 11,
ARTICLE 3, DIVISION 1 BY AMENDING SECTION 113.0103;
AMENDING CHAPTER 14, ARTICLE 2, DIVISION 6 BY
AMENDING SECTION 142.0640; AMENDING CHAPTER 14,
ARTICLE 2, DIVISION 13 BY AMENDING

SECTIONS 142.1302 AND 142.1303, BY ADDING NEW
SECTIONS 142.1304 AND 142.1305, BY AMENDING,
RENUMBERING, AND RETITLING SECTION 142.1304 TO
SECTION 142.1306, SECTION 142.1305 TO

SECTION 142.1307, SECTION 142.1306 TO

SECTION 142.1308, ADDING NEW SECTION 142.1309,
AMENDING AND RENUMBERING SECTION 142.1307 TO
SECTION 142.1310, SECTION 142.1308 TO

SECTION 142.1311, RENUMBERING SECTION 142.1309 TO
SECTION 142.1312, AMENDING AND RENUMBERING
SECTION 142.1310 TO SECTION 142.1313, AND

SECTION 142.1311 TO SECTION 142.1314; AMENDING
CHAPTER 14, ARTICLE 3, DIVISION 7 BY AMENDING
SECTION 143.0720; AMENDING CHAPTER 14, ARTICLE 3,
DIVISION 9 BY AMENDING SECTION 143.0915; AND
AMENDING CHAPTER 14, ARTICLE 4, DIVISION 5 BY
REPEALING SECTION 144.0508, RELATING TO
INCLUSIONARY AFFORDABLE HOUSING REGULATIONS.

Establishment of the San Diego Affordable Housing Fund

(a) There is hereby established a fund to be known end-deneminated as the
San Diego Affordable Housing Fund. The Affordable Housing Fund shall
consist of funds derived received from the commercial development
linkage fees paid to the City pursuant to Chapter 9,-Divisien-6; Article 8,

Division 6 of the San Diego Municipal Code; revenues from the Transient

-PAGE 1 OF 32-



(b)

(0-2020-64)

Occupancy Tax as provided in Section 35.0128 of the San Diego

Municipal Code; funds derived received from in lieu fees paid to the City

pursuant-to-Chapter 14,-Artiele- 2 Division13: and revenues received from

collected pursuant to Chapter 14, Article 2, Division 13 of the San Diego

Municipal Code; and any other appropriations as determined from time to
time by legislative action of the City Council. The Affordable Housing
Fund shall be administered by the San Diego Housing Commission
pursuant to the provisions of this Division, the appropriation ordinances
and applicable Council policies-applicable-therete.

There is also hereby established within the Affordable Housing Fund, a

San Diego Housing Trust Fund account. Except for funds received from in

lieu fees paid to the City pussuent-te-Chapter4;-Astiele 2, Pivision 13
and revenues received fronmrthe-use-efa-shared-equity-program-pursuani-to
of the San Diego Municipal Code, all funds received by the Affordable
Housing Frast Fund, either from special funds or general fund
appropriations, shall be deposited in the Housing Trust Fund account. The
administration and use of monies from the San Diego Housing Trust Fund
shall be subject to all provisions under this Division related to the

Affordable Housing Fund.

-PAGE 2 OF 32-



(0-2020-64)

(c) There is also hereby established within the Affordable Housing Fund, an

Inclusionary Housing Fund account. Funds received from in lieu fees paid

to the City pursuant-to-Chapter14-Astiele2Bivision13 and revenues

received from the

the San Diego Municipal Code shall be deposited in the Inclusionary
Housing Fund account. The administration and use of monies from the
Inclusionary Housing fFund shall be subject to all provisions under this
Division related to the Affordable Housing Fund.

§113.0103  Definitions

Abutting property through Marquee [No change in text.]

-PAGE 3 OF 32-



(0-2020-64)

Off-street parking space through Surface mining [No change in text. ]Fergeted

Target population through Yard [No change in text.]

§142.0640  Impact Fees for Financing Public Facilities

(a)
(b)

[No change in text.]

Payment of Fees

The payment of Development Impact Fees (as defined in California
Government Code Section 66000) shall be required prior to issuance of
any Building Permit in areas where Development Impact Fees have been
established by City Council resolution or ordinance. Notwithstanding the
above, the City Manager may also require the payment of Development
Impact Fees prior to issuance of any construction permit issued or

required for development that would increase demand for public facilities -

and/or result in the need for new public facilities. Development Impact

-PAGE 4 OF 32-



§142.1302

(0-2020-64)

Fees shall not be required for permanent supportive housing, transitional

housing facilities, companion unit or junior unit development.

Development Impact Fee due shall be determined in accordance with the

fee schedule approved by the applicable City Council resolution in effect
upon the issuance of a Building Permit, or construction permit, as
applicable, and may include an automatic increase consistent with
Section 142.0640(c).

(c) through (f) [No change in text.]

When Inclusionary Affordable Housing Regulations Apply

This Division applies to all residential development of twe 10 or more uhits

dwelling units, except as provided in Section 142.1303. The requirements of this
Division shall not be cumulative to state or other local affordable housing
requirements where those units dwelling units are subject to an affordability
restriction recorded against the property by the state or local agency. To the extent
that state or local regulations are inconsistent with the requirements of this
Division for the amount of the fee, length of the restriction or the level of

affordability, the more restrictive shall apply.

-PAGE 5 OF 32-



(0-2020-64)

§142.1303  Exemptions From the Inclusionary Affordable Inelusionary Housing
Regulations

This Division is not applicable to the following:

(a) [No change in text.]

¢e)(b) Rehabilitation of an existing building that does not result in a net increase
of dwelling units on the premises.
¢d)(c) Density bonus units constructed in accordance with the provisions of

Chapter 14, Article 3, Division 7.

-PAGE 6 OF 32-



(0-2020-64)

-PAGE 7 OF 32-



(0-2020-64)

-PAGE 8 OF 32-



(O-2020-64)

-PAGE ¢ OF 32-



(0-2020-64)

-PAGE 10 OF 32-



(0-2020-64)

-PAGE 11 OF 32-



(0-2020-64)

-PAGE 12 OF 32-



(0-2020-64)

Fee requi a i incre
Procedures Manual, Effective July 1, 2024, the Inclusionary Afferdeble

Heusing In Licu Fee shall be the-product-of-the-applieable-per-squarefoet

-PAGE 13 OF 32-



(0-2020-64)

¢e}(b) Fhe-Except as provided in Section 142.1306(c), the Inclusionary
Afferdable-Housing In Lieu Fee shall be determined using the rate in
effect at the time the-building-permit the applicant s development permit

Building Permit application is filed-deemed complete, whichever is earlier.
The Inclusionary Affordable Housing In Lieu Fee shall be paid on or
before the issuance of the first residential bBuilding pPermit for the

development.

(¢)  The Inclusionary In Lieu Fee applicable to residential development that

(d)  All funds collected pursuant to this Divisien Section 142.1306 shall be

deposited into the Affordable Housing Fund.

-PAGE 14 OF 32-



(0-2020-64)

§142.130507

Wi 14 C
Section 142.1304(b);
(3)  The rehabilitated dweli ) ! 1 o
e ate a imber of

-PAGE 15 OF 32-



(0-2020-64)

satisfacti e Buildin icial;

-PAGE 16 OF 32-



e and occupanc the dwelli

-PAGE 17 OF 32-

(0-2020-64)




(0-2020-64)

3

-PAGE 18 OF 32-



(0-2020-64)

(4)

-PAGE 19 OF 32-



:
|
|
|
|
1
1

and value. The Procedure

-PAGE 20 OF 32-

(0-2020-64)




(0-2020-64)

All of the SRO hotel rooms located in the SRO hotel shall be

ies with California Building Code requirement he

-PAGE 21 OF 32-



(0-2020-64)

(d)

-PAGE 22 OF 32-



(0-2020-64)

-PAGE 23 OF 32-



(0-2020-64)

§142.130608

he City: Tl . fthis Divisi be satisfied by the

-PAGE 24 OF 32-



(0-2020-64)

-PAGE 25 OF 32-



(0-2020-64)

-PAGE 26 OF 32-



(0-2020-64)

§142.136710 Variance, Waiver, Adjustment or Reduction of Inclusionary Affordable
Housing Regulations

(a) A variance, adjustment, or reduction from the provisions of this Division
may be requested and decided in accordance with Process Four. A waiver
from the provisions of this Division may be requested and decided in

accordance with Process Five. Any variance, waiver, adjustment or

-PAGE 27 OF 32-



(0-2020-64)

reduction shall require either that the findings-findings in

Section 142.1308]1 1(a) or in Section 142.1388]1(b) be made.

(b) [No change in text.]

§142.130811 Findings for Variance, Waiver, Adjustment or Reduction Approval
(a) [No change in text.]
{b)  The decision maker may approve or conditionally approve an application

for a variance, waiver, adjustment, or reduction to the provisions of this

Division if the decision maker makes a-finding findings that there-isan

-PAGE 28 OF 32-



(0-2020-64)

§142.130912 General Rules for Inclusionary Affordable Housing Regulations

(a) through (b) [No change in text.]

§142.131013 Declaration of Covenants, Conditions and Restrictions
All development of affordable-units inclusionary dwelling units pursuant to
H2-1305-or-Seetion142-1306(h) this Division shall be subject to the following
. inadditi | irs the Inolusi \Efordable Housi

(a)

Each inclusionary dwelling unit apd t¥he applicable portiong of the
development-premises shall have recorded against # them a Declaration of

Covenants, Conditions and Restrictions approved by and in favor of the

San Diego Housing Commission.

-PAGE 29 OF 32-



(b

(O-2020-64)

Any Declaration of Covenants, Conditions and Restrictions required by

this Division shall enjoy first lien position and shall be secured by a deed
of trust in favor of the San Diego Housing Commission recorded against
the development applicable portions of the premises er-unit-and dwelling

unit, as-applicable; prior to construction or permanent financing.

§142.131114 Reporting Requirements

)

h(a)

(bl

The San Diego Housing Commission shall annually report to the City
Council and the Housing Authority of the City of San Diego on the results
of implementing this Division, including;-but-net-limited-to; the following:
The number of applicants and location of developments that came before
the City for ministerial or discretionary approval and the number of
applicants and location of developments that were subject to the
requirements of this Division;

The number of applicants and location of developments that applied for a
waiver, variance, reduction, or adjustment in accordance with this
Division, and the number of applicants and location of developments .that
were granted a waiver, variance, reduction, or adjustment and the terms of
each; and

The number of market_rate units developed subject to this Division, and
the number of affordable-units; |

their ineluding-the location-efal affordable-units, the methods of
compliance with this Division, and the total Inclusionary A-fferdable

-PAGE 30 OF 32-



(0-2020-64)

Heusing |n Lieu Fees-and-Condomininm-ConversionInclusionary
Affordable-HousingFees-paid.
§143.0720  Density Bonus in Exchange for Affordable Housing Units
(a) [No change in text.]
(b)  The density bonus dwelling units authorized by this Division shall be

exempt from the Inclusionary Housing Regulations set forth in

Chapter 14, Article 2, Division 13. Developmentprovidingat-least10

(c) through (i) [No change in text.]

§143.0915  When Supplemental Neighborhood Development Permit Regulations Apply
for Affordable Housing, In-Fill Projects, and Sustainable Buildings

These regulations apply to the following types of development:
(a)  Affordable housing, which is any of the following:

(1)  Residential development {including both for-sale and for-rent

affordable-housing inclusionary dwelling units) in accordance with

-PAGE 31 OF 32-



(0-2020-64)

Section 1421305 C} 14, Adticle 2. Division 13.
(2) through (6) [No change in text.]

(b) through (c) [No change in text.]

HMF:soc

11/25/2019

Or. Dept: Council District 9
Doc. No.: 2212619

-PAGE 32 OF 32-



Passed by the Council of The City of San Diego on JAN 1 4 2020 , by the following vote:

Councilmembers Yeas Nays Not Present  Recused
Barbara Bry
Jennifer Campbell
Chris Ward
Monica Montgomery
Mark Kersey
Chris Cate
Scott Sherman

Vivian Moreno

NNOONNN NS
ODOoONNOOO OO
o e
O e f s e o

Georgette Gomez

Date of final passage JAN 2 8 2020
S KEVIN L. FAULCONER
AUTHENTICATED BY: - Mayor of The City of San Diego, California.
) ) AIZABETH S. MALAND

(Seal) - - ' City Clerk e City of San Diego, California.

By / , Deputy
| HEREBY CERTIFY that the foregoing ordinance was not finally passed until twelve calendar

days had elapsed between the day of its introduction and the day of its final passage, to wit, on

DEC 102019 , and on JAN 3 8 2020

| FURTHER CERTIFY that said ordinance was read in full prior to passage or that such
reading was dispensed with by a vote of five members of the Council, and that a written copy of
the ordinance was made available to each member of the Council and the public prior to the day
of its passage. -

o ELIZABETH S. MALAND
(Seal) ... City Clerff of The City of San Diego, California.

, Deputy

Office of the City Clerk, San Diego, California

O.rdinance Number O- 21167 '




