
%

1

1

1

1

*

 

(O-2022-34 REV)

ORDINANCE NUMBER 0-

 

2

33

1

 

(NEW SERIES)

DATE OF FINAL PASSAGE

 

N

0

V

 

2

 

3

 

2

0

2

1

AN ORDINANCE AMENDING CHAPTER 12, ARTICLE 6,

DIVISION 2 OF THE SAN DIEGO MUNICIPAL CODE BY

AMENDING SECTIONS 126.0203 AND 126.0205; AMENDING

CHAPTER I 2, ARTICLE 6, DIVISION 7 BY AMENDING

SECTION 126.0704; AMENDING CHAPTER 12, ARTICLE 9,

DIVISION 7 BY AMENDING SECTIONS 129.0710 AND

129.0715; AMENDING CHAPTER 13, ARTICLE 1, DIVISION 2

BY AMENDING SECTION 131.0222; AMENDING CHAPTER

13, ARTICLE 1, DIVISION 3 BY AMENDING SECTION

131.0322; AMENDING CHAPTER 13, ARTICLE 1, DIVISION 4

BY AMENDING SECTION 131.0422; AMENDING CHAPTER

13, ARTICLE 1, DIVISION 5 BY AMENDING SECTION

131.0522; AMENDING CHAPTER 13, ARTICLE 1, DIVISION 6

BY AMENDING SECTION 131.0622; AMENDING CHAPTER

13, ARTICLE 1, DIVISION 7 BY AMENDING SECTION

131.0707; AMENDING CHAPTER 14, ARTICLE 1, DIVISION 6

BY AMENDING SECTION 141.0621 AND ADDING

SECTIONS 141.0628 AND 141.0629; AMENDING CHAPTER

14, ARTICLE 2, DIVISION 6 BY AMENDING SECTION

142.0640, ALL RELATED TO THE IMPLEMENTATION OF

THE "SPACES AS PLACES" PROGRAM TO ALLOW

INCREASED OUTDOOR BUSINESS OPERATIONS AND

CREATING AN ENHANCED EXPERIENCE FOR ACTIVE

TRANSPORTATION.

WHEREAS, in the Summer of 2020, the City Council approved emergency ordinances

allowing for temporary outdoor business operations as an emergency response to the COVID-19

pandemic (Emergency Outdoor Operations Regulations); and

WHEREAS, the Emergency Outdoor Operation Regulations allowed certain businesses

to conduct outdoor dining and other outdoor activities within the public right-of-way so dining

establishments could continue to operate when indoor operations were restricted due to public

health orders issued to protect public health; and

WHEREAS, while originally conceived as an emergency response to the pandemic, the

City wishes to make outdoor dining and other outdoor activities permanent; and

-PAGE 1 OF 48-



-2022-34 REV)

WHEREAS, the City's Planning Department has developed the "Spaces as Places"

initiative to provide permanent options for multiple outdoor activities, including dining and

recreation that simultaneously provide flexibility for business owners to use the public right-of-

way while contributing to the enjoyment of the public space for people with all abilities, and

increasing opportunities for a more enjoyable pedestrian travel; and

WHEREAS, Spaces as Places will allow some eating and drinking establishments to

operate indoors and outdoors, with outdoor dining representing an expansion of an eating and

drinking establishment's seating capacity to enhance the overall public experience within the

public right-of-way as well as allow for greater recreational use of the public right-of-way; and

WHEREAS, Emergency Outdoor Operations Regulations permits will not be issued in

zones where Spaces as Places is effective. In Coasta Zones where Spaces as Places is subject to

the approval ofthe California Coastal Commission and prior to the California Coastal

Commission's approval of this Ordinance, Emergency Outdoor Operations Regulations permits

will be required for applicable business operations while those Emergency Outdoor Operations

Regulations remain in effect. Should the Emergency Outdoor Operation Regulations expire prior

to the approval of this Ordinance by the California Coastal Commission, businesses within the

Coastal Zones will not be able to utilize these regulations until the California Coastal

Commission approves this Ordinance; and

WHEREAS, the City will require the payment of an Exclusive Use Fee in some instances

prior to issuance of a public right-of-way permit for creating outdoor spaces; and

WHEREAS, it is anticipated that Spaces as Places will transform streets into more

healthy, sustainable, and vibrant neighborhood components and strengthen the local economy;

NOW, THEREFORE,

-PAGE 2 OF 48-



(O-2022-34 REV)

BE IT ORDAINED, by the Council of the City of San Diego, as follows:

Section 1. 

That Chapter 12, Article 6, Division 2 of the San Diego Municipal Code is

amended by amending section 126.0203, and amending section 126.0205 to read as follows:

§126.0203

 

When a Neighborhood Use Permit Is Required

(a) An application for the following uses in certain zones may require a

Neighborhood Use Permit. To determine whether a Neighborhood Use

Permit is required in a particular zone, refer to the applicable Use

Regulation Table in Chapter 13:

Artisan Food and Beverage Producer through Sidewalk cafes that deviate

from the requirements of Section 141.0621(a) [No change in text.]

Signs with automatic changing copy

Active Sidewalks (under certain circumstances described in Section

141.0621(c))

Streetaries (under certain circumstances described in Section 141.0621(b))

Temporary construction storage yards located off-site through Wireless

communicationfacilities (under certain circumstances described in Section

141.0420) [No change in text.]

(b) [No change in text.]

-PAGE 3 OF 48-



(O-2022-34 REV)

§126.0205

 

Findings for Neighborhood Use Permit Approval

A Neighborhood Use Permit may be approved or conditionally approved only if

the decision maker makes the followingßndings:

(a) through (c) [No change in text.]

(d) Supplemental Findings - Streetaries and Active Sidewalks

A Neighborhood Use Permit required in accordance with Section

141.0621(b)(5) and 141.0621(c)(7) may be approved or conditionally

approved only if the decision maker makes the following supplemental

ßndings in addition to theßndings required in Section 126.0205(a):

(1) The proposed streetary or active sidewalk will not adversely

impact the use ofthepubüc right-oway by pedestrians or

bicyclists;

(2) The proposed streetaiy or active sidewalk is compatible with

adjacent existing, permitted, or planned land uses; and

(3) The proposed streetary or active sidewalk will enhance thepublic

right-ofway and encourage more pedestrian travel.

Section 2.

 

That Chapter 12, Article 6, Division 7 of the San Diego Municipal Code is

amended by amending section 126.0704 to read as follows:

§126.0704

 

Exemptions from a Coastal Development Permit

The following coastal development is exempt from the requirement to obtain a

Coastal Development Perm:

(a) through (i) [No change in text.]

-PAGE 4 OF 48-



-2022-34 REV)

) 

Outdoor dining on private property and promenades, streetaries, and active

sidewalks designed in accordance with the Land Development Code and

the Spaces as Places Design Manual.

Section 3. 

That Chapter 12, Article 9, Division 7 of the San Diego Municipal Code is

amended by amending sections 129.0710 and 129.0715 to read as follows:

§129.0710

 

How to Apply for a Public Right-of-Way Permit

An application for a Public Right-of-Way Permit shall be submitted in accordance

with Sections 112.0102 and 129.0105. The submittal requirements for Public

Right-ofWay Permits are listed in the Land Development Manual. A

developmentpermit is required prior to issuance of a Public Right-of-Way Permit

for the following:

(a) through (c) [No change in text.]

(d) Notwithstanding Sections 129.0710(a)-(c), a development permit is not

required prior to issuance of a Public Right-of-Way Permit for

placemaking or a recreational amenity in the pubi right-oway subject to

the following regulations. For purposes of Section 129.0710, a recreational

amenity is defined as any improvement that provides recreational value to

residents or visitors and that enhances the pedestrian or bicycle travel

experience.

(1) through (7) [No change in text.]

(8) Theplacemaking project shall not include commercial services,

retail, or assembly and entertainment uses as accessory uses. Ifa

placemaking project is located within 15 feet of 

a permitted eating

-PAGE 5 OF 48-



(O-2022-34 REV)

and drinking establishment, its use as a streetary in accordance with

Section 141.0621(b) shall be allowed.

(9) through (10) [No change in text.]

§129.0715

 

Encroachment Maintenance and Removal Agreement

(a) An Encroachment Maintenance and Removal Agreement is required for

any privately-owned and/or privately-maintained encroachment located in

the public right-of-way or n a public service easement subject to the

following:

(1) [No change in text.]

(2) The record owner or permit holder, as applicable, shall agree to

indemnify the City with an indemnification agreement satisfactory

to the City Manager and City Attorney. For streetaries and active

sidewalks allowed in accordance with Section 141.0621, the

indemnification shall include any claims, damages, or injuries that

occur to or within the streetary or active sidewalk area against the

City or any utility provider whose facilities are located within the

public right-of-way.

(3) The record owner orpermit holder, as applicable, shall agree to

and shall remove or relocate the encroachment to the satisfaction

of the City Engineer within 30 days after notice by the City

Engineer, or the City Engineer may cause such work to be done,

and the costs thereof shall be a lien upon said land, or the record

owner orpermü holder, as applicable, shall agree to an equivalent

-PAGE 6 OF 48-



(O-2022-34 REV)

to the requirement for removal as determined by the City Engineer.

The record owner orpermit holder, as applicable, may also be

required to remove a streetary to the satisfaction ofthe City

Engineer at no cost to the City or any other utility provider that

owns or maintains facilities within the pubic right-oway to avoid

flooding or to protect public health and welfare. The record owner

orpermit holder, as applicable, may also be required to remove a

streetary to provide non-emergency access to any utility provider

that owns or maintains facilities located within thepubc nght-€/

way with 30 days notice. Active sidewalks allowed in accordance

with Section 141.0621 shall not be required to be removed by the

record owner or permit holder, as appicable.

(4) through (5) [No change in text.]

(6) Except as provided in Section 129.0715(a)(7), the record owner or

permit holder, as applicable, shall maintain a minimum policy of

 

at

least $1 million liability insurance, satisfactory to the City

Engineer, to protect the City from any potential claims which may

arise from the encroachment.

(7) through (11) [No change in text.]

(b) The Encroachment Maintenance and Removal Agreement shall be

recorded in the Office of the County Recorder. However, a record owner

or permit holder, as applicable, shall record in the Office of the County

Recorder any Encroachment Maintenance and Removal Agreement for a

-PAGE 7 OF 48-



(O-2022-34 REV)

streetary and active sidewalk allowed in Section 141.0621 and a

promenade allowed in Section 141.0629.

Section 4. 

That Chapter 13, Article 1, Division 2 of the San Diego Municipal Code is

amended by amending section 131.0222 to read as follows:

§131.0222

 

Use Regulations Table for Open Space Zones

The uses allowed in the open space zones are shown in Table 131-02B.

Legend for Table 131-02B

[No change in text.]

Table 131-02B

Use Regulations Table for Open Space Zones

Use Categories/Subcategories

 

Zone

 

Zones

[See Section 131.0112 for an explanation and

 

Designator

descriptions ofthe Use Categories, Subcategories '

 1 st & 2nd >>

 OP-

 OC-

 

O()- OF( )-

and Separately Regulated Uses]

3rd >> 1- 2- 1- 1- 1-

4th » 1 1 1 1 2 1

Open Space through Separately Regulated Institutional Uses -

Placemaking on Private Property [No change in text.]

Outdoor Dining on Private Property

[No change in text.]

Separately Regulated Institutional Uses - Satellite Antennas through

Separately Regulated Commercial Service Uses - Recycling

Facilities: [No change in text.1

Sidewalk Cafes, Streetaries, and Active Sidewalks

[No change in text.]

Sports Arenas & Stadiums through Signs [No change in

text.]

[No change in text.]

Section 5. 

That Chapter 13, Article 1, Division 3 of the San Diego Municipal Code is

amended by amending section 131.0322 to read as follows:

§131.0322

 

Use Regulations Table for Agricultural Zones

The uses allowed in the agricultural zones are shown in Table 131-03B.

-PAGE 8 OF 48-



(O-2022-34 REV)

Legend for Table 131-03B

[No change in text.]

Table 131-03B

Use Regulations Table for Agricultural Zones

Use Categories/Subcategories

 

Zone Zones

[See 

Sect

ion 

131.0

112 f

or an

 expla

natio

n and

 Des

igna

tor

descriptions of the Use Categories,

Subcategories, and Separately Regulated

 

1 st & 2nd AG AR

Uses] >>

3rd >> 1- 1-

4th » 1 2 1 2

Open Space through Separately Regulated Institutional Uses -

 

[No change in text.]

Placemaking on Private Property [No change in text.]

Outdoor Dining on Private Property

Separately Regulated Institutional Uses - Satellite Antennas

through Separately Regulated Commercial Service Uses -

Recycling Facilities: [No change in text.]

[No change in text.]

Sidewalk Cafes, Streetaries, and Active Sidewalks

Sports Arenas & Stadiums through Signs [No change in

text.]

[No change in text.]

[No change in text]

Section 6.

 

That Chapter 13, Article 1, Division 4 of the San Diego Municipal Code is

amended by amending section 131.0422 to read as follows:

§131.0422

 

Use Regulations Table for Residential Zones

The uses allowed in the residential zones are shown in the Table 131-04B.

Legend for Table 131-04B

[No change in text.]

-PAGE 9 OF 48-



-2022-34 REV)

Table 131-04B

Use Regulations Table for Residential Zones

Use Categories/

 

Zone

 

Zones

Subcategories

 

Designato

[S

ee S

ectio

n 131.0

1

12

 for 

1 st &

 2

n

d

>

> R

E

-

 RS-

 RX- RT-

an explanation and

3rd>> 1- 1- 1- 1-

descriptions of the Use

Categories, Subcategories,

 

4th>>1 2312

3456789

1011121314 1 2 12345

and Separately Regulated

U

s

e

s

l

Open Space through Separately

Regulated Institutional Uses -

Placemaking on Private Property [No

change in text.]

Outdoor Dining on Private Property

[No change in text.]

Separately Regulated Institutional

Uses - Satellite Antennas through

Separately Regulated Commercial

Service Uses - Recycling Facilities

[No change in text.]

[No change in text.]

Sidewalk Cafes, Streetaries, and

Active Sidewalks

Sports Arenas & Stadiums through

Sins [No change in text.1

[No change in text.]

Use Categories/

 

Zone 

Zones

Subcategories

 

Designator

[See Section 131.0112 for

 

1 st & 2nd >> 

RM-

an explanation and

descriptions of the Use

 

3rd >> 1- 2- 3- 4- 5-

Categories, Subcategories,

4th >> 1 2 3 4 5 6 7 8

 9 10 11 12

and Separately Regulated

Uses]

Open Space through Separately

Regulated Institutional Uses -

Placenaking on Private Property [No

change in text.]

Outdoor Dining on Private Property

Separately Regulated Institutional Uses -

Sateite Antennas through Separately

Regulated Commercial Service Uses -

[No change in text.]

-

[No change in text.]

-PAGE 10 OF 48-



(O-2022-34 REV)

Recycling Facilities [No change in text.]

Sidewalk Cafes, Streetaries, and Active

Sidewalks

Sports Arenas & Stadiums through

Signs [No change in text.]

[No change in text.]

Section 7.

 

That Chapter 13, Article 1, Division 5 of the San Diego Municipal Code is

amended by amending section 131.0522 to read as follows:

§131.0522

 

Use Regulations Table for Commercial Zones

The uses allowed in the commercial zones are shown in Table 131-05B.

Legend for Table 131-05B

[No change in text.]

Table 131-05B

Use Regulations Table for Commercial Zones

Use Categories/Subcategories

 

Zone 

Zones

D

esignator

[See Section 131.0112 for an

 lst & 2n

explanation and descriptions of >>

 CN.

 

C

R

-

 CO-

 

C

V

- 

C

P-

the Use Categories, 

3rd>> 1- 1- 2- 1-

 2- 3- 1- 1-

Subcategories, and Separately 123456 1 1 1 21 2 123 12 1

4th >>

Regulated Usesl

Open Space through Separately Regulated

 

[No change in text.]

Institutional Uses - Placemaking on Private

Property [No change in text.]

Outdoor Dining on Private Property 

L L L L L  L L

Separately Regulated Institutional Uses -

Sateite ntennas through Separately Regulated

Commercial Service Uses - Recycling Facilities

[No change in text.I

Sidewalk Cafes, Streetaries, and Active

Sidewalks

[No change in text.]

Sports Arenas & Stadiums through Signs

[No change in text.]

[No change in text.]

-PAGE 11 OF 48-



-2022-34 REV)

Use Categories/Subcategories

 Zone

 Zones

[See Section 131.0112 for an

 

Designator

explanation and descriptions of

 1 st & 2nd >>

 CC-

the Use Categories,

 

3rd>> 1- 2- 3- 4- 5-

Subcategories, and Separately

Regulated Uses]

 4th >>

 

12312345 45678 9123456123 45 6

Open Space through Separately Regulated 

Institutional Uses -Placemaking on Private Property 

[No change in text.]

[No change in text]

Outdoor Dining on Private Property : L L L L L

Separately Regulated Institutional Uses - 

Satelite Antennas through Separately Regulated i

Commercial Service Uses - Recycling Facilities 

[No change in text.1 i

Sidewalk Cafes, Streetaries, and Active

Sidewalks

Sports Arenas & Stadiums through Signs [No 

change in text.] 

[No change in text.]

[No change in text.]

Section 8. 

That Chapter 13, Article 1, Division 6 of the San Diego Municipal Code is

amended by amending section 131.0622 to read as follows:

§131.0622

 

Use Regulations Table for Industrial Zones

The uses allowed in the industrial zones are shown in Table 131-06B.

Legend for Table 131-06B

[No change in text]

-PAGE 12 OF 48-



(O-2022-34 REV)

Table 131-06B

Use Regu

lations Ta

ble fo

r Indu

strial Zo

nes

Use Ca

tego

ries/ 

Subc

ateg

ories

[See Section 131.0112 for an

explanation and descriptions ofthe

Use Catego

ries, Subc

ategories, 

and

Separately Regulated Uses]

Zon Zones

Designator

Ist & 2nd>> IP- IL- IH- IS- IBT-

3rd>: 1- 2- 3- 1- 2- 3-

 1- 2- 1- 1-

4th » 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1

Open Space through Separately Regulated

Institutional Uses - Placemaking on Private

 

[No change in text.]

Property

 [No ch

ange in text.]

Outdo

or Din

ing on P

rivate

 Prop

erty

 - L - L L L - L L L

Separately Regulated Institutional Uses -

Satellite An

tennas hro

ugh Separate

y

Regulated

 Commerc

ial Seice

 Uses -

Rec

yclin

g Fa

cilit

ies 

[No

 chan

ge i

n text

.]

Sidewalk Ca

fes, Streeta

ries, and

 Active

Sidewalks

Sports Arenas & Stadiums through

Signs [No change in text.]

[No change in text.]

[No change in text.]

Section 9. 

That Chapter 13, Article 1, Division 7 of the San Diego Municipal Code is

amended by amen

ding section 131.0

707 to read as

 follows:

§131.0707

 

Use Regulations Table for Mixed-Use Zones

The uses allowed in the mixed-use zones are shown in Table 131-07A.

Legend for Table 131-07A

[No change in text.]

-PAGE 13 OF 48-



(O-2022-34 REV)

Table 131-07A

Use Regulations Table for Mixed-Use Zones

Use Categories/Subcategories

 Zone

 

Zones

Designator

[See Section 131.0112 for an

explanation and descriptions of the

 1 st >>

 RMX

 

E

M

X

Use Categories, Subcategories, and

Separately Regulated Uses]

 

2nd >>  2 3 1 2 3

Open Space through Separately Regulated

 

[No change in text.]

Institutional Uses - Placemaking on Private

Property [No change in text.]

Outdoor Dining on Private Property L L L L L L

Separa

tely R

egulate

d Insti

tutiona

l Uses -

Satellite Antennas through Separately

Regulated Commercial Service Uses -

Recycling Facilities No change in text.1

Sidewalk Cafes, Streetaries, and Active

Sidewalks

Sports Arenas & Stadiums through Signs

[No change in text.1

[No change in text.]

[No change in text.]

Section 10. 

That Chapter 14, Article 1, Division 6 of the San Diego Municipal Code is

amended by amending section 141.0621 and adding sections 141.0628 and 141.0629 to read as

follows:

§141.0621

 

Sidewalk Cafes, Streetaries, and Active Sidewalks

The sidewalk cafes, streetaries, and active sidewalks regulations establish

requirements for outdoor dining and other uses located within thepublic right-qf

way. For the purposes of this Section, sidewalk cafes are defined as outdoor

dining spaces located within the sidewalk area of thepubc right-ofway 

that are

associated with adjacent eating and drinking establishments; streetaries are

defined as outdoor spaces located in a street space formerly dedicated to parking

spaces that serves as an extension of an eating and drinking establishment; and

-PAGE 14 OF 48-



(O-2022-34 REV)

active sidewalks are defined as the permanent extension of the curb into the

pubic right-fway to facilitate activation of thepubh-e right-ofway through

recreational amenities, landscaped areas, seating areas, farmers market, artworks

or outdoor dining. Sidewalk cafes, streetaries, and active sidewalks are permitted

as a limited use in the zones indicated with an "L" in the Use Regulations Tables

in Chapter 13, Article 1 (Base Zones) subject to the following regulations. It is not

the intent of this Section to regulate outdoor eating and drinking establishment

areas that are located on private property.

(a) 

Limited Use Regulations for Sidewalk Cafes

(1) Design requirements

(A) A sidewalk cafe shall be located within the sidewalk area

adjacent to a street-level eating and drinking establishment.

(B) through (J) [No change in text.]

(K) Lighting fixtures may be permanently affixed to the front

of the associated eating and drinldng establishment but

shall not protrude into the pedestrian path.

(L) The name and type of establishment may be placed on

umbrellas or on the valance of an awning with an overhang

not lower than 84 inches from the finished grade of the

sidewalk. Other signs are not permitted on a sidewalk cafe.

(M)

 

[No change in text.]

(2) through (3) [No change in text.]

-PAGE 15 OF 48-



(O-2022-34 REV)

(4) A Process Two Neighborhood Use Permit may be requested in

accordance with Section 126.0203 to deviate from the

requirements in Section 141.0621(a) as follows:

(A) The applicant shall identify any requirement in Section

141.0621(a) where a deviation is being requested and shall

specify why the deviation is needed.

(B) The decision maker will evaluate the request in accordance

with the adopted land use plan and Land Development

Manual to determine if a sidewalk cafe with the proposed

deviation is a suitable use for the proposed site and will not

infringe on use of thepublic right-ofway by pedestrians. In

making the determination the decision maker shall

consider the following:

(i) The width of the sidewalk;

(ii) The design and relationship of the sidewalk cafe to

other existing or planned uses in the vicinity;

(iii)

 

The amount of pedestrian use and the impact of 

the

sidewalk cafe's location on pedestrian activity; and

(iv) The sidewalk cafe's ability to fit the character of the

area create an outdoor pedestrian plaza, intensify

pedestrian activity, and make the street activity

more attractive.

(b) Limited Use Regulations for Streetaries

-PAGE 16 OF 48-



(O-2022-34 REV)

(1) Location Requirements:

(A) Streetaries shall be located adjacent to eating and drinking

establishments at the following locations:

(i) Within the curb lane on streets where on-street

metered or unmetered parking spaces exist adjacent

to the front of the eating and drinking

establishment, or along an adjacent neighboring on-

street metered or unmetered parking spaces with the

written permission from the adjacent property

owner stating the permission is valid for the term of

the Encroachment Maintenance and Removal

Agreement.

(ii) At least 20 feet away from an intersection, steet

corner, aley or a driveway; and

(iii)

 

Along curbs painted yellow, or green, or non-

painted curbs or motorcycle parking areas.

(B) Streetaries shall not be allowed at the following locations:

(i) Along a street segment with a speed limit greater

than 30 miles per hour.

(ii) Along a street with a street classified as major or

greater.

(iii)

 

Along a curb painted red white, or blue.

(iv)

 

Within or adjacent to an alley.

-PAGE 17 OF 48-



(O-2022-34 REV)

(v) Adjacent to a Metropolitan Transit System (MTS)

stop or a bus lane.

(Vi)

 

Within an existing bike lane or within a proposed

bike lane project identified in any comprehensive

bicycle plan or adopted land use plan.

(vii) Within 5 feet of storm drain inlets or cleanouts.

(viíi) Over utility access panels, manhole covers,

handholes, transformers, water meters or water

valves.

(ix)

 

Within 5 feet of a fire hydrant and any emergency

equipment.

(x) Within 5 feet of any natural gas or electric utility

facility, including the perimeter of any manholes,

handholes or vaults, and any surface-level

stctures such as natural gas meters, monitors,

pressure regulators, protection stations, poles,

curbside electric meters, transformers or green

utility boxes.

(2) Permit Requirements

(A)

 

Prior to installation of any furniture or improvements in the

pubüc right-ofway and prior to operation of a streetary, an

appicant shall obtain a Public Right-of-Way Permit in

accordance with Section 129.0710(d) and an Encroachment

-PAGE 18 OF 48-



(O-2022-34 REV)

Maintenance and Removal Agreement in accordance with

Section 129.0715. Violations ofa Public Right-of-Way

Permit shall be subject to the permit revocation procedures

set forth in Chapter 12, Article 1, Division 3.

(B) The Public Right-of-Way Permit for streetaries shall be

limited to a maximum two-year term period, after which a

new application may be submitted in accordance with

Section 141.0621(b).

(C) Removal of parking spaces, with the exception of

accessible parking spaces in accordance with Title 24 of the

California Code of Regulations (California Building

Standards Code), shall not be the basis of denial of a Public

Right-of-Way Permit for a streetary.

(D) The dimensions of a streetary shall be delineated on a site

plan and documented in the associated Public Right-of-

Way Permit.

(E) Prior to the issuance of a Public Right-of-Way Permit for a

streetary, the applicant shall pay a fee for the use of and

operation within thepublic nght-ofway, as adopted by San

Diego City Council Resolution.

(F) A streetary is subject to Development Impact Fees in

accordance with Section 142.0640(b)(6).

-PAGE 19 OF 48-



(O-2022-34 REV)

(G) Prior to issuance of a Public Right-of-Way Permit for a

streetary, the appicant shall provide evidence of general

liability insurance naming the City of San Diego as

additional insured, which shall remain in effect during the

operation of the streetary.

(H)

 

Alcohol, food, or beverages shall not be served or allowed

within the streetary before 7:00 a.m. and after 10:00 p.m.

Sunday through Thursday, and before 7:00 a.m. and after

11:00 p.m. Friday through Saturday or the day prior to a

City Holiday.

(I) Streetaries located within 150 feet of an adjacent residential

use shall not serve or allow alcohol, food or beverages

within the streetary before 7:00 a.m. and after 9:00 p.m.

Sunday through Thursday, and before 7

:00 a.m. and after

10:00 p.m. Friday through Saturday.

(J) Streetaries shall comply with all State of Cali fomia

Department of Alcoholic Beverage Control license

requirements, as applicable.

(K)

 

Smoking and vaping shall not be permitted within the

streetary. For purposes of this Section, the terms smoke,

smoking vape, and vaping have the same meanings as set

forth in San Diego Municipal Code Section 43.1001.

-PAGE 20 OF 48-



(O-2022-34 REV)

(L) Live entertainment is not permitted within a streetary

unless a Conditional Use Permit is granted in accordance

with Process Three and the Conditional Use Permit is in

accordance with the provisions of Chapter 3, Article 3,

Division 15. The Public Right-of-Way Permit holder for

the streetary shall provide a noise impact analysis to the

City for consideration before approval of the Conditional

Use Permit. The noise impact analysis shall be prepared by

a qualified acoustical engineer and shall evaluate noise and

vibration impacts to the surrounding neighborhood. A

Conditional Use Permit shall not be granted for live

entertainment before 8:00 a.m. and after 9:00 p.m. Sunday

through Thursday, and before 9:00 a.m. and after 10:00

p.m. Friday through Saturday.

(M)

 

Outdoor cooking and food preparation within the streetary

is prohibited.

(N)

 

Noise levels within the streetary shall comply with the

sound level limits of the adjacent use of the eating or

drinking establishment in accordance with Chapter 5,

Article 9.5, Division 4.

(O) The Gaslamp Quarter Planned District Design Guidelines

shall apply to streetaries located within the Gaslamp

Quarter Planned District.

-PAGE 21 OF 48-



(O-2022-34 REV)

(P) The Public Right-of-Way Permitpennit holder shall be

responsible for maintaining the streetary. Maintenance shall

include posting of the name, phone number, and email

address of the person responsible for the streetary in a

location visible from thepubic right-oway, keeping the

streetary free of litter, and preventing litter attributable to

the streetary from entering adjacent properties within the

public right-of-way.

(Q) Streetaries shall remain open to public during all non-

operational hours.

(3) Design Requirements

Streetaries shall be designed in accordance with the Spaces as

Places Design Manual and meet the following regulations

 to the

satisfaction of the City Engineer:

(A) Streetaries shall be designed as an extension of

 the

sidewalk with at least one minimum 48 inches wide entry

for every 10 feet of streetary along the curbside edge.

(B) The width of the streetary shall not extend within 2 feet of

the edge of the street travel lane.

(C) A streetary shall provide a setback of at least 4 feet from

adjacent vehicle parking spaces.

(D) The deck of the streetary platform shall be flush with the

sidewalk.

-PAGE 22 OF 48-



(O-2022-34 REV)

(E) Bolting into the street or penetrating into the surface of the

road shall not be permitted.

(F) A minimum 36 inches wide emergency access gap with

horizontal and vertical clearance shall be required for every

20 feet o

f the str

eetary or

 adjacent s

treetaries

 or othe

r

structures in the parking lane.

(G) The accessible path of travel through the streetary shall be a

paved sidewalk that is at least 5 feet wide, the width

identified in the applicable adopted land use plan, or the

width required by the applicable zone or planned district,

whichever width is greater.

(H) Drainage

(i) Streetaries shall not impede the flow of curbside

drainage.

(ii) An 8 inch by 6 inch minimum clear gutter space

shall be provided along the entire length of the

streetary adjacent to the curb.

(iii)

 

The appicant shall ensure that the drainage area

between the curb and the platform remains clear of

debris and proper drainage occurs at all times.

(I) A 42 inch high railing shall be placed at the edge of the

streetary to serve as a barrier from vehicular traffic.

-PAGE 23 OF 48-



(O-20

22-34

 RE

V)

(J) No horizontal or vertical structure shall be placed above 42

inches from the surface of the streetary except for

stanchions needed to provide lighting.

(K) Umbrellas with an overhang of a minimum of 84 inches

from the finished grade of the sidewalk may be used in

conjunction w

ith a streetary

, but no permanent

 roof

 or

shelter is permitted over the streetary. The canopy of the

umbrella shall be contained within the streetary and shall

not protrude into

 the sidewalk, ad

jacent park

ing space

s,

adjacen

t street

aries o

r the tr

avel or b

ike lan

e.

(J) Solar powered lights shall be permitted but electrical

lighting elements that contain wires that cross the clear path

of travel shall not be permitted.

(K) The placement of the name and type of establishment on

umbrellas is

 allowed. Othe

r signs shall

 not be pe

rmitted

 on

a streetary.

(L) Streetaries shall be designed in accordance with the Spaces

as Places Design Manual.

(M)

 

The Gaslamp Quarter Planned District Design Guidelines

shall apply to streetaries located within the Gaslamp

Quarter Planned District.

(4) Accessibility

(A) Accessible Path of Travel

-PAGE 24 OF 48-



(O-2022-34 REV)

(i) An accessible path of travel shall connect the

sidewalk to the accessible entry, deck surface,

wheelchair turning space, and wheelchair resting

space.

(ii) The accessible

 path of

 travel shal

l be a mi

nimum of

60 inches wide on the sidewalk and shall not pass

over tree wells.

(iii)

 

The accessible path of travel shall be free of

obstruction and protruding objects.

(B) Accessib

le Deck 

Surface

(i) The accessible path of travel on the deck surface

shall be a minimum of 44 inches wide.

(ii) The portion oft

he streetary dec

k connected b

y the

accessible path of travel to the wheelchair turning

space and wheelchair resting space shall be level.

(iii)

 

The accessi

ble deck su

rface maximu

m cross slope

(perpendicular to the sidewalk or curb) and the

maximum running slop

e (parallel to 

the curb) sh

all

not exceed 2 percent.

(

i

v

)

 

The su

rface

 of the ac

cessib

le route

, clearf

loor

spaces, and turning spaces shall be firm, stable, and

slip resistant.

-PAGE 25 OF 48-



(O-20

22-34

 REV

)

(v) Openin

gs inßoo

r or dec

k surfaces

 shall n

ot allow

the

 passa

ge of a

 spher

e mor

e than

 half an

 inch

 in

diam

eter. E

long

ated o

penin

gs 

shall be

 pla

ced so 

that

the 

long 

dime

nsion 

is pe

rpend

icula

r to t

he do

mina

nt

direction oftravel.

(C) A clea

r area o

f 60 i

nches i

n diam

eter lo

cated 

entirely w

ithin

the str

eetary 

shall

 be pro

vided

 for w

heelch

air tur

ning w

ith a

maxim

um over

lap of 

12 in

ches o

n the c

urb a

nd sid

ewalk

.

(D) A clear

foor

areao

f 36 i

nche

s by 4

8 inc

he

s shall 

be

prov

ide

d fo

r w

hee

lcha

ir res

ting

 spac

e w

ith a

 maxi

mum

over

lap of

 24 in

ches w

ith the

 whe

elchai

r turn

ing spa

ce in

any 

orien

tatio

n.

(E) The w

heelch

air res

ting sp

ace

 sha

ll pro

vide

 shou

lder-to-

shou

lder alig

nment ad

jacent to

 one side 

of

 

the fixed 

seat to

serve a

s wheelch

air user 

compan

ion 

seating

.

(F) 

A min

imum

 head

 heig

ht cle

aran

ce of

 

84 i

nches

 from

 the

finish

ed grad

e of

 the

 street

ary

 is req

uired

 at all

 times

.

(G)

 

Equ

ival

ent

 Fac

iliti

es

(i) Where 

tables, co

unters, or

 drink r

ails are pro

vided,

at leas

t one 

of each featu

re shall 

be wh

eelchai

r

accessible.

-PAGE 26 OF 48-



(O-2022-34 REV)

(ii) The top surface height of wheelchair accessible

tables, counters and or drink rails shall be 28

 inches

to 34 inches above the deck surface.

(iii)

 

Wheelchair accessible tables and counters shall be

approachable from the front and provide an

unobstructed knee clearance that is at least 27

inches high, 30 inches wide, and 19 inches deep.

v)

 

When movable tables are provided in lieu of fixed

tables, at least one of the movable tables shall be

accessible.

(v) Where drink rails are provided, a 60 inch long

portion of a drink rail shall have 36 inch wide and

level space adjacent to it for a side-approach by a

wheelchair user.

(H) Terraced or Multi-Level Streetaries

(i) Streetaries on streets with grades that exceed 5

percent may construct a terraced streetary with two

or more decks.

(ii) At least one ofthe terraces shall be wheelchair

accessible and provide equivalent seating, tables,

and countertop facilities to those found in other

terraces.

-PAGE 27 OF 48-



(O-2022-34 REV)

(iii)

 

The wh

eelcha

ir access

ible ter

race sha

ll prov

ide a

wheelc

hair acc

essib

le en

try f

rom the s

idewalk

.

(iv) The whe

elchair

 access

ible ent

ry shall i

nclude

 a

stncture on the sidewalk within the sidewalk

furnish

ing zone

 that pro

vides a 

transition

 betw

een

the sidewalk and streetary deck.

(v) Passage

 between

 terrace

 levels sha

ll prov

ide a

 ramp

with a runn

ing slope not 

to exceed 5

%.

(Vi)

 

Any step or 

stair shall conta

in a warning 

strip at the

nose

 of the s

tep an

d han

drail

s in ac

cord

ance

 wi

th

the Califo

rnia Bui

lding Co

de.

(5) Deviation Process

A deviatio

n from the requi

rements

 in Sectio

n 141.0621(b) m

ay be

permitt

ed wit

h a Neig

hborho

od U

se Perm

it decid

ed in

 accord

ance

with Process Two, as follows:

(A) The app

licant 

shall ide

ntify any 

require

ment in 

Section

141.06

21(b) wh

ere a 

deviat

ion is

 being 

reque

sted a

nd 

shall

spe

cify

 why

 the 

devi

ation 

is n

ece

ssary

.

(3) Deviation

s related 

to the fo

llowing 

shall not 

be grante

d:

(i) 

Additi

on of an ov

erhead s

tructu

re;

(ii) Storm water requirements;

(iii)

 

Hours ofoperation;

(iv) Engineering standards; and

-PAGE 28 OF 48-



(O-20

22-34 

REV)

(v) Accessibility requirements.

(c) Limited U

se Re

gulations fo

r Active 

Sidew

alks

(1) Location

 Requirem

ent:

(A) Active 

sidewalk

s shall b

e locate

d alon

g the c

urbside 

on

streets wher

e metered or 

unmetered

 parking exis

ts.

(B) Active

 sidewalks shall

 be locat

ed only

 on

 streets wi

th a

curb-to-

curb wid

th suffi

cient to 

accommo

date a

 Class IV

bicycle lane a

fter installation of the acti

ve sidew

alk.

(C) Active si

dewalk

s shall meet

 the loca

tional r

equirement

 to

the s

atisfa

ction o

f the Ci

ty Eng

ineer

 to en

sure pu

blic

 health

and safety.

(2) The fol

lowing

 uses shal

l be

 perm

itted w

ithin

 an act

ive sidew

alk:

(A) Recre

ationa

l amen

ities, in

cluding

 lands

caped 

and se

ating

areas,

 in ac

cordanc

e with Se

ction 1

29.07

10(d).

(B) 

rtwo

rk.

(C) Outdoor 

Dining in a

ccordan

ce with Se

ction 141.0621(c)(6).

(E) Farmers 

Markets 

in accor

dance wit

h Section 1

41.050

3.

(F) Other uses approved throu

gh a deviation in

 accordance

with 

Sec

tion 

141.06

21(c)

(7

(3) 

Perm

it Re

quire

men

ts:

(A) Prior to in

stallation 

of any furnit

ure or im

provement

s in th

e

public right-ow

ay and prior

 to operation 

of an active

sidewalk, th

e appliant shal

l obtain 

a Public Right-o

f-Way

-PAGE 29 OF 48-



(O-2022-34 REV)

Permit in 

accorda

nce wit

h Sectio

n 129.07

10(d) and

 an

Encroa

chm

ent Ma

intena

nce a

nd Rem

oval

 Agre

ement

 in

accord

ance

 with S

ectio

n 129

.0715

 to th

e sati

sfaction

 of the

City E

ngine

er. Vio

lation

s of

 a Pub

lic Righ

t-of-W

ay Pe

rmit

shall

 be sub

ject 

to the 

permit

 revo

cation 

procedu

res se

t

forth

 in

 Ch

apter

 12

, Art

icle 

1, Div

ision

 3.

(B) Remov

al of

 park

ing, w

ith th

e excep

tion o

f acc

essib

le

spaces

 in ac

cordan

ce wit

h Titl

e 24 o

fthe 

Califor

nia Cod

e

of Regu

lations (Ca

liforni

a Bui

lding

 Stan

dards Cod

e), s

hall

not be 

a bas

is of deni

al of

 a Pub

lic R

ight-

of-Way Pe

rmit f

or

an active sidewalk.

(C) 

Prior

 to issu

ance

 of a Pub

lic Rig

ht-of-W

ay Per

mit f

or an

active si

dewalk

, the a

pplicant sh

all prov

ide evid

ence o

f

gene

ral liab

ility 

insuran

ce nam

ing the 

City of

 San

 Diego 

as

additi

onal i

nsure

d, whic

h shall 

rem

ain in 

effect

 during

 the

ope

ration

 of the a

ctive 

side

walk.

()

 

Alcoho

l, food

, or bev

erages

 shall

 not be

 serve

d or all

owed

within 

the ac

tive si

dewalk

 bef

ore 7

:00 a

.m. an

d af

ter 1

0:00

p.m. Sund

ay thr

ough Thurs

day, be

fore 7

:00 a.m

. and 

after

11:00 p.m. Friday 

through S

aturday.

(E) Activ

e sidew

alks loc

ated w

ithin 1

50 feet

 of an adjac

ent

residen

tial use

 shall not

 serve or 

allow alcohol, foo

d or

beverag

es withi

n the ac

tive sidew

alk before 7

:00 a.m

. and

-PA

G

E 3

0 O

F 48

-



(O-2022-34 REV)

after 9:00 p.m. Sunday through Thursday, and before 7:00

a.m. and after 10:00 p.m. Friday through Saturday and the

day prior to a City Holiday.

(F) Live entertainment is not allowed within an active sidewalk

unless a Conditional Use Permit is granted in accordance

with Process Three and the Conditional Use Permit is in

accordance with the provisions of Chapter 3, Article 3,

Division 15. The Public Right-of-Way Permit permi

holder for the active sidewalk shall provide a noise impact

analysis to the City for consideration before approval of

 the

Conditional Use Permit. The noise impact analysis shall be

prepared by a qualified acoustical engineer and shall

evaluate noise and vibration impacts to the surrounding

neighborhood. A Conditional Use Permit shall not be

granted for live entertainment before 8:00 a.m. and after

9:00 p.m. Sunday through Thursday, and before 9:00 a.m.

and after 10:00 p.m. Friday through Saturday.

(G)

 

All programming along active sidewalks shall be in

accordance with the Special Events Ordinance, Chapter 2,

Article 2, Division 40.

(H) Smoking and vaping shall not be permitted within the active

sidewalk. For purposes of this Section the terms smoke,

-PAGE 31 OF 48-



(O

-20

2

2-3

4 R

EV

)

smok

ing, va

pe, an

d vapin

g have

 the sa

me m

eaning

s as in

San D

iego Mu

nicipal

 Code 

Section

 43.10

01.

(I) 

Activ

e sid

ewal

ks sha

ll co

mply

 with

 all S

tate of

 Cali

forni

a

Depar

tment

 of Alc

oholic B

everage

 Cont

rol licen

se

requirem

ents, a

s applicab

le.

(J) 

Activ

e sid

ewalk

s shal

l com

ply wi

th the 

sound 

level li

mits

of the adj

acent 

use i

n acc

ordanc

e w

ith C

hapter 

5, A

rticle

9.5, Division 4.

(K) The Pu

blic

 Right

-of-W

ay Per

mit perm

it holde

r sh

all be

respon

sible for

 mainta

ining the act

ive sidew

alk.

Main

tenan

ce sh

all in

clude, 

but no

t be li

mited t

o, po

sting o

f

the n

ame, p

hone 

numb

er, and

 emai

l addr

ess

 of t

he 

person

respo

nsible

 for the 

activ

e side

walk i

n a lo

catio

n visib

le

from the pub

lic righ

t-oway

, keeping

 the ac

tive side

walk

free of

 litter, 

and pr

eventi

ng litte

r attri

butabl

e to th

e activ

e

sidew

alk from ente

ring adj

acent pr

opertie

s an

d thep

ubüc

righ

t-of-

way

.

(4) 

Des

ign R

equir

eme

nts:

Acti

ve si

dewal

ks shall

 be des

igned

 in ac

cord

ance

 wi

th the

 Spac

es

as Plac

es De

sign M

anual 

and me

et the

 follow

ing regu

lations t

o the

sati

sfac

tio

n of

 the 

City

 En

gin

eer

:

(A) Perman

ent exp

ansion o

f the cu

rb line

 for an act

ive sid

ewalk

into t

he par

king

 lane s

tartin

g at the

 corne

r or

 in the 

middle

-PAGE 32 OF 48-



(O-2022-34 REV)

of the street shall be designed to the satisfaction ofthe City

Engineer.

3) The length of an active sidewalk shall be at least 54 feet.

(C) The design and placement of street furniture, trees, and

plantings on an active sidewalk shall not impede pedestrian

flow, or be placed within 10 feet from an intersection to

avoid interfering with visibility area, emergency

operations, or sight lines, to the satisfaction of the City

Engineer.

(D) The placement of the name and type of the associated

establishment on umbrellas shall be permitted. Other signs

shall not be permitted on an active sidewalk.

(E) Active sidewalks shall be designed in accordance with

current Storm Water standards.

(F) Active sidewalks shall be designed in accordance with the

Spaces as Places Design Manual, Street Design Manual,

and all applicable engineering standards.

(G) The Gaslamp Quarter Planned District Design Guidelines

shall apply to active sidewalks within the Gaslamp Quarter

Planned District.

(5) Active sidewalks shall comply with all State and Federal

accessibility requirements.

-PAGE 33 OF 48-



(O-20

22-34

 REV)

(6) The ex

clusive

 use of

 a portio

n of an active s

idewalk 

for

 outdo

or

dinin

g, in

cludin

g fix

ed or 

mov

eable

 furnit

ure 

placed

 closer 

to

 the

adja

cent 

eati

ng a

nd d

rink

ing 

estab

lishm

ent o

r clo

ser to 

the a

dja

cent

trav

el lan

e wit

hin

 the a

ctive

 side

walk,

 is a

llow

ed so

 long

 as:

(A) The access

ible path of

 travel is

 a paved

 sidewalk

 that is

 at

least

 5 feet

 wide,

 the w

idth id

enti

fied in

 the

 appli

cable

adopt

ed lan

d use pla

n, or t

he w

idth req

uired 

by th

e

applic

able z

one or 

plann

ed di

strict, w

hiche

ver wi

dth is

greater;

(B) 

42-inc

h-hig

h rail

ing 

is p

rov

ided a

long the ac

tive s

idewa

lk

facing

 the tra

vel l

ane wh

en se

ating f

or outd

oor

 din

ing i

s

place

d adja

cent to 

the st

reet

 trave

l lane;

(C) No horizontal or 

vertical structur

e is placed abov

e 42

inche

s from

 the

 surfa

ce oft

he act

ive si

dewal

k exc

ept fo

r

stanc

hions nee

ded to 

provide 

lightin

g; and

(D) The po

rtion o

fthe ac

tive sid

ewal

k used f

or outd

oor di

ning

remai

ns ope

n to p

ublic 

during

 all no

n-ope

ration

al ho

urs.

(7) Deviation Process

A devi

ation

 from

 the

 requi

remen

ts i

n Sect

ion 1

41.06

21(c)

 may

 be

permit

ted w

ith a N

eighb

orhood 

Use Per

mit dec

ided i

n acc

orda

nce

with

 Proc

ess Two

, as f

ollo

ws:

-PAGE 34 OF 48-



(O-2022-34 REV)

(A) The appcant shall identify any requirement in Section

141.0621(c) where a deviation is being requested and shall

specify why the deviation is necessary.

(B) Deviations related to the following shall not be granted:

(i) Addition of an overhead structure

(ii) Storm Water requirements;

(iii)

 

Hours of operation;

(iv)

 

Engineering standards; and

(v) 

Accessibility requirements.

§141.0628

 

Outdoor Dining on Private Property

The permanent use of a private property for outdoor dining is permitted as a

limited use in the zones indicated with an "L" in the Use Regulations Tables in

Chapter 13, Article 1 (Base Zones), subject to the following regulations:

(a) Permit Requirements:

(1) Written permission from the record owner of thepremises is

required.

(2) A Building Permit shall be obtained in accordance with Chapter

12, Article 9, Division 2.

(3) The Building Permit permit holder shall be responsible for

maintaining the outdoor dining area. Maintenance shall include

posting of the name, phone number, and email address of the party

responsible for the outdoor dining area in a location visible from

the public right-ofway, keeping the outdoor dining area free of

-PAGE 35 OF 48-



(O

-20

2

2-

34 

RE

V

)

litter

, and

 prev

entin

g litter

 attri

butab

le to

 the o

utdo

or di

ning a

rea

from

 ente

ring

 adjac

ent p

rope

rties,

 in a

eys,

 or w

ithi

n the

 pub

i

righ

t-of-

way

.

(4) The u

se of

 an alley

 for the 

purpose

s of ou

tdoo

r dining

 shall n

ot be

permitted.

(5) 

Remo

val 

of requ

ìred o-stre

et pa

rkin

g spa

ces o

napr

emise

s wh

ere

any 

porti

on of th

epre

mises

 is lo

cated

 with

in a 

transi

tprior

ity ar

ea,

with

 the e

xcept

ion of

 any

 existi

ng ac

cessi

ble 

space

s in

 acco

rdan

ce

with 

Title 24 of the Ca

liforni

a Cod

e of Regu

lation

s (Cal

iforni

a

Buildi

ng Sta

ndards C

ode), 

shall no

t be

 a ba

sis of

 deni

al of

 the

permit.

(6) The 

hours 

of opera

tion 

of the

 ou

tdoor 

dini

ng op

erati

ons s

hall 

be

limited 

to the

 hour

s that th

e kitche

n fac

ilitie

s of

the as

sociated

eatin

g an

d drin

king 

estab

lishm

ent ar

e op

en fo

r me

al or

derin

g.

Alcoh

ol, foo

d, or

 bevera

ges sh

all not b

e serv

ed or p

ermitted

 within

the ou

tdoor

 dining 

area be

fore 

7:00 a.

m. and 

after

 10:00 p

.m.

Sunda

y thro

ugh T

hursda

y, an

d befor

e 7:00 a

.m. an

d after 

11:00

p.m. Frida

y throu

gh Satur

day an

d the 

day pri

or to a

 City H

oliday

.

(7) 

Outdo

or di

ning l

ocated

 within 

150 fe

et of an

 adjac

ent

 resid

ential

use 

shall n

ot ser

ve o

r allo

w alcoh

ol, fo

od or be

verag

es w

ithin

 the

outdo

or dinin

g area 

befo

re 7:00 a

m and

 after

 9:00

 p.m. Sund

ay

throug

h Thur

sday, b

efore 7:00 

a.m. and 

after 1

0:00

 p.m. Fri

day

throu

gh Sat

urday.

-PA

GE

 36

 O

F 48

-



(O-20

22-34 

REV)

(8) Outdoor dining shall comply with the sound level limits of

 t

he

associated eating and drinking establishment in accordance with

Chapter 5, Article 9.5, Division 4.

(9) Live entertainment is not allowed within outdoor dining areas

unless a Conditional Use Permit is granted in accordance with

Process Three and provided that the Conditional Use Permit is in

accordance with the provisions of Chapter 3, Article 3, Division

15. The Building Permit permit holder for Outdoor Dining area

shall provide a noise impact analysis to the City for consideration

before approval of the Conditional Use Permit. The noise impact

analysis shall be prepared by a qualified acoustical engineer and

shall evaluate noise and vibration impacts to the surrounding

neighborhood. A Conditional Use Permit shall not be granted for

live entertainment before 8:00 a.m. and after 9:00 p.m. Sunday

through Thursday, and before 9:00 a.m. and after 10:00 p.m.

Friday through Saturday.

(b) Design Requirements:

(1) Outdoor dining on private property shall be delineated by a barrier

from the street parking spaces by a railing, fence, or a

combination of railing and fence, and planter boxes that are at least

3 feet in height. Solid walls are not permitted.

(A) The barrier may be either permanently installed or

moveable. If it is moveable, it shall be affixed to a sidewalk

-PAGE 37 OF 48-



(O-20

22-34 

REV)

while the eating and drinking establishment is open for

business.

(B) Awnings or umbrellas may be used in conjunction with an

area for eating 

and drinking but shall not be

 used as a

permanent roof or shelter over the area for eating and

d

rin

k

ing

.

(2) Outdoor dining on private property shall be designed and operated

so that it

 may be used by

 people o

f all abiliti

es by

 complyin

g with

all of the f

ollowi

ng:

(A) The surface of the outdoor dining area shall be level and

have a running slope and a cross slope that do not exceed 2

percent (1 unit vertical in 48 units horizontal).

(B) The outdoor dining area shall not be located on a raised

platform or in a sunken area, unless an accessible ramp is

provided in accordance with the California Building Code,

or the A

mericans with

 Disabiliti

es Act

, whicheve

r provi

des

gre

ate

r a

cce

ssi

bili

ty.

(C) At least one wheelchair accessible seating space shall be

provided for every 20 seats, or portion thereof.

(D) When mu

ltiple wh

eelchair a

ccessibl

e seati

ng spac

es are

provided, they shall be distributed and integrated within the

ou

tdo

or d

inin

g a

rea.

-PAGE 38 OF 48-



(O-2022-34 REV)

(E) Wheelchair accessib

le seating spac

es shall have a mi

nimum

unobstru

cted m

aneuvera

bility

 dimen

sion of

 30 inche

s in

width by 48 inches in depth.

(F) Access to de

signated whee

lchair seating sp

aces shall

 be

provided through

 an acce

ssible path with not le

ss than

 36

inches unobstructed width.

(3) Base Zone regula

tions for setbacks, a

nd minimum

 lot coverage,

and emergency a

ccess in accordan

ce with the

 California

 Fire Code

shall apply.

§141.0629

 Promenade

For the purpo

ses ofthi

s Section,

 a promenad

e is defined

 as the pa

rtial or co

mplete

street 

closure to v

ehicular 

trafic to 

facilita

te activ

e transp

ortation us

es 

such a

s

walking, bi

king, recre

ation, outd

oor dining, 

and enjoy

able publi

c interaction

.

Promenades 

enhance ped

estrian safe

ty, encourag

e non-mo

torized tran

sportation

and foster neighbo

rhood interaction an

d outdoor

 activities, increasing

 the

likelihood that more

 pedestrians will tra

vel by foot or bicyc

le. A promenade

initiated by the City s

hall not be subject to t

he additional

 requirements of this

Section.

(a) The following uses and othe

r similar use

s shall be perm

itted within a

promenade:

(1) Recreation

al amenit

ies in acco

rdance w

ith Sect

ion 129

.0710(d).

(2) Artworks.

(3) Outdoor Dining in accordance with Section 141.0621.

-PAGE 39 OF 48-



(O

-2

02

2-3

4 R

EV

)

(4) Farmers Markets in accordance with Section 141.0503.

(b) Permit Requirements:

(1)

 

The creation of a promenade 

may be initiated

 by any applican

t.

(A) For a promenade i

nitiated by

 a public agency,

 prior to

 the

installation of any

 furniture or impr

ovement

s in the

 pubic

right-ofway and prior to operation of a promenade, the

appicant shall o

btain a Public

 Right-of-Wa

y Permit in

accordance with Section 129.0710(d), and a plan for

maintenance shall be provided to the satisfaction of the

Transportation Director. Violations o f a Public Right-of-

Way Permit shall be subject to the permit revocation

proced

ures set 

forth in

 Chapter 12

, Articl

e 1, Divi

sion 3.

(B) For a promenade i

nitiated by

 a private applican

t prior to

the installation of any furniture or improvements in the

public right

-oway and prior to

 operation of 

a prome

nade,

the apph-cant shall obtain a Public Right-of-Way Permit in

accordance with Section 129.0710(d) and an Encroachment

Maintenance and Removal Agreement in accordance with

Section 129.0715. Violations of a Public Right-of-Way

Permit shall be subject to the permit revocation procedures

set forth in Chapter 12, Article 1, Division 3.

(C) For a pro

menade

 where

 the pubc

 right-of

way lies

 within

one ownership for the entirety of the promenade, the

-PAGE 40 OF 48-



(O-20

22-34

 REV)

appica

nt shall 

obtain a

public r

ight-ofw

ay v

acation

 in

accorda

nce wit

h Chapter 

12, Art

icle 5, Di

visio

n 9 prior to

installation of any fur

niture or imp

rovements in the

 pubüc

right-ofway and prior to operation of a promenade.

(2) Removal of parking, with the exception of accessible spaces in

accordance with

 Title 24 of the California

 Code ofRegula

tions

(California Build

ing Standards Code), shal

l not be a bas

is of 

denial

of the permit.

(3) Full access for emergency service vehicles shall be provided at all

times to ensure public health and safety to the satisfaction ofthe

City Engineer.

(4) All programming of activities within the promenade shall be in

accordance wit

h the Specia

l Events Ordina

nce, Chapter 2, 

Article

2, Division 40.

(5) Smoking and vaping shall not be permitted within the promenade.

For purposes ofthis Sec

tion the terms smoke,

 smoking vape, a

nd

vaping have the same meanings as set forth in San Diego

Municipal Code Section 43.1001.

(6) A promenade shall comply with all State of California Department

of Alcoholic Beverage Control license requirements, as applicable.

(7) The promenade sha

ll comply w

ith the sound

 level limits of

adjacent uses in accordance with Chapter 5, Article 9.5, Division 4.

-PAGE 41 OF 48-



(O-20

22-34 

REV)

(8) The Gasl

amp Quar

ter Planned

 District

 Design

 Guidelines

 shall

apply to a promen

ade located withi

n the Gaslamp Qu

arter Planned

District.

(9) The Pub

lic Right-of-

Way Pe

rmit permit

 hoWer

 shall be

 responsible

for maint

aining the prom

enade. Ma

intenance

 shall

 include, b

ut not

be limited to, pos

ting of the name, phone

 number, and e

mail

address of the person respon

sible for the p

romenade in a lo

cation

visible fro

m thepubüc

 right-ow

ay, keepi

ng the pro

menade

 area

free of litter, and preventing

 litter attributabl

e to the promenade

from entering adjacent 

properties within

 thepubh-c right-oway.

(c) Design requirements:

(1) The design and pla

cement of street fur

niture, trees, and pla

ntings

along a prome

nade shall not im

pede pede

strian flow.

(2) The placemen

t of the name and

 type of

 the associat

ed

establishm

ent on um

brellas sh

all be perm

itted. Oth

er signs s

hall

not be permitted on a promenade.

(3) The des

ign ofa pro

menade sh

all be in

 conforma

nce with

 current

Federal and State accessibility guidelines.

(4) The design of a promen

ade shall be i

n accordance wit

h current

storm water standards.

(5) Promenades shall b

e designed in ac

cordance with the

 Spaces as

Places Design Manual.

-PAGE 42 OF 48-



(O-20

22-34 R

EV)

(6) The Gaslamp Quarter Planned District Design Guidelines shall

apply to a promenade located within the Gaslamp Quarter Planned

District.

(d) Exclusive use of a section of the promenade for outdoor dining shall

comply with the following:

(1) Alcohol, food, or b

everages shall not b

e served or p

ermitted within

the promenade before 7:00 am. and after 10:00 p.m. Sunday

through Thursday, and before 7:00 a.m. and after 11:00 p.m.

Frid

ay t

hro

ugh 

Satu

rday

;

(2) Outdoor dining within 150 feet of an adjacent residential use shall

not serve or allow alcohol, food, or beverages within the

promenade befo

re 7:00 a.m. and after

 9:00 p.m. Sunday

 through

Thursday, and before 7:00 a.m. and after 10:00 p.m. Friday

through Saturday; and

(3) The portion of the promen

ade used for ou

tdoor dining remai

ns

open to public during all non-operational hours.

Section 11.

 

That Chapter 14, Article 2, Division 6 of the San Diego Municipal Code is

amended

 by amen

ding sec

tion 142

.0640 to

 read as fo

llows:

§142.0640

 

Impact Fees for Financing Public Facilities

(a) [No change in text.]

(b) Payment of Fees

Development Impact Fees (as defined in California Government Code

Section 66000) for applicable development shall be paid at the time

required building permit fees are paid and no later than the first inspection

-PAGE 43 OF 48-



(O-2022-34 REV)

of the developmen

t performed by the 

City in areas

 where Developme

nt

Impact Fees have been established by City Council resolution or

ordinance. Notwithstanding the above, th

e City Manager

 may also re

quire

the payment of Developme

nt Impact Fees 

for developmen

t that would

increase demand for p

ublic facilities an

d/or result in the

 need for new

public facilities, including outdoor dining. Development Impact Fees shall

not be required f

or inclusionary dwe

ing units provide

d pursuant

 to

Chapter 14, Article 

2, Division 13 if

 the appcant has sati

sfied all the

requirements

 of Division 13 

for inclusionary d

welling units on

 the same

premises as the ma

rket-rate dweing units. The Develop

ment Impact Fe

e

required by the City Manage

r shall be paid

 at the time

 required buildi

ng

permit fees are paid and no later than the first inspection of the

development performed by the City.

Exemptions:

(1) thr

oug

h (5

) [N

o ch

ange 

in te

xt.]

(6) For development of a streetary, in accordance with Section

141.0621, the DIFs shall be assessed at a rate of 1/15th of the

Development Impact Fees established by City Council resolution

or ordinance, and shall be collected every two years with the

issuance of the applicable Public Right of Way Permit.

(7) Active sidewalks developed in accordance with Section 141.0621

are exempt from DIFs.

Table 142-06A

-PAGE 44 OF 48-



(O-2022-34 REV)

[No change in text.]

(c) through (g) [No change in text.]

Section 12.

 

That prior to becoming effective, this Ordinance shall be submitted to the

San Diego County Regional Airport Authority (SDCRAA) for a consistency determination.

That if the SDCRAA finds this Ordinance consistent with the Airport Land Use Compatibility

Plans (ALUCP) for San Diego International Airport, Marine Corps Air Station Miramar,

Gillespie Field, Montgomery-Gibbs Executive Airport, and Brown Field Airport (collectively,

Airports), this Ordinance shall take effect and be in force on the thirtieth day from and after the

finding of consistency, or on the thirtieth day from and after its final passage, whichever is later,

except that the provisions of this Ordinance inside the Coastal Overlay Zone, which are subject

to California Coastal Commission jurisdiction as a City of San Diego Local Coastal Program

amendment, shall not take effect until the date the California Coastal Commission

unconditionally certifies those provisions as a local coastal program amendment.

That if the SDCRAA determines that this Ordinance is inconsistent or conditionally

consistent, subject to proposed modifications, with the ALUCPs for the Airports, the Ordinance

shall be 

submitt

ed to the

 City Co

uncil fo

r reconsider

ation.

That if the SDCRAA determines that this Ordinance is conditionally consistent with the

ALUCPs for the Airports, but that consistency is subject to proposed modifications, the City

Council may amend this Ordinance to accept the proposed modifications, and this Ordinance as

amended shall take effect and be in force on the thirtieth day from and after its final passage,

except that the provisions of this Ordinance as amended inside the Coastal Overlay Zone, which

are subject to California Coastal Commission jurisdiction as a City of San Diego Local Coastal

-PAGE 45 OF 48-



-2022-34 REV)

Progr

am amen

dmen

t shal

l not

 take e

ffect

 until 

the d

ate th

e Cali

fornia 

Coas

tal C

ommiss

ion

uncond

itionally

 certifies

 those p

rovisio

ns as a 

local coas

tal pro

gram amen

dment

That a p

roposed 

decisio

n by the

 City 

Council 

to ove

rrule a det

ermin

ation o

f

incons

istency 

or to re

ject th

e prop

osed mod

ificatio

ns for a f

inding 

of condit

ional co

nsisten

cy

shall in

clude t

he findi

ngs requir

ed pur

suant to

 Publ

ic Util

ities Co

de sect

ion 2167

0 and r

equire

 a

two-third

s vote. T

he propo

sed decis

ion and fin

dings shall

 be forwar

ded to

 the

 SDCRA

A, the

Califor

nia De

partmen

t of Transpo

rtation

, Divisio

n o f Aero

nautic

s, and t

he airpo

rt oper

ator

s for

the Airpo

rts. The C

ity Coun

cil shall ho

ld a seco

nd hearin

g not les

s than 45 d

ays fro

m the d

ate

the pro

posed d

ecision 

and find

ings were

 provid

ed at wh

ich hear

ing any

 comm

ents subm

itted by

the publi

c agenc

ies shall b

e considered a

nd a final

 decision

 to overru

le a dete

rmination

 of

inconsi

stency

 shall r

equire 

a two-

thirds vote.

That if the City

 Council mak

es a fina

l decision to

 overrule

 a detenni

nation of

inconsiste

ncy, this 

Ordinanc

e shall tak

e effect a

nd be in for

ce on the 

thirtieth day from

 and afte

r

that fin

al deci

sion, ex

cept tha

t the pr

ovisions of

this Or

dinanc

e in

side th

e Coa

stal Ov

erlay 

Zone,

which 

are su

bject to

 Califo

rnia Co

astal C

ommi

ssion juris

diction as 

a Ci

ty of Sa

n Die

go Lo

cal

Coastal P

rogram amendm

ent, shal

l not take

 effect un

til the d

ate the C

alifornia

 Coas

tal

Commis

sion uncon

ditionall

y certifie

s those 

provision

s as a lo

cal coa

stal prog

ram ame

ndment.

Section 13.

 

That no per

mits shall 

be issued

 for develop

ment tha

t is inconsisten

t with

the prov

isions of this O

rdinance

 unless a dee

med com

plete app

lication f

or such

 permits

 is

submit

ted to

 the Cit

y prior t

o the d

ate on whic

h the a

pplicab

le prov

isions of this

 Ordinan

ce

become 

effective. 

This Ord

inance con

tains a notic

e that a f

ull readi

ng of

 this Ordi

nance is

dispens

ed with

 prior t

o passa

ge, a wr

itten co

py hav

ing been

 avail

able to t

he Coun

cil and t

he

public

 prio

r to th

e day

 of its pas

sage

.

-PA

GE

 46 

OF

 4

8-



(O-2022-34 REV)

Section 14. 

That when this Ordinance goes into effect in a zone, no permits will be

issued under the authority of the Covid-19 related Emergency Outdoor Operation Regulations

within that zoe. Should the Emergency Outdoor Operation Regulations expire prior to the

approval of this Ordinance by the California Coastal Commission, businesses within the Coastal

Zones will not be able to utilize these regulations until the California Coastal Commission

app

rov

es th

is O

rdin

anc

e.

Section 15. 

That a full reading of this Ordinance is dispensed with prior to passage, a

written copy having been made available to the Council and the public prior to the day of its

passage.

APPROVED: MARA W. ELLIOTT, City Attorney

By

Noaí J. 

Deputy City Attot«

NJB:nja:jdf

08/19/2021

10/22/2021 COR. COPY

10/25/2021 COR. COPY 2

10/26/2021 REV. COPY

Or .Dept: Planning

Doc. No.: 2786778_5

-PAGE 47 OF 48-



(O-2022-34 REV)

I hereb

y certi

fy that th

e foreg

oing 

Ordina

nce w

as pa

ssed by 

the Cou

ncil

 of the City

 of

San 

Dieg

o, at

 this

 mee

ting 

of

 NOV O 9 2021

ELIZABETH S. MALAND

City Clerk 

/ Dèputy Ciy Clerk

App

rov

ed:

(date)

Vetoed:

D GLORI

(date)

 

TODD GLORIA, Mayor

-PAGE 48 OF 48-



(O-202

2-34 

REV)

STRIKEOUT ORDINANCE

OLD LANGUAGE: SqeOut

NEW LANGUAGE: Double Underline

ORDINANCE NUMBER O- 

(NEW SERIES)

DATE OF FINAL PASSAGE

AN ORDINANCE AMENDING CHAPTER 12, ARTICLE 6,

DIVISION 2 OF THE SAN DIEGO MUNICIPAL CODE BY

AMENDING SECTIONS 126.0203 AND 126.0205; AMENDING

CHAPTER 12, ARTICLE 6, DIVISION 7 BY AMENDING

SECTION 126.0704; AMENDING CHAPTER 12, ARTICLE 9,

DIVISION 7 BY AMENDING SECTIONS 129.0710 AND

129.0715; AMENDING CHAPTER 13, ARTICLE 1, DIVISION 2

BY AMENDING SECTION 131.0222; AMENDING CHAPTER

13, ARTICLE 1, DIVISION 3 BY AMENDING SECTION

131.0322; AMENDING CHAPTER 13, ARTICLE 1, DIVISION 4

BY AMENDING SECTION 131.0422; AMENDING CHAPTER

13, ARTICLE 1, DIVISION 5 BY AMENDING SECTION

131.0522; AMENDING CHAPTER 13, ARTICLE 1, DIVISION 6

BY AMENDING SECTION 131.0622; AMENDING CHAPTER

13, ARTICLE 1, DIVISION 7 BY AMENDING SECTION

131.0707; AMENDING CHAPTER 14, ARTICLE 1, DIVISION 6

BY AMENDING SECTION 141.0621 AND ADDING

SECTIONS 141.0628 AND 141.0629; AMENDING CHAPTER

14, ARTICLE 2, DIVISION 6 BY AMENDING SECTION

142.0640, ALL RELATED TO THE IMPLEMENTATION OF

THE"SPACES AS PLACES" PROGRAM TO ALLOW

INCREASED OUTDOOR BUSINESS OPERATIONS AND

CREATING AN ENHANCED EXPERIENCE FOR ACTIVE

TRANSPORTATION.

§126.0203

 

When a Neighborhood Use Permit Is Required

(a) An application for the following uses in certain zones may require a

Neighborhood Use Permit. To determine whether a Neighborhood Use

Permit is required in a particular zone, refer to the applicable Use

Regulation Table in Chapter 13:

-PAGE 1 OF 44-



(O-2022-34 REV)

§126.0205

Artisan Fo

od and Be

verage Pro

ducer through

 Sidewa

lk cafes t

hat devia

te

from the requi

rements of S

ection 14

1.0621(a) [No ch

ange in text.

-

1 Gg

s

Sins with automatic changing copy

Active side

walks (under 

certain circ

umstances d

escribed 

in Secti

on

141.0621(c))

Streetaries (undr certain circumstances described in Section 141.0621)

Temporary construction storage 

yards located off-site t

hrough Wireless

communicationfacilities (under certain circumstances described in Section

141.

0420

) [No 

chan

ge i

n tex

t.]

(b) [No chan

ge in tex

t.]

Findings for Neighborhood Use Permit Approval

A Neighborhood Use Permit may be approved or

 conditionally appro

ved only if

the decision maker makes the followingfîndings:

(a) through (c) [No change in text.]

íd Supplemental Findins - Streetaries and Active Sidewalks

A Neighborhood U

se Permit required

 in accordance wit

h Section

lLQ621(b)(5) and 141.0621(c)(7) may be approved or conditionally

approved_o

nly if the deci

sion mak

er makes 

the follow

ing suppl

emental

ndins in addition to the.ndins required in Section 126.0205(a):

LU The proposed 

streetary or active si

dewalk will not 

adversely

impact the use of the pubic rht-ofway by pedestrians or

bicyclists;

-PAGE 2 OF 44-

t



-2

0

2

2

-

34

 R

E

V

)

1 The proposed streetary or active sidewalk is compatible with

adjacent existing permitted, or planned land uses; and

21 The proposed str

eetary or active sid

ewalk will 

enhance the

 pubic

rht-of-wav and encourage more pedestrian travel.

§126.0704

 

Exemptions from a Coastal Development Permit

The following coastal development is exempt from the requirement to obtain a

Coastal Development Pennit:

(a) through (i) [No change in text.]

1 Outdoor dining on rivate property and promenades. streetaries, and active

sidewalks designed in accordance with the Land Development Code and

the Spaces

 as Places Design Manual

§129.0710

 

How to Apply for a Public Right-of-Way Permit

An application for a Public Right-of-Way Permit shall be submitted in accordance

with Sections 112.0102 and 129.0105. The submittal requirements for Public

Right-of-Way Permits are listed in the Land Development Manual. A

developmentpermit is required prior to issuance of a Public Right-of-Way Permit

for the following:

(a) through (c) [No change in text.]

(d) Notwithstanding Sections 129.0710(a)-(c), a developmentpermit is not

required prior to issuance of a Public Right-of-Way Permit for

placemaking or a recreational amenity in thepublie ght-of-ay subject

to the following regulations. For purposes of Section 129.0710, a

recreational amenity is defined as any improvement that provides

-PAGE 3 OF 44-



(O

-2

02

2

-34

 R

E

V

)

§129.0715

recreational value to r

esidents or visito

rs and that enhances

 the pedestrian

or bicyc

le travel 

experie

nce.

(1) through 

(7) [No chan

ge in text.]

(8) Theplace

making or recrea

tional am

enity project sha

ll not inc

lude

commer

cial servi

ces, retail, 

or assem

bly and e

ntertainm

ent use

s as

accesso

y uses. Ifapla

cemaking project o

r recreatio

nal amcnit

y is

located 

within

 15 feet of

 a permit

ted eating 

and drin

king

establis

hment and 

is located 

on a City s

treet wi

th a post

ed speed

limit no g

reater tha

n 30 mile

s per

 hour, the

 establish

ment ma

y

condu

ct out

door di

ning o

peratio

ns wi

thin the

 plac

malng

 project

or recreational amenity. The hours of operation ofthe outdoor

operations shall

 be limited

 to the ho

urs that

 the kitchen

 faciliti

es of

the associ

ated eatin

g and drin

king establis

hment a

rc open

 for meal

orderin

g. Alcoh

ol, food, o

r beverage

s shal

l not be 

served or

permitted w

ithin theplaccm

aking or recrea

tional amenity area af

ter

1'O

·m. Su

day thughFhud

y, ad

-after 11

·-p.m

.-Fiday

thegh-Sauday., its use as a treetary in accordance with Section

141.0621(b) shall be allowed.

(9) through 

(10) [No chan

ge in text

.]

Encroa

chment

 Mainten

ance and

 Remova

l Agreem

ent

(a) 

An Enc

roachme

nt Main

tenanc

e and Re

moval 

Agreeme

nt is re

quired

 for

any privately

-owned and/

or privately-

maintained

 encroa

chment locat

ed in

-PAGE 4 OF 44-



(O-2022-34 REV)

the public right-of-way or in apublíc service easement subject to the

following:

(1) 

[No 

chan

ge

 in te

xt.]

(2) The record owner orpermit holder, as applicable, shall agree to

indemnify the City with an indemnification agreement satisfactory

to the City Manager and City Attorney. For streetaries and active

sidewalks allowed in accordance with Section 141.0621, the

indemnification shall include any claims. damages. or inuries that

occur to or within th

e streetay_or activ

e sidewalk area a

ainst the

City or any utility provider whose facilities are located within the

public right-of-way.

(3) The record owner o

rpermít 

holder, a

s applica

ble, shall a

gree to

and shall remove or relocate the encroachment to the satisfaction

of the City Engineer within 30 days after notice by the City

Engineer, or the City Engineer may cause such work to be done,

and the costs thereof shall be a lien upon said land, or the record

owner orpermit holder, as applicable, shall agree to an equivalent

to the requirement for removal as determined by the City Engineer.

The record owner or permit holder, as applicable, may also be

required to remove a streetary to the satisfaction of the City

Engineer at no cost to the Ciy or any other utility provider that

owns or maintains facilities within the public riht-ofwav to avoid

flooding or to protect public health and welfare. The record owner

-PAGE 5 OF 44-



(O-2022-34 REV)

§131.0222

or permit holder

 as applicable, m

ay also be requi

red to remove a

streetary to prov

ide non-emergenc

y access to any

 utility provider

that owns or maintains facilities loca

ted within the public ih

t-0

way with 30 days notice. Ac

tive sidewalks al

]owed in accor

dance

with Section 1

41.0621 shall not be reui

red to be remov

ed_by the

record owner or permit holder, as applcable.

(4) through (5) [No change in text.]

(6) Except as provided in 

Section 129.0715

(a)(7), the record

 owner

 or

permit holder, as applicable, shall maintain a minimum policy of

$1 million liability insurance, satisfactory to the City Engineer, to

protect the City from any potential claims which may arise from

the encroachment.

(7) through (

11) [No ch

ange in text.

]

(b) The City may requir

e a record owner orpermi

t holder, as applic

able, to

record the Encroachment Maintenance and Removal Agreement in the

Office of the County Recorder. However a record owner or permit

holder, as applicable, shall record in the Office of the County Recorder

ay Encroachment Maintenance and Removal Agreement for a streetary

and active sidewalk allowed in Section 141.0621 and a promenade

allowed in Section 141.0629.

Use Regu

lation

s Table

 for Op

en Spa

ce Zon

es

The uses allowed in the open space zones are shown in Table 131-02B.

-PAGE 6 OF 44-



(O-2022-34 REV)

Legend for Table 131-02B

[No change in text.]

Tabl

e 13

1-02B

Use Regulations Table for Open Space Zones

Use Categories/Subcategories

 Zone

 Zones

[See Sectio

n 131.0112 for

 an explanatio

n and

 

Designator

descriptions of the Use Categories

, Subcategorie

s

 

'

 1 st & 2nd >>

 

O

P

-

 OC-

 

OR- OF()-

and 

Sepa

rately

 Reg

ulate

d Uses]

3rd >> 1- 2- 1- 1- 1-

4th

»

 

1

1

1

1

2

1

Open Sp

ace throu

gh Separ

ately Reg

ulated I

nstitutiona

l Uses -

Placemaking on Private Prope

rty [No chan

ge in text.]

Outd

oor D

ining on 

Priva

te Pro

perty

[No change in text.]

Separ

ately R

egulat

ed Institution

al U

ses - Sat

ellite 

ntenna

s throug

h

Separ

ately R

egula

ted Co

mmer

cial S

ervice 

Uses - Recy

cling

Facilities: [No change in text.]

Sidewalk Caf

es, Streetaries,

 and Active S

idewalks

[No change in text.]

Sports

 Aren

as & Stadi

ums thr

ough

 Signs

 [No c

hange 

in

text.]

[No cha

nge in t

ext.]

§131.0322

 

Use Reg

ulations Tab

le for

 Agricu

ltural 

Zones

The uses allow

ed in the 

agricultur

al zone

s are sho

wn in Tab

le 131-03B

.

Legend for Table 131-03B

[No change in text.]

-PAGE 7 OF 44-



(O-20

22-34 

REV

)

Ta

ble

 13

1-

03B

Use Regulation

s Table for A

gricultural Zon

es

Use Ca

tego

ries/

Subc

ateg

ories

 Zone

 Zones

[See S

ection 

131.0112 

for an

 explana

tion an

d

 

Designator

descriptions of the Use Categories,

 1 st & 2nd AG

 AR

Subcategories

, and Separat

ely Regulated

 Uses]

>>

3rd >> 1- 1-

4th» 1 2 1 2

Open 

Space

 throug

h Sep

aratel

y Reg

ulated I

nstitutio

nal Uses -

Place

naki

ng on Priva

te Pr

opert

y [No

 chang

e in text.]

[No change in text.]

Outdoor D

ining on Priva

te Property

Separ

ately 

Regula

ted I

nstitutio

nal Uses - Sat

ellite A

ntenna

s

through Separat

ely Regu

lated Co

mmercial

 Service 

Uses -

Recycling Facilities: [No change in text.]

[No ch

ange 

in text

.]

Sidewalk Ca

fes, Streetaries

, and Active

 Sidewalks

Sports A

renas & Stadiums thro

ugh Signs [No c

hange in

 text.

] 

[No change in text.]

[No change in text.]

§131.0422

Use Regulat

ions Table fo

r Residential 

Zones

The uses a

llowed in

 the reside

ntial zones

 are shown

 in the Table

 131-04B

.

Legend for Table 131-04B

[No change in text.]

-PAGE 8 OF 44-



(O-2022-34 REV)

Table 131-04B

Use Regulations Table for Residential Zones

se Zone

 

Zones

Categories/

 

D

esignato

Subcategories

 1 st & 2nd>> RE-

 RS- RX-

 RT-

[See Section 131.0112 for

3rd>> 1- 1- 1- 1-

an explanation and

descriptions of the Use

 

4th >>1 23 12345 6789

1011121314 1

 212345

Categories, Subcategories,

and Separately Regulated

Uses]

Open Space through Separately

 

[No change in text.]

Regulate

d Institutiona

l Uses -

Placemaking on Private Property [No

change in text.]

Outdoor Dining on Private Property z -

=

Separately Regulated Institutional

Uses - Satelite Antennas hrough

Separately Regulated Commercial

Service Uses - Recycling Facilities

[No change in text.]

[No change in text]

Sidewalk Cafes, Streetaries, and

Active Sidewalks

Sports Arenas & Stadiums through

Signs [No change in text.]

[No change in text.]

Use Categories/

 Zone

 Zones

Subcategories

 

DesignatoÎ

[See Section 131.0112 for

 1 st & 2nd >>

 RM-

an explanation and

descriptions of the Use

 

3rd >> 1- 2- 3- 4- 5-

Categories, Subcategories,

 4th>> 12345678

 9 10 11 12

and Sep

arately 

Regulat

ed

Uses]

Open Space through Separately

Regulated Institutional Uses -

Placemaking on Private Property [No

change in text.]

Outd

oor D

ining

 on Pr

ivate

 Prope

rty

[No change in text.]

Separately Regulated Institutional Uses -

Satellite Antennas through Separately

Regulated Commercial Service Uses -

Recycling Facilities [No change in text.]

[No change in text.]

-PAGE 9 OF 44-



(O-202

2-34

 RE

V)

Sidew

alk Ca

fes, S

treetar

ies, an

d Act

ive

Sidewalks

Sport

s Are

nas &

 Stad

iums thro

ugh

Sig

ns [

No 

chan

ge i

n tex

t.]

[No change in text.]

§13

1.0

522

Use Reg

ulation

s Table

 for Co

mmer

cial Z

ones

The use

s allow

ed in the c

omme

rcial zon

es are 

shown i

n Table

 131-0

5B.

Lege

nd f

or T

able

 131

-05B

[No change in text.]

Table 131-05B

Use Reg

ulations Tab

le for C

omme

rcial Z

ones

Use C

atego

ries/

Subc

ateg

ories

 Zone

 Zones

Designator

[See 

Sect

ion 1

31.0

112 f

or an

expl

anati

on a

nd de

script

ions of

the Use Categories,

Subcateg

ories, an

d Separat

ely

Regu

lated 

Uses]

1 st & 2nd

>>

3rd >>

4th >>

CN(1).

 CR-

 CO- 

CV- CP-

1- 1- 2- 1- 2- 3-

 1- 1-

123456 1 1

 

1 2

1

2 12

3 1

2 

1

Op

en 

Spa

ce 

thro

ugh

 Sep

arat

ely 

Reg

uat

ed

 

[No ch

ang

e in te

xt.]

Inst

ituti

onal

 Uses -

 Plac

emak

ing on Priv

ate

Pr

op

ert

y 

[N

o c

ha

ng

e i

n te

xt.

]

Outd

oor 

Dini

ng on P

rivat

e Pro

pert

y 

L 

L 

 

 

L 

L 

 

z

Sepa

rate

ly R

egul

ated In

stitut

iona

l U

ses -

Satelli

te Antenn

as through

 Separa

tely Re

gulated

Com

merc

ial S

ervic

e Uses - Rec

yclin

g Fa

cilitie

s

[No c

hange

 in text.]

Sidew

alk Ca

fes, S

treetar

ies, an

d Act

ive

Sid

ew

alks

[No change in text]

Sports 

Arenas

 & Stadi

ums thr

ough

 Signs

[No c

hange

 in tex

t.]

[No change in text.]

-PA

G

E 1

0 O

F 4

4-



(O

-20

22-3

4 R

E

V)

Use Ca

tego

ries/

Subc

ateg

ories

[See Section 131.0112 for an

explanation and descriptions of

the Use Categories,

Subcategories, and Separately

Regulated Uses]

Zone Zones

Designator

1 st & 2nd >>

 CC-

3rd >> 1- 2- 3- 4- 5-

4th >>

 

12312345456789 123456123 45 6

Open Space through Separately Regulated

Institutional Uses - Plalaking on Private Property

[No change in text.]

[No change in text.]

Outdoor Dining on Private Property

 

L L L L L

Separ

ately R

egulate

d Instituti

onal U

ses -

SateUite Antennas through Separately Regulated

Comme

rcial Se

nice 

Uses - Recycl

ing Faci

lities

[No c

hange

 in te

xt.]

Sidew

alk C

afes. S

treetar

ies. a

nd Ac

tive

Sidewalks

[No change in text.]

Sports Arenas & Stadiums through Signs [No

change in text.]

[No change in text.]

§131.0622 Use Regulations Table for Industrial Zones

The uses allowed in the industrial zones are shown in Table 131-06B.

Legend for Table 131-06B

[No change in text.]

-PAGE 11 OF 44-



(O-2

022

-34 

RE

V)

Table 131-06B

Use Re

gulatio

ns Table

 for In

dustria

l Zones

Use Ca

tego

ries/ 

Subc

atego

ries

 Zone

 Zones

[See

 Sec

tion

 131

.011

2 fo

r an

 

Des

igna

tor

expla

natio

n and 

descri

ption

s oft

he

 1 st & 2nd> >

 W-

 IL-

 III-

 

- m-

Use C

ateg

orie

s, S

ubc

ateg

orie

s, an

d

 3rd >> 1- 2-

 3- 1- 2- 3- 1- 2-

 1- 1-

Separate

ly Regu

lated U

ses]

4

t

h

 >

>

 

1 

1

 

1 

1

 

1

 

1 

1 

1

 

1 

1

Ope

n Sp

ace t

hrou

gh S

epa

rate

ly R

egu

lated

 

In

sti

tu

tio

na

l U

ses -

 P

la

ce

na

kin

g

 on

 Pr

iv

ate

 

[N

o c

ha

ng

e

 in t

ex

t.]

Prop

erty 

[No 

chan

ge in

 text

.]

utdo

or D

ining

 on P

rivat

e Pr

oert

y 

:

 L

 : LLL:LL L

Separ

ately R

egula

ted Institutio

nal Uses -

Sate

lite A

nten

nas thr

ough

 Se

par

atel

y

Regul

ated C

omm

ercial 

Seni

ce Uses -

Rec

ycli

ng F

acili

ties 

[No 

chan

ge in tex

t.]

Side

wal

k Ca

fes. 

Stree

tari

es, a

nd A

ctiv

e

Sidewalks

[No ch

ange i

n text.

]

Sport

s Are

nas & Sta

dium

s thro

ugh

Signs[

No chan

ge in tex

t.]

[No 

cha

nge

 in 

text

.]

§131.0707

Use Reg

ulation

s Tabl

e for M

ixed-Use Z

ones

The u

ses a

llowe

d in t

he m

ixed-

use 

zones

 are sh

own

 in Tab

le 131

-07A

.

Legend

 for Tab

le 131-

07A

[No c

hange 

in text

.]

-PAGE 12 OF 44-



(O-2022-34 REV)

Table 131-07A

Use Regulations Table for Mixed-Use Zones

Use Categories/Subcategories

 

Z

on

e Zones

Designator

[See Section 131.0112 for an

explanation and descriptions ofthe

 1 st >>

Use Categories, Subcategories, and

Separately Regulated Uses]

2

n

d

 >

>

 

1

Open Space through Separately Regulated

Institutional Uses - Placemaking on Private

Property No change in text.1

Outdoor Dining on Private Property L

RMX

 EMX

2 3 1 2 3

[No change in text.]

L L

- - LL L

Separately Regulated Institutional Uses -

Satelite Antennas hrough Separately

Regulated Commercial Service Uses -

Recycling Facilities [No change in text.]

Sidewalk Cafe Streetaries. and Active

Sidewalks

Sports Arenas & Stadiums through Signs

[No change in text.]

[No change in text.]

[No change in text.]

§141.0621

Sidewalk Cafes. Streetaries. and Active Sidewalks

Sidewalk cafes arc outdoor dining spaces located in thepublic right ofvay that

are associated with adjacent eating and drinking establishments. Sidewalk ca

arc permitted as a limited use in the zones indicated with an "L" in the Use

£1 / / 

wrn .  Chapter 13, Article 1 (Base Zones) subject to the folloing

regulations. It is not the intent of this section to regulate outdoor eating and

drinking establishment areas that are located on private property. The sidewalk

cafes, streetaries, and active sidewalks regulations establish requirements for

outdoor dining and other uses located within the public riht-owav. For the

purposes of this Section, sidewalk cafes are defined as outdoor dinin spaces

located within the sidewalk area of the pubüc riht-o-way that are associated

-PAGE 13 OF 44-



(O-2022-34 REV)

with adja

cent e

ating and d

rink

ing est

ablish

ments

; stre

etaries

 are 

deñn

ed as

outdoo

r space

s locat

ed in

 a stree

t spac

e form

erly d

edicat

ed to

 parking

 space

s that

serve

s as a

n exte

nsion

 of an e

ating 

and dr

inking

 esta

blishm

ent:

 and ac

tive

sidew

alks are

 define

d as th

e perm

anen

t exten

sion of th

e cur

b into

 the pu

blic ri

ht-

owav 

to faci

litate act

ivation 

ofthe p

ubic ri

ht-of-

,av thr

ough rec

reational

amenitie

slandscaped 

areas: seating are

as, farm

ers mark

et, artwo

rks or ou

tdoor

dining. Sid

ewalk cafes. 

streetaries, 

and active sid

ewalks are

 permitted as 

a limited

use in 

the zon

es indi

cated 

with 

an "L" 

in the

 Use

_Regul

ation

s Table

s in

 Chap

ter

13, Ar

ticle 1 (Bas

e Zon

es) sub

ect to t

he fol

lowin

g regu

lations

. It i

s not 

the in

tent

 f this S

ection t

o regula

te outdoo

r eating

 and drin

king est

ablishment

 areas t

hat are

located

 on priv

ate prop

erty.

(a) Limited

 Use Regu

lations for Side

walk Ca

fes

(1) Design requirements

(A)

 

A sidewa

lk cafe s

hall be l

ocated wi

thin th

e sid

ewalk ar

ea

adjacent to 

a street-

level ea

ting and d

rinking e

stabli

shmen

t.

(B) through 1) [No change in text.]

(K) Lighting 

fixtures m

ay be pe

rmanentl

y affix

ed to the f

ront

of the as

socia

ted ea

ting a

nd dri

nking

 establ

ishme

nt b

ut

shall not

 protrude int

o the pedest

rian path.

(L) The name and

 type of establishme

nt may be place

d on

umbrell

as or on

 the vala

nce of

 an awnin

g with an over

hang

not lower than

 84 inches from the finishe

d gra

de of

 

the

sidewalk. Other signs are not pennitted on a sidewalk cafe.

-PAGE 14 OF 44-



(O

-2022-

34 RE

V)

(M) [No c

hange 

in text.]

(2) through (3) [No change in text.]

1 A Process Two Neighborhood Use Permit may be requested in

accordance with Section 126.0203 to deviate from the

requirements in Section 141.0621(a) as follows:

6*å The applicant shall identify any requirement in Section

141.0621(a) where a deviation is being requested and shall

specify why the deviation is needed.

@Bì The decision maker will evaluate the request in accordance

with the adopted land useplan and Land Development

Manual to determine if a sidewalk cafe with the proposed

deviation is a suitable use for the proposed site and will not

infringe on use of thepubc right-qfay by pedestrians. In

making the determination, the decision maker shall

consider the following:

Ai The width ofthe sidewalk;

 The design and relationship of the sidewalk cafe to

other existing or planned uses in the vicinity;

(fiii) The amount of pedestrian use and the impact of the

sidewalk cafe's location on pedestrian activity; and

fDíil The sidewalk cafe's ability to fit the character of the

area create an outdoor pedestrian plaza intensify

-PAGE 15 OF 44-



(O-2022-34 REV)

pedestrian ac

tivity, and 

make the street ac

tivity

more attractive.

í 

Limite

d Use Reg

ulations for St

reetarie

s

£1 Location Requirements

(A 

Streetarie

s shall be

 locate

d adjace

nt to eati

ng and drink

ing

establishments at the following locatins:

 Within the curb lane on streets where on-street

metered or unmetered parking spaces exist adjacent

to the front of the eating and drinking

establis

hment.

 or along

 an adia

cent neig

hborin

g on-

street metered or unmetered parking spaces with the

written permission from the adjacent property

owner stating the permission is valid for the term of

the Encroachment Maintenance and Removal

Agreement.

íi 

At leas

t 20 feet a

way from

 an inters

ection.

 street

corner. allev or a driveway; and

(iii) Along curbs painted yellow, or green, or no-

painted curbs or motorcycle parking areas.

(B Streetaries shall not be allowed at the followin locations:

íi Along a street segment with a speed limit greater

than 30 miles per hour

-PAGE 16 OF 44-



(O

-2

0

22

-3

4

 R

E

V

)

(ii) Along a street with a street classified as mdor o

greater.

fiíi) Along a curb painted red, white, or blue,

íiy

 

Within or adjacent to an allev.

1 Adacent to a Metropolitan Transit System (MTS

stop or a bus lane.

(viì Within an existing bike lane or within a proposed

bike lane project identified in any comprehensive

bicycle plan or adopted

 

land use plan.

(viiì Within 5 feet of storm drain inlets or cl uts.

(viíi Over utility access panels, manhole covers

handholes, transformers, water meters or water

valves.

Within 5 feet of a fire hydrant and any emergency

equipment.

í 

Within 5 feet of any natural_gas or electric utility

facility. including the perimeter of any manholes.

handholes or vaults, and any surface-level

structures such as natural gas meters. monitors,

pressure regulators, protection stations, poles

curbside electric meters, transformers or green

uti

lity

 b

ox

es

.

2 

Perm

it Re

quire

men

ts

-PAGE 17 OF 44-



(O-2022-34 REV)

(Aì Prior to in

stallation o

f any furnit

ure or imp

rovements 

in the

public

 rht-o

way and pri

or to oper

ation of

 a street

ary, an

applica

nt shal

l obta

in a Pub

lic Rig

ht-f-Wa

y Perm

it in

accorda

nce with 

Section 

129.0710(d

ì and a

n Encr

oachme

nt

Maintenance and

 Removal Ag

reement in accor

dance with

Section 1

29.07

15, Viola

tions of

 a Public R

ight-of-W

ay

Permi

t shall 

be sub

ject to 

the p

ermit 

revoc

ation

 procedu

res

set forth in Chapter 12, Article 1, Division 3.

ím The Public Right-of-Way Permit for streetaries shall be

limited to a maximum two-year term period, after which a

new app

licatio

n may be 

subm

itted in

 acco

rdanc

e wi

th

Section 141.0621).

( Removal of parking spaces. with the exception of

accessible parking spaces in accordance with Titl 24 ofthe

California Co

de of Regulat

ins(Califomia Building

Standards Code). shall not be the basis of denial of a Public

Right-of-Way Permit for a streetary.

£ The dimensions of a streetary shall be delineated on a site

lan and documented in the associated Public Riht-of-

Way Permit

E) Prior to the issuance of a Public Right-of-Way Permit for a

streetary, the apphcant shall pay a fee for the use of and

-PAGE 18 OF 44-



(O

-

2

02

2

-

34

 

RE

V

)

operation within the pubhe iht-ofway, as adopted by San

Diego City Council Resolution.

Œì A streetary

 is subjec

t t_Develop

met Imp

act Fees

 in

accordance with Section 142.0640(b)(6).

(Gì Prior to 

issuance 

of aPub

lic Right

-of-Way Perm

it for a

streeta

ry, the a

ppücant s

hall pro

vide evi

dence o

f gen

eral

liability insurance naming the City of San Diego as

additional insured, which shall remain in effect during the

operat

ion oft

he stree

tary.

H Alcohol, food, or beverages shall not be served or allowed

within the streetary before 7:00 a.m. and after 10:00 p.m.

Sunday through Thursday, and before 7:00 a.m. and after

11:00 p.m

. Friday through

 Saturday a

nd the da

prior to a

C

ity

 H

ol

id

ay

.

£ Streetaries located within 150 feet of an adjacent residential

use sha

ll not se

rve or a

llow alcoho

l, food, 

or bev

erages

within the street

ary before 7

:00 a.m. and after 9

:00 pm.

Sunday throug

h Thursday, an

d before 7:00

 a.m. and after

10:00 p.m. Friday through Saturday.

íl Streetaries shall comply with all State of California

Departm

ent of

 Alcoho

lic Beve

rage Con

trol lice

nse

requirements, as applicable.

-PAGE 19 OF 44-



(O-2022-34 REV)

(K Smokin

 and api

n shall 

not be per

mitted wi

thin the

streetary. For purposes of this Sectio

n, the terms smo

ke.

smokin. pe. and vapin have the same meanings as set

forth in San Diego Municipal Code Section 43,1001.

(Lì Live entertainment is not permitted within a streetarv

unless a Cond

itional Use Permit

 is grante

d in accordanc

e

with Process T

hree and the Con

ditional Use Perm

it is in

accordance w

ith the provisio

ns of Chapte

r 3. Article 

3

Division

 15. The P

ublic Ri

ht-of-W

ay Per

mit holde

r for

the stre

etary shal

l provid

e a nois

e impa

ct anal

ysis to t

he

City for consideration before approval of the Conditional

Use Permit

. The noise im

pact analysis shall

 be prepa

red by

a qualified acoustical engineer and shall evaluate noise and

vibation impacts to the surrounding neighborhood. A

Conditional Use Pennit shall not be granted for live

entertainment befre 8:00 am and after 9:00 p.m. Sunday

through Thursday, and before 9:00 a.m. and after 10:OQ

.m. Friday trough Saturday.

(Mì Outdoor cooking and food preparation within the streetary

is pr

ohib

ited.

íN) Noise levels within the streetary shall comply with the

sound level limits of the adjacent use of the eating or

-PAGE 20 OF 44-



(O-2022-34 REV)

drinking establishment in accordance with Chapter 5,

Article 9.5, Division 4.

(O The Gaslamp Quarter Planned District Design Guidelines

shall apply to streetaries located within the Gaslam

Quarter Planned District.

(Pì The Public Right-of-Way Permit peni holder shall be

responsible for maintaining the streetary. Maintenance shall

include postin of the name. phone number, and email

address of the erson responsible for the streetary in a

location visible from the public riht-o-way, keeping the

streetary free of litter, and preventing litter attributable to

the streetary from entering adjacent properties within the

pubic riht-of-way.

O) Streetaries shall remain open to public during_all non-

operational hours.

£1 

Design Requirements

Streetaries shall be designed in accordance with the Spaces as

Places Design Manual and meet the follwing regulations to the

satisfaction ofthe City Engineer:

(Aì Streetaries shall be designed as an extension of the

sidewalk with at least one minimum 48 inches wide entry

for every 10 feet of streetary along the curbside edge.

-PAGE 21 OF 44-



(O-2022-34 REV)

(Bì The width of the streetary shall not extend within 2 feet of

the edge of the street travel lane.

(C A streetary shall provide a setback of at least 4 feet from

adjacent vehicle parking spaces.

D The deck of the streetary platform shall be flush with the

sidewalk.

E Bolting into the street or penetrating into the surface of the

road shall not be permitted.

(F) A minimum 36 inches wide emergency access gap with

horizontal and vertical clearance shall be required for every

20 feet ofthe streetary or adacent streetaries or other

structures in the parking lane.

(Gì The accessible path of travel through the streetary shall be a

paved sidewalk that is at least 5 feet wide, the width 

identified in the applicable adopted land use plan, or the

width 

require

d by the a

pplicabl

e zone o

r pla

nned dis

trict.

whichever width is greater.

H) 

Drain

age

íü Streetaries shall not impede the flow of curbside

drainage.

íiü An 8 i

nch by

 6 inch

 minim

um clear gutt

er space

shall be provided along the entire length of the

street

ary

 adjac

ent

 to th

e cu

rb.

-PAGE 22 OF 44-



(O-2022-34 REV)

(iii) The appicant shall ensure that the drainage area

between the curb and the platform remains clear of

debris 

and pro

per d

rainag

e occu

rs at all 

times.

Ul A 42 inch high railin

g shall 

be placed 

at the e

dge of the

streetary to serve as a barrier from vehicular traffic.

L o horizontal

 or vertical s

tructure shall

 be placed

 

a

b

o

v

e

 4

2

inches from the surface of the streetay except for

stanchions needed to provide lighting.

(Kì Umbrellas with an overhang of a minimum of 84 inches

from the finished rade of the sidewalk may be used in

conjunction with a streetary, but no permanent roof or

shelter is permitted over the streetary. Theçanopy of the

umbrella shal

l be con

tained within

 the streetary

 and shall

not protr

ude int

o the sid

ewalk. 

adiacent

 parking

 spaces

adacent stree

taries or

 the travel or

 bike lane.

0 Solar powered lights shall be permitted but electrical

lihting elements that contain wires that cross the clear path

of travel shall not be permitted.

(K The placement of the name and type of establishment on

umbrellas is allo

wed. Other sin

s shall

 not be permitte

 on

a streetary.

(Lì Streetaries shall be designed in accordance with the Spaces

as Places Design Manual.

-PAGE 23 OF 44-



(O-202

2-34 R

EV)

(M The Gaslamp Quarter PIanned District Design Guidelines

shall apply to streetaries located within the Gaslamp

Quarter Planned District.

1 Accessibility

(A 

Accessible Path of Travel

íiì An accessible path o f travel shall connect the

sidewalk to the accessible entry, deck surface

wheelchair turning space. and wheelchair resting

space.

íii The accessible path of travel shall be a minimum of

60 inches wide on the sidewalk and shall not pass

over tree wells.

(iii)

 

The accessible pth of travel shall be free of

obstruction and protruding objects.

(B Accessible Deck Surface

íi The accessible path of travel on the deck surface

shall be a minimum of 44 inches wide

íiü The portion of the streetary deck connected by the

accessible path of travel to the wheelchair turnin

space and wheelchair restin soace shall be level.

(iíiì 

The accessible deck surface maximum cross slope

íperpendicular to the sidewalk or curb) and the

-PAGE 24 OF 44-



(O-2022-34 REV)

maximum running slope (parallel to the curb) shall

not exceed 2 percent.

(iv The surface o

f the acces

sible route,

 clear loor

spaces, and turning spaces shall be firm. stable, and

slip resistant.

££1 Openings in loor or deck surfaces shall not allow

the passage of a sphere more than half an inch in

diameter. Elongated openings shall be placed so that

the long dimension is perpendicular to the dominant

direction oftravel.

(C A clear areaof 60 inches in diameter located entirely within

the streetary shall be provided for wheelchair turning with a

maximum overlap of 12 inches on the curb and sidewalk.

(D A clear loor area of 36 inches by 48 inches shall be

provided for wheelchair resting space with a maximum

overlap of 24 inches with the wheelchair turning space in

any orientation.

íIŽ) The wheelchair resting space shall provide shoulder-to-

shoulder alignment adjacent to one side of the fixed seat to

serve as wheelchair user companion seating.

(F) A minimum head height clearance of 84 inches from the

finished rade of the streetary is required at all times.

(G) Equivalent Facilities

-PAGE 25 OF 44-



(O-2022-34 REV)

íi Where tables, counters. or drink rails are provided,

at least one

 of each feature shal

l be wheel

chair

accessible,

fii The top surface

 height of wheelcha

ir accessible

ables, counters and or drink rails shall be 28 inches

to 34 inches above the deck surface.

(iii) Wheelchair accessible tables and counters shall be

approachable from the front and provide an

unobstructed knee clearance that is at least 27

inches high 30 inches wide and 19 inches deep.

íix

 

When movable tables are provided in lieu of fixed

tables. at least one of the movable tables shall be

accessible.

í Where

 drink r

ails ar

e provid

ed, a

 60 inc

h long

on of a drink rail shall have 36 inch wide and

level space adjacent to it for a side-approach by a

wheelchair user.

H) Terraced or Multi-Level Streetaries

íi Streetaries on streets with grades that exceed 5

percent may construct a terraced streetay with two

or more decks.

fi At least one o f the terraces shall be wheelchair

accessible and provide equivalent seating, tables,

-PAGE 26 OF 44-



(O-2022-34 REV)

and countertop facilities to those found in other

terraces.

Œi

 

The wheelc

hair access

ible terrace

 shall provi

de a

wheelchair accessible entry from the sidewalk.

íi

 

The wheelchair accessible entry shall include a

structure on the sidewalk within the sidewalk

furnishing zone that provides a transition between

the sidewalk and streetary deck,

íl Passage between terrace levels shall provide a ramp

with a running slope not to exceed 5%.

(vi Any step or stair shall contain a warning strip at the

nose ofthe step and handrails in accordance with

the California Building Code.

í 

Deviation Process

A deviation from the requirements in Section 141.0621(b) may be

permitted with a Neighborhood Use Permit decided in accordance

with Process Two. as follows:

(Aì The appicant shall identify any requirement in Section

141.0621(b) where a deviation is being requested and shall

secify why the deviation is necessary.

(Bì Deviations related to the following shall not be granted:

íi Addition of an overhead structure·

íi Storm water requirements·

-PAGE 27 OF 44-



(O-2022-34 REV)

(iíiì 

Hours of operation

(ivì 

ngíneerin standards: and

íl Accessibility requirements.

í Limited Use Regulations for Active Sidewalks

íl Location Requirement:

A) Active sidewalks shall be located alongthe curbside on

streets where metered or unmetered parking exists.

(B) Active sidewalks shall be located only

 

on streets

 

w

it

h

 

a

curb-to-curb width sufficient to accommodate a Class IV

bicycle lane after installation of the active sidewalk.

(Cì Active sidewalks shall meet the locational requirement to

the satisfaction of the City Engineer to ensure public health

and safety.

1 The following uses shall be permitted within an active sidewalk:

A) Recreational amenities, including landscaped and seating

areas, in accordance with Section 129.0710(d).

ím

 

Artworks.

(C) Outdoor Dining in accordance with Section 141.0621(c)(6)..

E) Fanners Markets in accordance with Section 141.0503.

 

Other uses approved through a deviation in accordance

with Section 141.0621(c)(7).

Q Permit Requirements:

-PAGE 28 OF 44-



(O-2022-34 REV)

(Aì Prior to installation of anv furniture or improvements in the

public riht-owav and prior to operation of an active

sidewalk the applicant shall obtain a Public Right-of-Way

Permit in_accordance with Section 129.0710(d) and an

Encroachment Maintenance and Remval Agreement in

accordance with Section 129.0715 to the satisfaction of the

City Engineer. Violations of a Public Right-of-Way Pennit

shall be subject to the permit revocation procedures set

forth in Chapter 12, Article 1, Division 3.

(Bì Removal of parking with the exception of accessible

spaces in accordance with Title 24 of the California Code

of Regulations (Califòmia Building Standards Code), shall

not be a basis of denial of a Public Right-of-Way Permit for

an active sidewalk.

(Cì Prior to issuance of a Public Right-of-Way Permit for an

active sidewalk, the applicant shall provide evidence of

general liability insurance naming the City of San_Diego as

additional insured, which shall remain in effect during the

operation ofthe active sidewalk

(D Alcohol, food, or beverages shall not be served or allowed

within the active sidewalk before 7:00 a.m. and after 10:00

p.m. Sunday through Thursday, before 7:00 a.m. and after

11:00 p.m. Friday through Saturday.

-PAGE 29 OF 44-

r



(O-

2022-3

4 REV

)

E Active sidewalk located within 150 feet of an adjacent

residential u

se shall not serve

 or allow alcohol, food

 or

beveraes within the active sidewalk before 7:00 a.m. and

after 9:00 p.m. Sunday through Thursday. and before 7:00

a.m. and after 10:00 p.m. Friday through Saturday and the

day prior to a City Holiday,

 Live entertainment is not allowed within an active sidewalk

unless a Conditional Use Permit is granted in accordance

with Process Three and the Conditional Use Pennit is in

accordance with the provisions of Chapter 3, Article 3,

Division 15. The Public Right-of-Way Permit permit

holder for the active sidewalk shall provide a noise impact

analysis to the C

ity for considerat

ion before apr

oval of 

the

Conditional Use Permit. The noise impact analysis shall be

prepared by a qualified acoustical enineer and shall

evaluate noise and vibration impacts to the surroundin

neighborhood. A Conditional Use_Permit shall not be

granted fr live entertainment before 8:00 a.m. and after

9:00 p.m. Sunday through Thursday. and before 9:00 a.m.

and after 10:00 p.m. Friday through Saturday.

(G) All programming along active sidewalk shall be in

accordance with the Special Events Ordinance, Chapter 2,

Article 2, Division 40.

-PAGE 30 OF 44-



(O-2022-34 REV)

H) Smoking and vapin shall not be permitted within the active

sidewalk. For purposes of this Section, the terms smoke

smokin, vape, and vaping have the same meanings as in

San Diego Municipal Code Section 43.1001.

1 Active sidewalks shall comply with all State of California

Department of Alcoholic Beverage Control license

requirements, as applicable.

íl Active sidewalks shall comply with the sound level limits

ofthe adjacent use in accordance with Chapter 5. Article

9.5. Division 4.

(Kì The Public Right-of-Way Permit permit holder shall be

responsible for maintaining the active sidewalk.

Maintenance shall include, but not be limited to, posting of

the name, phone number, and email address ofthe_person

responsible for the active sidewalk in a location visible

from the public right--wv, keeping the active sidewalk

free o f litter, and preventing litter attributable to the active

sidewalk from entering adjacent properties and the public

right-of-way.

íà Design Requirements:

Active sidewalks shall be designed in accordance with the Spaces

as Places Design Manual and meet the following regulations to the

satisfaction of the City Engineer:

-PAGE 31 OF 44-



(O-2022-34 REV)

(A) Permanent expansion of the curb line for an active sidewalk

into the parking lane starting at the corner or in the middle

of the street shall be designed to the satisfaction ofthe City

Engineer.

(Bì The length of an active sidewalk shall be at least 54 feet.

(Cì The design and placement ofstreet furniture. trees, and

plantings on an active sidewalk shall not impede pedestrian

flow, or be placed within 10 feet from an intersection to

avoid interfering with isibilitv area. emergency

operations, or sight lines, to the satisfaction ofthe City

Engineer.

(Dì The placement of the name and type ofthe associated

establishment on umbrellas shall be permitted. Other signs

shall not be permitted on an active sidewalk.

í Eì Active sidewalks shall be designed in accordance with

current Storm W

ater standards.

 Active sidewalks shall be designed in accordance with the

Spaces as Places Design Manual. Street Design Manual.

and all applicable engineering standards.

(G The Gaslamp Quarter Planned District Design Guidelines

shall apply t active sidewalks within the Gaslamp Quarter

Planned District.

-PAGE 32 OF 44-



* IO E £ EIÐVd-

SOIOJ SE 0KI, søoo 41!

pi

o

 

! 

pø

p!0

0p

 1!U

LI

d

 @

 P

o

t1

0

pN

 E

 iw

 p

l!u

u

ð

 ÁBUI (0)I 90I Þ ! uo!S u! Sí@IU@Imb 41 UIO U!!Aøp V

S

S

0

0

Id

 U

R

!

C

í 

O

.Ió IBUÒEdo-uou

 Ile kuunp !Iqnd oud

o suu

uu

pi

pn

 0 p

n Ie

øp

S A

OB @

30 U

.od

 øtr

 

J

pu :kíuíf! opold 0 pøpøU SUO!4UBS

10 OX IEØPS A 0 EjS 1 UIO. Spu

EÞ AOq po

id s

! 

n.us

 0

.IA 1 [EU0

04 ON

 

J

rei IBII 3

 4 01 lüop poed

s! u 

u !p

 oop

 no 

 u

øs u

wñ

 uI A

. oI

 u

1EPS A!  íI PPAO.Id s! íul [krti-tpu!-2 

1.

! p

 

! 1Ati! 

!P puud 0 uoz @q!Idd

4 Áq pnbl qppñ 9 0 'UId øsn p Pdp

ícìí

dd øq u! Pg

up

! ip

!ñ @11 

   1Eí

W s  i IløpS pøEd 1

2  1@AB JÒ ð iqssoo tL J

SE ítIOI OS pMO[l  'IEMPS AE 1 U!4M UI pAB

IpE 

 0 360p 0 

üUIS

l p[ULIp pue 

U u[p

4 

 leso

 pd mu

g Iq@Aol[

 IO pXy ftp

rípu uñ

p

oopo 1 Ips @AE tm JO UoIod E o Sn Asnïox i.£ 

·sluumbl Á!!Qss@003

ep

 P

 l 

Il 4

!M Ád

uoo 

II

s MI

p! AnV 

J

(A £-EZOZ-O)



(O-202

2-34 R

EV)

A) The applicant shall identify any requirement in Section

141.0621(c) where a deviation is being requested and shall

specify why the deviation is necessary.

 Deviations related to the following shall not be granted:

 Addition of an

 overhea

d

 

st

uc

t

r

e

·

,

íiü

 

Storm Water requirements

fíií Hours of operatin·

fiv Engineering standards; and

í Accessibility requirements

Outdoor Dining on Private Property

Ihe permanent use of a prvate property for outdoor dining is permitted as a

limited use in the zones indicated with an "L" in the Use Regulations Tables in

Chapter 13, Article 1 (Base Zones), subject to the following regulatins:

íål Permit Requirements:

íll Written permission from the ecordo

wner oftheprem

isesis

required.

 A Building Permit shall be obtained in accordance with Chapter

12, Article 9, Division 2.

íâl The Building Permit permit holder shall be responsible for

maintaining the outdoor dining area. Maintenance shall include

osting of the name. phone number, and email address of the part

responsible for the outdoor dining area in a location visible from

the public riht-oway, keeping the outdoor dining area free of

-PAGE 34 OF 44-



(O-2022-34 REV)

litter, and preventing litter attributable to the outdoor dining area

from entering adjacent properties, in allevs, or within the pubic

riht-of-way.

11 The use ofanaev forthe purposes of outdoor dining shall not be

permitted.

í Removal of required o-street parking spaces on a preises where

any portion of the premises is located within a transit prioritv area

with the exception of any existing accessible spaces in accordance

with Title 24 ofthe California Code of Reulations (California

Building Standards Code), shall not be a basis of denial of the

permit.

íá The hours ofoperation of the outdoor dining operations shall be

limited to the hours that the kitchen facilities of the associated

eating and drinking estabishment are open for meal ordering.

Alcohol, food. or beverages shall not be served or permitted within

the outdoor dining area befòre 7:00 a.m. and after 10:00 p.m.

Sunday through Thursday, and before 7:00 a.m. and after 11:00

p.m. Friday through Saturday and the day prior to a City Holiday.

í Outdoor dininglocated within 150 feet cfan adjacent residential

use shall not sere or allow alcohol, food, or beverages within the

outdoor dining area before 7:00 a.m. and after 9:00 p.m. Sunday

through Thursday. befòre 7:00 a.m. and after 10:00 D.m. Frida

throu

gh Sa

turday

-PAGE 35 OF 44-



(O-2022-34 REV)

íål Outdoor dining shall comply with the sound level limits of

 the

associated eating and drinking establishment in accordance with

Chapter 5, Article 9.5. Division 4.

2 Live entertainment is not allowed within outdoor dining areas

unless a Conditional Use Pennit is granted in accordance with

Process Three and provided that the Conditional Use Permit is in

accordance with the provisions of Chapter 3, Article 3, Division

15. The Building Permit pit holder for Outdoor Dining area

shall provide a noise impact analysis to the City for consideration

before approval of the Conditional Use Permit. The noise impact

analysis shall be prepared by a qualified acoustical engineer and

shall evaluate noise and vibration impacts to the surrounding

neighborhood. A Conditional Use Permit shall not he granted for

live entertainment before 8:00 a.m. and after 9:00 p.m, Sunda

through Thursday. and before 9:00 a.m. and after 10:00 p.m,

Friday through Saturday,

m 

Des

ign 

Requ

ireme

nts:

£1 Outdoor dining on private property shall be delineated by a barrier

from the #street parkin spaces by a railing fence, or a

combination of railing and fence, and planter boxes that are at least

3 feet in heiht Solid walls are not permitted.

(Aì The barrier may be either permanently installed or

moveable. If it is moveable, it shall be affixed to a sidewalk

-PAGE 36 OF 44-



(O-2022-34 REV)

while the eating and drinking establishment is open for

business.

(Bì Awnings or umbrellas may be used in conjunction with an

area fr eating and drinking but shall not be used as a

permanent roof or shelter over the area for eating and

drinking.

21 Outdoor dining on private property shall be designed and operated

so that it may be used by people of all abilities by complying with

all of the followin

(A The surface of the outdoor dining area shall be level and

have a running slope and a cross slope that do not exceed 2

percent (1 unit vertical in 48 units horizontal).

(Bì The outdoor dining area shall not be located on a raised

Dlatform or in a sunken area unless an accessible ramp is

provided in accordance with the California Building Code

or the Americans with Disabilities Act, whichever provides

greater accessibility.

(Cì At least one wheelchair accessible seating space shall be

rovided for every 20 seats, or portion thereof.

Dì When multiple wheelchair accessible seating spaces are

provided, they shall be distributed and integrated within the

outdoor dining area.

-PAGE 37 OF 44-



(O-2022-34 REV)

í Wheelchair accessible seating saces shall have a minimum

unobstruçted maneuverability dimension of 30 inches in

width by 48 inches in depth.

(F Access Ø designated wheelchair seating spaces shall be

rovided through an accessible path with not less than 36

inches unobstructed width.

£1 Base Zone egulations for setbacks. and minimüm lot coverae.

and emergency access in accordance with the California Fire Code

sha

ll a

ppl

y.

8141.0629

Pr

om

en

ad

e

For the purposes of this Section, a promenade is defined as the partial or complete

street closure to vehicular traffic to facilitate active transportation uses such as

walking, biking, recreation, outdoor dining, and enoyable public interaction.

Promenades enhance pedestrian safety. encourage non-motorized transportation.

and foster neighborhood interaction and outdoor activities, increasing the

likelihood that more pedestrians will travel by foot or bicycle. A promenade

initiated by the City shall not be subject to the additional requirements of this

Section.

íå The following uses and other similar uses shall be permitted within a

promenade:

£11 Recreational amenities inaccordancewith Section 129.0710(d),

i

 

Arworks.

 Outdoor Dining in accordance with Section 141.0621.

-PAGE 38 OF 44-



(O-2022-34 REV)

íá Farmers Markets in accordance with Section 141.0503.

 Permit Reauirements:

(1) The creation of a promenade may be initiated by any applicant.

(A For a promenade initiated by a public agency. prior to the

installation of any furniture or improvements in the pubh-c

riht-ofwav and prior to operation ofa promenade, the

applicant shall obtain a Pubic Riht-of-Way Permit in

accordance with Section 129.0710(d), and a an for

maintenance shall be provided to the satisfaction of

 the

Transportation Director. Violations of a Public Right-of-

Way Permit shall be subject to the permit revocation

procedures set frth in Chapter 12, Article 1, Division 3.

B) Fora promenade initiated by a private apph-cant, prior to

ihe installation of any furniture or improvements in the

public riht-ofwav and prior to operation of a promenade,

the appicant shall obtain a Public Right-of-Way Permit in

accordance with Section 129.0710(d) and an Encroachment

Maintenance and Removal Agreement in accordance with

Section 129.0715. Violations of a Public Right-of-Way

Permit shall be subject to the permit revocation procedures

set forth in Chater 12. Article 1. Division 3.

Cì For a promenade where the pubh-c riht-ofwav lies within

one ownership for the entirety of the promenade, the

-PAGE 39 OF 44-



(O-2022-34 REV)

applicant shall obtain a public riht-oav vacation in

accordance with Chapter 12. Article 5. Division 9 prior to

installation of any furniture or improvements in the pubic

riht-oway and prior to operation of a promenade

1 Removal of parking with the exception of accessible spaces in

accordance with Title 24 of the California Code of_Regulations

íCalifornia Building Standards Code), shall not be a basis of denial

ofthe_permit.

£ 

Full access for emerency service vehicles shall be provided at all

times to ensure public health and safety to the satisfaction of the

City Engineer.

íál All programming of activities within the promenade shall be in

accordance with the Special Events Ordinance, Chapter 2, Article

2, Division 40.

íál 

Smokin and vapin shall not be permitted within the promenade.

For purpses of this Section. the terms smoke smokin, ape. and

vapin have the same meanings as set forth in San Diego

Municipal Code scti 43.1001.

í A promenade shall comply with all State of California Department

ofAlcoholic Beverage Control license requirements. as applicable.

íl The promenade shall comply with the sound level limits of

adiacent uses in accordance with Chapter 5, Article 9.5, Division 4.

-PAGE 40 OF 44-



(O-2022-34 REV)

íå The Gaslamp Quarter Planned District Design Guidelines shall

apply to a promenade located within the Gaslamp Quarter Planned

District.

 The Public Right-of-Way Permit permit holder shall be responsible

for maintainin the promenade. Maintenance shall include, but not

be limited to, posting ofthe name phone number. and email

address of the person responsible for the promenade in a location

visible from the pubic rht-of-way, keeping the promenade area

free of litter, and preventing litter attributable to the promenade

from entering adjacent properties within the public riht-ofway.

í Design requirements

£1 The design and placement ofstreet furniture, trees. and plantings

along a promenade shall not impede pedestrian flow.

 The placement of the name and type of the associated

establishment on umbrellas shall be permitted. Other sins shall

not be pennitted on a promenade.

í The design of a promenade shall be in conformance with current

Federal and State accessibility guidelines.

 

The design of a promenade shall be in accordance with current

storm water standardst

í Promenades shall be designed in accordance with the Spaces as

Places Design Manual.

-PAGE 41 OF 44-



(O-2022-34 REV)

§142.0640

í The Gaslamp Quarter Planned District Design Guidelines shall

apply to a promenade located within the Gaslam Ouarter Planned

D

is

tr

ic

t

.

ídl Exclusiveuse of a section of the promenade for outdoor dininghall

comply with the following:

£1 Alcoho. food, or beverages shall not be served or permitted within

the promenade before 7:00 a.m. and after 10:00 p.m. SundaY

through Thursday, and before 7:00 a.m. and after 11:00 p.m.

Frid

ay th

roug

h S

aturd

ay:

2 Outdoor dining within 150 feet of an adjacent residential use shall

not serve or allow alcohol, food, or beverages within the

romenade before 7:00 a.m. and after 9:00 p.m. Sunday through

Thursday, and before 7:00 a.m. and after 10:00 p.m. Friday

through Saturday; and

í The portion of the promenade used for outdoor dining remains

open to public during all non-operational hours.

Impact Fees for Financing Public Facilities

(a) [No change in text.]

(b) Payment of Fees

Development Impact Fees (as defined in California Government Code

Section 66000) for applicable development shall be paid at the time

required building permit fees are paid and no later than the first inspection

of the development performed by the City in areas where Development

Impact Fees have been established by City Council resolution or

-PAGE 42 OF 44-



(O-2022-34 REV)

ordinance. Notwithstanding the above, the City Manager may also require

the payment of Development Impact Fees for development that would

increase demand for public facilities and/or result in the need for new

public facilities, including outdoor dining. Development Impact Fees shall

not be required for inclusionary dweling uits provided pursuant to

Chapter 14, Article 2, Division 13 ifthe applicant has satisfied all the

requirements of Division 13 for inclusionary dweling units on the same

premises as the market-rate delling units. The Development Impact Fee

required by the City Manager shall be paid at the time required building

permit fees are paid and no later than the first inspection ofthe

development performed by the City.

Exemptions:

(1) through (5) [No change in text.]

í For development of a streetary, in accordance with Section

141.0621, the DIFs shall be assessed at a rate of 1/15th ofthe

Development Impact Fees established by City Council resolution

or ordinance, and shall be collected every two years with the

issuance ofthe applicable Public Right of Way Permit.

íll Active sidewalks developed in accordance with Section 141.0621

are exempt from DIFs.

-PAGE 43 OF 44-



(O-2

02

2-3

4 RE

V)

Table 142-06A

[No change in text.]

(c) t

hro

ugh

 (g) [N

o c

han

ge 

in te

xt.]

NJB

:nja

:jdf

08/11/2021

10/2

2/20

21 C

OR. CO

PY

10/

25

/20

21 C

OR

. C

OP

Y 2

10/26/2021 REV. COPY

Or. D

ept: Plan

ning

Doc. No.: 2786781_4

-PA

GE

 44

 OF

 4

4-

.



Pa

ss

ed

 b

y th

e 

Co

un

ci

l o

f T

he

 C

ity

 o

f S

an

 D

ieg

o 

on

 NOV 0 9 2021 ,

 

by

 th

e f

ollo

wi

ng

 vo

te

:

C

o

u

nc

ilm

em

b

er

s

 Yeas

 

Na

ys

 N

ot

 P

re

se

nt

 

Rec

use

d

Jo

e

 L

a

C

a

v

a

Je

nn

ife

r C

am

pb

el

l 

0

 

 

l 

I

S

te

p

h

e

n

 W

h

it

b

u

rn

M

on

ic

a 

M

o

nt

go

m

e

ry 

St

ep

pe

 

Marni von 

Wilpert

 

 

CI 

El

Chr

is C

ate

Rau

l A

. C

am

pil

lo

V

iv

ia

n

 M

o

re

n

o

 

0

 

 

 

U

Se

an

 E

lo

-R

ive

ra

 

 

 

 

Da

te 

of 

fin

al p

as

sa

ge

 

N

Ó

V

 2

 3

 

2

0

2

1

AU

TH

EN

TIC

AT

ED

 B

Y:

TODD GLORIA

M

ay

or

 of

 Th

e 

City

 o

f S

an 

Die

g

o, C

ali

for

nia

.

(Seal)

Ci

ty C

ler

k

j

By

A, 

IZA

BET

H

 S

. M

ALA

ND

he

 C

ity 

of

 Sa

n D

ieg

o,

 C

ali

fo

rn

ia.

, Deputy

 M

t=K

Y 

t

 

- 

na

 n

e T

or

eg

o

ng 

or

an

an

ce

 wa

s n

o

 n

ay

 p

as

se

d u

nt

il t

w

elv

e c

a

len

da

r

da

ys

 h

ad

 e

la

ps

ed

 b

et

w

ee

n t

he

 da

y o

f i

ts 

in

tro

du

cti

on

 an

d t

he

 d

ay

 of

 its

 fin

al 

pa

ssa

ge

, t

o 

wit,

 on

o

C

T

 

2

 

6

 

2

0

2

1

 

N

O

V

 

2

 3

 

20

2

1

, 

a

nd

 o

n

1 F

URT

HE

R C

ER

TIFY

 th

at

 sa

id 

or

din

an

ce

 wa

s re

ad

 in 

ful

l p

rio

r to

 p

ass

ag

e 

or 

th

at

 suc

h

re

ad

ing

 w

as

 d

isp

en

se

d 

with

 b

y 

a 

vo

te 

of

 fiv

e m

em

be

r

s o

f th

e 

Co

un

cil, 

an

d 

th

at 

a w

rit

te

n 

co

py

 o

f

th

e 

or

di

na

nc

e 

w

as

 m

ad

e 

av

ai

lab

le

 to

 ea

ch

 m

em

be

r o

f

 th

e 

Co

un

ci

l a

nd

 th

e 

pu

b

lic

 p

rio

r to

 th

e

 da

y

of

 it

s p

as

sa

ge

.

EL

IZ

AB

ET

H S

, M

ALA

ND

of

 Th

e C

ity

 o

f S

a

n 

Die

g

o, 

C

al

ifo

rn

ia

.

(S

ea

l)

C

i

t

y

 

h

, Deputy

O

ffi

ce

 o

f t

he

 C

ity

 Cl

er

k,

 Sa

n 

D

ieg

o, C

alif

or

nia

O

rdi

na

nc

e 

Nu

mb

er 

0-

 

21391


