
3

1

\

 

1

2

1

1

 

*

5

4

(

O

-

2

0

2

2

-

7

6

 

R

E

V

.)

COR. COPY 3

21439

ORDINANCE NUMBER O-

 

IEW SERIES)

DATE OF FINAL PASSAGE

 

M

A

R

 

1

1

 

20

22

AN ORDINANCE AMENDING CHAPTER 9, ARTICLE 8,

DIVISION 5 OF THE SAN DIEGO MUNICIPAL CODE BY

AMENDING SECTION 98.0502; AMENDING CHAPTER 12,

ARTICLE 5, DIVISION 4 BY AMENDING SECTION 125.0410;

AMENDING CHAPTER 12, ARTICLE 9, DIVISION 2 BY

AMENDING SECTION 129.0211; AMENDING CHAPTER 13,

ARTICLE 1, DIVISION 6 BY AMENDING SECTIONS

131.0622 AND 131.0623; AMENDING CHAPTER 14,

ARTICLE 1, DIVISION 3 BY AMENDING SECTIONS

141.0302 AND 141.0311; AMENDING CHAPTER 14,

ARTICLE 2, DIVISION 6 BY AMENDING SECTION 142.0640;

AMENDING CHAPTER 14, ARTICLE 2, DIVISION 13 BY

AMENDING SECTION 142.1305; AMENDING CHAPTER 14,

ARTICLE 3, DIVISION 4 BY AMENDING SECTIONS

143.0402 AND 143.0455; AMENDING CHAPTER 14,

ARTICLE 3, DIVISION 7 BY AMENDING SECTION 143.0720,

RETITLING AND AMENDING SECTION 143.0742,

AMENDING SECTION 143.0745, AND ADDING SECTION

143.0746; AMENDING CHAPTER 14, ARTICLE 3 BY

ADDING DIVISION 13 AND ADDING SECTIONS 143.1301,

143.130

3,143.1

305,143

.1307,

143.13

10, AND 143.

1315;

AMENDING CHAPTER 14, ARTICLE 5 BY RETITLING

DIVISION 40, AMENDING SECTION 145.4001, RETITLING

AND AMENDING SECTIONS 145.4002 AND 145.4003, A

ND

REPEALING SECTIONS 145.4004 AND 145.4005; AMENDING

CHAPTER 15, ARTICLE 1, DIVISION 4 BY AMENDING

SECTION 151.0401; AMENDING CHAPTER 15, ARTICLE 5,

DIVISION 2 BY ADDING SECTION 155.0238; AND

AMENDING CHAPTER 15, ARTICLE 16, DIVISION 1 BY

AMENDING SECTIONS 1516.0107, 1516.0112, 1516.0117,

1516.0122, AND 1516.0131, ALL RELATING TO THE HOMES

FOR ALL OF US: HOUSING ACTION PACKAGE CODE

UPDATE.

WHEREAS, this Ordinance, 

also known as the "Homes for All of Us: Ho

using Action

Package,

" amends the S

an Diego Municipal

 Code, inc

luding th

e Land Develop

ment Code, to

implement recent cha

nges in state

 law and inc

ludes incentiv

es to address loc

al housing

 needs;

and

-PAGE 1 OF 58-



O-2022-76 REV.)

C

OR. C

O

PY 3

WHEREAS, the Homes for All of Us: Housing Action Package aims to incen

tivize and

promote new housing opp

ortunities th

roughout th

e City for

 all incom

e levels; a

nd

WHEREAS, the H

omes for 

All of Us: Housing

 Action P

ackage

 will (1

) incentiv

ize the

construct

ion of more homes, focus 

development near

 transit, an

d create 

permanent

 afforda

bility;

(2) implement Senate B

ill 9 (SB 9) by adding a 

new division to

 the Land Development Code;

and (3) amend the existing Accessory Dwelling Unit regulations to align with the SB 9

regulations, an

d addresses co

mmunity concerns; and

WHEREAS, SB 9 allows local 

agencies t

o tailo

r state r

equirem

ents allow

ing u

p to four

housing u

nits on a single

-family zo

ned lot to

 address loc

al needs

; and

WHEREAS, the Homes for All of Us: Housing Action Packa

ge include

s tailored

regulations to 

implement SB 9, includi

ng setback requ

irements, parki

ng, urban tree cano

py, and

development impact fees; and

WHEREAS, the Homes for All of Us: Housing Action Packag

e amends the Land

Development Code to

 implement SB 9, to alig

n its requirements with the Ci

ty's existing

Accessory Dwelling Unit regulati

ons, and to 

address com

munity concer

ns; and

WHEREAS, the Ho

mes for All of U

s: Hous

ing Implementation

 Package

 also se

eks to

incentivi

ze housin

g for San Diegans of

 all incom

e levels

 through

 a variety

 of progr

ams and

incentives

, includin

g: afforda

ble hous

ing in all com

munities, a

n employee

 housing

 incentive

program, live/work flexibili

ty, facilitating new housing at 

City facilities, 

a housing a

ccessibili

ty

program, housing for

 families of all sizes

, building perm

it timeline adjust

ments, and aff

ordable

housing permit regulations; and

WHEREAS, City staff 

conducted ex

tensive ana

lysis and pub

lic outreach

 involving

multiple stake

holder groups

, City departm

ents, and othe

r governmental agen

cies in creating

 the

Homes for All of Us: Housing Action Pack

age; NOW, THEREFORE,

-PAGE 2 OF 58-



(O

-20

22-7

6 R

EV.)

COR. COPY 3

BE IT ORDAINED, by the Council of the City of San Diego, as fo

llows:

Section 1. That Chapter 9, Article 8, Division 5 of the San Diego Municipal Code is

amended by

 amending

 section 98.0502, to read 

as follow

s:

§98.0502

 

Establishment of the San Diego A

ffordable Housing Fund

(a) There is established a fund to be known as the San Diego Affordable

Housing Fun

d. The Affordab

le Housing Fun

d shall con

sist of

 funds

received from the commercial development linkage fe

es paid to the City

pursuant to Chapter 9, Arti

cle 8, Division 6 of the San Diego Municipal

Code; revenues fro

m the Transient Occupancy Tax as provided in

Section 35.0128 of the San Diego Municipal Code; funds received from

the Employee Housing Incentive

 Program Fee paid to the City pursuant to

Section

 143.0742 ofth

e San Diego Municipal C

ode; funds 

received f

rom

in lieu fee

s paid to t

he City and reve

nues recei

ved from promiss

ory note

repayments, share

d equity p

ayments, or 

other payments col

lected pursua

nt

to Chapter 14, Articl

e 2, Division 13 of

 the San Diego Municipal Code;

and any

 other appr

opriation

s as determ

ined fr

om time to time by

legislative 

action of the City Council. Th

e Affordable H

ousing Fun

d shall

be administered by the San Diego Housing Commission pu

rsuant to th

e

provisions of this Division, the appro

priation or

dinances and 

applicable

Council policies.

(b) There is a

lso establis

hed within the Affordab

le Housing Fu

nd, a

San Diego Housing T

rust Fund

 account. Except f

or fund

s received f

rom

the Employee Housing Inc

entive Prog

ram Fee pa

id to the City pursuan

t to

Section 14

3.0742 of the San Diego Municipal Code and fun

ds receiv

ed

-PAGE 3 OF 58-



(O-2022-76 REV.)

COR. COPY 3

from in lieu fees paid to the City and revenues rec

eived from promissory

note repayments, shared equity payments, or other

 payments collected

pursuant to Chapter 14, Article 2, Division 13 of the San Diego Municipal

Code, all funds received by the Affordable Housing Fund, either from

special funds or general fund appropriations, shall be deposited in the +

Housing Trust Fund account. The administration and use of monies from

the San Diego Housing Trust Fund shall be subject to all provisions under

this Division related to the Affordable Housing Fund.

(c) There is also established within the Affordable Housing Fund, an

Inclusionary Housing Fund account. Funds received from the Employee

Housing Incentive

 Program Fee paid to the City pursuant to

 Section

143.0742 ofthe San Diego Municipal Code, funds received from

 in lieu

fees paid to the City, and revenues 

received from promissory note

repayments, shared equity payments, or other payments collected pursuant

to Chapter 

14, Article 2, 

Division 13 of

 the San D

iego Municipal 

Code

shall be deposited

 in the Inclusionary

 Housing Fund acc

ount. The

administration and use of

 monies from the Inclusiona

ry Housing Fund

shall be subject to

 all provisions und

er this Division

 related to the

Affordab

le Housing 

Fund.

Section 2. That Chap

ter 12, Article 5, D

ivision 4 of the San Diego Municipal C

ode is

amended by amending section 125.0410, to read as

 follows:

-PAGE 4 OF 58-



(O-2022-76 REV.)

COR. COPY 3

§125.0410

 

When a Tentative Map Is Required

A tentative map is required for each

 subdivision of land except for

 aparcel map

that creates no additional lots or a lot

 created pursuant t

o Section 1

43.1315 as an

urban lot split.

Section 3. That Chapter 12, Article 9, Division 2 of the San Diego Municipal Code is

amended by amending section 

129.0211, to read as

 follows:

§129.0211

 

Closing of Building Permit Application

(a) [No change in text.]

(b) The application file for City projects and for residential master planned

developments shall be closed after two years have elapsed since the date

the Building Perm

it application is d

eemed complete. For the pur

poses of

this s

ection

, resid

ential

 master 

plann

ed

 

deveopments are

 residential

developments submitted with one or more building types constructed in

pha

ses o

n on

e or

 multip

le

 lots.

(c) through (e) [No change in text.]

Section 4. That Chapter 13, Article 1, Division 6 of the San Diego Municipal Code is

amended by amending sections 131.0622 and 131.0623, to read as follows:

§131.0622

 

Use Regulations Table for Industrial Zones

The uses allowed in the industrial zone

s are shown in Table I 31-06B.

Legend for Table 131-06B

[No change in text.]

-PAGE 5 OF 58-



(O-2022-76 REV.)

COR. COPY 3

Table 131-06B

Use Regulatio

ns Table fo

r Indu

strial Z

ones

Use Categorie

s/ Subca

tegories

 Zone

 Zones

[See Sec

tion 131.0112 for an

 

Designator

explanation an

d descriptio

ns of 1 st & 2nd> >

 IP- IL-

 IH- IS- IBT-

the

 Use C

ate

go

ries

,

 

3rd>> 1- 2- 3-

 1- 2- 3-

 1- 2- 1- 1-

Subcategories, and Separately

4th >> 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1

Regulated Uses]

Open Space th

rough Residential, Rooming

 

[No change in text.]

House

[See Section

131.0

112(a)(3)(A)1

Use Categorie

s/ Subca

tegories

 Zone

 Zones

[See Sec

tion 131.0112 for an

 

Designator

explanatio

n and descriptio

ns of

 1 st & 2nd> >

 IP- IL- IH-

 

IS- IBT-

the Use Categories,

 

3rd» 1- 2- 3- 1- 2- 3- 1-

 2- 1- 1-

Subcategories, and Separately

 th >> 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1

Regulated Usesl

Sh

op

kee

pe

r U

nit

s

 

[No change in text.]

[No p

change in

text]

Single Dwelling Units through Separately

 

[No change in text.]

Regulated 

Residentia

l Uses, Junio

r

Accessor

y Dwelling Units

Live/W

ork Quarter

s

 

[No change in text.]

[

N

o

 

)

change in

text]

Low Barrier Navigation Center through

 

[No change in text.]

Separately

 Regulated Signs Uses, Theater

Marquees

Footnote

s for Table 13

1-06B

[No change in text.]

§131.0623

 

Additional U

se Regulations of Industria

l Zones

The additional use regulations

 identified in this section 

are applicable to uses

where indic

ated in Table 131-06B. In ad

dition to the use-

specific 

regulations

below, the combined grossßoor area for the uses ident

ified in

-PAGE 6 OF 58-



(O-2022-76 REV.)

COR. COPY 3

Sections 

131.0623(a), (b), (d), (h), (k), (m

), and (n

) shall not 

exceed 35 percent of

he alow

able g

ross jloor

 area of th

e prem

ises.

(a) through (i) [No change in text.]

(j) To encourage and fac

ilitate living in closer proximity to employment

opportunities, res

idential uses in the IP-3-1 zone are perm

itted subject to

the following regulations:

(1) Residential development is permitted in accordance 

with the

Business Park - Residential Permitted CPIOZ of the applicable

community plan subject to the following:

(A) Residential

 

development

 shall not exceed a maximum of

49 percent ofthe total lot area within the Business Park -

Residential Permitted CPIOZ or, in other areas, a maximum

of 49 percent of the gross floor area of he premises·, and

(B) Residential development shall comply with the developm

ent

regulations of the residenti

al zone identi

fied in the Business

Park - Residential Permitted CPIOZ ofthe applicable

community plan, except that

 the lot area, lot

 dimensions,

ßoor area ratio, and setback requirements of the IP-3-1

zone shall apply.

(2) Residential

 

de

ve

lop

men

t is

 

permitted outside of the Business Park -

Residential Permitted CPIOZ as follows:

(A) Live/work quarters in accordance with Section 1

41.0311.

-PAGE 7 OF 58-



(O-20

22-

76

 REV.)

COR. COPY 3

(B) Shopkeeper units may include space for uses in accordance

with Section 13 1.06230)(2)(C) and shall com

ply with the

Live/Work quarters regulations in Section 141.0311.

(C) A maximum of 49 percent of

the

 

gross floor area

 on the

premises my be

 used for residential uses. At least 51

percent of the gross#oor area on the premises shall be

used fo

r Retail Sales, Commercial Servi

ces, Ar

tisan Foo

d

and Beverage Produc

er, Offices, Research and

Development, or Light Manufacturing.

(D) The residential area and the business area must be occupied

by the same tenant and no portion of the residential ar

ea

shall be r

ented or sol

d separ

ately.

(E) The residential area is permitted above, a

djacent to, or

behind the business area, provided that there is internal

access 

between the resi

dentia

l area and bu

siness a

rea.

(k) through (n

) [No change in

 text.]

Section 5. That Chapter 14, Article 1, Division 3 of the San Diego Municipal Code is

amended by amending sections 14I.

0302 and 141.0311, to read as fol

lows:

§141.0302

 

Accessory Dwelling Units and Junior Accessory Dwelling Units

Section 141.0302 provides for the c

onstruction of Accessory Dwelling Units

(ADUs) and Junior Accessory Dweing Units (14DUs), consistent with the

requirements of state law, and is int

ended to encourage 

the construction of

 ADUs

and JADUs through several loc

al regulatory provisions, includin

g eliminating

parking req

uirements for ADUs and JADUs, and providing

 an affordabl

e housing

-PAGE 8 OF 58-



(O-20

22-

76

 REV.)

COR. COPY 3

bonus o

f one add

itional A

DU for ev

ery deed

-restric

ted afford

able ADU

constructed on the

 

premises, as

 

specif

ied in

 the r

egu

lation

s be

low. ADUs ar

e

permitted in all z

ones allow

ing residenti

al uses and

 JADUs are pe

rmitted in al

l

Single Dwelling Unit Zones by-

right as a

 limited use deci

ded in accor

dance w

ith

Process 

One, indic

ated with an "L" in the U

se Regulatio

ns Tables i

n Chapte

r 13,

Article 

1 (Base Zone

s) subject t

o the fo

llowing regu

lations.

(a) The following definitions apply to this section:

(1) Single Dwelling Unit Zone

 means a zone

 that permits single

dwelling

 units bu

t does n

ot perm

it multi

ple dwell

ing units.

(2) Multiple Dwelling Unit Zone means a zone th

at permits multle

dwelling units.

(b) The fo

llowing reg

ulations a

re app

licable 

to both ADUs and JADUs:

(1) 

Use R

egu

latio

ns

(A)

 

One ADU and one JADU are permitted on apremises

locate

d within a 

Single Dwelling Unit Zo

ne with an

existing or 

proposed single dwe

ing unit.

(B) thr

oug

h (C) [N

o cha

nge

 in te

xt

.]

(Dj 

An Acces

sory

 Dwellin

g Unit or Ju

nior 

ccessor

y Dwelling

Unit shall no

t be permitted to be cons

tructed on any

premises that ha

s utilized the pr

ovisions of Chapter 14,

Article 3

, Division 13, Multi-Dwelling 

Unitand 

Urban Lot

Split R

egulatio

ns for Sin

gle Fam

ily Zones, e

xcept as

provided in Section 143.1305(c)(1).

(2) Development Regulations

-PAGE 9 OF 58-



(O-20

22-

76

 REV.)

COR. COPY 3

(A) through (C) [No change in text.]

(D)

 

An

DUorJ

ADUthat 

is con

verted

 from

 an ex

isting

dweing unit or accessoy structure or is constructed in the

same locatio

n and within th

e sam

e buildi

ng envelo

pe as an

existing dweing unit or acces

sory structure may continue

to obser

ve the 

same se

tbaek

s as the 

existin

g dwel

ling unit

or accessory structure.

E) DU and JADUstructures m

ust comply with

 the fron

tyard

and stree

t side yard

 setbac

k of

 the base

 zone. Int

erior

 side

yard and rear y

ard setb

acks for n

ew ADU and JADU

struc

tures s

hall b

e pro

vided 

as fo

llows:

0) 

One-s

tory ADUs or JA

DUs wth a struc

ture he

ight

16 feet or less may observe a zero-foot setback at

the 

interi

or side yar

d and

 rear yar

d.

(ii) One-stor

y ADUs or JADUs with a stru

cture h

eight

that exceeds 16 feet and

 multi-story ADU or 14DU

structu

res may obse

rve zero

-foot int

erior sid

e yard

and rear 

yard

 setbac

ks, unl

ess the s

ide or re

ar

property üne ab

uts anotherpr

emises that is

reside

ntia

lly zo

ned or d

evelo

ped with ex

clus

ively

reside

ntial use

s, in which c

ase a 4-f

oot set

back shall

apply.

(F) The foll

owing land

scape re

gulations 

shall appl

y to the

construction of an ADU or JADU:

-PAGE 10 OF 58-



(O-2022-76 REV.)

COR. COPY 3

(i) Ifcons

truction 

of anDUorJDUthat w

ould

bring the number

 of ADUs or JADUs on the

premises to a total oftwo or more is proposed, two

trees shall be p

rovided on the premises for every

5,000 square feet

 

oflot

 

area, with a minimum of

one tree 

perprem

ises. If plantin

g of a new tree i

s

required to com

ply with this sectio

n, the tree 

shall

be selected in accordance with the Landscape

Standards ofthe

 Land

 Develo

pment Manua

l and

 the

City's Street Tree Selection Guide.

ii) 

ADUs cons

tructed

 in acco

rdance w

ith Sect

ion

141.0302(c)(2)(C) shall comply with the street tree

require

ments i

n Sec

tion 1

42.0

409(a).

(G) ADUs and JADUs shall not be required to provide fire

sprinkle

rs i f they are

 not req

uired for

 the primary d

weing

unit. When located o

n a premises where the pr

imary

dweing unit is p

rotected

 with an

 automatic fir

e sprinkl

er

syste

m in acc

ordance

 with Se

ction R

313 o

f the

 Califor

nia

Residenti

al Code, a 

DU or JADU shall be

 protected

 with

an automatic fire sp

rinkler sys

tem.

(H) Construc

tion of an ADUor 14DU shall no

t requ

ire the

correction

 

of previously conforming

 conditions on the

premises.

(3) 

Park

ing 

Regu

lation

s

-PAGE 11 OF 58-



(O-2022-76 REV.)

COR. COPY 3

(A) through (B) [No change in text.]

(C) Notwithstanding 141.0302(b)(2)(H), if the constru

ction of

an ADU or JDU causes an existing driveway curb cut to

no longer comply with the dimensions required in Table

142-05K of Section 142.0560 for an qýstreet parking

space, the driveway shall be closed to the satisfaction of the

City Engineer.

(4) [No change in text.]

(c) In addition to the requirements in Section 141.0302(a), the following

additio

nal reg

ulation

s are app

licable

 to ADUs:

(1) [No change in text.]

(2) Development Regulations for ADUs

(A) [No change in text.]

(B) One ADUshall be perm

itted in a Singl

e Dwelling Unit

Zone on apremises with an existing or proposed single

dwelling unit.

(C) On apremises ocated in a Single Dwelling Unit Zone with

an existing multiple dwellíng unit, or a premises ocaed in

a Multiple Dwelling Unit Zone with an existing or

proposed dweling unit, ADUs shall be permitted as

follows:

(i) Two ADUs that are attached to and/or detached

from an existing or proposed structure are

permitted; and

-PAGE 12 OF 58-



(O-2022-76 REV.)

COR. COPY 3

(ii) The number ofADUs permitted within the habitable

area of an existing dweing unit structure is limited

to 25 percent of the total number of existing

dwelling units in the structure, but in no case shall it

be less than one D and

(

i

i

i

)

 

There is no limit on the number ofADUs permitted

within the portions of existing dweing unit

structures and accessory structures that are not used

as livable space, including storage rooms, boiler

rooms, passageways, attics, basements, or garages,

if each ADUcomplies with state building standards

for dwelling units.

(D) An ADU witha grossßoor area of 800 square feet shall be

permitted on apremises with an existing or proposed

dweing unit regardless of maximum lot coverage,

maximumfloor area ratio, and minimum open space

requirements. The devel

opment shall

 comply with theßoor

area ratio of the underlying base zone unless the

development incorporates an existing structure that exceeds

the allowable floor area ratio or is under the allowable

ßoor area ratio by less than 800 square feet, in which case

an DUthat does not exceed 800 square feet shall be

permitted.

(E) through (F) [No change in text.]

-PAGE 13 OF 58-



(O-2022-76 REV.)

COR. COPY 3

(G) [No change in text.]

Table 141-03A

Qualifying Criteria for Affordable ADU Bonus

[No change in text.]

Footno

tes for T

able 141-03A

(1) For-sale ADUs are subject to the requirements of Section 141.0302(c)(1)(B).

(d) In addition to the require

ments in Se

ction 141.0302(a), Juniorccessory

DweUing Units are subject to the following additional regulations:

(1) [No change in text.]

(2) 

Deve

lop

men

t Regu

lati

ons

(A) One JADUis permitted on apremises located within a

Single Dwelling Unit Zone with an existing or proposed

prmary single dwelling unit.

(B) through (C) [No change in text.]

§141.0311

 

Live/Work Quarters

Live/work quarters 

are studio sp

aces designed

 to integ

rate living

 space int

o the

workspace an

d are primarily design

ed for indus

trial or commercial occupancy

.

Live/work quarters are permitted as a limited use in the zones indicated 

with an

"L" in the Use Regulations Tables in Chapter

 13, Article 1 (Base Zones) subject

to the following regulations.

(a) [No change in text.]

(b) The minimum floor area used

 or arranged for no

n-residential

purposes 

shall be 10

0 square 

feet.

(c) through

 (h) [No change

 in text.]

-PAGE 14 OF 58-



(O-20

22-

76

 REV.)

COR. COPY 3

Section 6. That Cha

pter 14, Article 2, D

ivision 6 of

 the San Diego Municipal Code is

amended by amending se

ction 14

2.0640, to re

ad as follo

ws:

§142.0640

 

Developm

ent Impact Fee

s for Publ

ic Facilities

 and Sp

aces

(a) [No change

 in text.]

(b) Payment of Fees

Development Impact Fees

 (as defined

 in California

 Government Code

Section 66

000) for a

pplicable 

development shall 

be paid prior

 to

requesting

 a final ins

pection. A final inspecti

on shall n

ot occur

 until the

applicable DIFs are paid in areas where DIFs have been established by

City Council

 resolution or ordin

ance. Notwithstandi

ng the abo

ve, the Cit

y

Manager may also requ

ire the pa

yment of DIFs for de

velopment that

would increase demand for public faciliti

es and/or result i

n the need for

new public facilities

. DIFs shall not be req

uired for inclusiona

ry

 

dweling

units p

rovide

d pursu

ant to

 Chapte

r 14, Article 2

, Division 

13, if the

applicant has satisfied al

l the requirements of Division 13 for incl

usionary

dweUing units on the same premises as the 

market-rate

 dweling

 units.

 The

DIF amount due s

hall be bas

ed upon

 the DIF schedule 

in effect

 when the

Building Permit was issued, or the

 DIF schedule in effect when the fees

are paid, w

hichever am

ount is low

er, plus a

n automatic incre

ase consi

stent

with Section 142.0640(c), ifapp

licable.

Exemptions:

) Accessory Dwelling Units, Junior Accessory Dweling Units,

movable t

iny houses

, and g

uest quar

ters are ex

empt from DIF,

except as follows:

-PAGE 15 OF 58-



(O-2022-76 REV.)

C

OR. C

OPY 3

(Å Theûrsttw

o Accessory D

welling

 Units on a premises 

are

exempt from

 the requir

ement to

 pay DIF, regard

less of

 the

gross floo

r area of the Accessory 

Dwelling

 Unit,unkssthe

Accessory Dweing Units are constru

cted in accorda

nce

with Sec

tion 143.

1305(c)(1), in wh

ich case pa

yment of DIF

will be required in accordance with Section

142.0640(b)(1)(B).

(B) Accessory Dweing Units that 

are 750 or more squ

are feet

in gross foor area and are in excess of the first two

Accessory

 Dwelling Units o

n a pre

mises or are

 cons

rued

in accordance

 with Section 143.13

05(c)(1)

 shall be requ

ired

to pay DIF at the m

ultple dw

eing unit rate which sha

ll be

scaled in accordance w

ith Resolution No. R-313688,

adoptin

g the Citywide

 Park 

Developm

ent Impact Fee

 and

with Table 142-06A based upon th

e Accessory Dweing

Unit size, or shall 

be proportion

ate in relation

 to the square

footage o

f the p

rimary dwe

lling unit o

n the premises at th

e

multle dweing uni rate, whic

hever results in the lower

DIF. The DIF for the ccessory Dweling Unit shall no

t

exceed the DIF for the primary dweing unit.

(C) Notwithstanding Sections 142.0640(b)(1)(A) and (B),

Accessory Dwelling Units on a premises in which the

record owner agr

ees to r

eside in 

one of

 the dwe

ing un

its

as their

 primary resid

ence for

 a minimum of three y

ears

-PAGE 16 OF 58-



(O-20

22-76

 REV

.)

C

OR. C

OPY 3

from the date

 of build

ing permit issuan

ce for

 the Accessory

Dwelling Unit are exempt from the requirement to pay DIF.

Prior to the issuance 

of the building permit, the recor

d

owner shall sign an affidavit acknowledging the record

owner intends to reside in one of the dwe

ing units as their

primary residence for a minimum ofthree years from the

date of issuance of

 the building

 permit for the

 

Accessory

Dweing Unit. The affidav

it shall be i

n a form that is

approved by the 

City and re

corded in the Office of

 the

County Recorder. Thi

s requirement shall not ap

ply to a

record owner that is a co

mmunity land trust, as define

d in

California Revenue and Taxation Code Section

402.Ha)(11)(C)(ii), or is a qualified nonprofit corporation

as described in 

California Revenue

 and Taxation Code

Section 214.15.

(2) through (7) [No change in text.]

(8) The first two dweing units construc

ted in accordance

 with

Chapter 1

4, Articl

e 3, Divis

ion 13 shal

l be exem

pt from the

requirem

ent to pay DIF. The seco

nd and 

third dwelling

 units

constructed in accordance with Chapter 14, Article 3, Division 13

shall be 

required t

o pay DIF, which s

hall be sca

led in acc

ordance

with Resolutio

n No. R-313688, adopti

ng the Ciwide Park

Develop

ment Impact

 Fee a

nd Table 142-06

A, bas

ed upo

n the

dwelling unit sze.

-PAGE 17 OF 58-



(O-2022-76 REV.)

COR. COPY 3

Table 142-06A

Scaled 

Developm

ent Impact Fe

e Rate for S

pecifie

d Resident

ial Developm

ent

nit Sie(SF)

 

ealed Fee Rte

1,251 > Full Fee

1,201 - 1,250

 99%

1,151 - 1,200

 9756

1,101 - 1,150

 95%

1,051 - 1,100

 

9

2

%

1,001 - 1,050

 90%

951 - 1,000

 87

901 - 950

 85%

851 - 900

 83%

801 - 850

 

8

0

751 - 800 78%

701 - 750 76%

651 - 700

 73%

601 - 650

 

7

1

%

551 - 600

 

6896

501 - 550

 66%

(9) Development that

 designs and

 construct

s an onsite 

park that

satisfies the devel

opment's park standard identif

ied in the Parks

Master Plan, shall not be subject to the requirement to pay the

Citywide Park DIF, where the requirem

ents set forth i

n San Diego

Resolution R-313688 have been sati

sfied. Development that

designs a

nd const

ructs an onsite p

ark that 

satisfies a portion ofthe

development's parks standar

ds shall be subject 

to a proportionate

share credit of the DIF for the Citywid

e Park DIF where the

requirem

ents set

 forth in 

San Diego Reso

lution R-313688 have

-PAGE 18 OF 58-



(O-2022-76 REV.)

COR. COPY 3

been satisfied. To be eligible for 

any exemption under this

subsectio

n, the fo

llowing add

itional requ

irements sha

ll apply:

(A) through (F) [No change in text.]

(10) Interim residential development th

at obtains a Bui

lding Permit in

accordan

ce with Section

 141.0309 shall be

 require

d to pay

one-third of the applicable resid

ential DIF. At the end of 10 years

from issuance of the Neighborhood Use Permit, if the interim

residential use

 and associated Neighborhood

 Use Permit is

extended beyond the initia

l term, the remaining tw

o-thirds of

 the

applicable resident

ial DIF in effect at th

e time of the granting 

o

 f

the initial 

Building

 Permit shall b

e paid.

(c) through (g) [No change in text.]

Section 7. That Chapt

er 14, Article 2

, Division 13

 of the San Diego Municipal Code is

amended by

 amending s

ection 142.1305, 

to read as fol

lows:

§142.1305

 

Metho

ds o

f Complia

nce

(a) The require

ment to provide in

clusionary dwellin

g units may be met in any

ofthe following ways:

(1) through 

(2) [No change

 in text]

(3) On differentp

remises from the deve

lopment that d

oes not meet the

locationa

l criteria i

n Sectio

n 142.1305(

a)(2) but w

ithin the City of

San Diego, ift

he recei

ver site is

 within a transit

 priority area

, in

an area identified 

as a High or Highest Resource California Tax

Credit Allocation Committee Opportunity Area according to the

most recent California State T

reasurer TCAC/HCD Opportunity

-PAGE 19 OF 58-



(O-2022-76 REV.)

COR. COPY 3

Area Maps, and le

ss than fiv

e percen

t of the ex

isting dwe

ing units

in that co

mmunity plan

ning area are c

ovenant-

restricted to very

low income, low income, or modera

te incom

e househo

lds·,

(4) through (6

) [No change

 in text.]

(b) through (c) [No change

 in text.]

Section 8. That Cha

pter 14, Arti

cle 3, Division 4 of the San Diego Municipal 

Code is

amended by 

amending sec

tions 143.0402 and 

143.0455, to read as follows:

§143.0402

 

When Planned D

evelopment Permit Regulations Apply

This Division applies to all

 

development

 

proposa

ls for w

hich a Planne

d

Development Permit is requested, in

 accordance with Table 143-04A.

Table 143-04A

Supplemental Plan

ned Development Permit Regulation

s Applicability

Type of Development Propos

a

 

Applicable Sections

 

Required

Development

Permit/Decision

Process(')

Residen

tial dev

elopment

 

[No change in text.]

request

ing dev

iations from

applicable zone regulations2)(3)

Commercial and Industrial

 

[No change in text.]

developm

ent reques

ting devia

tions

from applica

ble zone r

egulations

)

[No cha

nge in 

text.]

[No cha

nge in 

text.]

Deve

lop

ment

s w

ith

n lan

d u

se

plans w

here a 

Planned

Develop

ment Pe

rmit is

recommended when other

discretionary actions are

requested6

143.0403, 143.0465

PDP/Process 3

Development that complies with

 

[No change in text.]

the appl

icable la

nd use plan

designation, but contains uses that

are not per

mitted in the unde

rlying

base zone{5

[No cha

nge in tex

t.]

-PAGE 20 OF 58-



(O-2022-76 REV.)

COR. COPY 3

Type ofDeve/opment Proposal

 

Applicable Sections

 

Required

Development

Permit/Decision

Prcess

Mu

ltipl

e dw

elli

ng un

it

 

143.0403, 143.0410,

development requesting increased

 

143.0455

density where the land use pan

expressly

 allows for inc

reased

dens

ity with th

e app

rova

l of

 a

Planned Development Permit()

PDP/Process 4

Rural cluster development in the

AR and OR zones

[No cha

nge in

 text.]

[No change in text.]

Rura

l clu

ster d

evelo

pment w

ith

incr

eas

ed d

ens

iy in th

e A

R- 1- 1

and OR-1-2 zones within

Prop

osit

ion

 A La

nd

Residential development in RS

zones of urbanized Communities

where a Planned Development

Permit is r

equest

ed

[No change in text.]

[No change in text.]

[No change in text.]

[No change in text.]

Footnotes for Table 143-04A

1 through  [No change in text.]

 Developme

nt utilizing the incr

eased den

siy alter

native ex

pressly a

lowed in the l

and

 usep/an in

conjunction with Chapter

 14, Article 3, Divi

sion 7, does

 not require

 a Planned Development

Permit for the inc

reased dens

io alternative p

ursuant

 to the ad

opted /and use p/an.

§143.0455

 

Supplemental Plan

ned Development Perm

it Regulations f

or Multiple

Dwelling Unit Residential 

Development with

 Increased

 Density

 per the

Adopte

d Land

 Use Plan

In addit

ion to the 

general 

regulat

ions for 

all Plann

ed Developm

ent Perm

its in

Section 

143.0410(j)(5

) through

 (11), the fo

llowing reg

ulations

 apply

 to multle

dweing unit develo

pment that requ

ests approv

al of increased

 density where the

land use plan expressly a

llows for incr

eased density with appro

val of a Plann

ed

Develop

ment Perm

it. It is 

the inte

nt of

 these r

egulati

ons to p

rovide in

creased

density in pedestri

an-friendl

y development that i

s consistent 

with the p

lanned

character of the neighborhood

 as specified in the

 land use plan.

-PAGE 21 OF 58-



(O-2022-76 REV.)

COR. COPY 3

la

 

D

ensity

(1) [No change in text.]

(2) Utilization 

of this incr

eased dens

ity alterna

tive pur

suant to the

adopted

 land use plan shall not p

reclude

 the use 

of the state d

ensity

bonus program, where applicable.

 

Devel

opm

ent

 

utilizing the

increa

sed densi

ty altern

ative exp

ressl

y allow

ed in the land

 use pla

n

in conjunctio

n with Chap

ter 14, Articl

e 3, Division 7, doe

s not

require a

 Planned

 Development Perm

it for th

e increase

d densiy

alternative p

ursuant to the 

adopted land use plan.

(b) [No chan

ge in text.

]

Sectio

n 9. That

 Chapte

r 14, Article 

3, Div

ision 7

 of the Sa

n Diego M

unicipa

l Code is

amended by 

amending s

ection 143

.0720, retitlin

g and amending sect

ion 143.0742, amending

section 14

3.0745, and adding se

ction 143.0746, to 

read as follow

s:

§143.0720

 

Density B

onus in E

xchange

 for Affordab

le Housing 

Units

(a) throug

h (h) [No change i

n text.]

(i) 

A density

 bonus 

agreem

ent for

 a develo

pment within a tran

sit priori

o

area provid

ing 10

0 perce

nt of the tot

al pre-d

ensio bonu

s and po

st-de

nsity

bonus dw

eing units as 

affordable 

to ve low income, low income, and

moderate income

 

househ

olds shall

 utilize t

he follo

wing quali

fying cri

teria:

(1) [No change in text.]

(2) Rents for all dweling units in the development shall be establ

ished

as follows:

(A) through

 (B) [No change in

 text.]

-PAGE 22 OF 58-



(O-2022-76 REV.)

COR. COPY 3

(C Moderate income dweling units inthe development sha

be affordable, including an allowance for utilities, to

moderate income households at a rent that does not exceed

30 percent of

 110 percent of

 the area median income,

except that 20 percent of the dweing units may be

affordable up to 30 percent of 150 percent of the area

median i

ncome, ifth

ose units

 contain 

at least

 three

bedrooms.

(3) through (4) [No change in text.]

(j) through

 (k) [No change i

n text.]

) A development proposal 

requesting

 an affordable h

ousing dens

ity

 bonus is

subj

ect

 to th

e fo

llow

ing

:

(1) 

[No change in text.]

(2) For deve

lopment meeting the

 criteria f

or very

 low income

househo

lds in Sect

ion 143.0720(c)(1), the d

ensity bonus

 shall be

calculat

ed as set

 forth in T

able 143-07

A. The inc

reased d

ensity

shall be i

n additio

n to any other 

increase i

n density allow

ed in this

Division.

(3) For development meeting the criteria for low income households in

Section 143.0720(c)(2), the

 

den

si

ty

 bonus shall be calculated as set

forth in Table 143-07B. The increased

 

density

 shall be in addition

to an

y ot

her 

inc

reas

e in

 

density

 allowed in this Division.

-PAGE 23 OF 58-



(O

-20

22-7

6 R

EV.)

COR. COPY 3

(4) For development meeting the criteria for moderate income

households in Sec

tion 143.0720(c) and (d), the density bonus shall

be calculated as set forth in Table 143-07C. The increased density

shall be in addition to any other increase in density allowed in this

Division.

(5) through (14) [No change in text.]

(15) For development that meets the criteria in Sections 143.0720(c)(1),

143.0720(c)(2), 143.0720(d)(1), 143.0720(d)(2), 143.0720(d)(3),

143.0720(e), 143.0720(,143.0720(g), 143.0720(h), or

143.0720, where at least 20 percent of the total dweing units

are three bedrooms or greater, an additional density bonus of 20

percent shall be granted and an additional density bonus of 10

percent of the pre-density bonus dwe#ing units shall 

be granted, i f

the densiy bonus dweing units prov

ided contain at least

 three

bedrooms.

(m) through (n) [No change in text.]

§143.0742

 

Incentives for Non-Residential Development

The Employee Housing Ince

ntive Progr

am shall be im

plemented in

 accordance

with this section. An applicant for non-res

idential development as defined in

 this

section that contribut

es to the constructio

n of affordable housi

ng through the

payment of the Employee Housing Incentive Program Fee, as adopted by City

Council Reso

lution, shall be e

ntitled to receive

 incentiv

es, as set

 forth below

.

(a) Eligible Non-residential Development.

-PAGE 24 OF 58-



(O-20

22-7

6 

REV.)

COR. COPY 3

(1) The non-residential development shall be located in a transit

priority area.

(2) For purposes of this secti

on, non-residentia

l development includes

all sub

categor

ies within the R

etail S

ales, Commercial S

ervice

s, and

Office use 

categories

, and the Lig

ht Manufacturi

ng and

 Resear

ch

& Development subcatego

ries within the Industri

al use category

 in

accordance with Section 

131.0122(a), but does n

ot include

Separately Regu

lated Uses within these u

se categorie

s.

(b) Incentives shall be consistent with Sections 143.0740(a)(1),

143.0740(b)(1)-(3), and 143.0740(c), with the following exceptions:

(1) Incentives may not be used t

o deviate from minimumßoor

 

area

ratio r

equire

ments fo

r resi

dentia

l uses.

(2) Floor area ratio may not be increased by more than 1.5.

§143.0745

 

Locating

 Required

 Afforda

ble Dwelling U

nits Off-site

A developm

ent that co

mplies with the Affordable

 Housing R

egulations 

may

provide al

l or a portio

n o f the requi

red affordab

le dwe

ing units off

-site in

accordan

ce with the foll

owing:

(a) [No change in text.]

(b) Off-site affor

dable dwellin

g units that 

do not meet the loca

tional criteria i

n

Section 14

3.0745(a) and (c) may be approv

ed with a Pr

ocess Four 

Planned

Development Permit in accordance

 with Section 126.0604.

(c) Off-site

 afford

able d

weing units 

that do

 not m

eet the 

location

al crite

ria in

Section 143

.0745(a) may be lo

cated in an area wh

ere the re

ceiver site 

is

within a transit

 priority area, an area identified 

as a High or Highest

-PAGE 25 OF 58-



(O-2022-76 REV.)

COR. COPY 3

Resource California Tax Credit Allocation Committee (CTCAC)

Opportunity Area, and less than five percent of the existing dweUing units

in that community planning area are covenant-restricted to very low

income, low income, or moderate income households.

(d) At a minimum, the same number of affordable dwe

Uing units required 

of

the development must be provided, at the same affordability levels and the

same total bedroom count as the develop

ment. The app

licant may provide

different

 bedroom

 mixes to meet the t

otal dwel

ing unit a

nd bedroom

count minimums. For purposes of calculating total bedroom count, an

affordable studio s

hall count as 60 percent of

 an affordable 

bedroom and

an affordable SRO hotel room shall count as 

40 percent of

 an affordable

bedr

oom

. Åny

 

calculations resulting in fractional units shall round up to

the next whole number.

(e) The applicant, prior 

to the issuance of the first b

uilding permit for the

development, shall secure the required number of off-site affordable

dweing units and enter into 

an agreement(s) with the Pres

ident and

 Chief

Executive Officer of the San Diego Housing Commission establishing

 the

same terms and conditions set forth in Section 143.0720 for similar

affor

dable

 dens

ity bon

us dwe

ing units

.

(f 

Off-site 

afforda

ble dwe

Uing units m

ay be

 locate

d in an exis

ting

structure), provided the applicant provides evidence that the existing

structure has a remaining useful life 

of at least 55 years from

 the issuance

of a Certificate of Occupancy pursuant to Sec

tion 143.0745(f)(2)(B

) and

complies with curren

t Building

 Code stand

ards, to

 the satisfa

ction ofthe

-PAGE 26 OF 58-



(O-20

22-7

6 R

EV

.)

COR. COPY 3

City Manager. Off-site affordable dweing units that are occupied at the

time the application is deemed complete shall comply with the State

Relocation Act pursuant to Government Code Section 7260.

(g) Prior to the issuance of the first building permit, the applicant shall record

a deed restriction against the off-site development that:

(1) through (2) [No change in text.]

§143.0746

 

Affordable

 Housing in A

ll Communities

(a) Affordable housing uses not otherwise allowed in High or Highest

Resource California Tax Credit Allocation Committee (CTCAC) Areas.

Affordable housing may be permitted in High or Highest Resource

California Tax Credit Allocation Committee Areas in accordance with

Process One on 

a premises

 located within a non-residential base zone that

does not otherwise allow multple dweing unit development, subject t

o all

of

 the

 fo

llo

wing

:

(1) The development proposes to construct one or more ofthe

following:

(A) A multiple dweing unit development in which at least 100

percent of the total delling units, exclu

sive of a manager's

unit or units, are covenant-restricted as affordable to very

low income. low income, or moderate income househods·,

() Permanent supportive housin,

(C) Transitional housing; or

(D) An emergency shelter.

(2) The premises is located within all of the following:

-PAGE 27 OF 58-



(O-2022-76 REV.)

COR. COPY 3

(A) A transit p

riority area

·,

(B) An area iden

tified as 

a High or Highest Res

ource

 CTCAC

Opportunity Area according to the most recent California

State Treasurer TCAC/HCD Opportunity Area Maps;

(C) A community planning area in which less than 5 percent of

the e

xistin

g dwe

ing units

 are c

ovena

nt-rest

ricted to v

ery

low income, low income, or moderate income

 

households;

an

d

(D) Outside of an area identified as Industrial or Open Space in

a land use plan.

(3) The reside

ntial den

sity shall b

e determined for the 

applicab

le

portion of thepremises as follows:

(A) Within Mobility Zone 1 (the Downtown Community

Planning Area), the density and#oor area ratio shall be

unlimited.

(B) Within a community planning area that meets the definition

of Mobility Z

one 3 as 

defined in

 Section

 143.1103(a

)(3

),

density

 

shall be limited by a maximumßoor

 

area ratio o

6.5.

(C) Within a community planning area that meets the defi

nition

of Mobility Zone 4 as defined in Section 143.1103(a)(4),

density shall be limi

ted by a maximumfoor area ratio of

4.0.

-PAGE 28 OF 58-



(O-20

22-7

6 R

EV.)

COR. COPY 3

(4) Residenti

al develop

ment shall c

omply with th

e devel

opment

regulat

ions oft

he RM-2-5 zone

 with the

 excep

tion

 

of density,for

area ratio, lot

 

area, and lot dim

ensions which s

hall comply with

the base zone.

(5) Development consist

ent with the criter

ia in this secti

on shall be

entitled t

o incent

ives and waivers i

n accordan

ce with Section

s

143.0740 through 143.0743.

(6) Development shall

 comply with the reg

ulations of the Airport La

nd

Use Compatibility Zone.

(7) Dweling units sha

ll remain available

 and afforda

ble for a p

eriod of

55 years or

 longer, 

as may be requ

ired by oth

er law

s or cov

enants.

(b) Affordable ho

using may be perm

itted on a

 premises owned by

 a pub

lic

agency or a 

qualified

 nonprofit 

corporatio

n (consiste

nt with Chapte

r 2

 of

the M

unic

ipal Code) in

 accor

dance

 with P

roces

s One on 

a

 

premises

located w

ithin a base zo

ne that does

 not allow

 multle dwelli

ng unit

development, subje

ct to all of

 the follow

ing:

(1) The app

lication for the prem

ises is sub

mitted by a person that has

the author

ity to fill out a

n applicati

on in accordan

ce with Secti

on

112.0102 and is 

a publi

c agenc

y or 

a quali

fied non

profit

corpor

ation 

qualifi

ed und

er Sec

tion 501(c)(3) of the 

Interna

l

Revenue Code.

(2) The dev

elopment inc

ludes o

ne of the fol

lowing:

-PAGE 29 OF 58-



(O-2022-76 REV.)

COR. COPY 3

(A) A multile dweing unit develop

ment in whi

ch at leas

t 25

perce

nt of the to

tal dwe

lling

 units,

 exclu

sive

 of a manage

r's

unit or units, are c

ovenant-restricted 

as affordable 

to very

low income, low income, or moderate incom

e households

·

,

(B) Permanent supporti

ve housing

(C) Transitional housing; or

(D) An emergency shelter.

(3) Thepremises is located:

(A) Within Mobility Zone 

1,2, or 3 as def

ined in Section

14

3

.1

10

3(

a); 

an

d

(B) Outside of

 an area 

identified 

as Indust

rial or O

pen Sp

ace in

a land use plan.

(4) The residential density shall be determ

ined for the app

licable

portion of the

 

premises as

 follows:

(A)

 

Within Mobility Zone 

1, (the Downtown Comm

unity

Planning Area), the densiy andfloor a

rea ratio shall be

unlimited.

(B) Within an are

a as de

fined in

 Section

 143.1103(

a)(2) as

Mobility Zone 2, densit

y shall be limited by a maximum

loor area ratio of 6.5.

(C) Within an are

a as de

fined in

 Section

 143.1103(

a)(3) as

Mobility Zone 3,

 density shall b

e limited by a maximum

floor area ratio of 4.0.

-P

AGE 30 O

F 5

8-



(O-2022-76 REV.)

COR. COPY 3

(5) Residential development shall comply with the development

regulations of the RM-2-5 zone with the exception of density,floor

area ratio, lot

 

area, and lot dimensions which shall comply with

the base zone.

(6) Development consistent with the criteria in this section shall be

entitled to incentives and waivers in accordance with Sections

143.0740 through 143.0743.

(7) Development shall comply with the regulations of the Airport Land

Use Compatibi

lity Zone.

(8) Dweing units shall remain available and affordable for a period of

55 years or longer, as may be required by other laws or covenants.

Section 10. That Chapter 14, Article 3, of the San Diego Municipal Code is amended by

adding Division 13 and adding sections 143.1301,143.1303,143.1305,143.1307,143.1310, and

143.13 15, to read as follows:

Division 13: Multi-Dwelling Unit and Urban Lot Split Regulations

for Single Family Zones

§143.1301

 

Purpose of the Multi-Dwelling Unit and Urban Lo

t Split Regulations for

Single Family Zones

These regul

ations are int

ended to implement California Se

nate Bill 9

 (2021-2022)

and California Government Code Sections 65852.21,66411.7 and 66452.6 by

allowing the construction of multile dweing units in single-family zones and/or

an urban lo

t split, as spe

cified in this Division. These re

gulations

 specify when

and how multle dweing unit development may be constructed in a base zone

that permits singe dwelling unit development, but not multiple dwelling unit

development.

 

These regulations also specify when and how a single

 

premise may

-PAGE 31 OF 58-



(O-20

22-7

6 

REV.)

COR. COPY 3

be split int

o two premises that

 can be deve

loped and conveyed

 separatel

y when

located within a base 

zone that p

ermits single

 dweing unit dev

elopment, but 

not

multiple dwelling unit development.

§143.1303

 

Applicatio

n of Multi-Dwelling Unit and U

rban Lot Split R

egulations

 in

Single Dwelling Unit Zones

(a) This Division applies to premises located

 within a RS, RE, RX, RT and

Planned District Zones that

 permits single dweling

 unit development but

not multle dweUing unit development, except as prohibited in Section

143.1303(b).

(b) This D

ivision 

is not a

pplica

ble in the fol

lowing circ

umstance

s:

(1) When the premises is located within any of the following:

(A)

 

Prime farmland or farmland of statewide importance, as

defined pursuant to United States Department of

Agriculture land inventory and monitoring criteria, as

modified for California, and

 designated on

 the maps

prepared by the Farmland Mapping and Monitoring

Program of the Department of Conservation, 

or land zoned

or designated 

for agricultural protection o

r preservati

on by

a local ballot measure that was approved by the voters of

that j

urisd

iction

;

0

) 

W

et

la

nd

s

·

,

-PAGE 32 OF 58-



(O-2022-76 REV.)

COR. COPY 3

(C) The Very High Fire Hazard Severity Zone, unless the

development

 

complies with Chapter 7A of the California

Building Code, which mitigates wildfire exposure risk

through materials and construction methods;

(D) A hazardous waste site that is listed pursuant to California

Government Code Section 65962.5 or a hazardous waste

site designated by the Department of

 Toxic Substa

nces

Control pursuant to S

ection 25356 ofthe California Health

and Safety Code, unless the 

State Department of

 Public

Health, State Water Resources Control Board, or

Department of Toxic Substa

nces Control has clear

ed the

site for residential use or residential mixed uses;

(IE) A delineated e

arthquake fault zo

ne as determined by the

State Geologist in any official maps published by the

California State Geologist, unless the

 

development

complies with applicable 

seismic protect

ion building

 code

standards adopted by t

he California Bui

lding Stand

ards

Commission under the California Building Standards Law

(Part 2.5 (commencing with Section 18901) of Division 13

ofthe Health a

nd Safety

 Code), and 

by the Develo

pment

Services Department;

Œ) Special Flood Hazard Areas, unless·.

-PAGE 33 OF 58-



(O-2022-76 REV.)

COR. COPY 3

(i) The premises has been su

bject to a Letter of Map

Revision prepa

red by the

 Feder

al Em

ergency

Management A

gency 

and issue

d to the loc

al

jurisdiction; or

(ii) The premises m

eets Federa

l Emergency

Management Agency requirements necessary to

meet minimum food plain management criteria

 of

the National Flood Insuranc

e Program pursuan

t to

Part 59 (commencing with Section 59.1) and 

Part

60 (commencing

 with Secti

on 60.1)

 of Subchap

ter

B of Chapt

er I of

 Title 44 of

 the Code of

 Federal

Regulations.

(G) A regulatory floodway as determined by the Federal

Emergen

cy M

anage

ment A

gency 

in any 

official 

maps

published

 by the Fede

ral Emergenc

y Managem

ent Agency,

unless the deve

lopment has receive

d a no-rise ce

rtification

in acco

rdance 

with Sect

ion 60.3(d)(3) of Titl

e 44 of

 the

Code o

f Fede

ral R

egulat

ions

. If an

 appica

nt is ab

le to

satisfy al

l appli

cable fede

ral qua

lifying 

criteria

 in ord

er to

provid

e that

 the premises s

atisfi

es this s

ubpar

agraph 

and is

otherwise eligible

 for streamlined approv

al under this

section, an application s

hall not be deni

ed on the basis t

hat

-PAGE 34 OF 58-



(O-2022-76 REV.)

COR. COPY 3

the applicant did not comply with any additional City

permit requirement, standard, or action that is applicable to

that premises

) The MHPAof the MSCP Subarea Plan·,

(I) Environmentay Sensitive Lands conserved by dedication

in fee title, covenant of easement, or conservation

easement; or

) Å historical district thatìs a designated historicalresource,

or on a premises thal contans a designated historical

resource.

(2) If the development requires demolition or alteration of any of the

following:

(A) A dwelling unit that is 

subject to a recorded 

covenan

ordinance, or law that restricts rents to levels affordable to

persons and families of moderate income, low income, or

very low income.

(B) A dweing unit that has been occupied by a tenant in the

last three years.

(3 fthe premises contains SRO hotel rooms or oher dweling units

that were withdrawn from rent or lease in accordance with

California Government Code Sections 7060 through 7060.7 during

the 15-

year

 period

 preced

ing th

e appli

cation

.

-PAGE 35 OF 58-



(O

-2022-

76

 REV.)

COR. COPY 3

(4) If the development requires the demolition of more than 25 percent

of the existing ex

terior structural 

walls of a dwelling unit, unless

thepremises has not been occupied by a tenant in the last three

years prior to application submittal.

§143.1305

 

Utilizing the Provisions of this Division

(a) An applicant seeking to utilize the provisions of this Division may use the

multiple dweing unit provisions of Section 143.1310, the urban lot split

provisions of Section 143.1315, or a combination of both in compliance

with the applicable regulations.

(b) An application to utilize the provi

sions of this Division may be denied if

the City makes a writtenfìnding based upon a preponderance of the

evidence that the development would have a specific, adverse impact upon

public health and

 safety or the physical environm

ent and there is

 no

feasible m

ethod to satisfactor

ily mitigate or

 avoid the

 specific

, adver

se

impact. A specific,

 adverse im

pact means a sig

nificant 

quantifiabl

e,

direct, and unavoidab

le impact, based on obje

ctive, identified w

ritten

public health or safety standards, policies, or conditions as they existed on

the date the application was deemed complete. The following shall not

constitute a

 specific

, advers

e impact up

on the public

 health or sa

fety:

(1) Inconsistency with a zoning ordinance or land use plan

designation.

(2) The eligibility to claim a welfare exemption under subdivision (g)

of Section 214 of the California Revenue and Taxation Code.

-PAGE 36 OF 58-



(O-2022-76 REV.)

COR. COPY 3

(c) This Division may be utilized in conjunction with Accessory Dweing

Unit development consistent with the following regulations:

(1) An appicant utilizing only the multle dweing unit provisions of

Section 143.1310 and not the urban lot split provisions of Section

143.1315 may construct two attached or detached Accessory

DweUing Units in addition to the two dweing units permitted in

accordance with Section 143.1310.

(A) The ccessoy Dweing Units shall comply with the

regulations in Section 141.0302, except that no more than

two ccessory DweHing Units shall be permitted on the

premises.

(B) Under no circumstances shall the total number of dweing

units on the lot, incusive of Accessory Dwelling Units,

exceed four.

Çl) Ån Accessory Dwellíng Unit or Junior Accessory Dwelling Unit

shall not be permitted on a premises that proposes to utilize or has

utilized both the multile dwelüng unit provisions of Section

143.1310 and the urban lot split provisions of Section 143.1315.

(A)

 

lf an Accessory Dwelling Unit or Junior Accessory

Dwelling Unit exists on a premises that proposes to utilize

the provisions of both Section 143.1310 and 143.1315, the

ccessory I>weing Unit must be removed or converted to

one of the multile dweing units permitted under Section

143.1310.

-PAGE 37 OF 58-



(O-2022-76 REV.)

COR. COPY 3

(B) Under no circumstances shall the total number of dweing

units across the two

 

lots

 

resulting from Section 143.1315

exceed four.

§143.1307

 

Rental of Dwelling Units Constructed in Accordance with this Division

A dweling unit constructed in accordance with this Division shall not be rented

for fewer than 31 days.

§143.1310

 

Construction of Multiple Dwelling Units in a Single Dwelling Unit Zone

Up to two dweing units may be permitted on apremises within a RS, RE, RX,

RT and Planned District Zones that permits single dwelling unit development, but

not multiple dweUing unit development, in accordance with the following

regulations:

(a) The development regulations of the base zone in which the premises is

located shall apply, except as specified in this section.

(1) Densio Regulations. The maximum permitted density shall be two

dweing units per 

lot. The dwe

ing units m

ay be atta

ched to or

detache

d fro

m one a

nother, 

provid

ed that 

the str

ucture(s

) meet

California Building Code safety standards and are constructed

sufficiently to allow separate conveyance.

(2) Setback Regulations

(A) No setback is required for an existing structure that is

converted to a dweing unit. In addition, a dwelling unit

that is constructed in the same location and within the same

building envelope as an existing structure may continue to

observe the same setbacks as the structure it replaced.

-PAGE 38 OF 58-



(O-2022-76 REV.)

COR. COPY 3

(B) Except as provided in Section 143.1310(a)(2),

 

dwelling

units must comply with the front yard and street side yard

setbacks ofthe base zone. Interior side yard and rearyard

setbacks for dweing units shall be provided as follows:

(Ù One-story dweling units with a structure height of

16 feet or less may have zero setbach in the interior

side yards and rear yards.

(ii) One-story dwelling units with a structure height that

exceeds 16 feet and multi-story dweing units may

have zero setbacks in the interior side yards and

rearyards, unless the side or rearproperty üne

abuts anotherpremises that is residentially zoned or

developed with exclusively residential uses, in

which case a 4-foot setback shall apply.

(3) 

Pa

rkin

g R

eg

ula

tion

s

(A) Within a transit priority area, no off-street parking spaces

are required.

(B) Outside ofatransit priority area, ff-streetparkingspaces

shall be provided as follows:

i) One of-street parking space per dwelling unit shal

be required for the construction of the third and

fourh dwelling units. Ojf-street parking spaces are

not required for the first two dweing units.

-PAGE 39 OF 58-



(O-2022-76 REV.)

COR. COPY 3

(ii) Within the Beach Impact Area ofthe Parking

Impact Overlay Zone, one t-street parking space

shall be required per dwelling unit unless the

applicant can demonstrate to the satisfaction of the

City Manager that there is access to a car share or

other shared 

vehicle with

in one block

 of the

premises.

(4) Landscape Regulations

(A) Two trees shall be p

rovided on the premises for every

5,000 square feet of lot area, with a minimum of on

e tree

perpremises. This regulation can be met by existing trees

on the premises. If planting of a new tree is required to

comply with this section, the tree shall be selected in

accordance with the Landscape Standards of the Land

Development Manual and the City' s Street T

ree Selection

G

ui

de

.

(B) If development would result in more than two dweing

units within the two premises permitted by this Division,

then compliance with the street tree regulations pursuant to

Section 142.0409 is required.

(5) Supplemental Regulations within Areas of Future Sea 

Level Rise

(A) Within the Coastal Overlay Zone, the following regulation

s

apply to dweing units constructed outside of ecial

Flood HazardAreas and within an area of future sea level

-PAGE 40 OF 58-



(O-2022-76 REV.)

COR. COPY 3

rise (within a 75-year horizon) as determined by the City

Manager based on the most current sea level rise

vulnerability maps:

(i) 

The d

weing units 

shall 

comply with the

regulations in 

Section 143

.0146(c) an

d if applicable,

Section 14

3.0146(g). The base#ood elevation

utilize

d, and

 the app

licabil

ity of Sect

ion

143.0146(g), shall be based on the FIRMZone of

the Sp

ecial F

lood H

azard

rea in close

st prox

imity

to the premises on whi

ch the

 dweing

 unit

 is

proposed. The permit requirements of 143.0110(b)

and other regul

ations of Chapter 14, Article 3,

Division 1 do not apply.

(ii) Hard shoreine armoring shall not be constructed to

protect dweing units from the effects of sea level

rise.

(iii)

 

The rec

ord owner of

 the dw

eUing unit shal

l, in a

form that is approve

d by the City, 

acknowledge the

following: (1) that the

 

dwelling unit s

 

ocated in an

area of future sea level rise that may become

hazardous in

 the future; (2) that sea 

level rise could

render it difficult or impossible to provide services

to the premises; (3) that the boundary between

public land (tidelands) and private land may shift

-PAGE 41 OF 58-



(O-2022-76 REV.)

COR. COPY 3

with rising seas and the development approval does

not permit encroachment onto public trust land; (4)

that additional

 adaptation strategies may be requi

red

in the future t

o address sea 

level rise consi

stent with

the Coastal Act and certified

 Local Coastal

Program; and (5) that the dwelling unit may be

required to be removed or relocated and the site

restore

d if it becom

es uns

afe; and

 further

 the rec

ord

owner shall waive any rights under Coastal Act

Section 30235 and related Local Coastal Program

policies

 to any

 hard sh

oreline

 armoring

 to prot

ect

the dwelling unit.

(

i

v

)

 

The record owner of the dweUing unit shall provide

notice to all occupants, upon occupancy, o f the

dwelling unit

 

of the provisions in Section

143.1310(a)(5)(A)(ii i).

(6) Develop

ment Impact F

ees for 

develo

pment co

nstruc

ted in

accordance with this Division shall comply with Section

142.0640(b).

(b) Notwithstanding Section

 143.1310(a),a second dweUing unit with a

maximum gross#oor area of 800 square feet shall be permitted on a

premises with an existing 

or propose

d dweing unit, 

regardless o

f

non-compliance with one or more development regulation

s. The

development shall comply with theßoor area ratio ofthe un

derlying base

-PAGE 42 OF 58-



(O-2022-76 REV.)

COR. COPY 3

zone unless the development incorporates an existing structure that

exceeds the allowableoor area raio or is under the

 allowableßoor area

rato by less than 800 square feet, in which case a second dweing unit

that does not 

exceed 800 square feet sha

ll be permitted.

§143.1315

 

Urban Lot Splits in a S

ingle Dwelling Unit Zone

An urban lot split is 

a lot split that divid

es an existing singlep

remises into no

more than two separately convey

able premises in a zone tha

t allows single

dwelling unit development,but not multiple dwelling unit development, and may

be permitted, subject to the following regulations:

(a) An urban lot split shall be p

ermitted in accordanc

e with a Process One

parcel map and

 

shall comply with Chapter 14, Article 4, Division 2,

except tha

t dedicatio

ns ofpubl

ic rights-

fway or the co

nstructio

n of

offsite improvements for the parcels being created and the correction of

nonconforming development regulations ofthe base zones are not

required.

(b) The expiration ofthe subdivision shall be in accordance with Government

Code Section 66452.6.

(c) The urban lot split provisions of this section may not be used if any of the

fol

low

ing

 ap

ply

:

(1) The lot was established through a prior urban lot split in

accordance with this section. A lot may only be split once in

accordance with this section. Lots created pursuant to this section

are ineligible for any further subdivision.

-PAGE 43 OF 58-



(O-2022-76 REV.)

COR. COPY 3

(2) The record owner or any person acting in concert with the record

owner has previously subdivided an adjacent lot using an urban lot

split in accordance with this section.

(d) Only residential uses are permitted on a lot that was created by the urban

lot split provisions ofthis section.

(e) Prior to the recordation of thepareel map, the record owner shall sign an

affidavit a

cknowledging

 the recor

d owner intends to reside i

n one of t

he

dweing units as their primary residence for a minimum of three years

from the date of the approval of the urban lot split. The affidavit shall be

in a form that is approved by the City and recorded in the Office ofthe

County Recorder. This requirement shall not apply to a record owner that

is a community land trust, as defined in California Revenue and Taxation

Code Section 402.1(a)(11)(C)(ii), or is a qualified nonprofit corporation as

described in California Revenue and Taxation Code Section 214.15.

 The development regulations of the base zone in which the lot is located

shall apply, except as specified in Section 143.1310(a) and this section.

(1) The minimum lot area and minimum lot dimensions regulations of

the base zone shall not apply and are replaced with the following

regulations:

(A)

 

The two lots shall be approximately equal in size, provided

that one lot shall not be smaller than 40 percent of the lot

area of the original lot.

(B) The two lots shalleach

 be no smaller than 1,200 square

feet.

-PAGE 44 OF 58-



(O-2022-76 REV.)

COR. COPY 3

(C) If the lot contains existing structures that will remain as

part of the developmen4 the lot shall be split in a manner

that complies with or comes as close as possible to

compliance with the floor area ratio of the underlying base

zone, consistent with Section 143.1315(f)(1)(A) and (B).

(2

) 

Å

 l

o

t

 

should be subdivided in a manner that complies with the

streetýontage and driveway width requirements ofthe base zone

wherever feasible. Development that does not comply with the

street,ontage and driveway width requirements of the base zone

shall record an access easement on the lot to the satisfaction of the

City Engineer.

(g) Notwithstanding Section 143.1315(f), an urban lot split and construction

of a second 

dwelling unit

 

with a maximum

 

gross floor area

 

of 800 square

feet shall be permitted on each of the los created by an urban lot split,

regardless of non-compliance with one or more development regulations,

subject to the following:

(1) The development shall comply with thejloor area

 ratio of the

underlying base zon

e unless the develop

ment incorporates a

n existing

structure t

hat excee

ds the allow

able foor area ratio or is un

der the

allowable jloor area ratio by less than 800 square feet, in which case a

second

 

dwelling unit

 

that does no

t exceed 800 square fe

et shall be

permitted.

(2) The development shall comply with the lot size requirements in Section

143.1315((1).

-PAGE 45 OF 58-



(O-2022-76 REV.)

COR. COPY 3

Sectio

n 11. That Cha

pter 14

, Artic

le 5, D

ivision 40 of the

 San Diego

 Municip

al Code is

amended by 

retitling

 Division 40, amending se

ction 14

5.4001, retitli

ng and

 amending sect

ions

145.4002 and 145.4003, and repe

aling sectio

ns 145.4004 and 145.4005, t

o read as 

follows:

Article 5: Building Regulations

Division 4

0: Housing Access

ibility Program

§145.4001

 

Purpose

The purp

ose of the Housing

 Accessib

ility Pro

gram is to e

ncourag

e acces

sible

residential

 development above 

the requirements pursu

ant to the California

Building Co

de, and to increase

 the number of accessible

 dwelüng units in the

local hous

ing supply that meet long term housi

ng needs by offeri

ng ince

ntives

that facilitat

e this type of

 accessible d

esign for p

eople of all abilit

ies. The 

intent is

to increase o

pportunities 

for persons with temporary, dev

eloping, or

 permanent

disabilities 

to "age in place" 

and thereby

 reduce the

 potential for occup

ants to be

displace

d from their ho

mes due to

 a disab

ility, as well as allo

wing tho

se person

s

to visit neig

hboring d

weing units.

§145.4002

 

When t

he Housin

g Accessi

bility

 Pro

gram

 Applie

s

(a) The fo

llowing res

identia

l devel

opment is e

ligible

 for the 

Housing

Accessibility Program:

0) Develop

ment of a multiple d

welling unit 

structu

re up to fv

e stor

ies

that provide

s an elevator

 to all stor

ies.

0 Development

 

of multi-story

 townhomes or d

uplexes

 that ex

ceed

the a

ccessib

ility req

uirements o

fthe C

alifo

rnia B

uilding C

ode

(Chapter 1 1A) and include the following: a primary entrance, at

-PAGE 46 OF 58-



(O-20

22-76

 REV

.)

COR. COPY 3

least one 

accessib

le bathro

om, at leas

t one acc

essible kit

chen, at

least one 

accessib

le bedroom

, and at least o

ne accessi

ble livi

ng

room on an accessible route.

(3) Development exem

pt from accessibi

lity requ

irements of

 the

California B

uilding Code (Chapter 1 A).

(b) Development with dwellin

g units re

ceiving deviations

 for reas

onable

accommodations 

in accordan

ce with Secti

on 131.0466 ar

e not eligib

le for

the Housing Accessibility Program.

§145.4003

 

Housing Accessibili

ty Progra

m Regulations an

d Development Incen

tives

(a) Incentiv

es grant

ed solel

y under 

the Housing 

Accessib

ility Pro

gram in

accordan

ce with Sectio

n 145.4003(e) shall not

 require ap

proval of a

deviation from the underlying base zone.

(b) [No change in text.]

(c) An incent

ive shal

i not be 

granted where it 

would allo

w develop

ment tha

t is

inconsisten

t with the polici

es in the cer

tified

 

Local Coastal Program and

developm

ent regu

lations of

 the Environmentally Sen

sitive Lands

Reg

ulat

ion

s.

(d) An incent

ive shal

l not be 

granted 

where i

t conflic

ts with State 

laws and

regulations.

(e) The follow

ing types

 of devel

opment may be gran

ted incentiv

es in

accordance with this section:

(1) A multiple

 dwelling

 unit developm

ent that provides

 an elevatorto

al floors in

 a multiple dwell

ing unit stru

cture shal

l be entitled

 to

three incentives listed in Section 145.4003(f).

-PAGE 47 OF 58-



(O-20

22-

76 

REV.)

CO

R. 

COPY 3

(2) An accessible multi-sto dweling unit that exceeds the housing

accessibility requirements of the California Building Code

(Chapter 1 lA) and Se

ction 145.4002(a)(2

) by at 

least 25 percen

t of

the total number of dweing units shall be eligible for two

incentives listed in Section 145.4003(f).

(3) A development that exceeds the requirements for the number of

accessible 

dwelling units

 

under the 

California 

Building Code

(Chapter

 1 IA) by two accessibl

e dweUi

ng units sha

ll be elig

ible for

three incentives listed in Section 145.4003(f).

(4) A development that exceeds the requirements for the number of

accessible 

dwelling units

 

under the California Building Code

(Chapter I l A) and Section 145.4002(a)(2) by three or more

accessible

 

dwelling units

 

shall be eligible for four incentives listed

in Section 145.4003(f).

(f) Incentives

An applicant for development eligible for incentives pursuant to Section

145.4003(e) may select from the following incentives:

(1) Setback regulations may be reduced by up to 15 percent for the

building with the elevator.

(2) Lot coverage regulations may be exceeded by up to 15 percent.

(3) Afloor area ratio bonus up to a maximum of 25 percent for the

building with the elevator.

-PAGE 48 OF 58-



(O-20

22-7

6 

REV.)

COR. COPY 3

(4) The applicable maximum structure height regulations may be

exceeded by up to 15 feet for the building with the elevator. The

maximum structure height may not exceed height limit allowed

within the Coastal Height Limit Overlay Zone or conflict with

Federal Aviation Regulations Part 77 airspace protection surfaces

within airport influence areas designated by the Federal Aviation

Administration.

(5) A densybonus up to 10 percent based on the pre-densiy bonus

dweing units for the entire development. This density bonus is in

addition to any other density bonuses for which the development is

eligible.

Section 12. That Chapter 15, Article 1, Division 4 of the San Diego Municipal Code is

amended by amending section 151.0401, to read as follows:

§151.0401

 

Uses Permitted in the Planned Districts

(a) [No change in text.]

(b) The permit process for a separately regulated use shall be determined in

accordance with applicable planned district use regulations, with the

exception of the following uses, which shall be permitted as a Process One

construction permit in all planned district zones that permit the use as

either a limited or conditional use:

(1) Accessory Dwelling Units and Junior Accessory Dwelling Units

shall be permitted in accordance with the regulations in Section

141.0302.

-PAGE 49 OF 58-



(O-2022-76 REV.)

COR. COPY 3

(2) Transitional housin

g facilities shall be

 permitted in accord

ance

with the regulations in Section 141.0313.

(3) Permanent supportive housing shall be permitted in accordance

with the regulations in Section 141.0315.

(c) [No change in text.]

(d) In case of conflict between Section 151.0401 and regulations for a planned

district, the planned district regulations shall apply, with the exception of

Accessory Dwelling Unites, Junior Accessory Dwelling Units, transitiona

housing facilities and permanent supportive housing, which shall be

permitted in accordance with Section 151.0401

Section 13. That Chapter 15, Article 5, Division 2 of the San Diego Municipal Code is

amended by amending section 155.0238, to read as follows:

§155.0238

 

Use Regulations Table of CU Zones

The uses allowed in the CU zones are shown in Table 155-02C:

Legend for Table 155-02C

[No change in text.]

-PAGE 50 OF 58-



(O-2022-76 REV.)

COR. COPY 3

Table 155-02C

Use Regulations Table for CU Zones

Use Categories/Subcategories

 Zone

[See

 Land

 Deve

lopm

ent

 

Designato

CodeSection 131.0112 for an

expla

nati

on and

 des

crip

tion

s

of the Use Categories,

Subcat

egori

es, an

d

SeparatelyRegulated Uses]

Zones

1 st & 2nd CU-

>>

3rd>> 1- 2- 3-

4th >> 1 2 3 4 5 3(212) 6 7 8

Open S

pace t

hrough

 Reside

ntial,

 Sing

e

Dwelling Units

Separately Regulated Residential Uses

Accesso

ry Dwelling

 Units 

L

Continuing 

Care Retirement Communities

through Home Occupations

Junior

 Accessor

y Dwelling

 Units 

-

Sepa

ratel

y Regula

ted R

eside

ntial

Uses, Live/Work Quarters through

Signs, Sep

arately Regulated Signs

Uses, Theater Marquee

[No change in text.]

L 

L

[No change in text.]

-

[No change in text.]

Footnotes for Table 155-02C

[No change in text.]

Section 14. That Chapter 15, Article 16, Division 1 ofthe San Diego Municipal Code is

amended by amending sections 1516.0107,155.0112,1516.0117,1516.0122, and 1516.0131, to

read as follows:

§1516.0107 Administration and Permits

(a) through (c) [No change in text.]

-PAGE 51 OF 58-



(O-2022-76 REV.)

COR. 

COPY 3

Table 1516-01A

Type of Development Prop

osal and

 Applicabl

e Regulati

ons

Type of Development Proposal

 

Applica

ble Sec

tions

 

Required

Permit /Decision

Process

1. 

[No ch

ange 

in tex

t.]

2. [No change in text.]

3. [No change in text.]

4. • Re-roof

ing (where the exis

ting roofing

 

[No change in text.]

mater

ial, 

roo

f st

ruct

ure

, or

 roo

f

diaphragm is altered)

• Repainting o

r recoloring

 of exterior

surfaces where the existing exterior

building color is altered

• Any additio

n to or altera

tion of any

non-historical structure which is minor

[No ch

ang

e in

text.]

in scope.

• New construction of any non-habitable

accessory structure that does not exceed

100 square f

eet in gross 

floor area an

d

that would not be visible from the

public right-of-way.

• Conversion of existing habitable or

non-habita

ble areas to

 an Accessory

Dwellin

g Unit or

 Junio

r Access

ory

Dweling Unit, or the construction of

an a

ttac

hed

 or d

etac

hed Acces

sor

y

Dwelling Unit or Juni

or Accessory

Dweing U

nit, i

n acc

ordan

ce with

Secti

on 14

1.030

2 and the a

pplica

ble

Sections ofthis Division.

5. [No change in text.]

6. 

[No chang

e in text

.]

7. [No change in text.]

§1516.0112 Use Regulation

s for Old Town San Diego Residentia

l Zones

The uses a

llowed in the Old Town San Diego Resid

ential zon

es are sho

wn in

Table 1516-01:

-PAGE 52 OF 58-



(O-2022-76 REV.)

COR. COPY 3

Legend 

for Table 1516-01

B

[No cha

nge in

 text.]

Table 1516-01B

Use R

egula

tions

 for O

ld Town Reside

ntial Zo

nes

Use Categories/Subcategories

 

Zone Designator

[See Se

ction 13

1.0112 for an

explanati

on and descripti

ons of

 I st & 2nd >>

the Use Categories, S

ubcatego

ries,

 

3rd >>

and Separately Regulated Uses]

 4th >>

Zones

OTRS-

 OTRM-

1- 1- 2-

1 1 12

Open Space thr

ough Residential, Sin

gle Dwelling

U

ni

ts

Separately

 Regulated 

Residential Uses

Accessor

y Dwelling

 Units

Boarder & Lodger Accommodations

Employee Housing through Housing for Sen

ior

Citizens

Junior Accessory Dweling Units

Residential, Separately Regulated Uses,

Live/Work Quarters through Signs, Separately

Regulated Si

gns Uses, Theater

 Marquee

[No ch

ang

e i

n te

xt]

L

L

L

[No change in text]

[No change in text]

.L - -

[No change in text]

Footnotes for Table 1516-01B

[No change in text.]

§1516.0117 Use Regulations T

able for Old Town San Diego Commercial Zones

The uses 

allowed in the O

ld Town San Diego Commercial zones 

are show

n in

Table 1516-01D:

Legend f

or Table 15

16-01D

[No change in text.]

-PAGE 53 OF 58-



O-2022-76 REV.)

COR. COPY 3

Table 1516-01D

Use Regulations for Old Town San Diego Commercial Zones

Use Categories/Subcategories

 Zone Zones

[See Section 131.0112 for an

 

Designator

expl

anation and

 desc

riptio

ns of

 I st & 2nd >> OTCC- OTMCR-

the Use Categories,

 3rd >> 1- 2- 3- 1

Subcategories, and Separately

 4th >>

 1 123 1

 2 123

Regulated Uses]

Open Space through Residential, Single

Dwelling Units

Residential, Separately Regulated Residential

Uses

Accessory Dwelling Units

Boarder & Lodger Accommodations

Employee Housing through Housing for Sen

ior

Citizens

[No change in text]

L L L

[No change in text.]

[No change in text.]

Junior Accessory Dwelling Units

Residential, Separately Regulated Uses,

Live/Work Quarters through Signs, Separately

Regulated Signs Uses, Theater Marquee

[No change in text.]

Foo

tno

tes

 for

 Tabl

e 1

516-

01D

[No chang

e in te

xt.]

§-1516.0122 Use Regulations T

able for Old Town San Diego Open Space-P

ark Zones

The uses allowed in the Old Town San Diego Open Space-Park zones are shown

in Table 

1516-01F:

Legend for Table 1516-01F

[No change in text.]

-PAGE 54 OF 58-



(O-2022-76 REV.)

COR. COPY 3

Table 1516-01F

Use Regulations for Old Town San Diego Open Space-Park Zones

Use Categories/

 Zone

Subcategories

 

Designator

[Sce

 Se

ctio

n 1

31.01

12

 

1 st & 2nd>>

for Use Categories,

 

3rd >>

Subcategories, and

 4th >>

Separately

Regulated Uses]

Open Space through Residential, Single

Dwelling Units

Separately Regulated Residential

IJses

Zones

OTOP-

1- 2-

1 1

[No change in text]

Accessory Dwelling Unis

Boarder & Lodger Accommodations

Employee Housing through Housing

for Senior Citizens

Junior Accessory Dwelling Units

[No change in text]

[No change in text]

Residential, Separately Regulated

Uses, Live/Work Quarters through

Signs, Separately Regulated Signs

Uses, Theater Marquee

[No change in text]

Footnotes for Table 1516-01F

[No change in text.]

§1516.0131 Accessory Buildings for Old Town San Diego Residential Zones

(a) through (d) [No change in text.]

(e) Habitable accessory buildings may be permitted:

(1) to a single dwelling unit in accordance with Section

141.0307, or

(2) [No change in text.]

Section 15. That a full reading of this Ordinance is dispensed with prior to passage, a

written copy having been made available to the Council and the public prior to the day of its

passage.

-PAGE 55 OF 58-



(O-2022-76 REV.)

COR. COPY 3

Section 16. That prior to becoming effective, this Ordinance shall be submitted to the

San Diego County Regional Airport Authority acting as the

 Airport Land Use Commission

(ALUC) for a consistency determination.

That if the ALUC finds this Ordinance consistent with the Airport Land Use

Compatibility Plans (ALUCP) for San Diego International Airport, Marine Corps Air Station

Miramar, Gillespie Field, Montgomery Field, and Brown Field Airport (collectively, Airports),

this Ordinance shall take effect and be in force on the thirtieth day from and after the finding of

consistency, or on the thirtieth day from and after its final passa

ge, whichever is later, ex

cept that

the provisions of this Ordinance inside the Coastal Overlay Zone, which are subject to California

Coastal Commission jurisdiction as a City of San Diego Local Coastal Program amendment,

shall not take effect until the date the California Coastal Commission unconditionally certifies

those pro

visions 

as a local

 coastal p

rogram

 amendment.

That if the ALUC determines that this Ordinance is inconsistent or conditionally

consistent, subject to proposed modifications, with the ALUCPs for the Airports, the Ordinance

shall be submitted to the Council for reconsideration.

That if the ALUC determines that this Ordinance is conditionally consistent with the

ALUCPs for the Airports, but that consistency is subject to proposed modifications, with the

ALUCPs for the Airports, the Ordinance shall be submitted to the Council for reconsideration.

That if the ALUC determines that this Ordinance is conditionally consistent with the

ALUCPs for the Airports, but that consistency is subject to proposed modifications, the Council

may amend this Ordinance to accept the proposed modifications, and this Ordinance as amended

shall take effect and be

 in force on the thirtieth day from and after its final passage, except tha

t

the provisions of this Ordinance as amended inside the Coastal Overlay Zone, which are subject

to California Coastal Commission jurisdiction as a City of San Diego Local Coastal Program

-PAGE 56 OF 58-



(O-2022-76 REV.)

COR. COPY 3

amendment, shall not take effect until the date the California Coastal Commission

unconditionally certifies

 those provisions as a local coastal

 program amendment.

That a proposed decision by the Council to overrule a determination of inconsistency or

to reject the proposed modifications for a find

ing of conditional consistenc

y shall include the

findings required pursuant to Public Utilities Code section 21670 and require a two-thirds vote.

The proposed decision and findings shall be forwarded to the ALUC, the California Department

of Transportation, Division of Aeronautics, and the airport operators for the Airports. The

Council shall hold a second hearing not less than 45 days from the date the proposed decision

and findings were provided, at which hearing any comments submitted by the public agencies

shall be considered and a final decision to overrule a determination of inconsiste

ncy shall require

a two-thirds vote.

That if the Council makes a final decision to overrule a determination of inconsistency,

this Ordinance shall take effect a

nd be in force on the

 thirtieth day from and after that final

decision, except that the provi

sions of this Ordinance inside the 

Coastal Overlay Zone, which are

subject to California Coastal Commission jurisdiction as a City of San Diego Local Coastal

Program amendment, shall not take effect until the date the California Coastal Commission

unconditio

nally certifi

es those pro

visions as 

a local coas

tal progr

am amendment.

Section 17. That no permits shall be issued for development that is inconsistent with the

provisions ofthis Ordinance unless a deemed complete application for such permits is submitted

to the City prior to the date on which the applicable provisions of this Ordinance become

effective.

Section 18. That San Diego Ordinances O-21380,-21391,-21401,-2022-1,

O-2022-36,-2022-37,O-2022-48,-2022-59,O-2022-60, and O-2022-68 have been recently

considered by the Council; and that Ordinances O-2022-43 and O-2022-45 will be considered by

-PAGE 57 OF 58-



(O-2022-76 REV.)

COR. COPY 3

the City Council

 in the near fut

ure which a

mend San Diego Municipal C

ode sections 

also

amended by 

this Ordinance

; therefo

re, the City Clerk, with the w

ritten ap

proval a

nd concur

rence

of the City Attorney, i

s authorize

d to reco

ncile the

 numbering of sectio

ns and pl

acement of

 text

within this sectio

n upon the fin

al passage

 of the Ordi

nances, without f

urther actio

n by

 the City

Counc

il, pu

rsuan

t to S

an Diego 

Chart

er sec

tion 27

5.

APPROVED: MARA W. ELLIOTT, City Attorney

By /s/ Lauren N. Hendrickson

Lauren N. Hendrickson

Deputy City Attorney

LNH:jdf:cm

12/16/2021

02/08/2022 REV.

02/08/2022 COR. COPY

04/06/2022 COR. COPY 2

04/25/2022 COR. COPY 3

Or.Dept: Planning

Doc. No. 2946698_2

1 here

y certif

y at the. foreg

oing Ord

inarã

lf f

 

assed b

y the C

ounci

l of the 

City o

f

Sa

n Dieg

o, at 

thi

s m

eet

ing of

 2022

ELIZABETH S. M

AL*

l

City Clerk 

Deputy City Clerk

Appr

ove

d:

TODD GLORIA, Mayor

>oe·.

(date)

 

TODD GLORIA, M

ayor

(NOTE: 

See 

memo

 an

d si

gna

ture

 pag

e.)

-PAGE 58 OF 58-



Office of

The City Attorney

City of San Diego

MEMORANDUM

DATE:

 

April 25,2022

TO: 

Matthew Hilario, Legislative Recorder

FROM: 

Lauren N. Hendrickson, Deputy City Attorney

SUBJECT:

Correction to O-21439 REV. COR. COPY 3 (O-2022-76) Housing Action

Package Code Update

This Memorandum is presente

d, pursuant to 

San Diego Char

ter (Charter

) section 275

(a), to

noti fy the O

ffice of the City Clerk that this Office is reque

sting to correct

 a typograph

ical or

clerical error in Table 141-03A Footnote 1 with respect to Ordinance No. O-21439 (O-2022-76).

This Office approves

 of the reques

ted correction,

 as permitted under the

 provision

 of Charte

r

section 275(a).

We are submitting a corre

cted clean copy and stri

keout of

 the Housing Action Package Code

Update ordin

ance (bot

h COR. COPY 3) to ref

lect the fo

llowing chan

ge:

In Table 141-03A titled "Qualifying Cr

iteria for Affordable ADU Bonus" (on page 14 ofthe

ordinance an

d strikeout), Fo

otnote 1, it is corre

ct to delete "141.0302(b)(1)(Br and repl

ace it

with "141.0302(c)(1)(B)."

No other substantive 

changes were made on the ordinance o

r strikeout.

LNH:cm

Doc. No. 2962210

CC:

 

Gil Sanchez

, Associa

te Managem

ent Analyst

Sonia Pickens, Municipal Code Administrator

 Charter section 275 addresses modifications to ordinances as follows:

An alteration necessary only to correct a typographical or clerical error or omission may be

performed by the City Clerk with the written approval and concurrence of the City Attorney, so

long as the alteration does not materially or substantially alter the contents, requirements, rights,

responsibilities, conditio

ns, or prescriptions con

tained in the origina

l text of the ordinance. A

typographical or clerical error shall include

, but is not limited to, incorrect spelling

, grammar,

numbering, punc

tuation, tra

nsposed words or numbers, and duplicate w

ords or num

bers.

San Diego Charter § 275(a).



(O-2022-76 REV.)

COR. COPY

I hereby certify that the foregoing Ordinance was Dassed by the Council of the City of

M

A

R

 

1

 

2

0

2

2

San Diego, at this meeting of

ELIZABH S. MALAND

ity e  ,

By

/Bputy CitíCIerk

 

1

2

Approved:

 

 

 

 

-

(date)

 

- TODI)5@îIA, Mayor

Vetoed:

(date)

 

TODD GLORIA, Mayor

-PAGE 57 OF 57-



(O-20

22-7

6

 REV.)

COR. COPY 3

STRIKEOUT ORDINANCE

OLD LANGUAGE: eOut

NEW LANGUAGE: Double Underline

ORDINANCE NUMBER O-

 

(NEW SERIES)

DATE OF FINAL PASSAGE

AN ORDINANCE AMENDING CHAPTER 9, ARTICLE 8,

DIVISION 5 OF THE SAN DIEGO MUNICIPAL CODE BY

AMENDING SECTION 98.0502; AMENDING CHAPTER 12,

ARTICLE 5, DIVISION 4 BY AMENDING SECTION 125.0410;

AMENDING CHAPTER 12, ARTICLE 9, DIVISION 2 BY

AMENDING SECTION 129.0211; AMENDING CHAPTER 13,

ARTICLE 1, DIVISION 6 BY AMENDING SECTIONS

131.0622 AND 131.0623; AMENDING CHAPTER 14,

ARTICLE 1, DIVISION 3 BY AMENDING SECTIONS

141.0302 AND 141.0311; AMENDING CHAPTER 14,

ARTICLE 2, DIVISION 6 BY AMENDING SECTION 142.0640;

AMENDING CHAPTER 14, ARTICLE 2, DIVISION 13 BY

AMENDING SECTION 142.1305; AMENDING CHAPTER 14,

ARTICLE 3, DIVISION 4 BY AMENDING SECTIONS

143.0402 AND 143.0455; AMENDING CHAPTER 14,

ARTICLE 3, DIVISION 7 BY AMENDING SECTION 143.0720,

RETITLING AND AMENDING SECTION 143.0742,

AMENDING SECTION 143.0745, AND ADDING SECTION

143.0746; AMENDING CHAPTER 14, ARTICLE 3 BY

ADDING DIVISION 13 AND ADDING SECTIONS 143.1301,

143.1303, 143.1305, 143.13

07, 143.1310, AND 143.1315;

AMENDING CHAPTER 14, ARTICLE 5 BY RETITLING

DIVISION 40, AMENDING SECTION 145.4001, RETITLING

AND AMENDING SECTIONS 145.4002 AND 145.4003, AND

REPEALING SECTIONS 145.4004 AND 145.4005; AMENDING

CHAPTER 15, ARTICLE 1, DIVISION 4 BY AMENDING

SECTION 151.0401; AMENDn4G CHAPTER 15, ARTICLE 5,

DIVISION 2 BY ADDING SECTION 155.0238; AND

AMENDING CHAPTER 15, ARTICLE 16, DIVISION 1 BY

AMENDING SECTIONS 1516.0107, 1516.0112, 1516.0117,

1516.0122, AND 1516.0131, ALL RELATING TO THE HOMES

FOR ALL OF US: HOUSING ACTION PACKAGE CODE

UPDATE.

-PAGE 1 OF 69-



(O-2022-76 REV.)

COR. COPY 3

§98.0502 Establishment of the San Diego Affordable Housing Fund

(a) There is established a fund to be known as the San Diego Affordable

Housing Fund. The Affordable Housing Fund shall consist of funds

received from the commercial development linkage fees paid to the City

pursuant to Chapter 9, Article 8, Division 6 of the San Diego Municipal

Code; revenues from the Transient Occupancy Tax as provided in

Section 35.0128 of the San Diego Municipal Code; funds received from

the Employee Housing Incentive Program Fee paid to the City pursuant to

Section 143.0742 of the San Die.Mnicipal.Cde; funds received from

in lieu fees paid to the City and revenues received from promissory note

repayments, shared equity payments, or other payments collected pursuant

to Chapter 14, Article 2, Division 13 ofthe San Diego Municipal Code;

and any other appropriations as determined from time to time by

legislative action ofthe City Council. The Affordable Housing Fund shall

be administered by the San Diego Housing Commission pursuant to the

provisions of this Division, the appropriation ordinances and applicable

Council policies.

(b) There is also established within the Affordable Housing Fund, a

San Diego Housing Trust Fund account. Except for funds received from

ihe_Emlpx_Housin Incentive Program Fee paid to the City pursuant to

Section 143.0742 of the San Dieg u unicial Code and

 funds received

from in lieu fees paid to the City and revenues received from promissory

note repayments, shared equity payments, or other payments collected

-PAGE 2 OF 69-



(O-2022-76 REV.)

COR. COPY 3

pursuant to Chapter 14, Article 2, Division 13 of the San Diego Municipal

Code, all funds received by the Affordable Housing Fund, either from

special funds or general fund appropriations, shall be deposited in the

Housing Trust Fund account. The administration and use of monies from

the San Diego Housing Trust Fund shall be subject to all provisions under

this Division related to the Affordable Housing Fund.

(c) There is also established within the Affordable Housing Fund, an

Inclusionary Housing Fund account. Funds received from he Employee

Housing Incentive Program Fee paid to the Citypursuant to Section

143.0742 of the San Diego Municipal Code. funds received from in lieu

fees paid to the City and revenues received from promissory note

repayments, shared equity payments, or other payments collected pursuant

to Chapter 14, Article 2, Division 13 of the San Diego Municipal Code

shall be deposited in the Inclusionary Housing Fund account. The

administration and use of monies from the Inclusionary Housing Fund

shall be subject to all provisions under this Division related to the

Affordable Housing Fund.

§125.0410

 

When a Tentative Map Is Required

A tentaive map is required for each subdivision of land except for apareel map

that creates no additional

 

lots or a lot 

reate_ oursuant to Section 143.1315 as a

urban lot split.

§129.0211

 

Closing of Building Permit Application

(a) [No change in text.]

-PAGE 3 OF 69-



O

-2

0

2

2

-

7

6

 

R

E

V

.)

COR. COPY 3

§131.0622

(b). The application file for City projects and for residential master planned

development shall be closed after two years have elapsed since the date

the Building Permit application is deemeempleedeemed

 

comlete. for

the purpose

s of this section,

 residential master lanned deve

lovments are

residential

 

developments

 

submitted with one or more building types

constructed in phases on one or multiple

 

lots.

(c) through (e) [No change in text.]

Use Regulations Table for Industrial Zones

The uses allowed in the industrial zones are shown in Table 131-06B.

Legend for Table 131-06B

[No change in text.]

Table 131-06B

Use Regulations Table for Industrial Zones

Use Categories/ Subcategories

[See Section 131.0112 for an

explanation and descriptions of

the Use Categories,

Subcategories, and Separately

Regulated Usesl

Zone Zones

Designator

1 st & 2nd> > IP- IL- IH- IS- IBT-

3rd >> 1- 2- 3- 1- 2- 3- 1- 2- 1- 1-

4th >> 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1

Open Sp

ace th

rough 

Resident

ial, Roomin

g

 

[No change in text.]

House

[See Section

131.0112(a)(3)(A)1

Use Categories/ Subcategories

 Zone Zones

[See Section 131.0112 for an

 

Designator

explanation and descriptions of

 1 st & 2nd> > IP- IL- IH- 

IS- IBT-

the Use Categories,

 3rd» 1- 2- 3- 1- 2- 3- 1- 2- 1- 1-

Subcategories, and Separately

 

th >> 1 1 1  1 1 1 1 1 1

Regulated Usesl

Shopkeeper Units

 

[No change in text.]

[No - )

changein

text]

-PAGE 4 OF 69-



(O-2022-76 REV.)

COR. COPY 3

Use Categories/ Subcategories

 

Zone Zones

[See Section 131.0112 for an

 

Designator

explanation and descriptions of

 1 st & 2nd> > IP- IL-

 IH- S- IBT-

the Use Categories,

 3rd >> 1- 2- 3- 1- 2-

 3- 1-

 2- 1- 1-

Subcategories, and Separately

 4th >> 1 1 1

 1 1 1 1 1 1 1

Regulated Usesl

Single Dwelling Units through Separately

 

[No change in text.]

Regulated Residential Uses, Junior

Accessory Dwelling Units

Live/Work Quarters

 

IN  -

 

[No change in text.]

changein

text]

Low Barrier Navigation Center through

Separately Regulated Signs Uses, Theater

Marquees

[No change in text.]

Footnotes for Table 13I-06B

[No change in text.]

§131.0623

 

Additional Use Regulations of Industrial Zones

The additional use regulations identified in this âection are applicable to uses

where indicated in Table 131-06B. In addition to the use-specific regulations

below, the combined gross floor area for the uses identified in Sections

131.0623(a), (b), (d), (h), (k), (m), and (n) shall not exceed 35 percent ofthe

alowable gross floor area of he premises.

(a) through (i) [No change in text.]

(i) To encourae and facilitate livin in closer proximit to emlovment

opportunities, Residential uses in the IP-3-1 zone are permitted subject to

the following regulations:

(1) Residential development is permitted in accordance with the

Business Park - Residential Permitted CPIOZ of the applicable

community plan subiect to the following:

-PAGE 5 OF 69-



(O-2022-76 REV.)

COR. COPY 3

() Residen

tial de

velopm

ent co

mprise

s no more th

an shall no

t

exceed a mažçjmum of 49 percent of the tot

al lot area

 within

the Business Park - Residential Permitted CPIOZ or. in

other are

as, a m

aximum of 49_percent

 of the ross

 oor

area ofthepremises; and

(1) Residential dev

elopment eemplishall comply with the

development regulation

s of the residentia

l zone identifie

d in

the Business Park - Residntial Permitted CPIOZ of the

applica

ble community plan, e

xcept tha

t the lot

 area, lot

dimensions,foor area ratio, and setback requirements of

the 

IP-3-1 zo

ne s

hall 

app

ly.

1 Residential development is permitted outside of the Business Park -

Residential Permitted CPIOZ as follows

 Live/work auarters in accordance with Section 141.0311.

(B) Shokeeer units

 mav inclu

de sce for us

es in accor

dance,

with Secion 131.0623*2)(C) and shall comply with the

ive/Work quarters regulations in Section 141.0311.

  maximum of 49 percent of the .ross floor a

rea on the

premises may be

 

used for re

side

ntial u

ses. At lea

st 51

perçen

t ofthe

ross floo

rareaon the_

rems_ shall be

used for Retail Sa

les. Commercial Services

. Artisan Foo

and Beverae Producer, Offices, Research and

Develoment. or Lig

ht Manufaçtur

ine

-PAGE 6 OF 69-



(O-2022-76 REV.)

COR. 

COPY 3

(Dì Ihe residential area and the business area must be occupied

þv the s

ame tena

nt and no ortion o

fthe res

idential

 area

shall 

be ren

ted or

 sold 

separ

atey.

E) The residential area is permitted above, adiacent to, or

behind the business area, provided that there is internal

access between the residential area and business area

00 through (n) [No change in text.]

§141.0302

 

Accessory

 Dwelling U

nits and Junior Accessory

 Dwelling

 Units

Section 141.0302 provides fo

r the const

ruction o

f Accessory Dweing Units

(ADUs) and Junior Accesso Dweing Units (JADU1 consistent w

ith the

requirements of state law, and is i

ntended to encourage 

the constru

ction of ADUs

and JADUs through several local regulatory provisions, including alewig

encroachment into the interior sid yard and rearard sctback up to the poperty

Urliminating parking requirements for DUs and JADUs, and providing an

affordable housing b

onus of one additi

onal ADU for every deed-restricted

affordable DU constructed on the premises, as specified in the regulations

below.

 ADUs are

 

permitted in all zones allowing residential uses and

 JADUs are

permitted in all øigle-e#ig-un žSingle Dwelling Unit Zones by-right a

s a

limited use

 decided

 in acco

rdance 

with Proce

ss One, ind

icated with an "L" in 

the

Use Regulations Tables in Chapter 13, Article 1 (Base Zones

) subject to the

following regulations.

í The following-definitions DDIV to this sectior

-PAGE 7 OF 69-



(O-2022-76 REV.)

COR. COPY 3

£1 Sinle Dwellin Unit Zone means a zone that rmits sinle

dwellin · units but does not ermit multiple dwellin units.

Q Multiple Dwelling Unit Zone 

means a zone t

ha prmits multiple

dw

eil

ing

 u

nit

s.

(2) The following regulations are applicable t

o both ADUs and JD Us:

(1) Use Regulations

(A) One DUand one JADU are permitted on apremises

located

 within a sige

e#igw

i#-žS

ine_Dwelline Unit

Zone with an existing o

r proposed single dweing unit.

(B) through (C) [No change in text.]

(D)

 

An Access

ory Dwellinž

 Unit or Ju

nior Acce

ssoy Dwe

llin

Unit shall not be permitted to be constructed on any

remises

 

that has utilized the Drovisions of Chater 14.

Article 3, Division 13, Multi-Dwelling Unit and Urban Lot

Split Regulation

s for Single family Zones, e

xcept as

roviled in Section 143.1305(c)(l).

(2) Development Regulations

(A) through (C) [No change in text.]

(D) The following setback

 allowanccs are applic

able:

 Conversion of cisting :tructurc to an.1DU or

DU No setback is required for an eisting

dweling unit or accessory :tructur: tht \

converted to an .DU or 1.1DU, or to a portion of an

-PAGE 8 OF 69-



(O-2022-76 REV.)

COR. COPY 3

DU or JDU. An ADU or JADW thais

constructed in the same location and to the :ame

dimensions as an existing structure may continue to

observe the :ame etbac as the structure it

 New.1DUand J.DUstructurs. New.DUand

1DUstructurc must comply with the front yard

and stret side yard :ctback of the zone. New DU

ûndDU.tructures may encroach into the

required interio

r sido ard and rearard:ctback

 up

to the

 

proprt

 inc to accommodate construction of

the ADW or JADU.

An ADUorUDU.that_is converted from an existing

dwein unit or accessorv structure or is constucted in the

same location and within thesame ådldin envelope as an

existing dwellimr unit or accescy structure_may continue

to observ

e the same setb

cks as th

e existin

 dwellin

e unit

or accessor strucure.

(E) DUs and JADUs shall not be required to provid fire

sprikers if they are not required for the primary dling

uit. When located on a premises where the primary

dllig unit is 

protected 

with an auto

matic fire

 sprink

ler

>'stem in accordance with Section R313 ofthc California

-PAGE 9 OF 69-



(O-2022-76 REV.)

COR. COPY 3

Residential Code, an DU or lDU shall be protected with

an automatic fire sprinkler system. ADU and JADU

structures must comply with the front vard and street side

yardsetbacký of the báse zone. Interior side yard and rea

yard setbacks for new ADU and JADU structures sha\\ be

rovled as follows:

1 One-story ADUs or JADUs with a structure 

height

16 feet or less may observe a zero-foot setback at

the interior side vard and rear vard.

 One-storv ADUs or JADUs wih a structure heiht

that exceeds 16 feet and multi-stoy

 ADU or JADU

structures may observe zero-foot interior side vard

and rearyard sebacks

_unless-the s

ide or rear

property line abuts another premises hat is

ridentil

ly_onç or.deyelop

çd_with exclu

sively

reside

ntial uses,

 in which

 çase a

 4-foo

t setba

k shall

al

(F) The following landscape regulations shall apply to the

construction of an ADU or JDU:

 If construction of an ADUor JADU that would

bring the number

 

of ADUs or JADUs

 on the

premises to a total of two or more is proposed, two

trees shall be rovided on ihpremises for every

-PAGE 10 OF 69-



(O

-2022-7

6

 REV.)

COR. COPY 3

5,000 square feet of lot area, with a minimum of

one tree per premises, If plantin of a new tree is

required to comply with this section, the tree shall

be sel

ected i

n accord

ance w

ith the

 Landscape

Standards of the Land Development Manual and the

City's Street Tree Selection Guide.

£ìil ADUs constructed in accordance with Section

141.0302(c)(2)(C) shall comply with the street tree

requi

rements in

 Sect

ion 14

2.0409(

) ADUs and JDUs shall not be required to provide fire

sprinklers i f they are not required for the primary dweing

unit. When located on a premises where the primary

dwelling unit is protected with an automatic fire sprinkler

system in accordance with Section R313 of the California

Residential Code, a ADU or 14DU shall be protected with

an automatic fire sprinkler system.

í Construction ofan ADU or JADUshall not require the

correction

 

of previously conformin

 

conditions on the

premises.

(3) Parking Regulations

(A) through (B) [No change in text.]

-PAGE 11 OF 69-



-2022-76 REV.)

COR. COPY 3

íí Notwithstandin 141.03020£(2£H). if the construction of

an DUor 14DU causes an existin drivewy_curb cut

 to

 longer cmly withthe çljmnsins required in Table

142-05K of Section 142.0560 for an #-street parking

space, th driveway shall be closed to the satisfaction of the

City Engineer.

(4) [No change in text.]

() In addition to the requirements in Section 141.0302(a), the following

additional regulations are applicable to

 ADUs

(1) 

[N

o c

han

ge

 in

 tex

t.]

(2) Development Regulations for ADUs

(A) [No change in text.]

(3) Ne-mee4h-eQne ADU shall 

be permitted

 jn a Sin

le

Dwelling Unit Zone on a

 

premises

 

with an existing or

proposed singe dwelling unit.

(C) A leeateQn apremises located i

n a Single Dwdling

Unit Zone 

with an existi

ng multile d

wellin

 unit, or

 a

premses

 

located in a Multiple Dwelling Unit Zone with an

existing or proposed elling unit, ADUs shall be

permitted as follows:

(i) The number of.DU permitted within the habitable

ûreù of an cústing multiple dwe!!ing unit structure

is limited to 25 percent of the total number of

-PAGE 12 OF 69-



(O-2022-76 REV.)

COR. COPY 3

eisting dling unit in the structure, but in no

case shall be less than one .DU;Two

 

ADUs

 

th

at

 ar

e

attached to and/or detached from an existing or

Droposed structure are permitted; and

(ii) Two DUs th

 

at are detached from an existing

mutiple dwelling unit structure ore permittedýhe

number

 

of

ADUs

 

permitted within the habitable

area of an existing dwellin unit structure is limited

to 25 percent of the total number Of existjng

dwellin units in the structure, but in no case shall it

be le

ss t

han

 one A

DM and

(iii)

 

There is no limit on the number ofADUs permitted

within the portions of existing mWe-dweing

unit structures nd accessor structures hal are not

used as livable space, including storage rooms,

boiler rooms, passageways, attics, basements, or

garages, if each ADU complies with state building

standards for dwelling units.

(D)

 

An ADUwitha grossßoor area of 800 square feet shall be

permitted on apremises with an existing or proposed

dweing unit regardless of maximum lot coverage,

maximum floor area ratio, and minimum open space

requirements. The development shall comply with theloor

-PAGE 13 OF 69-



(O-2022-76 REV.)

COR. COPY 3

area ratio ofthe underlying base zone unless the

development incorporates an existing structure that exceeds

the allowablýfloor area ratio or is under the allowable

floor area ratio by

 

less than 800 square feet, in which case

an DUthat does not exceed 800 square feet shall be

permitted.

(E) through (F) [No change in text.]

(G) [No change in text.]

Table 141-03A

Qualifying Criteria for Affordable ADU Bonus

[No change in text.]

Footnotes for Table 141-03A

(1) For-saleADUs are subject to the requirements of Section 141.0302(c)(1)(B).

(ed) In addition to the requirements in Section 141.0302(a), Juniorccessory

Dweing Units are subject to the following additional regulations:

(1) [No change in text.]

(2) Development Regulations

(A) One JADUis permitted on a premises located within a

sigee#ýWW Silç Dwelling Unit Zone with an

existing or proposed primary single dwelling unit.

(B) through (C) [No change in text.]

-PAGE 14 OF 69-



(O-2022-76 REV.)

COR. COPY 3

§141.0311

 

Live/Work Quarters

Live/work quarters are studio spaces in buildings that wore originally designed to

integrate living sace into th wrkspace and are_ primarjly designed for industrial

or commercial occupancy that have been converted to integrate living space into

hewele-speee. -Live/work quarters are permitted as a limited use in the zones

indicated with an "L" in the Use Regulations Tables in Chapter 13, Article 1

(Base Zones) subject to the following regulations.

(a) [No change in text.]

(b) A mimum of 19 percent o

f the floo

r area of eac

h live/work quar

ter

may be used or arranged for residential purposes such as sleeping,

kitchen, bathroom, and closet areaThe minimum floor area used or

arranged for non-residential ouroses shall be 100 sauare feet.

(c) through (h) [No change in text.]

§142.0640

 

Development Impact Fees for incin-Public Facilities and Spaces

(a) [No change in text.]

(b) Payment of Fees

Development Impact Fees (as defined in California Government Code

Section 66000) for applicable development shall be paid prior to

requesting a final inspection. A final inspection shall not occur until the

applicable DIFs are paid in areas where DIFs have been established by

City Council resolution or ordinance. Notwithstanding the above, the City

Manager may also require the payment of DIFs for development that

would incre

ase demand for pu

blic facilit

ies and/

or result in

 the need f

or

-PAGE 15 OF 69-



(O-2022-76 REV.)

COR. COPY 3

new public facilities. DIFs shall not be required for inclusionary

 

dwelling

units provided pursuant to Chapter 14, Article 2, Division 13, if the

applicant has satisfied all the requirements of Division 13 for inclusionary

dweing units on the same premises as the market-rate dwel/ing units. The

DIF amount due shall be based upon the DIF schedule in effect when the

Building Permit was issued, or the DIF schedule in effect when the fees

are paid, whichever amount is lower, plus an automatic increase consistent

with Section 142.0640(c), if applicable.

Exemptions:

(1 Accessory Dwelling Units, Junior Accessory Dwelling Units,

movable tiny houses, and guest quarters are exempt from DIF

except as follows:

Ll The frsttwo Accessory Dwellin Units on apremises are

exempt from the requirement to pay DIF. reardless of the

gross floor area of he Accessory Dwellin Unit. uness the

Accessory Dwellin Units are constructed n accordance

with Section 143.1305()(l), in which case payment of DIF

wjll be required in accordance with Section

142.0640(bíl)(B

(B) ccessorv Dwein Units that are 750 ormore square feet

in rross loor area and are in excess of the first two

Accessory Dwelling Units ora premises or are consructed

in accordance with Section 143.1305(Oíl) shall be required

-PAGE 16 OF 69-



O-2022-76 REV.)

COR. COPY 3

to pay DIF at the multi,le  e i, · unit

 rate, which shal

l be

scaled in accordance with Resolution No. R-313688,

dootin the Citvwide Park Develoment Imct F and

with Tabe 142-06A based upon the Accessoy Dwellin

_Unit size, or shall be proportionate in relation to the square

footage of the primary dwellinunit on the premises at the

multiple d

wellin unit ra

te, which

ever resu

lts in the lower

DIF. The DIF for the ccessory Dweline Unit shall not

xçeed_he DIf fr®ç primay dwellin unit.

í Notwithstandin Sections 142.0640(b)(1)(A) and (B)

Accesory Dwellin Units on a premises nwhchhe

record owner agrees to re

side in one of the dveli units

as their Drimar residence for

 a iimum of three vearâ

from-th date of buildi

n ermit issuanc

e for the

 

Accessorv

Dwein Unit are exemt from the reguirement to Dav DI

Prior to the issuance ofthe buildin permit, the_record

owner shall sign an affidavit 

acknowledging the record

owner intends to reside in one of the dwelln units as their

primary residenc

e for a

 minimm ftbree

 vears fr

om the

date of issuançe of the buildng permit for the

 

Accessor

Dwellin Unit. The affi

davit sh

all be i

n a form that is

approved by the City and recorded in the Office of the

Cpunty Recorder. This require

ment shall not_

apply to a

-PAGE 17 OF 69-



(O-2022-76 REV.)

COR. COPY 3

record owner that is a community land trust, as defined in

California Revenue and Taxation Code cti

402.lía(11)(Cìi. or is a aualified nonprofit conoratio

as described in California Revenue and Taxation Code

S

e

c

ti

o

n

 

2

14

.

1

5

.

(2) through (7) [No change in text.]

íål The first two dwein units constructed in accordance with

Chapter 14, Article 3, Division 13 shall be exempt from the

requirement to pay DIF. The second and third dwelin units

constru

cted 

in accor

dance 

with Chapter

 14, Ar

ticle 3,

 Divisi

n 13

shall be required to pay DIF, which shall be scaled in accordance

ith Resluti No. R-313688. adopting the Citywjde Park

Development Impact Fee and Table 142-06A, based upon the

dellin unit size,

Table 142-06A

Scaled Deveopment Impact Fee Rate for Secified Residential Development Uižig-he

Housin

g So

lutio

ns Pr

ogra

m

Unit Sie (SF)

 

Seled Fee ate

1,251 > Full Fee

1,201 - 1,250

 

9

9

%

1,151 - 1,200

 97%

1,101 - 1,150

 

9

5

%

1,051 - 1,100

 

9

2

6

1,001 - 1,050

 90%

951 - 1,000

 87%

-PAGE 18 OF 69-



(O-2022-76 REV.)

COR. COPY 3

U

it S

i

e (

l)

 Seled Fee Ite

901 - 950 85%

851 - 900 83%

801 - 850

 

8

0

%

751 - 800 78%

701 - 750 76%

651 - 

700 73%

601 - 650 71%

551 - 600 68%

501 - 550 66%

(82) Development that designs and constructs an onsite park that

satisfies the development's park standard identified in the Parks

Master Plan, shall not be subject to the requirement to pay the

Citywide Park DIF, where the requirements set forth in San Diego

Resolution R-313688 have been satisfied. Development that

designs and constructs an onsite park that satisfies a portion of the

development's parks standards shall be subject to a proportionate

share credit of the DIF for the Citywide Park DIF where the

requirements set forth in San Diego Resolution R-313688 have

been satisfied. To be eligible for any exemption under this

subsection, the following additional requirements shall apply:

(A) through (F) [No change in text.]

(10 Interim residential

 

development

 

that obtains a Building Permit in

accordance with Section 141.0309 shall be required to pay

one-third of the applicable residential DIF. At the end of 10 years

from issuance of the Neighborhood Use Permit, if the interim

-PAGE 19 OF 69-



(O-2022-76 REV.)

COR. COPY 3

residential use and associated Neighborhood Use Permit is

extende

d beyond t

he initial

 term, the rem

aining tw

o-thirds o

f the

applicable resident

ial DlF in effect at the time of the granting 

of

the initial Building Permit shall be paid.

(c) through

 (g) [No change i

n text.]

§142.1305

 

Methods of Compliance

(a) The requirem

ent to provi

de inclusiona

ry dwellin

g units may be met in any

of the following ways:

(1) through (2) [No change in text]

(3) On differentpremises from the development that does not meet the

locational criteria in Section 142.1305(a)(2) but within the City of

San Diego, ifthe

 

applicant

 

provide

s fiv percent m

ore inclu

sionary

delling unit than requi

red for the dev

elopment pursuant to

Setion  12.1304a) or Section 142.1304(êreceiver site is within 

transit r

iorió, area. in an area ide

ntified as_ High or

 Hihest

Resource C

alifornia T

ax Credit A

llocation Committee Op

rtunity

Area according to the most recent California State Treasurer

TCAC/HCD Opportuni

ty Are Mas. and le

ss than five

 ercent of

the existin

dwellin unis in that c

ommunitv lannin area ar

e

coyenantiesçld to very low income. low income. or moderate

income

 households:

(4) through (6) [No change in text.]

(b) through

 (c) [No change

 in text.]

-PAGE 20 OF 69-



(O-2022-76 REV.)

COR. COPY 3

§143.0402

 

When Planned Development Permit Regulations Apply

This Division applies to all development proposals for which a Planned

Development Permit is requested, in accordance with Table 143-04A.

Table 

143-0

4A

Supplemental Planned Development Permit Regulations Applicability

Type of Development Proposal

 

Applicable Sections

 

Required

Development

Permit/Decision

Process()

Residential development

 

[No change in text.]

request

ing dev

iations from

applicable zone regulations((3)

Commercial and Industrial 

[No change in text.]

deve

lopm

ent

 

requesting deviations

from applicable zone regulations

(3)

[No change in text.]

[No chan

ge in t

ext.]

Developments within land use

plans where a Planned

Development Permit is

recommended when other

discretionary actions are

requestedíá

143.0403,143.0465

PDP/Process 3

Development that complies with

 

[No c

han

ge i

n tex

t.]

the applicable land use plan

designation, but contains uses that

are not permitted in the underlying

base zone(

INo change in text.]

Multip

le dwelling unit

 

143.0403, 143.0410,

development requesting increased

 

143.0455

dens

ity where

 he l

and use 

plan

expressly allows for increased

density with the approval of a

Planne

d Devel

opment 

ermit(3]

PDP/Process 4

Rural cluster development in the

AR and OR zones

[No change in text.] [No change in text.]

Rural cluster development with

incre

ased 

dens

io in the

 AR-1-

1

[No change in text.]

[No change in text.]

-PAGE 21 OF 69-



(O-2022-76 REV.)

COR. COPY 3

Type of Development Proposal

 

Applicable Sections

 

Required

Development

Permit/Decision

Process

and OR-1-2 zones within

Proposition A Lands-

Residential development in RS

mnes of urbanized Communities

where a Planned Development

Permit is requested

[No change in text.] [No change in text.]

Footnotes for Table 143-04A

 through 5 [No change in text.]

á velment utl.izj .žreed dem altmaliv expresslv 

llowd in thçl

due nlanin

coni-tion with Chapter 14, Article 3, Division 7, does not require a Planned Development

Permit for the increased densió alternative_pursuant to the adopted land us plan.

§143.0455

 

Supplemental Planned Development Permit Regulations for Multiple

Dwelling Unit Residential Development with Increased Density per the

Adopted Land Use Plan

In addition to the general regulations for all Planned Development Permits in

Section 143.0410(i)(5) through (11), the following regulations apply to

 

mutiple

dweing unit development that requests approval of increased density where the

land use plan expressly allows for increased density with approval of a Planned

Development Permit. It is the 

intent of these

 regulatio

ns to provide i

ncreased

density in pedestrian-friendly deveopment that is consistent with the planned

character of the neighborhood

 as specified i

n the land use plan.

ø

 

D

en

si

ty

(1) [No change in text.]

(2) Utilization of this increased density alternative pepursuant to,the

adopted land »pen-use plan.shall not preclude the use of the

state density bonus program, where applicable. Development

-PAGE 22 OF 69-



(O-2022-76 REV.)

COR. COPY 3

utilizin the increased densitv alternative

 exoresslv allowed in the

land use Wan in cniunçtion with Chap

ter 14, Artic

le 3

Division 7, does not require a Planned Development Permit for the

increas

ed den

siy alterna

tive pu

rsuan

t to t

he ado

pted lan

d use p

lan.

(b) [No change in text.]

§143.0720

 

Density Bonus in Exchange for Affordable Housing Units

(a) through (h) [No change in text.]

(i) A density bonus agreement for a development within a transitpriority

area providing 100 percent of the total pre

-densio bonus and po

st-density

bonus dweing units as affordable to very low income, low income, and

moderate income households shall u

tilize the following qualifying cri

teria:

(1) [No change in text.]

(2) Rents for all dwelling units in the development shall be established

as follows:

(A) through (B) [No change in text.]

C Moderate income dwelling units in the development shall

be affo

rdable, 

includin

g an allowance fo

r utili

ties, to

moderate income households at a rent that does not exceed

30 percen

t of 11

0 perc

ent of the ar

ea median inco

me, s

adjusted

 for hou

sehold si

ze, appr

opriate fo

r the 

rcling

w#except that 20 percent ofthe dwellin units may be

-PAGE 23 OF 69-



(O-2022-76 REV.)

COR. COPY 3

affordable uo to 30 ercent of 150 ercent of the are

median income, i f those units contain at least three

bedrooms.

(3) through (4) [No change in text.]

(i) through (10 [No change in text.]

(1) A development proposal requesting an affordable housing density bonus is

subject to the following:

(1) [No change in text.]

(2) For development meeting the criteria for very low income

households 

in Section 143.0720(c)(1 the

 

density

 bonus shall be

calculated as set forth in Table 143-07A. The increased density

shall be in addition to any other increase in density allowed in this

Division, up to a maximum combined

 

dy

 

increase of 75

pttt.

(3) For development meeting the criteria for low income households in

Section 143.0720(c)(2),the density bonus shall be calculated as set

forth in Table 143-07B. The increased density shall be in addition

to any other incre

ase in density allowed in this Divisionr-e-a

maximum combined

 

d

n

ty

 

increase of 75 percent.

(4) For development meeting the criteria for moderate income

households in Section 143.0720(c) and (d), the density bonus shall

be calculated as set forth in Table 143-07C. The increased density

-PAGE 24 OF 69-



(O-2022-76 REV.)

COR. C

OPY 3

shall be in addition to any other increase in density allowed in this

Division, up to a maximum combined dciity increase o f 50

ettett.

§1

43

.0

742

(5) through (14) [No change in text.]

(15) For develo

pment that meets the criteria in 

Sections 143.0720((11

43.0720(c)(2), 143.0720(d)(1), 143.0720(d)(21 143.0720(d)O).

143.0720(e), 143.0720(,143.0720(g), 143.0720(h), or

13.0720(i), where at least 20 percent of the total dwellin units

are three bedrooms or greater, an additional densitv bonus of 20

percent 

shall be g

ranted and

 an addit

ional densi

 bonus o

f 10

Dercent of the Dre-deniv bonus dwellin units shall be ranted. if

the density bonus dwellin

 units provided

 contain at least three,

þedrooms.

(m) throug

h (n) [No change 

in text.]

Incen

tives

 for Ge

mmee

i-Non-

Reside

ntial D

evelo

pment

An applicant

 for a commercial de

velopmen

t that has ent

ered into an agreem

ent

with an applicant 

for a resident

ial developm

ent that pro

vides at leas

t 15 percent 

of

the deling units as affordable

 to vcry low icome households or

 at least 30

percnt of the dling unit as affordable to l

ow income households in

acordance with Section 113.0720 shall bc entitl

ed to a development bonus in

accordance

 with Government Code Sect

ion 65915.7(b) prov

ided that:

-PAGE 25 OF 69-



(O-2022-76 REV.)

COR. COPY 3

e The agreement shall be approved by the City Manager and identify how

the applicant for the commercial dvelopment will contribute to affordable

housing in one ofthe following ways

 Directly constructing the affordable

 

dwlling units·,

 Donating a portion of the commercial site or another site that

meets the criteria in Section 113.0712(b) for development of the

affordabl lling units; or

 Financially contributing to the devlopment of the affordable

,e!!ing:mits-.

b Tho residential dvelopment shall be located within the City of San Diego,

in close proximity to public amenities, and within a

 

Transit Priority Area.

The Elov Housin. Incentive Proram shall be imlemented in accordance

with this sect

ion. An applicant

 for non-

residential

 development as defi

ned in this

section that contributes to the construction of affordable housing through the

payment of the Emploee Housing Incentive Program_ee_as_adopted b Ci

Council_Resolution. shall be entitled to receive incentives, as set forth below.

íål Eligible Non-residential

 

Development.

£11 The non-residential development shall be located in a transit

riorìty area.

2 Egr ourooses ofthis section. non-residential

 develoment

 includes

all subcategories within the Retail Sales. Commercial Services, and

Office use caories. and the Light Manufaring and Research

& Development subcategies within the Industrial use category_ in

-PAGE 26 OF 69-



(O-2022-76 REV.)

COR. COPY 3

accordance with Section 131.0122ía), but does not include

Separately Reg

ulated Uses within these use categ

ories,

1 Jncentives shall be consistent with Sections 143.0740(a)(1 )

143.0740(b)(1)-0), and 143.07401 with the followin exceptions:

£1 Incentives 

may not be

 used to devia

te from minimum.foor 

rea

ratio 

requir

ements fo

r resid

ential u

ses.

í Floor area

 ratio my not be in

creased

 by more tha

n 1.5.

§143.0745

 

Locating Required Affordable Dwelling Units Off-site

A development that co

mplies with the Affordable 

Housing Regulation

s may

provide al

l or a portio

n of the require

d affordab

le dweing units off-sit

e in

accordance with the following:

(a) [No change in text.]

(b) Off-site affor

dable dweing units that 

do not meet the lo

cational c

riteria in

Section 143.0745(a) and (cì may be approved with a Process Four Planned

Development Permit in accordance with Section 126.0604.

í Off-site a

ffordab

le dwelli

 units t

hat_d

 not meet the 

locatio

nal criteria

_i

Section

 143.0745(a may be lo

cated-in an area 

where th

e recei

ver sit

e i

within a transt priorio area, an area identified as

 a High or Hihest

esource California Tax Credit Allocation Committe (CTCAQ

OpportunityAça. ad less than five percent ofthe existing_áell unis

 that communit Iannin rea are covenant-r

estricted to verv low

income, low income or moderate incom

e households

.

-PAGE 27 OF 69-



(O

-20

22-

76 

REV.)

COR. COPY 3

(ed)

 

At a minimum, the same number of affordable

 

dwelling units required of

the development must be provided, at the same affordability levels and the

same total bedroom count as the development. The applicant may provide

different bedroom mixes to meet the total dwelling unit and bedroom

count minimums. For purposes of calculating total bedroom count, an

affordable studio shall count as 60 percent of an affordable bedroom and

an affordable SRO hotel room shall count as 40 percent of an affordable

bedroom. Åny

 

calculations resulting in fractional units shall round up to

the next whole number.

() The applicant, prior to the issuance of the first building permit for the

development, shall secure the required number of off-site affordable

dweing units and enter into an agreement(s) with the President and Chief

Executive Officer of the San Diego Housing Commission establishing the

same terms and conditions set forth in Section 143.0720 for similar

affordable density bonus dweing units.

(

e

D

 

Off-site affordable dweing units may be located in an existing

structure(s), provided the applicant provides evidence that the existing

structure has a remaining useful life of at least 55 years from the issuance

of a Certificate of Occupancy pursuant to Section 143.0745(f)(2)(B) and

complies with current Building Code standards, to the satisfaction of the

City Manager. Off-site affordable dwelling units that are occupied at the

time the application is deemed complete shall comply with the State

Relocation Act pursuant to Government Code Section 7260.

-PAGE 28 OF 69-



(O-2022-76 REV.)

COR. COPY 3

()

 

Prior to the issuance 

of the first building perm

it, the applicant sh

all record

a deed 

restricti

on again

st the of

f-site deve

lopment tha

t:

(1) through (

2) [No chang

e in text.]

Affo

rda

ble

 Hous

in

 in 

All C

om

muni

ties

íål Affordable housing uses not

 otherwise allowed in Hih or Hig

hest

Resource California Tax Credit Allocati

on Committee (CTCAC) Areas.

Affordable

 housing

 may be per

mitted in H

ih or Highest R

esource

California T

ax Credit 

Allocation C

ommittee Are

as in acco

rdance with

Process One on a

 

premises

 

located

 within a no

n-rsid

entia

l base 

zone tha

t

do s o.th rwise all•w mltiple dwellin unit development, subiect to all

pfthe folowing:

L

U

 

T

h

e

 

development

 

proposes to construt one r more of the

fo\\ow

in·Á

A A mult

iple dw

ein

nit d

evelo

ment in

which at least 1

00 percet-ofthe to

tal dwellin

 units.

exclusive of a manager's unit or units, are cenant-

restricted as affordable to very low income_low_income. or

mode

rate 

inco

me hou

seho

lds;

(àl Permanent suportive housing

íC 

Tran

sition

al hou

sing; 

or

íI

 

An em

erg

en

cv 

she

lter

 

T

h

e

 

p

r

e

m

i

 

i

 

located within all of the following:

Làl A transit priority area·.

-PAGE 29 OF 69-



(O-2022-76 REV.)

COR. COPY 3

Bì An area identified as a Hih or Highest Resource CTCAC

Opportunity Area

 

according to the most recent California

State Treasurer 

TCAC/HCD Opportu

nity Ar Maps

í A communiy planning area in which less than 5 percent of

the existing dwellin units are covenant-restricted to verv

low incom

e, ow income, or m

oderat

e incom

e

 

hous

eho

lds;

an

(D) Outside of an area i

dentifid 

as Indu

strial r Open Spa

ce in

a land use plan.

íll The residential densitv shall be determined for the applicable

portion of the remi

ses as follow

s:

íål Within Mobility Zone I (the Downtown Communit

Plannin Area), the densiy and oor area ratio shall be

Unlimitd

(B) Within a com

munitïpla

nnin_area that m

eets the d

efinition

f Mobilitv Zone 3 as defined in Section -143,1103(a(3

densitv shall 

be limited bv amaximum./oor area ratio of

á

íC Within a community planning area that meets the definition

of Mobility Zone 4 s dÊfned in Section 143.1103(a)(4),

densi

tv sha

ll be li

mited by

 a maxim

um_floo

r ar

earatio

 of

,.

-PAGE 30 OF 69-



(O-2022-76 REV.)

COR. COPY 3

íá Residential development shall complv with the develomen

reulations of the RM-2-5 zone with the exception of dens/tv,loor

area ratio,lot

 

area, and lot dimensions which shall comply with

the base zone.

íál Development consis

tent with the cri

teria in this se

ction shal

l be

entitled to incentives and waivers in accordance with Sections

143.0740 through 143.0743.

íál Development shall comply with the regulations of the Airport Land

Use C

ompati

bilit

y Z

one.

 Dwellin units shall 

remain availab

le and affor

dable for

 a period o

f

55 years or longer, as may be required by other laws or covenants.

ff rda.- u in_ may be permitted on a premises owned by a public

aency ora qualified nonprofit corporation (consistent with Chaer 2 of

the Municipa Cod) in accordance with Process One on a premises

located within a base zone that does not allow multile dwellin unit

eveloment. subiect to all of the followin

LU The applica

tion for

 the prem

ises is subm

itted by a

 person th

at has

the authority to fill out an application in accordance with Section

112.0102 and is

 a ublic ag

encv or

a qualified

 nonpr

ofit

ororation q

ualified 

under 

Sectio.5.1.c

)(1).of.the In

ternal

Reve

nue C

ode

í The development includes one ofthe followin.

-PAGE 31 OF 69-

R



-69 0 ZE 39Vd-

  !1 Dato of

U

X

U

I  A

 

01

!U

!!l 

Ø

 l

s

 

Ásup'£

 

u

O

Z

 

Á

l

!

!

K

SE (£)(

£0 1*£

I Uo

!@S u! P

UUP S

 08 Uê 

U!41!ñ 

Ü

* *9 o  3íD 

ui

u!!x

eu

  Áq

 po

lu

!10

 

 4

isü

ap

 't

 ïöZ

 9

!!

lF

I

S E)£0 I I'£ I UO!1S U! PUp SE EJE UE U!41!ñ ÎJ

p

1

!

!

u

n

'

oq ieqs

 o.i/u vm oo

# pu á#suap  ·iev u!uu

d

Ál!UUIU10

 U

l

G t

 '  

002 Áì!

1qo

IN u!4

!A 

V

š/olOJ G 

.m.m-

 Jo u

!

qiaae   pu!uilolp  lis -á#Stap ].!,up!01 041 

·uod an put 

U! 

Ojes ü

CID

 JÓ 

pšn

pUI s

e p

!!lu

op! 

1 UB J

 @P!

sno

 

rm

Pu )£01 1£.I

uo!S u! pup SE £ 10 Z 'I @uoz Á!1!q u!41! J

poeool s! ss.ma

d 41 

'J

t[

S 

Á

U

J

U

I

 U

V

 

il

 !

u

s

n

oq

 

eu

!1

!s

u

u

 

5

tžu

sn04 3!lod

d1 l

UtUad 

tp\v

šno auoou! 313pol 0 'ato

u! o 'auoo

t! 01

73ë

pôJJŠ-

mš=m

êôy

rš

ñ-ó

m

S,EIEu E jo A!snx 's.un p [3101 41 jO O.Id

ÇZ 

seo 

 4!

 U! uam

aoa

ap uun

 umaHp 

ld/

u V 

VJ

£ ÅdODHO

(A[ 9L-ZZO-O)



(O-2022-76 REV.)

COR. COPY 3

íá Residential dev

t shall comly with the develop

ment

regulations of the RM-2-5 zone with the exception of densi,oor

area ratio, lot

 area, and lo

t dimensions wh

ich.shall com

ply with

the b

ase 

zone

.

íál Development consistent with the criteria in this section shall be

entitled to incenti

ves and waivers in accorda

nce with Sections

143.0740 through 143.0743.

l

l

 

D

ev

el

o

p

m

en

t

 

shall comply with the regula

tions of the Airport Land

Use C

mpati

bilit

 Zon

e,

(å

l 

D

w

el

lin

 u

ni

ts

 

shall remain available

 and afforda

ble for a eriod of

55 years or longer, as may be equired by other laws or covenants.

Division 13: Multi-Dwelling Unit and Urban Lot Split Regulations

for Sinle Family Zones

Purpose of the Multi-Dwelling Unit and Urban Lot Split Reglations for

Sinple

 Family Zones

These regulaions are intended to im

plement California Senate Bil

l 9 (2021-2022

and California Government Code Sections 65852.21.66411.7 and 66452.6 by

allowing the construction

 

of multiple dwellin units in

 

single-family zones and/or

an urban lot split, as specified in this Division. These regulations specify when

and how multiW_welline unit develop

ment may be cons

tructed in a base zonq

that nermts sinle dwellin unit develoment.but not mutiple dwellin uni

development. These r

egulations also spec

ify when and 

how a single p

remise may

be split into two premises that can be developed and conveyed separately when

located within a base zone that p

ermits sinle dwellin

 unit developm

ent, but not

multip

le dwe

llinž 

unit d

evelop

ment.

-PAGE 33 OF 69-



(O-20

22-7

6 R

EV

.)

COR. COPY 3

Aplication of Multi-Dwelling_Unit and Urban Lot Split ReulatioP '

Single Dwelling_Unit ones

íâ This Diyision applies to premises located within a RS, RE, RX, RT and

Planned District Zones that permits sinle dwellin unit development, but

not multiple dwelling unit development, except as prohibited in Section

13 J 303.

ím This Division is n

ot applic

able in the follo

wing circum

stances:

£ When the

 

remises is

 

located within any of the followin

íál Prime farmland or farmland of statewide importance, as

defined pursuant to United States Department of

Agriculture land inventory and monitoring criteria, as

modified for California, and desinated on the maps

preared bv the Farmland Main and Monitoring

Proram of the Department of Conservation, or land zoned

or designated for agriculturalprotection or preservation by

a local ballot measure that was aproved by the voters of

that jurisdiction;

l

 

W

e

tl

a

n

d

s

·.

(C) The Very High Fire Hazard Severiy Zone, unless the

develoment complies with Chapter 7A of the California

Building Code. which mitigates wildfire exposure risk

through materials and construction methods:

-PAGE 34 OF 69-



(O-2022-76 REV.)

COR. COPY 3

íU A hazardous waste site that is listed pursuant to California

Government Code Section 65962.5 or a hazardous waste

site desinated by the Department of Toxic Substançe

Control pursuant to Section 25356 ofthe California Health

and Safety Code, unless the State Dartment of Public

Health, State Watr Resources Control Board, or

Department of Toxic Substances Control has cleared the

site for

 resident

ial use o

r reside

ntial mixed u

ses;

í A delineated earthquake fa

ult zone as dete

rmined bv the

State Geologist in any offiçial m

aps mlished by the

California State Geologist. unless the development

çomplies with applicable seismic protection building code

standards adopted by the California Building Standard

Commiss

ion un

der th

e Californ

ia Bu

ildin Sandar

ds Law

Part 2.5 (cmmencing with_Section 18901) of Division 13

of the Health and Safety Code), and by the Develomn

Services Department:

 Special Flood Hazard Areas,uness:

íi The premises has been subiect to a Letter of Map

evision Dre

ared bv the Federal 

Emerencv

Management Agency and issued to the local

jurisdiction: [

-PAGE 35 OF 69-



(O-2022-76 REV.)

COR. COPY 3

íi The premises meets Federal Emergency

Management Agency requiements necessary to

meet minimum flood plain management criteria of

the National Flood Insurance Program pursuant to

Part 59 (commencing with Section 59.1) and Part

60 (commencing with Section 60.1) of Subchapter

B of Chater I of Title 44 of the Code of Federal

R

egulations.

 A reulatory floodway as determined by the Federal

Emergencv Management Agency in any official maps

published by the Federal Emerencv Manaement Aencv.

unless the development has received a no-rise certification

in accordance with Section 60.3(d)(3) of Title 44 of the

ode of Federal Reultions. If an olicant is able to,

atisfy all applicable federal qualifing criteria in order to

rovide that the 

premises

 

satisfies this subaragrph and is

otherwise eligible for streamlined approval under this

section, an application shall not be denied on the basis that

the aplicant did not comply with any additional City

ermit reauirement. standard. or action that is alicable to,

that premises;

 The MHPA of the MSCP Subarea Plan·

-PAGE 36 OF 69-



-69 O LE 39Vd-

lu!uqns u!! 01 JO!ð SBA

01l le 41 u! luuo e Áq p!Inoo uq u seg na qí

ssn 7Ul im.tp  JO Sñ [B.Il. 10!X ! ls! 41 JO

uood ÇZ Ueql o.totu jo UÓ!!óulop 041 Sl!b

 

;UU013ap

 411 rø

ueo!dd 

 íu!p

ooad po!

deÁ- 1 41

Žíupnp L090L 4il 090£ sl0!OS PÒ jt[AO) !IOJ!0

41!M

-

põ

 u! 

S[ l

O UN UIOJ

 Uñ

.P4

!M 

 t

su

n šu

p 124

0 10

 S00 13

4 ONS sum

uo ss!11

3.d 

 

o

'SIBÁ 04 1sí

@l u! uu@  Aq po!anooo uooq sq eq un øu/Utp ¥ J

'U

OOU

 

01 u

å

10 'WOt t 'OU OpOU J !!ulj p suod

0 iqpoUU SpA 01 Sl 1!11.1 ll1  10 'Ul!po

UBU@A

o pp

@J B 01 10@

!-qns s!

 4 u

n u/#

p v 

:

u

!

A

O

to

j

41 Jo Áue Jo uo!1Bêll 0 UO!!louop s!nbl

 

t

tu

ó

l

a

P

 í 

30.lOS.l

1!01!4 PaDu!3p  sumilo 1 53!31  UO 10

'

tno

sa

 o

o

ol

s! 4 

Pl

>u

sap

  

 reu

 j!

!P l)0!

10

!4 

V 

0 IUISB

!WAJSUO O S JO UEUAO '1!1  U!

Uo!!Pp Á pA.ISU SpUD7 /#SUS-uuuo.u 

£ ÅdOO 'O

(A 9L-ZZOZ-O)



(O-2022-76 REV.)

COR. COPY 3

Utilizing the Provisions of this Division

íå n

 

alicant seeking to utilize the rovisions of this Division mav use the

multiple dwellin unit rovisions of Section 143.1310, the urban lot split

provisions of Section 143.1315. ora combination of both in compliance

with the aplicable regulations.

21 An application to utilize the provisions of this Division may be denied if

the City makes a writtenjindin based upon a eponderance of the

eidence that the development would have a specific, adverse impct UO

ublic health and safetv or the hysical environment and there is no

feasible method to satisfactorily mitiate or avoid Ìhe specific, adverse

impact. A secific. adverse ict means a sinificant. auantifiable,

direct, and unavoidable impact based on obiective, identified written

public health or safety standards. policies, or conditions as they existed on

the date the Blictio ws deemed comlete. The followin shall not

constitute a specific, adverse impact unon the oublic health or safet:

LU Jnconsistency with a zoning ordinance_pr land use plan

desination.

£2 The eligibility to claim a welfare exemption under subdivision (g)

of Section 214 ofthe California Revenue and Taxation Code.

£1 This Division may be utilized in coniunctin with

 

Accessory D

wellin

Unit development consistent with the following regulations:

-PAGE 38 OF 69-



(O-2022-76 REV.)

COR. COPY 3

Ana,licant utilizing onlv th m. ltile . eing unit rovisions of

Section 143.1310 and not the urban lot split provisions of Section

143.1315 may construct two attached or detached Accessoy

Dwellin Units in addition to the two dwellin unis permitted in

accordance with Section 143.130.

(Aì The ccessoy Dwellin Unis shall comply with the

egulations in Section 141.0302, except that no more than.

two Accessoy Dwellin Unts shall be permitted on the

premises.,

í Under no circumtances shall the total number of dwellin

units on the lot, ncusive of Accessorv Dwellinž Units.

exceed four.

An Accessory Dwellin Unit or Junior Accessory Dwelling Unit

shall not be permitted on a prenu that roooses to utilize or has

utiljzed both the multiple dwellin unit provisions of Section

143.1310 and the urban lot split roviions of Section 143.1315,

l \f an Accessory Dwellin Unit or Junior Accessorx

Dwellin Unit exists on a remises that proposes to utilize

the provisions of bth Section 143.1310 and 143.1315, the

ccessor Dwelliný_Unit must be removed or converted to

one of the mWtivle dwellin units Ê[mitted under Section

11111

-PAGE 39 OF 69-

Ð

E



(O-2022-76 REV.)

COR. COPY 3

(B Under no circumstances shall the total number of dweine

wits across the two

 lots

 

resulting from Section 143. U J á

exceed four.

Re., 1 ofDwelling Units Constructed in Accordance with tb . ' 

A dwellin unit constructed in accordance with this Division shall not be rented

for fewer than 31 days.

Construction of Multiple Dwelling Units in a Sinle Dwellin Unit Zone

UD to two dwein units mav be ermitted on_a iss within a RS. RE. RX,

RT and Planned District Zones that permits sinle dwellin unit development, but

not muiple dwellin unit development in accordance with the following

eulations;

íå The development regulations of the base zone in which the premises is

located shall apply, exceptas specified in this section.

i

l

l

 

D

e

n

s

i

tv

 

Regulations. The maximum ermitted

 densitv 

shall be twq

wellin units per lot. The dweilin unitsmaïbe-tachd to o

detached from one another, provided that the structure) meet

California Building Code safety standards and are constructed

sufficiently to allow separate conveyance.

 Setback Regulations

(A) No setback is required for an existintructure that is

converted to a dwellin unit. In addition, a dwelli unit

that is constructed inthe same location and within the same

-PAGE 40 OF 69-



(O-2022-76 REV.)

COR. COPY 3

buildin envelope as an

 

existing

 

structure may

 continue to

observe the s

ame setbacks as

 the structure 

it replaced.

£1 Except as provided in Section 143.1310(a)(21 dwlline

units must comply with the front yard and street side vard

se/back of the base zone. Interior side yardand rearyard

setbacks for dwellin units shall be provided as follows:

íi One-stoy dwelin units with a structure heiht of

16 feet or less mav have zero setbacks in the interior

âide v

ards 

and re

ar

 vards.

íi One-ston dwellin units with a structure heiht tha

exceds 16 feet and multi-storv dwelline units mav

have zero setback in the interior side yards and

rear yards, unless the side or rear propery üne

abuts another premises that is residentially zoned or

developed with exclusively

 residentia

 uses, in

which case a 4-foot setback shall apply.

íl Parking Regulation

t Wthin a transit priority area, no off-street parkin spaces

re required.

 Out f.ß transit priority area. off-street varkinspaces

shall be provided as follows:

-PAGE 41 OF 69-



(O-2022-76 REV.)

COR. COPY 3

01 One off-street parkin space per dwellin unit shal

be required for the construction of the third and

fourt dwellin units, Off-street parkin saces are

not required for the first two dwellin units.

íi Within the Beach Impact Area of the Parking

Impact Overlay Zone, one o#-street pki space

shall be required per dwellin unit unless the

applicant can demonstrate to the satisfaction of the

City Manager that there is access to a car $hare or

other shared vehicle within one block ofthe

premises.

íiì Landscape Regulations

(A) Iwo trees shall be provided on the premises for every

5.000 sauare feet 

of iot area.

 

with_a minimum of one tree

per premises. This regulation can be met by existing tre

on the

 

premises.

 

If planting of a new tree is required t

comply wi h this section. the tree shall be selected in

accordance with the Landscape Standards of the Land

Development Manual and the City's Street Tree Selection

Guide.

-PAGE 42 OF 69-



(O-2022-76 REV.)

COR. COPY 3

íB) If development would result in more than two dwellin

un#s within the two premises permitted bv this Division.,

then compliace with the street tree reulations pursuant to

Section 142.0409 is required.

ía Suppemental Regulations within Areas of Future Sea Levl Rise

(A) Within the Coastal Overlay Zone, the following reulations

apply to dwellin units constructed outside of Special

Flood Hazard Areas and within an area of future sea level

rise (within a 75-year horizon) as determined by the City

Manager based on the most current sea level rise

vulnerability maps:

íÜ The dwelling units shall comply with the

regulations in Section 143.014) and ifapplicable.

Section 143.0146(g). The baseoodelevation

utilized, and the applicability of Section

43.0146(gkshall be based on the FIRM Zone of

the Special Flood HazardArea in closest proximity

to the premises on which the dwellin unit i

proposed. The prmit requirements of 143.0110(b

and other regulations of Chapter 14. Article 3.

Division 1 do not apply.

-PAGE 43 OF 69-



(O-2022-76 REV.)

COR. COPY 3

íi Hard shoreline armoring shall not be constructed to

protect dwellin units from the effects of sea level

Iiåe.

íiiü The rec

ord owner of

 the dwe

lling unit sh

al, in a

form that is approved by the City, acknowlede the

following: (1) that the dwellin unit is located in an

area of future sea level rise that may become

hazardous in the future_(2) that sea level rise could

render it difficult or impossible to provide services

to the premises; 0) that the boundary betwee

Dublic land (tidelands) and private land may shif

with rising seas_apd the development approvaldcžes

not permit encroachment pnto public trust land: (4)

that additional adaotatin stratçgies mav be reauired

jn the future to address sea level rise consistent with

the Coastal.Act and certified Local Coastal

Proram; and (5) that the dwellin unit may be

required to be removed or relocated and the site

restored if it becomes unsafe; and further the record

owner shall-waive an rihts undr Coastl Act

Section 30235 and relatedocal Coastal Prora

policie. to any hard shoreline armorin to rotec

the dwellin unit.

-PAGE 44 OF 69-



(O-2022-76 REV.)

COR. COPY 3

fivì The record owner of the dwellin.nit shall provide

otice to all occupants, upon occupancy, of the

dwellin unit of the provisions in Section

143.1310(a)(5)(A)(ii i).

íál Deveopment Impact Fees for development constructed in

accordance with this Division shall comply with Section

J42,0640(b).

ím Ntwithstanding Section 143.1310(a),asecond

 

dwelliny unit

 

with a

maximum ross oor area of 800 square feet shall be permitted on a

premises with an eisting_r prposed dwellir ut. regardless of

on-compliance with one or more

 

development

 

regu

lation

s. T

he

*velopment shall comply with the /oor area ratio of the underlying base

zone unless the developmnt inçorporates an existing structure that

exceeds the allowable oor area rao or js under the allowable loor are

ratio by less than 800 squar feet, in which case a second dwellin unit

that does not exceed 800 square fret shall be permitted.

Urban Lot Splits in a Sinple.Dwelling Unit Zone

An urban lot split is a lot split that divides an existing single

 

premises

 

into no

more than two separately conveyable premises in a zone that allows sinle

wellin unit develoment. but nomultiple dwellin unit develoment. and may,

be ermitted. subiect to the followin reulations:

-PAGE 45 OF 69-



(O-2022-76 REV.)

COR. COPY 3

í An urban lot split shall be permitted in accordance with a Process One

parcel map and

 

shall comply with Chapter 14, Article 4, Division 2.

çept that dedications ofpublic rikhts-ofway or the construction of

offsite improvements for the parcels being created and the correction of

nonconforming develoment regulations of the base zones are n

required.

í The expiration of the subdivision shall be in accordance with Government

Code 

Sec

tion

 66

452.6

íl The urban lot solitprovisions of this section may nt be used if any ofthé

following apply:

£1 The lot was established through a prior urban lot split in

accordance with this section. A lot may only be split once in

accordance with this section. Los created pursuant to this section

are_ineligible for any further subdivision.

í The record owner or any person acting in concert. with the record

owner has previously subdivided au adiacent lot using an urban lot

split in accordance with this section.

1 Only residential uses are permitted on a lot that was created by the urban

lot split provisions of this section.

 priorto thereçordation of the parcel.mv. the record owner shall.sign an

affidavit acknowledging the record owner intends to reside in one of the

dwein units as their primary residence for a minimum of three years

from the date ofthe approval of the urban loísplit. The affidavit shall b

-PAGE 46 OF 69-



(O-2022-76 REV.)

COR. COPY 3

in a form that is approved by the City and recorded in the Office of the

County Recorder. This requirement shall not apply to a record owner that

is a community land trust. as defined in California Revenue and Taxation

Code Section 402.1(a)(11)(C)(ii), or is a qualified nonprofit corporation as

described in California Revenue and Taxation Code Section 214.15.

íll The developmentregulations ofthebase zone in which th lot is located

shall apply, except as secified in Section 143.1310(a) and this section.

£11 The minimum lot area and minimum lot dimensions regulations of

the base zone shall n_t applyand are replaced with the following

reulations:

íål The two

 

lots

 

shall be approximately equal in size, provided

that one lot shall not be smaller than 40 percent of the lot

area of the original lot.

í The two lots shall each be n smaller than 1.200 sauare

21.

íí Jfthe lot contains existinjutructures that will remain as

part of the developmen the lot shall be plit in a manner

tha complies with or comes as close as pos$ible to

compliance with the floor area ratio of the underlyin ba

zone..çonslsalwith Section 143.1315(f)(1)(A) and (B).

(21 A lot

 

should be subdivided in a manner that complies with the

street#ontae and drivewa_width requirements of the base zone

wherever feasible. Development tbat does no comply with the

-PAGE 47 OF 69-



(O-2022-76 REV.)

COR. COPY 3

§145.4001

treet #ontae and driveway width requirements of the base zone

shall record an access easement on the lot to the satisfaction of th

City Engineer.

 Notwithstanding Section 143.1315(, an urban lot split and construction

of a second

 

dwelinz_unit

 

with a maximum ross /loor

 

area

 

of 800 square

feet shall be permitted on each of the lots created by an urban lot split

reardless of non-compliance with one or more

 

development

 

regulations,

subiec

t to the

 follow

ing:

£1 The develovment shall coV with the oor area ratio of the

underlyin base zone unless the development incorporates a

existing

 structure t

hat excee

ds the allo

wable 

oor area

 ratio or

 is

under the allowable loor area ratio by less than 800 square feet, in

which case a second dwellin uni that does not exceed 800 sauare

feet shall be ermitted.

í Thçveíment shall comply with the lot size requirements i

Section 143.1315(f)(1).

Article 5: Building Regulations

Division 40: ¥elunwy-Housing Accessibility Program

Purpose

The purpose of the ¥lŸ-Housi Accessibility Program is to encourage

accessible residential development haneepea-

 

above the reauirements

pursuant to the California Building Code,_nd to increase the number of

accessible dwellin units in the local housine suly that meet long term housing

-PAGE 48 OF 69-



(O-2022-76 REV.)

COR. COPY 3

needs by offering incentives that facilitate this type of accessible design-eaes

including accessibl routes of travel, accessible entrances, and accessible common

use rooms to meet the neds of as many users as possiblefor people ofall abilities.

The intent is to increase opportunities for persons with temporary, developing, or

permanent disabilities to "age in place" and thereby reduce the potential for

occupants to be displaced from their homes due to a disability, te-as well as

allowing those persons to visit neighboring dweling unitsrand--inceae he

number of accessible drelling unit in the local housing supply that meet long

term housing needs by offering incentives that facilitate this type of accessible

d

e

ig

.

§145.4002

 

When the Housing Accessibility Program Applies

(a) The following epeseè-residential development is eligible for the

¥euaŸ-Housing Accessibility Program:

(1) Development thatis cxempt from the accessibility requiremen of

the California Building Code (Chapter 1 1A),of a

 

multiple dwellin

nit structure up to five stories that provides an. elevator to all

to

r

ie

s

,

(2) Development where only a portion of the residential development

9subjeeof multi-storv townhomes or duIxs that exceed the

accessibility requirements of the California Building Code

(Chapter llA)re and include the followin: a primary entrance. at

-PAGE 49 OF 69-



(O-2022-76 REV.)

COR. COPY 3

least one accessible bathroom,_at least one accessible kitchen, at

Jeast one accessible bedroom, and at least one accessible living

room on an accessible rout.

(3) Development whee4he-Fqi-exempt from accessibility -i

aceedene with. the-requirements of the California Building Code

(Chapter 1 A) and would be less accessibl than would be

achieved through the Voluntary Accessibility Program.

(b) Development with dwelling units that are voluntarily designed to be

accessible may be granted incentivs receiving deviations for reasonable

accommodations in accordance with Section 44.41 3 1.0466 are no

eligible for th Housin Accessibility Program.

 Deveopment

 

receiving deviations for reasonable accommodations in

accordance with Section 131.0166 ar not eligible for the Voluntary

Acoesibiiy egm.

§145.4003 ¥el*y-Hsií_Accessibility Program Regulations and Development

Incentives

(a) Incentives granted solely under the ¥li-Housig Accessibility

Program in accordance with Section 145.4003-n-  shall not

require aroval of a deviation from the underlying base zone.

(b) [No change in text.]

(c) The incentives avoilablc to a development shall be determined by the

number and type of rclling units that would be voluntarily designed for

aeeesiili+ŸAn incentive shall not be granted where it would allow

-PAGE 50 OF 69-



(O-2022-76 REV.)

COR. COPY 3

development that is inconsistent with the policies in the certified Local

Coaal Program and development reulations of the Environmentally

Sensitive Lands Reulations.

 Each dlling unit voluntarily designd in accordance with

Section 115.1001 (Tier I Accessible Dwelling Unit) shall bo

eige-fc the-

 

feløwing-iee¿es

 

Aßoor ara raio bonus up to a maximum of 5 percent,

€1

f  choice of one development incentive listed in Section

MéAQQ*

 Each dircHing unit voluntarily designed in accordance with

Section 115.1005 (Tier H Visitable Unit) shall be eligible forone

cfth fc!!ewi4nene

 

Å jl

oo

r

 area ratio

 

bonus up to a maimum of 5 percent, or

B A chice-of one development incentive listed in

Section 145.4003(d).

 Development with at least 50 percent of the eligible 'clling unit

voluntarily designed in accordance with either Section 115.1001

(Tier I Accessibe Dwelling Uit) or Section 115.4005 (Tier II

*iiableW

h!-beligible for the following incentives:

 ccnives or each Tier I Acoessible Dwelling Uit in

accordance with Section 115.1003(c)(1),

-PAGE 51 OF 69-



(O-2022-76 REV.)

COR. COPY 3

 An incentieferach Tier  Visitable nit in accordance

with Section 115.1003(c)(2), and

 Expedite processing consistent with Council Policy.

 Development with 100 percent of the eligible dllíng unit

voluntarily designed in accordance with Section 115.1001 (Tier I

Accessible Dwelling Unit) shall be eligible for:

6 Incentivs for each Tier I Accessible Dwelling Unit in

accordnce with Section 115.1003(c)(1),

 Epedite processing consistent with Concil Po!icy-d

  density bonus up to 5 percent based on the pro bonu

number of dilling unit in the project voluntarily designed

in accordance wih Sectio 115.4001 (Tier I Accessible

Dwelling Unit).

3 Deveopment

 

providing a minimum of 10 Tier I Accessible

Dwelling Units shall be eligible for a choice of 1 additional

incentive listed in Section 115.1003(d).

(d) ceiesAn incentive shall not be rani' where it conflicts with State

laws and regulations

An applicant for development eligible for one or more incentives pursuant

to Section 115.1003, may select from the following incentives:

 An applicant may request one ofthc following modifications of

the applicable parking regulations in Section 112.0560 for Tier I

Accssible Dwe#ig-·Wnir

-PAGE 52 OF 69-



(O-2022-76 REV.)

COR. COPY 3

6 A reduction of the drive aisle width to a minimum of

22 fot if using standard

 par]ing space dimensions,

 A reduction of the required motorcycle facilities up to

0peee

 A reduction of the driveway width consistent with the

minimum dimensions specified in Table 112 05N,

 Encroachment of required qýstrectparkng paces into the

required setback area of a private driveway (where parking

:paces would not conflict with a required visibility area), or

 Calculation of tandem parking spaces (designd in

accordance with Section 112.0560) as two spaces to meet

the applicable parlng requirement.

 The applicable tback regulations may bo reduced up to

10 percent for proposed structures where necessary to fulfill tho

accessible design requirements.

 The applicable lot coerag regulations may be exceeded up to

10 percent wher necessary to fulfill the accessible design

eqiements

0 The applicable maximum structure height regulations may be

eceeded by up to 10 percent to accommodate an elevator or

pecial access (wheelchair) lift system. The maximum structure

height may not exceed height limits required within the Coastal

Height Limit Overlay Zone or conflict with Federal Aviation

-PAGE 53 OF 69-



(O-2022-76 REV.)

COR. COPY 3

Regulations Part 77 airspac protection surfaces within designated

irprt influenc ars.

 The applicable landscape requirements may bo modified or

reduced to the minimum etent necessary to accommodate an

accessible route of travel.

(e) Theßoor area raio bonus and incentives applicable to a development in

accordance with Section 115.1003(c) are limited to dlling units that are

voluntarily designed in accordance with the Voluntary Accessibility

Program and may not be redistributed across the development as a whole.

The following tves of develovment mav be ranted incentives in

accordance with this section:

£1 A multiple dwein unit devlovment that provides an elevator to

all.oors in a multiple dwellin unit structure shall be entitled to

three incentives listed in Section 145.4003(1

 An accessible multi-stoy dwellin unit that exceeds the housing

accessibility requirements of the California Bulding Code

(Chapter 1 1A) and Section 145.4002(a)(2) by at least 25 percent of

the total number of dwelling units shall be eligible for two

incentives listed in Section 145.4003(.

íl A develoment that exceeds the requirements for the number of

accessible

 

dwellinu#s

 

under the California Building Code

(Chapter 1 1A) by two accessiWe dwellin units shall be ligible for

hre_incentives listed in Section 145.4003(fi.

-PAGE 54 OF 69-



(O-2022-76 REV.)

COR. COPY 3

 A development that exceeds the requirements for the number of

cessible dwellin unis under the California Building Code

hapter 1 1 A) and Section 145.4002(a)(2) by three or 

more

accessible

 

dweilin

 units

 

shall be eligible for four incentives lsted

in Section 145.4003(0.

 

 bonus or incentive shall not be granted where it would allow

evelopment that is inconsistent with the policies in the certified Local

Coastal Program land u:cplan or the allowed uses and development

regulations of the Environmentally Sensitive Lands regulationIncentives

An applicant for development eligible for incentives pursuant to Section

145.4003(e) may select from the following incentives:

£1 Setback regulations may be reduced by up to 15 percent for the

building with the elevator,

21 Lot coverae reÁulâtjpns_may be exceeded by up to 15 percent,

í A floor area ratio bonus uka maximum of 25 eent for the

uilding with the elevator.

í The applicable maximum structure iht regulations may be

exceeded by up to 15 feet for the building with the elevator. The

maximum sucture heiht may not eeed eight limit allowed

within the Coastal Heigh_Limit Overlay_Zone or conflict with

Federal Aviation RegulationsPart 77 airspace protection surfaces

àthin airort influence areas desinated bv the Federal Aviation

Administration.

-PAGE 55 OF 69-



(O-2022-76 REV.)

COR. COPY 3

í A densió bonus up to 10 percent based on the pre-densi bonu

dwellin units for the- entire development. Thi densiy bonus is in

addition to any other densió bnuses for which the development is

eligible.

Tier I Accessibl Dwlling Unit Design Standard

Ø> -edeMe-meeMherir I Aeesile Dwelling Unit Design Standards,

dlling units shall comply with the California Building Code

equirements for accessibility (Chapter I l A), except as othenvise

indicated in Section 115.1001(b), (c), and (d).

b For the purpose of this section, dwlling unts developed with multiple

stories shall provide a kitchen on the primary entry level in accordance

with the California Building Code requirements for accessibility

(Chapter 11) in addition to other accessible design requirements required

in accordance with Section 115.1001(

 Accessible entrances designed for T

  1 .

 

ceessible -Dwel-Wi-sha#

be permitted up to a maximum of three quarters of an inch in height

differential between the exterior and interior landings.

 The change in elevation shall be beveled with a slope no greater

than 50 percent (1 unit vertical in 2 units horizontal).

(2 

Thethreshold shall beno higherthan 0.5 inches (12.7 mm).

è Rqired ûccessibe ff st·cct parking spaces

 Eing!c dwc!!ing units nd dup\

-PAGE 56 OF 69-



(O-2022-76 REV.)

COR. COPY 3

 Single dwcing units shû\\ proide o sti·cct parking spaces

per dA'cling unit in accordance with Sections 112.0520 and

44206

 Duplexcs shall provide strctparking spaces per

dlling unit in accordance with Sections 112.0525 and

442:60:

 In addition to the required parking in

Section 115.1001(d)(1)(A) or (B),an accessiblo off street

loading and unloading area shall be provided.

0 The minimum dimensions shall be 11 feet in width

by 18 fet in depth with a maximum slope of one

quarter inch per foot in any direction,

 Th off street loading area may bc located within

the priate- y and may encroach into the

requird setback area, and

 The loading arca shall be connected to the dling

unit via an accessible route of travel to an accessible

e aiee

 

ultiple delling unit development with three or more di'elling

units shal provide qýstrcctparking spaces in accordance with

Sections 112.0525 and 112.0560 including required accessible q#

street parking spaces i

 

accordance with California Building Code

Section 1 109A as may be amended.

-PAGE 57 OF 69-



(O-2022-76 REV.)

COR. COPY 3

Tier H Visitable Unit Design Standards

a The Tier H Visitable Unit Design Standards are intended to create

dlling unit that facilitate ccess to, and access within, th prim :t

level of a dcing unit for persons with temporary, developing, or

permanent disabilities. The primary entry level of a Tier II Visitable Unit

hall include accessible routes of travel, an accessible entrance, and

accessible common use spaces including a kitchen, a bathroom or half

bathroom, and at least one common us room.

b At least ono exterior accessible route o f travel shall connect an accessible

ntrance to either the sidewalk or driveway.

 A minimum width shll be provided in compliance with California

Building Code Section 1113..1.1 as may be amended.

 A maximum slope less than 1 unit vertical and 12 units horizontal

shall be provided with o maximum 2 percent cross slope.

 A level landing area of 5 fect in length shall be provided for every

30 inches of rise in circumstances where the accessible route of

travel would have û slope exceeding 5 percent.

(4 Handrils are not required.

 

At least one accessible entrance to the primary entry level shall be

provided that docs not exceed three quarters of an inch in height

difeeial-ewee-th cx:cric: and-- -lndings.

 The change in elevation shall be beveled with a slope no greater

than 50 percent (1 unit vertical in 2 units horizontal),

-PAGE 58 OF 69-



(O-2022-76 REV.)

COR. COPY 3

 The threshold shll be no higher than 0.5 inches (12.7 mm).

€ In liu of the requirements of Section 115.1005(c), the entrance for up to

50 percent of the eligible delling units may be designed to be adaptable

fcr accssibiity.

1 A maximum of 1 inches in step height shall be provided between

the eterior and interior landin.

4-miimm-elcar space f 12 iches iegth- eery-1-neh-;

tep height shall be provided on the cterior side of the door to

accommodate a future ramp.

3 The ramp clear space shall not overlap the extorior landing.

1 Interior and extorior landings shall provide a minimum length of

18 inches to the accessible route oftravel.

 The entry door shall provide a minimum net clear opening width of

32-iehe

e At least one interior accessible route of travel shall be provided in

compliance with California Building Code Section 1119. as may bo

amended. The interior route of travel shall connect an accossible entrance

to th following rooms located on the primary entry level:

 At least one bathroom or half bathroom,

f 

Fheiehe-ad

 Any common use rooms such as a living room or family room,

* A kitchen shall be provided on the primary entry level.

-PAGE 59 OF 69-



(O

-2022-

76

 REV.)

COR. COPY 3

 The kitchen shall be accessible from the interior accessible route of

F

l

2 A clear floor space at least 30 inches by 18 inches shall be

provided to allow a parallel approach by a person in a wheelchair

at a range or cook top, tho kitchen sink, oven, dishwasher, and

refrigertor/freezer.

 In lieu of the requirements of Section 115.1005, a kitchen with o

pass through design may provide a 39 inch wide or greater

accessible route of travel to a range or cook top, kitchn sink, oven,

dishwasher and refrigertor/froezer.

 Kitchen sink faucet controls shall use lover hardware or other

similar hardware.

Ø A miimum Nnoar lengh øf 30 inches o f countertop space shall be

provided adjacent to the kitchen sink.

g At least one accessible bathroom or half bathroom, located along the

interior accessible route of travel on the primary entry level, shall be

pfi

 The bathroom entrance shall provide sufficint maneuvering space

in accordance with California Building Code Sections 1132A.5

and 1131A.1 as may bc amended.

-PAGE 60 OF 69-



(O-2022-76 REV.)

COR. COPY 3

 Structural reinforcements for future grab bar installation shall be

provided in the walls adjacent to sho'ors and bathtubs, and in the

walls or floor adjacent to toilets, in accordance with California

Building Code Chapter 11..

 A minimum clear space cf 30 inches by 18 inches shall bo

provided for parallel approach at the lavatory. Maneuvering

spaces may include any knee space or toe space available below

bathrccm fixtures.

 A minimum clear :pace of 30 inches by 18 inches shall bo

provided for forward approach at the toile

 When provided, a minimum clear space of 30 inches by 18 inches

hall bo provided for parallel approach at the shower or bathtub.

 Faucet controls shall use lever hardware.

) Clear spces at thc sink, toilet and shower or bathtub may overlap

or coincido to meet the minimum requirements.

 The accessible primary entry Icvcl:húll include at least one common uso

room such as a living room or family room.

 

Accessible rooms located along the interior accessible route of travel ond

tho accessible entrance to the primary entry level shall comply with the

following requirements:

 ee

 Doors shall have a minimum net clear opening width of 32

iehe

-PAGE 61 OF 69-



(O-2022-76 REV.)

COR. COPY 3

 Lever hardwre, or other similar hardware, centered

between 30 inches and 11 inches abov the floor is required

for all doors, except for pocket doors or sliding doors.

 Maximum effort to operat doors shall not exceed

8.5 pounds (38 N) for exterior doors and 5 pounds (22 N)

for interior doors where applied at right angles to hinged

doors, and at the center plano of sliding or folding doors.

Compensating devices or automatic door operators may be

utilized to mcot thosc standards.

 Pocket doors and sliding doors providing access to room

required along the interior accessible route of travel shall

be easily operated by persons with limited dexterity.

 Electrical Outlets and Fixture

 Electrical switches and outlets shall be located no more

than 18 inches measured from the top of the outlet box nor

less than 15 inches measured from the bottom of the outlet

box to the level of the finished floor.

( Electrical outlets providing power to appliances such as

ovens, refrigerators, microwave oens, dishwashers,

ashing machines, ders and other :imiaed

appiances are exempt.

-PAGE 62 OF 69-



(O-2022-76 REV.)

COR. COPY 3

§151.0401

 

Uses Permitted in the Planned Districts

(a) [No change in text.]

(b) The permit process for a separately regulated use shall be determined in

accordance with applicable planned district use regulations, with the

exception of transitional housing facilities and permanent supportive

housing,

 

which shall bo permitted in accordance with Section 111.0313

and Section 111.0315 in all planned district zones that permit transitional

housing facilities as a conditional use the following uses. which shall be

permitted as a Process One construction permit in all planned distric

zones that permit the use as either a limited or conditional use:

ll Accessory Dwellin Units and Junior Accessory Dwellin Units,

shall be permitted in accordance with the regulations in Sectio

141.0302.

£2 Transitional housing facilities shall be permitted in accordance

with the regulations in Section 141.0313.

 er en nt suvoortive housine shall be permitd in accordance

-with the regulations in Section 141.0315.

(c) [No change in text.]

(d) In case ofconflict between Section 151.0401 and regulations for a planned

district, the planned district regulations shall apply, with the exception of

Accessory Dwellin Unite Junior Accessorv Dwellin Units, tansitiona

housing facilities and permanent supportive housing, which shall be

permitted in accordance with Section 151.0401.

-PAGE 63 OF 69-



(O-2022-76 REV.)

COR. COPY 3

§155.0238

Use Regulations Table of CU Zones

The uses allowed in the CU zones are shown in Table 155-02C:

Legend for Table 155-02C

[No change in text.]

Table 155-02C

Use Regulations Table for CU Zones

Use Categories/Subcategories

 Zone

[See Land Development

 

Designato

CodeSection 131.0112 for an

explanation and descriptions

of the Use Categories,

Subcategories, and

SeparatelyRegulated Uses]

Zones

st & 2nd

 CU-

>>

3rd >> 1-() 2- 3-

4th >> 1 2 3 4 5 3(212) 6 7 8

Open Space through Residential, Sing/e

Dwelling Units

Separately Regulated Residential Uses

Accesson

Dwelling_Units 

L

empæe6

Continuing Care Retirement Communities

through Home Occupations

Junior Accessory Dwellin Units 

[No change in text.]

L L

 -

[No change in text.]

Separately Regulated Residential

Uses, Live/Work Quarters through

Signs, Separately Regulated

 

Signs

Uses, Theater Marquee

[No change in text.]

Footnotes for Table 155-02C

[No change in text.]

-PAGE 64 OF 69-



(O-2022-76 REV.)

COR. COPY 3

§-1516.0107 Administration and Permits

a) through (c) [No change in text.]

Table 1516-01A

Type of Development Proposal and Applicable Regulations

Type of Development Proposal

 

Applicable Sections

 

Required

Permit /Decision

Process

1. [No change in text.]

2. [No change in text.]

3. [No change in text.]

4. • Re-roofing (where the existing roofing

 

[No change in text.]

material, roof structure, or roof

diaphragm is altered)

• Repainting or recoloring of exterior

surfaces where the existing exterior

building color is altered

• Any addition to or alteration of any

non-historical structure which is minor

in scope.

• New constructi

on of any non-h

abitable

accessory structure that does not exceed

100 square feet in gross floor area and

that would not be visible from the

public right-of-way.

• Conversion of existing habitable o

non-habitable areas to an ccessory

Dwellin Unit or Junior Accessory

Dwellin_Unit. or the construction of

an attached or detached ccessory

Dwelin Unit or Junior Accessory

Dwelling Unit, in accordance with

Section 141.0302 and the applicable

Sections ofthis Division.

[No change in

text.]

5. [No change in text.]

6. [No change in text.]

7. [No change in text.]

-PAGE 65 OF 69-



(O-2022-76 REV.)

COR. COPY 3

§-1516.0112 Use Regulations for Old Town San Diego Residential Zones

The uses allowed in the Old Town San Diego Residential zones are shown in

Table 1516-01:

Legend for Table 1516-01B

[No change in text.]

Table 1516-01B

Use Regulations for Old Town Residential Zones

Use Categories/Subcategories

 

Zone Designator

[See Section 131.0112 for an

explanation and descriptions of

 1 st & 2nd >>

the Use Categories, Subcategories,

 3rd >>

and Separately Regulated Uses]

 4th >>

Zones

OTRS-

 

OT

RM

-

1- 1- 2-

1 1 1 2

Open Space through Residential, Single Dwelling

Units

Separately Regulated Residential Uses

Accessory Dwellin Units

Boarder & Lodger Accommodations

Ompa:b U,its

Employee Housing through Housing for Senior

Citizens

Junior Accessory_Dwelling Units

[No change in text]

L L L

-

[No change in text]

-  -

[No change in text]

-L - -

Residential, Separately Regulated Uses,

Live/Work Quarters through Signs, Separately

Regulated Signs Uses, Theater Marquee

[No change in text]

Footnotes for Table 1516-01B

[No change in text.]

-PAGE 66 OF 69-



(O-2022-76 REV.)

COR. COPY 3

§-1516.0117 Use Regulations Table for Old Town San Diego Commercial Zones

The uses allowed in the Old Town San Diego Commercial zones are shown in

Table 1516-01D:

Legend 

for Table 1516-01D

[No change in text.]

Table 1516-01D

Use Regulations for Old Town San DiegoCommercial Zones

Use Categories/Subcategories

 Zone 

Zones

[See Section 131.0112 for an

 

Designator

explanation and descriptions of

 1 st & 2nd >> OTCC- OTMCR-

the Use Categories,

 

3rd >> . 2- 3- 1

Subcategories, and Separately

 4th »

 

1 1231 2 123

Regulated Uses]

Open Space through Residential, Single

Dwelling Units

Residential, Separately Regulated Residential

Uses

Accessorv Dweling Units

Boarder & Lodger Accommodations

Cmpaniøn-i*irt

Employee Housing through Housing for Senior

Citizens

ueW  Junior Accessory Dwellin Units

Residential, Separately Regulated Uses,

Live/Work Quarters through Signs, Separately

Regulated Signs Uses, Theater Marquee

[No change in text]

L

[No change in text.]

-

[No change in text.]

- -

[No change in text.]

Footnotes for Table 1516-01D

[No change in text.]

-PAGE 67 OF 69-



(O-2022-76 REV.)

COR. COPY 3

§-1516.0122 Use Regulations Table for Old Town San Diego Open Space-Park Zones

The uses allowed in the Old Town San Diego Open Space-Park zones are shown

in Table 1516-01F:

Legend for Table 1516-01F

[No change in text.]

Table 1516-OIF

Use Regulations for Old Town San Diego Open Space-Park Zones

Use Categories/

 Zone

Subcategories

 

Designator

[See Section 131.0112

 1 st & 2nd>>

for Use Categories,

 3rd >>

Subcategories, and

 4th >>

Separately

Regulated Uses]

Open Space through Residential, Single

Dwelling Units

Separately Regulated Residential

Uses

Accessory Dwellin Units

Boarder & Lodger Accommodations

Zones

OTOP-

1- 2-

1 

1

[No change in text]

-

=

[No change in text]

GempaiøUis - -

Employee Housing through Housing

for Senior Citizens

às Junior Accessorv

Dwelli

n Units

Residential, Separately Regulated

Uses, Live/Work Quarters through

Signs, Separately Regulated Signs

Uses, Theater Marquee

[No change in text]

[No change in text]

Footnotes for Table 1516-01F

[14 change in text.]

-PAGE 68 OF 69-



(O-2022-76 REV.)

COR. COPY 3

§-1516.0131 Accessory Buildings for Old Town San Diego Residential Zones

(a) through 

(d) [No change 

in text.]

(e) Habitable accessory buildings may be permitted:

) to a single dwelling u

nit in accordan

ce with Sectio

n

111.0302 or 141.0307, or

(2) [No change in text.]

LNHjdf:cm

12/14/2021

02/08/2022 REV.

02/08/2022 COR. COPY

04/06/2022 COR. COPY 2

04/25/2022 COR. COPY 3

Or.Dept: Planning

Doc. No. 2946725_2

-PAGE 69 OF 69-



Passed by the Council of The City of San Diego on

 

M

A

R

 

0

 1

 

20

2

2 

,

 

by the following vote:

Councilmembers

 

Ye

as

Joe LaCava

Jennifer Campbell 

Stephen Whitburn 

Monica Montgomery Steppe 

Marni von Wilpert l

Chris Cate

Raul A. Campillo

Vivian Moreno · 

Sean Elo-Rivera 

Nays

 Not Present 

Recused

 0 

El l l

El El El

El LI 0

0 l LI

  

  

0 0 0

  

Date of final passage 

M

A

R

I

 

1

 

2

0

2

2

AUTHENTICATED BY:

TODD GLORIA

Mayor of The City of San Diego, California.

(Seal)

City Cler

V

LIZABETH S. MALAND

The City of San Diego, California.

, Deputy

1 HEREBY CERTIFY that the foregoing ordinance was not finally passed until twelve calendar

days had elapsed between the day of its introduction and the day of its final passage, to wit, on

F

E

B

 

0

 8

 2

0

2

2

 

,

 

an

d o

n

 

MAR 1 1 2022

1 FURTHER CERTIFY that said ordinance was read in full prior to passage or that such

reading was dispensed with by a vote of five members of the Council, and that a written copy of

the ordinance was made available to each member of the Council and the public prior to the day

of its passage.

LIZABETH S. MALAND

f*he City of San Diego, California.

11

, Deputy

Office of the City Clerk, San Diego, California

Ordinance Number 0-

 

A.14- 9

(Seal)

City Clerti

By


