woS™
(0-2020-82)
ORDINANCENUMBERO-__ ¢ 21181 ~ (NEW SERIES) :

DATE OF FINAL PASSAGE  APR 092020

AN ORDINANCE AMENDING CHAPTER 12, ARTICLE9, .
DIVISION 1 OF THE SAN'DIEGO MUNICIPAL CODEBY =
AMENDING SECTION 129.0104; AMENDING CHAPTER 12,
ARTICLE 9; DIVISION 2 BY AMENDING SECTIONS
129.0203,129.0211, 129.0216, AND 129.0218; AMENDING

" CHAPTER 12, ARTICLE 9, DIVISION 3 BY AMENDING - .
' SECTION 129.0307, AMENDING AND RETITLING SECTION
129.0309; AMENDING CHAPTER 12, ARTICLE 9, DIVISION 4

- BY AMENDING AND RETITLING SECTION 129.0410;
"AMENDING CHAPTER 12, ARTICLE 9, DIVISION 9 BY
' AMENDING AND RETITLING SECTION 129.0907;
AMENDING CHAPTER 14, ARTICLE 2, DIVISION 12 BY

. *.  AMENDING SECTION 142.1210; AMENDING CHAPTER 14,

© ' ARTICLES, DIVISION 1 BY: AMENDING SECTIONS -
145.0101, 145.0103, 145.0104, 145.0105, 145.0106, AND .

. 145.0107; AMENDING CHAPTER 14, ARTICLE 5, DIVISION 2
BY AMENDING SECTION 145.0201 AND REPBALING '
SECTION 145.0202; AMENDING CHAPTER 14, ARTICLE 5,
DIVISION 4 BY AMENDING SECTION 145,0401 AND-
ADDING-NEW SECTION 145.0406; AMENDING CHAPT ER
14, ARTICLE 5, DIVISION 7 BY REPEALING SECTION.
145.0702 AND AMENDING SECTION 145.0711; AMENDING
. CHAPTER 14, ARTICLE 5, DIVISION 12 BY-RENUMBERING
AND RETITLING SECTION 145.1207 TO SECTION 145, 1206
AND ADDING NEW SECTION 145, 1207, AMENDING
CHAPTER 14, ARTICLE 5, DIVISION 15 BY AMENDING
SECTIONS 145. 1501 145.1505 AND 145.1507, ADDING NEW
SECTION 145.1510, AND RENUMBERING AND RETITLING
CURRENT.SECTION 145.1510 TO SECTION 145.1511; .
- AMENDING CHAPTER 14, ARTICLE 5, DIVISION 18 BY ,
-AMENDING SECTION 145.1803; AMENDING. CHAPTER '14,
ARTICLE 5, DIVISION 31 BY AMENDING SECTION 145.3101
AND REPEALING SECTION 145.3109; AMENDING = -
CHAPTER 14, ARTICLE 5, DIVISION 32 BY AMENDING
SECTION 145.3203; AMENDING CHAPTER 14, ARTICLE 5,
DIVISION 33 BY -AMENDING SECTIONS 145.3301 AND
145.3303; AMENDING CHAPTER .14, ARTICLE 5, DIVISION
38 BY RETITL]NG DIVISION 38 AND BY AMENDING AND

. RETITLING SECTIONS 145.3801, 145.3802, 145.3803,
145.3804, 145.3805, AND 145.3806; AMENDING CHAPTER 14,
ARTICLE 5, DIVISION 39 BY AMENDING SECTION 145.3905
AND AMENDING AND RETITLING SECTION 145.3910;
AMENDING CHAPTER 14, ARTICLE 5, DIVISION 40 BY

-PAGE 1 OF 66-.




" '"AMENDING SECTION 145.4005; AMENDING CHAPTER 14,

' ARTICLE 6, DIVISION 1 BY AMENDING SECTIONS "
146.0103, 146.0104, 146.0105, 146.0106, AND 146.0107;
AMENDING CHAPTER 14, ARTICLE 6, DIVISION 2 BY

(0-2020-82)

REPEALING SECTIONS 146.0208 AND 146.0209; AMENDING :

CHAPTER 14, ARTICLE 7, DIVISION 1 BY AMENDING

' SECTIONS 147. 0103, 147.0104, 147.0105, AND 147.0106;
.AMENDING CHAPTER 14, ARTICLE 7, DIVISION 2 BY
ADDING NEW SECTION 147.0203, RENUMBERING .
SECTION 147.0213 TO SECTION 147.02I 1, AND AMENDING'
AND RETITLING SECTION 147.0212; AMENDING CHAPTER
14, ARTICLE 7, DIVISION 4 BY- AMENDING SECTION
147.0405; AMENDING CHAPTER 14, ARTICLE 8, DIVISION 1
BY AMENDING SECTIONS 148.0103, 148.0104, 148.0105,
148.0106, AND 148.0107, AMENI)/ING CHAPTER 14,

- ARTICLE 9, DIVISION 1 BY AMENDING SECTIONS
149.0103, 149.0104, 149.0105, 149. 0106, 149.0107, AND'

149.0108; AMENDING CHAPTER 14, ARTICLE 9,D IVISION 2

" BY AMENDING SECT ION 149.0201 AND REPEALING
SECTION 149.0202; AMENDING CHAPTER 14, ARTICLE 9,
" DIVISION 3 BY AMENDING SECTIONS 149.0301 AND -

‘ . 149.0302, ADDING NEW SECTION 149. 0309 AMBNDING'

' AND RETITLING SECTION 149.0319, ADDING NEW
SECTION 149.0324, RBPEALING SECTION 149.0326, AND .
AMENDING SECTION 149.0337; AMENDING CHAPTER 14,

- ARTICLE 9, DIVISION 9 BY AMENDING SECTION 149.0902; .

. AMENDING CHAPTER 14, ARTICLE 10, DIV ISION 1 BY

_AMENDING SECTIONS 1410.0103 AND 1410.0107;
AMENDING CHAPTER 14, ARTICLE 10, DIVISION 4 BY
AMENDING SECTION 1410.0403; AMENDING CHAPTBR 14,
ARTICLE 11, DIVISION 1 BY AMENDING SECT IONS .
1411.0103, 1411,0104, 1411.0105, 1411.0106, AND 1411.0107;
AMENDING CHAPTER 14, ARTICLE 11, DIVISION 3 BY

. AMENDING SECTION 1411.0301 AND AMENDING AND

" RETITLING SECTION 1411.0302; AMENDING CHAPTER 14,
'ARTICLE 11, DIVISION 4 BY AMENDING AND RETITLING

_SECTION 1411.0401, REPEALING SECTIONS 1411.0402,
1411.0403, AND 1411.0404, AND ADDING NEW SBCTION

* 1411.0405; AMENDING CHAPTER 14, ARTICLE 11, BY

. ADDING NEW DIVISION 5, SECTIONS 1411.0501, 1411.0502,

AND 1411.0503, RELATING TO THE 2019 CALIFORNIA

BUILD]NG STANDARDS CODE

-PAGE 2 OF 66-




(0-2020-82)

‘WHEREAS, the California Building Standards Code,.2_019 Edition, was pnblished by the |
California Building Standards Commission, and .‘z.m.endcd'by the State Department cf Housing
and Community Development, the Division of the State Architect/Access Compliance, the State
Office of Stntewide Health l?lnnning nnd Developxnent; and the State Fite Marshal' and

WHEREAS Cahfomla Health and Safety Code section 17958 provides that the

‘ govermng body of every cnty or county shall adopt ordinances or regulations i lmposmg the same
requlrements as those contamed in the Cahforma Bmldmg Standards Code; and '

WHERBAS the Clty of San Dlego desncs to adopt these requmements except as
modlﬁed be]ow, and to make necessary cIanﬁcattons and remove mconsxstencws, and

WHER.EAS, Cah_forma Healtlm nnd Safety Code secnons 17958.5, 17958.7, and 18941.5 -
provide that a c1ty or county may make such changes or modifications to, the‘reqnlrentents o |
'containcd”in ﬂle 'Callfornia Building Standards Code as it detérmines are reasonably necessary )

. because of local clu:nat:c geologwal or topogmphlcal condmons, NOW THEREFORE,

. BEIT ORDAINED by the Councﬂ of the Clty of San Dlego, as follows

Sectlon 1. That it finds and declarw, in accordance with Callformn Health and Safety
Code section 17958 5, that the following additions'and deleti’ons incorporate changes and S
: .modlﬁcatlons that-are reasonably necessary because of the local chmauc, geologxcal or

topographical conditions set forth below

1. Climatic Conditions

Eacll ycnr? the City of San Diego experiences ,pexjiods of high temperatures, acc'ompanied‘
by low humidity and high winds. Yeirs of drcnght in the City’s semi-arid natural environment -
- have i_ncreased the combustibility of vegetation. Thcse conditions create an environment in
‘wh'icld t‘he. Fire Department commits large nuxnbers of ﬁreﬁghtlng re:s'ources to control and -

extinguish wildland fires. The City experienced major wildfires in 2003 and 2007, Limited

\ - -PAGE 3 OF 66-




(0-2020-82)
, ﬁreﬁghting reSources means that ﬁreﬁghtem may have great difﬁcuityr eontrotling ﬁres in |
structuree | | a o

San Drego is exposed to sunny or partrally sunny days for more than half of the days in
the .year and asa result, isa natronal leader in the unplementatlon of solar photovoltarc systems.
Streamlmmg the approval process through the adoptlon of standards for solar systems facilitates
broader adoptlon and w111 help the Clty achleve the net Zero energy consumpt1on goals of the i

Clty s General Plan.

As noted above, the Clty of San Dxego has a serm-and natural envrronment a.nd as such, -

~ .water conservatron isan 1mportant goal The Chmate ‘Action | Plan for the City of San Diego has -

water efﬁcrent burldmgs as one of its: .goals. To achreve that goal Sa.n Dlego must adopt water

conservatlon and efﬁclent water usé standards ‘In addltlon to requmng the use of water efﬁcrent

: plumbmg ﬁxtures the City of San Diego reduces water eonsumptron through various water reuse -

programs Reducmg the quantlty of water supplled to plumbmg fixtures can also result in

- A

reduced water consumptlon .

San Dlego is subject to flood hazards along the coastal netghborhoods to the west and in .

1ts valleys and, therefore restricts constructrou in speclal ﬂood hazard areas.

2. . Geolog;cal Condltrons

4

" The City of San Diego is situdted near three major earthquaike fuults each eapable of

‘. generaung quakes with magmtude of 7. 0 or greater on the Rlchter scale the Elsinore Fault,
northeast of the City, the Rose Canyon Fault which extends from LaJ olIa Cove through Rose
'Canyon and into downtown SarDiego; and the Coron'ado Banks Fault which extends in a
northwest/southeast direction Just offthe coast under the Pacrﬁc Ocean The most severe threat

. from earthquakes is damage to and collapse of bmldmgs and other structures due to ground

-PAGE 4 OF 66- -




. (0-2020-82)

- movement. Barthquakes can also cause ﬁree ey damaging ges and power lines, e.nd ean make |
’ : firefighting difficult or impossible by breaking water mams and damaging sprinkler systems.

The City of San Dieéo is included in the 'A.cquis't f’riolp Snecjal Fauit Study Zone and the
Rose Canyon fault area, both with high mapped_eeisnlic eeceiernﬁons t.hat‘ i@pect construction of . '
& lugh rise buildings. o |

3, Topographical Conditidns ' ' '

"The Cit)} ef San Diego has over 900 linear miles of wildland urban interface, where'
backyards of homes meet the natural vegetatlon, 1ncludmg coastal sage sorub and chaparral
Access to this natural vegetanon for purposes of ﬁreﬁghtmg is made difficult by topograpmcal
. features of the City that include hills, momtmns and canyens. These topographlcal features
create s;'gniﬁé:ant difficulties for emergency pe;sonnel'attezneﬁng to extmgutsh fires in tneée
Due,te th‘e.‘prevaleneé of canyons, preeerved open space, the Paciﬁc Ocean, and an ’
.intemn't.ional 'border; fhe City of Snn Diego has constrained buildable space that requires verdcd
construction. | o -

San Dlego mcludes nelghborhoods that are sub_]ect to ﬂoodmg during periods of hlgh
rainfall due to the prevalence of canyons steep slopes, the ocean to the west, as well as nvers
: ‘passmg thx‘ough canyons and termmatmg in the ocean. .

Section 2, That Chapter 12 Artlcle 9, Dmswn 1 of the San Dlego Mummpal Code is ;
amended by amendmg sectlon 129 0104 to read as follows: o : Y
§129.0164 | Construction Permthuthormes | | o

(e) * The powers and duttes of the Building Official are as follows:

(1) through 13) [No change i in text. ]

-PAGE 5 OF 66-




. 14y

(15)

a6y

(0-2020-82)

To review applicaiions for Grading Permits for,‘ and to inspect

: grading on, private lots thatdo not iriclude publi'c rights of way,
well as associated plans, speclﬁoahons, and other data to determme .

" ifan apphcauon isin comphance w1th the gradmg regulauons in-

the Cahforma Building Code, other adopted Clty standards; and

- engmeermg standards of practloe |

[No chango in 'text.],

To review planis 'and' specifications for wator and seover utilities ond |
‘installations, and to inspect the utilities ahd io'stallations ‘wh;cri

' ,'.located in pnvate streets for comphance w1th the issued .
,constructzon permtt the San Diego Fn'e Code, the San Dlego .
:Bulldmg, Electrical, Plumbmg, Mechamcal,.Remdentlal Bmldmg,

- Green Building, fmd' Existing Building Regulations, and all other -

apphcable prowswns of the San Diego Mumclpal Code

(b) through (c) [No change in text ]

Sect:on 3. That Chapter 12, Axtmle 9, Division 2 of the San Dlego Mumclpal Code is

amended by amendmg sections 129.0203, 129, 0211 129. 0216 and 129. 0218, to read as folloWs

’ §129.0203 Exemptions from a Bulldmg Permlt

(@ A Bmldmg Perrmt is not requlred for the followmg structures and

actxvmes, exoept when the development would mvolve alteratlons, repairs,

or 1mprovements toa historical resource as. descnbed in Sectlon

143.0220; whcn ‘development on a premxses contammg enwronmentally

sensitive lands requires a development permitin accordanoe with ~Sect10n .

143.0110; or when a building is constructed with unreihfooced masonry

-PAGE 6 OF 66-




(0-2020-82)

bearing walls or ox.terior wall parapets:
(.1) [No ch‘ange in text.]
: (2) -Fences that are 7 feet in height or less.
(3) through (6) [No change in toxt.] '
(D Sidewhiks and dﬁveways that are 30 inches or less above adjoceilt
grade, are not over any basement or story, and are not part of an :
' accesoib]e route in accordance with the éalifomio Buﬂofog Code. |
~(8). through (9) [No change in text.] |
(10) Wmdow awmngs supported by an extenor wall of Group R
D1v1s1on 3, and Group U Occupanclcs that do not project more-
than 54 mches ﬁ'om the extenor wall and do not require addltlonal
support | ‘ |
(1 1) through (13) [No change in text. ]
. (14 Blectr_oher standards, ﬂag poles, and antennas that are 30 feet of
| . - Tess in hoighf above finish grade wﬁen'ﬁﬂly extended. ‘
(15) Decks accessory to ouildings wiihin the scope of the California
| Res1dent1a1 Code that do not exceed 200 square feet (18 58 m2) in
area, that are not more than 30 inches (762 mm) above grade at
‘any pomt, that are no_t attached toa dwelhng, and that do not serve
| the exit door reqmred by Section R311.4 of the Cahforma '
| Resulentlal Code. | ‘ .
(16) - Renewal of roof coverings on any building permitted oy the

California Building Code and the California Residential Code,

-PAGE 7 OF 66-




an

- (0-2020-82)

where the existing roof enpcnne, including roof diaphragm, is not _
altered.

Repairs that 'involye only the replaeemexit of components or

" existing work with similar materiel_s for the'purpose of

(18)

(19)

(20)

ey

mamtenance, that do not have an aggregate valuatlon of over

$1, 000 00, and that do not affect any electrical or mechamcal

' iostallations. Repalrs exempt from penmt requirements shall not '.

include any addition, change, or modification in construction, exit

. facllmes, or permanent ﬁxtures or equlpment The followmg

repmrs are exempt from permlt requirements w1thout limit to

: valuatlon. )
(A) through (D) [No change in text.]

- Structures placed in pubhc streets, alleys and sidewalks, except

those regulated by Chapter 32of the California Building Code

Work done by employees of the Cxty on City-owned or leased

buildings. IR .

A temporary shed, ofﬁce or storage bmldmg and other structure
mcldental to and for work authorlzed bya valid Grading or

Bulldmg Pertmt Such structures must be removed upon exp1rat10n -
of the permit or completlon of work covered by the Gradmg or

Building Permit.

Inistalling replacemerit windows in existing window operiings

. ~ where all of the following conditions apply:

-PAGE 8 OF 66-




(A)

®)

©

(D)

@

(0-2020-82)

The wiridows are replaced in detached one and two-family

dwellings or fowriho'usesj as defined in the California

Residential Code

The proposed wmdow replacement shall not require any .

modlﬁcatlons to the weather resxstlve extenor walI

envelope protectmg the structure or- the interior of the

) structure

The emstmg windows to' be replaced are not required to be

ﬁre resxstwe

“The propbsed work shall not require modiﬁcatjbﬁs to the -

' existing rough openings.

New permane’nf parkmg at@d vehicular use areas for less than four

-

" vehicles, including access to the spaces, but excluding parking for. -

single dweliirgg unit uses on a single lot in Residential-Single Unit .

~ -Zones..

ey

4

Specific st}uctures as determined by the Building Official fora .-

parncular and Justxﬁable reason.

A s1dewa1k cafe that is in comphanoe w1th Sectlon 141.0621,

®

- unless" any one, of the followmg applles
(A) . The SIdewalk cafe would alter or modlfy the exlstmg '

‘bmldmg,.bmldmg fagade, or any means of building egress;

The sidewalk cafe would be located on a raised platform or °

in a sunken area; or

-PAGE 9 OF 66- -




(0-2020-82)

, | © A barrier conmstmg of rallmgs, fences, or pIanter boxes ' :
| would be mstalled to dehneate the area of the sxdewalk
cafe.
(b) through"(c) [No change in text.]
§120.0211  Closing of Building Permit Application
: @) through (d)[Ng change in text | b
(e The application for all Electncal Plumbmg, Mechamcal or Fire Permxts
" associated with a Bugldmg Permit shall expire concurrently with t_he _
Building Permit. o | |
| §129.0216 Initlal Utilization of a BuildmgPermit
' A Bmldmg Permit shall become void 1f work authorized by the permit is suSpended,
the stmcture is abandoned, or substantial work authorized by the perrmt has not
’ been completed and validated by an. mspectmn w1thm 12 months of the date of
. penmt 1ssuance unless an extensmn has been granted pursuant to Sectlon
: 129.0219. |
§129.0218 Expiration of a Bullding Permlt
“(a) - [No change in text.] ; _
b If the building or work authorized by a Building Permit hes not received |
: ﬁnal mspectlon approval by the perrmt expiration date, all work shall stop
until a new penmt is issued. All Eleotncal Plumbmg, Mechamca.l or Fire
- Pertmts assoclated with a Bmldlng permlt shall expire concurrently with

the Building Permit.

-PAGE 10 OF 66-




(0-2020-82)

Section 4. That Chapter 12 Axucle 9 D1v1s1on 3 of the San Diego Mumclpal Code i§
amended by amendmg sectlon 129 03 07, amendmg and retlt]mg section 129 0309, to read as ‘
follows: . |
§129.0307 How to Appt‘y for an Eleett'ical Permit

- (2) through (f) [No change in text] |

§129.0309  Issuance of an Electrical Permit and Closing of an Electrical Permit
Application A

(a) through (b) [No change in text. ]
' . (¢y  Ifone year has elapsed since the date an Electncal Permit apphcatmn is’
: . deemed complete dnd the applzcant has not requested that an Electncal
.. Permit be issued, the apphcanon file shall be closed. Plans and other data
submitted for review may be retumed to the applzcant or destroyed by the . | ‘
Bmldmg Official. To reapply, the applzcant shall subrmt a new Electrical
Permit apphcatlon w1th required submttal matenals and shall be subj ect to
- - all apphcable fees and regulatlons in effect on the date the new apphcanon
isfiled | | o
. (&) “The Electrical Pemﬁt aﬁplipaﬁdn ﬁig for Ciity projects shall bo closed after
| two years have elapeed smce the date the Bl:eetrical Permit application.is
~ deemed complete. -
(¢  The Building Official mdy extend an'Elech'ical Permit appﬁcetion one
~ time, for a period tlot exceeding 180 calendar days, if _the Buiidihg Official -
determines that circumstences beyond the cen_trol of the applicant |
prevented issﬁance of the. Electrical Perrhit. | | |
Section 5 ‘That Chapter 12, Artlcle 9, D1v1s10n 4 of the San Dlego Mum01pal Code is

amended by amendmg and rehtlmg section 129 0410, to read as follows:

-PAGE'11 OF 66-




§129.0410

(0-2020-82)

.Issuance of a Plumbing/Mechanlcal Permit and Closmg ofa

Plumbing/Mechanical Permit Apphcatxon R

(a)

®

©

A Plumbmg/Mechamcal Penmt may be 1ssued aﬁer all approvals have

'been obtained and the requlred fees have been paid. -

A Plumbmg/Mechamcal Permit shall not be issued for a development that

Vrequlres a development permzt until the development permit has been

. 1ssued

If one year has elapsed since the date a Plumbmg,/Mechamcal Permit
application is deemed complete and the apphcant has not requested thata

Plumbmg/Mechamcal Permit be issued, the applxcatton ﬁle shall be

E closed Plans and other data submltted for review may be retumed tothe

_ applzcant or destroyed by the Building Oﬂicm] To reapply, the apphcant

shall subtmt a new Plumbmg/Mechamcal Permn apphcatlon with requued

submtttal matenals and shall be subject to all apphcable feesand |

. regulatlons in eﬂ’ect on the date the new apphcatlon is ﬁled

@ -

()

The Plumbmg/Mechamcal Penmt apphcatxon ﬁle for Clty pro; jects shall be

closed after two years have elapsed since the date the Plumbmg/

- Mechamcal Penmt applxcatlon is deemed complete
The Bunldmg Official may extend a Plumbmg/Mechamcal Permit
.appllcatlon one tlme, for a period not exceedmg 1 80 ca]enda: days, if the -

B_ulldmg Ofﬁcml determmes that clrcumstances beyond the codtrol of the

applicant prevented issua;nce of the Plizmbing/Mecha:ﬁcal Permit,

Section 6. That Chapter 12 Article 9, Division 9 of fhe San Dlego Mummpal Code is

amended by amendmg and retlthng Sectlon 129 0907 to read as follows

-PAGE 12 OF 66-




(0-2020-82)

§129.0007  Issuance of a Fire Permit and 'Closing of a Fire Permit Application

(@)
®)

©

@)

(©

[No change in text.] -
A Fire Pemnt sha]l not be 1ssued until associated penmts have been
issued.

If one year has elapsed since the datea Fire Pemnt application is deemed

, complete and the appltcant has' not requested that a F1re Permlt be 1ssued

the application file s_hall be closed. Plans.and other data submitted for -

review may be r&med to the applicant or destroyed-b); the Bililding

Official. To reapply, the appl:cant shall submit a new Fire Permxt .

apphcatlon w:th required subrmttal matenals and shall be subject to all

. appltcable-fces and regulations in pﬁ'ect on the date the new application is

filed.

| The Fire Permit application file for City projects shall be closed after two *

years have elapsed since the date the Firé Permit application is deemed
complete,

The Building Official may extend a Fire Permit application one time, for a

period not exceeding 180 calendar days, if the Building Official -

determines that circumstances beyond the control of the applicant

: pre';'ented issuance of the Fire Permit.

Section 7. That Chapter 14, Article 2, Division 12 of the San Diego Municipal Code is

amended by amending section 142.1210, to read as follows:

-PAGE 13 OF 66-




(0-2020-82)

§1421210  General Sign Regulations
This sect’ioneils divided into subsections for copy x;egulations, loeetione]
regulations, eﬁ'ueteral regulaﬁode,' and sién maintenance regil_le_tions.
(® through (b) [No ehgnge‘in te#t’.] . | |
(9 Structural Regulaﬁoﬁe |
' ) through (3) [No chw;e in text.]
4) When mstalled on the exterior walls of hxgh-nse bulldmgs as .
| deﬁned in Chapter 4 of the Cahfomla Bmldmg Code, exterior wall
‘s1gns greater than 100 square. feet in area or greater than 10 feet in

' . elther d1mens10n shall eomply with Sectlon 705.12 of the 2019

ER Cahforma Building Code and Sectlon 705.1 of the 2019 California -

Flre Code

'(d) L change in text]

Section 8. That Chapter 14 Arncle 5, Division 1 of the San Dlego Mumc1pa1 Code is - -

Aamended by amending sectlons 145 0101 145 0103, 145 0104, 145 0105, 145 0106, and
145 0107 to read as fo]lows
_ §145.0101 Purpose of the Bmldmg Regulations

(a) . The purpose of the Building Regulatxons is to estabhsh minimum -

* standards to safeguard health a.nd safety, property, and pubhc welfare, and

to satlsfy the purpose of the 201 9 Cahforma Bmldmg Code as prov1ded in
_Sectlon 1.1.2 of the 2019 Cal_lforma Building Code.

‘ (b) - [No changein text.]

-PAGE 14 OF 66-




(0-2020-82)

- §145.0103 Adoption of the Cahforma Bmldmg Code

(®

®)

©

@

BCR

' through 38.

.The 2019 Cahforma Buﬂdmg Code, published by the Callfomm Bulldmg

Standards Commxssxo_n (BSC), and as amended by the State Depamnent of

' ~ Housing and Community Development, (HCD 1, f—ICD 1/ACj; the Division _
| Vof the State Archltect/Access and Comphance (DSA/AC), the State Office:
3 of State\mde Health Planmng and Development (OSI-[PDS), and the State
o F1re Marshal (SFM), is adopted by referencc, except as othermse prov1ded
' mA Chapter 14, Article 5 of the Land Development Code,-Dmsmns?

through 38. A copy of the 2019 California Building Codé is on file in the

office of the City Clerk__aé Document No. 00-_- 21181 }

“When refe'renco is made to'the 'Califomia Building Code, it shall be the

2019 Cahforma Bmldmg Code, Cahforma Code of Regulatlons Title 24
Part 2, as publlshed by the Cahforma Bulldmg Standards Commlssxon
Each of the regulations, provmons, condmons, and terms of the 2019 '

Callforma Bunldmg Code is made a paﬂ of Chapter 14 Artlcle 5 as if fully‘

_ setforth in this Artlcle except as otherwise provnded in D1v1smns 2.

- Numbering of Sections in Divisions 2 through 38 of this Article is cross

referenced to Sections in the 2019 Califoria Building Code. -

The adoptmn of the 2019 California Building Code shall in no way lnmt,

prohlbxt, 1mpede, or prevent the City Council from adoptmg ordmances |

lnmtmg or prcventmg the issuance of any type, number, or geographlcal

- dlstnbuuon of permits for construction or demolition of any faclhty for ’

which a permit is requlred.

- -PAGE 15 OF 66-




© §145.0104 -

§145.0105

(0-2020-82)

® - [No change in text]

Portions of the Callfomia Bmldmg Code Not Adopted by the City of San
Diego

The following portions of the 2019 California Building Code are not addpted by

the City of San Diegot .

(8  Chapter 1, Division 11 “Scope and _Adminiétmtion,” all portions witht_he

exceptton of Sectlon 104.11.

()  Chapter 15, RoofAssembhes and Rooﬁop Structures, Section 1511 4.

@ ~[No change in text]

Modifications to the Cahfomia Bullding Code Adopted by the Clty of San

Diego ) R _

: The followmg Secttons or Subsectlons of the 2019 Callforma Bmldmg Code are
' modlﬁed by the City of San Diego:

' (a) ['No chgnge in text.]

® ‘Chaptevr 12, Interior Environment,. Section 120_6, Sound Tranémi;sion,
. Section 1207 .4, Efficiency Dwelling Umts | | |

(©) . Chapter 15 Roof Assembhes and Rooﬁop Structures, Section 1505.1

‘ General, Section 1505 Flre Classtﬁcauon, Section 1505.8 Bmldmg—

mtegrated photovoltmc prodttcts, Section 1505.9 Rooﬁopl mounted .
photovoltaic panel systemst_, Secti‘dﬁ 1510.7.1 Firé classification, Sectiotl
1507.8 Wood smﬁglee, Section 1507.9 Wood Shakes, and Section 1511.1
General. . -

(d) through (f) [No cliange in text.]

-PAGE 16 OF 66-




§145.0106

(8

© (0-2020-82)

Appendix o, Eme'rgency Housing Section 0103.2.1 Exception 1,0103.6
L1ghtmg, Ventllatlon, and Heatlng, 0106 General, Sectlon 0106. 1 1

Tents and Section 0106 1.2 Membrane Structures.

Additions to the Californin Building Code Adopted by the City of Saﬁ Didgo

The followmg Sectlons and Subsectwns are added to the 2019 Cahfomla Bmldmg B

Code by the Clty of San Diego: -

@
)

(©)

@

©

®

(®

Chapter 4, Motor ‘Vehicle Occupanc:es, Secnon 406 2.1.1.
Chapter 7A, Matenals and Constructlon Methods for Exterior ledﬁre
Exposure, Sectlon 702A Dcﬁmtlons, Sectxon 703A 6.1, Alternative ‘

Matenals, Des_lgns or Methods,. Sectlon 703A.6.2, Mod1ﬁcat10ns,» Section

© 705A 4, Roof Gutters, Section 705A4, L, Drip Edge Flashing, Section

708A 2 2.1, mel Wmdow Remforcmg, and Sectlon 711A.1, Spark
Arrwtors

Chapter 12, Sound Transmission, Section 1206.05.

" Chapter 15, Roof Assemblies and Rooftop Structures, Subsections
.1505.1.5.and 1505.1.6, Sections 1507.1.3 and Subsections 1511,l< through

1511.1.5.

Chapter 16, Structural Design, Section 1607.2, Fire Trucks and

Emergency Vehicle Live Load and 1612.3, Flood Loads.

. Chapter 17, Structural Tests and Special Inspections, Section 1704.3.1

item 6.

Chapter 18, Soils and Foundatlons, Section 1803 Geotechnical

.Investlgahons, Subsectlons 1803 2 exceptlons 2 through 4 Sectxons

i

- -PAGE 17 OF 66-




@)

@

)

§145.0107

(0-2020-82)

" 1803.2.1;1803.2.2, 1803.2.3, 1803.5.11.1, 1803.5.11.2, 1803.5.13,

1803.5.13. 1 1803.5.13.2 and Table 145.1803.

Chapter 32, Bncroachments mto the Public Right-of- Way, Sectlon 3203
Entrance Canopies, Subsections -3203 1 through 3203.6. '

Chapter 33, Safeguards Durmg Constructlon, Section 3303 8, Demohtlon

and Removal Regulatlons

Appendix O, Emergency I-Iousing, Subsection 0103.2.1 Exception 2,
- Subsections 0106.2 through 0106.7, Section O11 1 Emergency Housmg
ﬁ Lighting and Ventﬂatlon Reqmrements, Subsectlons o1 11 1 and 01 11 2,

Scchon 0112 Emergency Housmg Fire and Life Safety Requirements,

Subsect:ons O112.1 through 0112.13, and Section 0113 Emergency

" Housing Altematlves and Modifications, Subsectlon O113.1.

Adoption of Appendic‘es to -the California Building Code

The following App"endix Chapters of the 2(_)1 9 Chliforh‘iaBuilth Codedre

adopted by the City of San Diego:

(a)

Appendix chapters s])emﬁcally amended by a State agency listed i in

~ Section 145. 0103 and 1dent1ﬁed in the adoptlon matrices of the 2019

- California Bmldmg Code.

(b) through (e) [No change in text.] '

®

* Appendix O, Emergéncy Housing.

Section 9. That Chapter 14, Article 5, Division 2 of the San Diego Mumclpal Code is

~ amended by amendlng sectlon 145. 0201 and repealing sectlon 145.0202, to read as follows:

-PAGE 18 OF 66-




§145.0201

(0-2620-82)

Local Modiﬂcatlons and Additions to Chapter 2 Definitions of the California

Bmlding Code _
Chapter 2 of the California Building Code is adopteci:by reference Without change

pursuant to Section 1450103 of the Land Development Code.

Section 10. That Chapter 14, Article 5, Division 4 of the San Diego Municipal Codois

: amended by amendlng section 145. 0401 a.nd adding new secnon 145 0406 to read as follows N

§145.0401

§145.0406

.. Local Modxﬁcations and Additions to Chapter 4 “Special Detailed

Requirements Based on Use and Occupancy” of the California Butldmg |

‘Code . r

Cbapter 4 of the Cahfomla Bulldmg Code is adopted by reference with addltlons .

pursuant to Sectxon 145 0106 of the Land Development Code

- Local Modiﬁcations and Addnttons to Secﬁon 406 “Motor Vehicle Related

Occupancies” . _ . , S
Section 406.2.1, “Automatic garage door openers and vehicular gates,” is adopted .

with additions pursuant to Section 145.0106. Section 406.2,1.1 , “Backup Power

. for Automatic Garage Door Openers,” is added as follows: 406 2 1.1 Backup

Power for Automatlc Garage Door Openers. When private parkmg garages that
serve an mdmdual dwellmg are equipped with automatlc garage door openers, .

the automatlc garage door openers shall mclude battery backup functions that are

" des1gned to operate ina manner S0 that the automattc garage door openers are

operatlonal w1thout mterruptlon durmg an electrical outage

" Section 11. 'I‘hat Chapter 14, Artlcle s, D1vrs1on 7 of the San Diego Municipal Code is

amended by repealing section 145.0702 and amending sectlon 145.0711, to read as follows:

-PAGE 19 OF 66-




(0-2020-82)

§145.0711 °  Local Additions to Section 711A “Additional Building Standards for .

‘Buildings Located in the Local Agency Very High Fire Hazard Severity
Zone” of Chapter 7A of the California Bulldmg ‘Code

. Section 711A. 1 is added as follows to Chapter TA pursuant to Sectlon 145. 0106

_of the Land Development Code \ ‘ '

.'7 11A.1 Spark arrester. All structures havmg any chnnney, flue, or stoveplpe shall

., be eqmpped w1th an approved spark arrester if the chimney, flue, or stovepipe is
attached to any ﬁreplace, stove, barbecue or other sohd or hquld fuel burmng

_equipment or devwe

Sectron 12. That Chapter 14, Arucle 5, Dmsmn 12 of the San Diego Mumcxpal Code is

amended by renumbenng and retltlmg sectlon 145.1207 to sechon 145.1206 and addmg new

section 145 1207 to read as follows

~

. §145.12,064 Local dditions and Modiﬁcations to Sectron 1206 “Sound Transmlssion” of - '

the C 'forniaBmldmg Code
Section 1206 of the Cahforma Bulldmg Code is adopted wnh addmons
: and mod:ﬁcatlons pursuant to Secuons 145 0105 and 145 0106 of the-
'Land Development Code. Section 1206 is modlﬁed by addmg Sectlon

12065,

(b) . Section 1206.5. Additionai Noise Regulations. For additional noise
regulatrons lnmtmg the intrusion of exterior noise mto bulldmgs based on
land use standards, see Chapter- 13, Artrcle 2, Dmsmn 15 of the Land

" Development Code. For additional noise regulatlons }nmtmg the mtrusroh
of exterior noise into non-residmdal Buildiogs, see Section 5.507 of the

-California Green Building Standards Code.

-PAGE 20 OF 66-




§145.1207

' (0-202.0-82) "

Local Addltwns and Modiﬁcations to Section 1207 “Interior Space
Dimensions” oi‘ the California Building Code

(®

®)

" . have a living-room-of not less s than 150 square fect (13 .93 m2) of floor

Section 12074 of the California Building Code is adopted with
modifications pursuant to Section 145.0105 of the Lénd Doirolopment'

Codoﬁ

. Section 1207.4 item 1 is modified as follows: 1. The dwelling unit shall

area. An add1t10na1 100 square feet (9.3 m2) of ﬂoor area shall be

‘ prov1ded for each occupant of the dwellmg unit in excess of two. .

- Sectlon 13 “That Chapter 14, Article 5, Dmsmn 15 of the. San Dxego Mum01pal Code is

amended by amend_mg sections 145.1_501, 145.1505, ond 145.1507, addmg pew sect:on :

145.1510, and renumbering and retitling current section 145.1510 to section 145.1511, to read as

~ follows:

§145.1501

Local Modiﬁcations and Addltions ‘to Chapter 15 “Roof Assemblies and -

(a)

®

@

Rooftop Stmctures” of the California Bmldmg Code

[No change in text. ]
 Sections 1501 through 1504 and Sectlons 1506, 1508, and 1509 are

adopted by reference thhout change pursuant to Section 145:0103 of the '
Land Development Code o

SecﬁonsZISQS.l; 1505.8, 1505.9, 1507.1, 1507.8,.15'0.7.9,' and 1510.7.1,
and 1511 are adopted by reference with modifi_catio_ns and additions
pursuant t0 Sections 145.01 05 and 145.0106 of the Land Dovolopgient

Code. '

_PAGE 21 OF 66-




(0-2020-82)_ |

§145.1505 Local Addmons and Modifications. to Section 1505 “Fire Classiﬁcation” of
. : the ‘California Building Codé _

(a) through (b) [No change in text.]
(¢) . Section 1505. 8 is modified pursuant to Section 145 0105 of the Land :

. Development Code as follows: 1505.8 Bmldmg-mtegrated photovoltale .
products Bulldlng-mtegrated photovoltalc products installed as the roof
covenng shall be tested hsted and Iabeled for fire clasmﬁcauon in-
accordance W1th Section 145 1505(b) ) o '

"‘h('d)l’ © Section 1505 9 is modified putsuant to Sectlon 145 0105 of the Land |
- Development Code as follows 1505 9 Rooftop mounted photovoltalc
'. panel systems Rooﬁop rack-mounted photovoltmc panel systems shall be.
tested hsted and 1dent1ﬁed witha fire class1ﬁcat10n in aooordance V)lﬂl .
UL 1703 and UL 2703 and Sectlon 145. 1505(b)

- §1451507 Local Addltions and Modificatlons to Section 1507 “Requirements for Roof
o Coverings” of the Califomia Building Code

(a) [No change in text 1 '

| (5) ~ Section 1507 L. 3 is added as follows pursuant to Sectlon 145. 0106 of the' B
‘Land Development Code: 1507.1.3. Roof coverings shallﬂbe secured or . -
fastened to the supportmg roof constructlon | o

§145.1510 Local Addmons and Modlﬁcatnons to Secuon 1510 “Rooftop Stmctures” of .
the Callfomla Buildlng Code . :

'Sectlon 1510.7.1 is modlﬁed pursuant to Sectnon 145. 0105 of the Land
: Development Code'as i_‘ollows. 1510.7.1 Fire classification. Rooﬁop-mounted
photovoltaic panels and modules shall have ja fire classiﬁcation in acdotda_née ]

‘with Section 145.1505.

-PAGE 22 OF 66-




§145.1511°

' (o-zozo-sz)

Local Additions and Modlﬂcations to Section’ 1511 “Rerooﬁng” of the

California Building Code

(8)

®)

©

Section 1511.1 is modified putsuent‘ to Section 145.0105 of the Land

Development Code as follows: 15111 General. Materials and methods of

'application-used for covering or replacing an existing roof covering ehall

. comply with the requlrements of Chapter 15 of the Cahforma Bmldmg

Code as adopted and amended by the City'of San Dtego

'Sectlons 1511 1.1 through 1511.1 28 are added pursuant to Section

145. 0106 of the Land Development Code
0} 1511 1.1. All replacements alteranons, or repairs shall bea Class

“A” roof assembly

@ 4 1511 1 2. The entlre roof shall be a Class “A” roof assembly where

. more than twenty-five percent of the total roof areg is replaced
'altered or repalred within any twelve»month penod

Sectlons 1511, 1.3 through 1511 1.5 are added pursuant to-Section

) 145 0106 of the Land Development Code

(1) 1511.1.3. Wood shakes and shmgles _are .pr'ohibi_ted throughout the

roof .vu'rlter'e more than twenty-five percent of the total roof area is

replaced, altered or repmred within any twelve- month period. .
) 151 1 14, Wood shakes and shingles are not pemxitted, except as |

provl_ded in California Historical Building Code, Section 8-408 and -

Land Development Code Section 145.1511(c)(1).

| (3) 1511.1.5.No roof covering shall be applie‘d over any existing

wood shakes or wood shingles.

" .PAGE 23 OF 66-




(0-2020-82)

Section 14, That Chapter 14, Anicie's Division 18 of the San Diego Municipal Code is

amended by amendmg section 145 1803, to read as follows:

§145.1803 Locale Additions and Modifications to Section 1803 “Geotechmcal
' Investigations” of the California Bmlding Code ‘

(a) through (e) [No change in text 1

-

The Geologrc Hazard Category and the Bmldmg, Structure and Fac:hty
Class must be detemuned as follows when using Table 145 1803t0

determme whether a geotecbmcal mvestlgatmn report is requlred due to

| . local geologtcal hazards w1thm the Clty of San Dlego
. (l) " [No change in text. ]

(2)  City staff éhall assign one of four Building, Structure and Facility

classes to'each buﬂdmg, structure, of fecility ba’sed on their use, - .
) type of oecupancy, number of occupants and whether hazardous -‘
materials are bemg used or stored in the bmldmg, structure or .
facility to determme whether a Geotechmcal Investlgatlon Report
s requxred |
(A) [No chenge in t-ext..].
8) ClassB inclides the folldwiné developnrer'lt.s" occupency
_groups, and structures provrded they are not mcluded in '
~ Class A |
@ Al new ‘structures requiring deep. foundaﬁons, such
as plers or pilings. .

(i)  All structures over three stories in height. -

" _PAGE 24 OF 66-




(i)

4 Groupl,Divisions2and3.

(iv).

™)

™) |

. structures over 35 feet high.

(vii)

 (0-2020-82)

All structures cor_ltainir{g the following occupancies

'pumuant fo the California Buildihg Code, .

. Chapter 3:

a. Group A, Diyisions 1,2,3 ér_ld 4,

b. Group E, buildiﬁgs g.nd other stru;:turcs
contéining élerﬁcnfary, scho.01, ‘ secondary
scﬁéol or day care facilities v}ith an

’ ogzél;pant ‘Io"ac'l greater than 250; .

c. . - GroupH, Divisions 1, 2, and 3; and

‘Al structures with an occupant load of more than

300 occupants as determined by Table 1004.1.2 of

the California Building Code and structures used for~
pubhc assembly a331gued to RlSk Category IMin
Table 1604.5 of the Cahforma Bulldmg Code

Tanks, bins, hoppers, 31losg and other’ storage :

structures with more than 20,000-gallon capacity

inténded to store toxic, hazérddus, or ﬂammable
contents that are not assocxated with a bulldmg,
structure, or facﬂ.tty in Class A |

Tanks, bms, hoppers, silos, and other storage

Towers over 35 feet high.

"_PAGE 25 OF 66-




(0-2020-82)

(ﬁﬁ) . Retairiing walls over the heights listed in the "
- following Subsections a. and b. w1th t_he. height |
measured from the' top: of the féoting to the -tol; of
thowall: - v |
»  Retaining walls over 12 feetin height; and
b. . Rétéinsng V:valls over 8 feet m Héight
suéporting:a surcharge| or retaining toxic,
. hazgrddu_s, or ﬂamn};,ﬁle contents, . . .v
: © tﬁr;)ugh'(Dj No change in téxt.] |

(2 [No change’ in tp)it‘.]

 Table 145.1803-) .
Required Geotechnical Investigation
Type of Hazard | .. Hazard Category. '- .Bu.ildil,lg, Structure, -.
. . . : : : and Facility Class
Fault Zones/Ground . - . v | ' : .
Rupture . ) 11,12,13 A,B,C,D
~ : 21,22 - . AB,CD
Landslides/Potential :
Slope Instability ’
. ' 23, 24, 25, 26, 27 - ~ AB,C
'Liqueft:tction/Potqntial . ) : S .
Ground Failure - ' 3‘{ 32 . ABCD
o 41,42,43 - A,B,C,D
anStal Bluff Stability . - - :
_ 44,45, 46,47, 48 ' ~ AB"

_PAGE 26 OF 66-




((0-2020-82)

54 ) 4 ' A) ‘B; C.
' All Other Terrain 52,53 1 AB
51,55 A
Footuotes [156 change in text.]

Section 15. That Chapter 14 Artwle S, Division 31 of the San Dlego Mumclpal Code is |
ended by amendmg section 145 3101 and repealmg section 145 3109, to read as follows I

: §145.3101 Local Modlﬁcations and Additions to Chapter 31 “Special Constructmn” of
: the California Building Code - : .

Chapter 31 of the California Bullding Code is adopted by refereoce without : 3
change pursuant to Sectxon 145 0103 of the Land Development Code .
i Sectlon 16 Thai Chapter 14, Artwle 5 Dmsmn 32 of the San Diego Mumclpal Code is
alnended by amendlng section 145. 3203 to read as follows

§145.3203  Local Additions to Chapter 32 “Encroachments Into The Public Right—of-
. way”

fSection 3203 “Entrance Canopies” is added pursuant to Seetion 145.0106 of the :
Land Devclopmené éode: ‘ ' |
(a) through (b) [No change intext] .
(¢)  3203.3. 'Consttoctiog. Enh'eﬂee éarlopy frameés and supporting sn'oeﬁmal :
| nlembers shall be conen'ucted of conoslon;resistant met"al. deslignecl and
oonstrueted to withstand wind or other lateral loads and live, loads as
required -l)y Chapter 16 of the California Building Code. Entrance -‘

" canopies shall also meet all of the following reqiljrementé.:

-PAGE 27 OF 66-




(0-2020-82)

) Canopies shall be oovered with an approved covering that
| . cornphes with Section 3105 3 of the Cahforma Bulldmg Code
2) through (4) [No change in text. ]
E(Y) through ® [No change in text.]
Section 17. That Chapter 14, Article 5, Dmsmn 33 of the San Diego Mumclpal Code is
amended by amendmg sections 145, 3301 and 145.3303, to read ns follows:

§145.3301 Local Modxﬁcatlons and Additlons to Chapter 33 “Safeguards Dunng
: Construction” of the Califorma Building Code :

(®. [No change in text] _
(o) Sections 3301 through 3302 and 3304 through 3314 are'adonted by
reference without change ppreuant to Section 145.0103 of the Land
| De'velopnient Code N | |

§145.3303.  Local Modlﬁcations and Additions to Secﬁon 3303 “Demohtion” of the.
U Cahfornia Building Code S .

Sectlon 33 07 8 is added pursuant to Sechon 145.0106 of the Land Development
Code 3307 8 Addltlonal Demolmon Regulatlons The followmg regulatlons
' apply to the demohtmn ofa Structure ot bmldmg, in whole or.in part or the
* removal o_f a structure from a site: . .
(a) through (j) [No change in text.) .
. Section-18: That Chapter 14, Artxcle 5, D1v1s1on 38 of the San Diego Municipal Code is
‘amended by fefitling Division 38 and amendmg and retitling sectlons 145 3801 145. 3802

145.3803, 145.3_804, 145.3805, and 14533806, to read as follows:

" PAGE 28 OF 66-




§145.3801.

§145.3802

(0:2020-82) ’

Division 38: Additions and Modifications to Appendix 0 of the
. California Building Code .

Local Modlﬁcations and Additions to Appendix 0 “Emergency Housing” of
the California Building Code

(®)

)

©

@

 Appendix O of the California Building Code is adopted by reference with

modifications and additions pursuant to Sectionsi45.0105 and 145.0106

of the Land Development Code.

[No change in text.]

'I'he regulations in thlS Division and in Appendlx 0 shall be apphcable to
emergency housmg established pursuant to. the declaratxon of a shelter

crisis under Cahforma Govemment Code Sechon 8698.4 and located in |
new or exnstmg buildings o structures owned, operated, or constructed by, .

for, or on behalf of, the City.

The regulatlons in thxs D1v1310n and in Appendix 0 shall apply to

emergency housmg operated dunng a declaratlon of a shelter crisis. Other
than the requlrements in Appeéndix 0 asadopted w1th modlﬁcauons and
addltlons by this Dmswn, the emergency housmg need not comply with .

the requirements of the Cahforma Bulldmg Code for Group R

occupancxes

Local Modlﬂeations and Addltlons to Section 0103 “Emergency Housing” of
the Cahfornia Building Code

@

®)

Sectton 0103 is adopted with modlﬁcanons and addltions pursuant to

-Sectlons 145.0105 and 145.0106 of the Land Development Code.

The existing éxception in Section 0103.2.1 is numbered as Exception 1.

- Bxception 2 is added to Section 0103 '2t1: as follows:

 -PAGE 29 OF 66-




 §145.3803

©

(®

®). -

' the Building o‘fﬁciéu; When required, lighting and ventilation shall

(0-2020-82)

2. Change in occupancy shall not ma.ndate conformance with new
construction requlrements set forth i in the Cahforma Bulldmg Standards

Code, prov1ded such change in occupancy meets-the minimum fire and life

vsafety requirements set forth in S_ectlon 145.3805 of the Land
' De\'/elopment Code. :

, 'Sectlon 0103.6 Heatmg is modified as follows:

01 03.6 nghtmg, Venulatlon, and Heatmg All sleepmg areas shall be

_ pro,vided wtth adequate lighting, ventilation, and heating as determmed by

eomply with Section 145 3804

Local Modifications and Addltions to Section 0106 “Tents and Membrane .
Structures” of the California Bullding Code . ,

Sectlon 0106 is adopted with modlﬁcatlons and additions pursuant to
Sectxons 145. 0105 and 145. 0106 of the Land Development Code, .
Sectlon 0106.1 General is modlﬁed as follows
(l) Sectton 0106 1.1 Tents is modlﬁed as follows
0106 1. l Tents Tents shall not be used to house occupants for
more than 7 consecutlve days unless such tents are mamtamed w1th
| tight wooden ﬂoors raised at least 4 inches ( 101.6 mm) above the
’ ground level and are equipped with baseboards on all stdes toa
hexght of at lcast 6 inches (152 4 mm). Tents may be mamtamed
with concrete slabs with the finished surface at least 4 inches
‘(101 .6 mm) above grade and equlpped with curbs.on all sides at.
least 6 inches (152.4 mm) high. A tent shall not be considered a
suitable sleeping place when it isvt’ound necessary to provide

-PAGE 30 OF 66-




©

@

(0-2020-82)

heating facilities in order to maintain a minimum temperaturé of 50

‘ degree's Fahrenheit (10 degrees .Ce_lsius) within such tent during the

period of occupancy. '

Section 0106.1.2 Membrade_’ Structures is added with mo'diﬁcation
as follows: N '

0106.1.2 Membrene Structures Membrane strucrures installed
and/or assembled in accordance with Chapter 31 of the Cahforma

Building Code and the Calrforma Flre Code may be perrmtted to -

' .be used as emergency housmg and emergency housmg facllmes , ‘

Sectron 01 06.2 Membrane Stmctures In Use for More than 180 Days is -

v added as follows _
Ol 06 2 Membrane Structures In Use for More Than 180 Days. Membrane |

' structures in use for 2 perrod of more than 180 calendar days shall comply

with the Cahfomra Fire Code and with the followmg

a

.The membrane structure shall be mspected bya Callforma

) regrst_ered design professronal at least once every 180 calendarj

days from the date of final _inspection to ensure that the membrane
schttlre continues to perform as desig‘ned and initially erected

The reglstered desrgn professronal shall certlfy in wntmg that the

. membrane structure contmues to be in compha.nce with the

. :apphcable_regulatrons. of the‘Cuhfonna Fu'e Code and California .

Buildirlg' Code in effect on the d-ere of final inspection. Inspection

. 'records Shau be kept and 'shall be made available for veriﬁcation _

by the Fire Code Official and the Building Official.

-PAGE 31 OF 66-




(@

(e) .

o -

(&

(0-2020-82)

2 No. change in text. ]

Sectlon 0106.3 Means of Egress is added as follows:

0106.3 Means of Egress. Means of e egress for rnembrane structures used

as emergency housmg shall be determmed b_ased on the occupant Joad

spec:ﬁed in Sectlon 0103 3.

Section 0106 4 Storage of Flarnmable Matenals Wrthm Terits or ..
Membrane Structures is added as follows:

0106 4 Storage of Flammable Matenals Wxthm Tents or. Membrane
Structures Flammable matena!s, mcludmg the possessrons of occupants

and users stored in tents and membrane structures shatl not obstruct

' vrequrred arsle wrdths between beds or othcr furmshmgs The quantlty of -
- stored ﬂammable materials w1thm a membrane structure not protected .
" wrth an automatrc ﬁre spnnkler system, or w1thm tents, shall be subJect to
| the approval of the Frre Code Offical. | |

:Sectlon 0106 5 Flammable or Combustrble quulds is added as follows

0106 5 Flammable or Combustxble Liguids. The possess1on or storage of
y ﬂammable or combustrble quulds ot gases shall not be permtted '

msrde a tent or membrane structure except for. mtaot crgarette lighters. The

use of any type of open flameé msrde a tent or membrane structure is

prohibited unless each separate useis approved by the Flre Code Ofﬁcxal;
Sectron 0106.6 Fire Department Access is added as follows:

0106.6 Fire ljepartrnent Access. Fire Department access to tents or-

‘ membrane structures used for emergency bousing shall be in compliance -

~ .PAGE 32 OF 66-




§145.3804

()

(0-2020-82)

with Secuon 503, Section 504 and Appendix D of the Callforma Fire
Code and approved by the Fire Code Official.

Section 0106.7 Water Supply is added as follows:

' 0106.7 Water Supply. An apurov_ed fire protection water supply

' complying with Section 507 of thé California Fire Code, or aé approvéd

by the Fire Code Ofﬁcxal shall be prowded for each tent or membrane

structure group of structures, or premtse.s' used for emergency housmg

Local Addition of Section 0111 “Emergency Housing nghtmg and

(®)

®)

(©)

‘Ventilation Requlrements” to the Calitiornia Buildjng Code

Section Ol 11 Emergency Housmg nghtmg and Ventﬂauon Reqmrements
is added pursuant to Sectxon 145 0106 of the Land Development Code. -
Section 011 1 A Emergency I.-Iou31ing L1ghtmg Reqmre_meuts is added as -
follows: | | | - |

O111.1 Emergency Housing L'ighﬁng Requirements. Builuings or

- structures used for emergency housmg shall either be prov:ded with

b

" natural hght by means of extenor gla.zed opemngs in aocordance w1th

Sectlon 1205.2 of the Cahforma Bulldmg Code or shall be prowded with -
artlﬁcxal light in accorda.nce with Secuon 1205 3 of the Callforma
Building Code. ' ;
Section O111.2 Veutilauon is add':ed as folluws:

0Ol111.2 V.entilation. Buiidings or s:tructures' used for emergency housmé
shall either be provided with natm'ﬁl vmﬁlaﬁon in accordance with |
Sec_tiun 1203.5 of the California Bzuilding Code or mechanical ventilation
in accordance with the California Mechanical Code, |

|
§
{

-PAGE 33 OF 66-

|
|




| §145.3805

(0—2020-82)

Local Addltlon of Section 01 12 “Emergency Housmg Fire and Life Safety
Requirements” to the California Building Code

(a)

®

: ©

(@)

Section 0112 Emergency Housmg Fire and Llfe Safety Requrrements is -

added pursuant to Sectron 145.0106 of the Land Development Code. -

_ -Sechon 0112.1 Fire Separanon Dlstance is added as follows ‘

o1 12 1 Fire Separatlon Dlstance Bmldmgs or structures used for .

emergency housmg, mcludmg sleepmg cabms, shall be constructed and .

1located ona lot in comphance with the regulatlcns in Chapters 6 and 7of

the Cahforma Bulldmg Code, based on their ﬁre separatron dlstance

Dunng a declared shelter cnsw, the fire separatlon dlstances are penmtted '

to be measured to the exrstmg bmldmgs on the adJ acent parcels rather than ]

to the interior lot lmes, prowded the open spaces ' within the ﬁre separatlon

distance rem_ain clear and _unobstructed for the d_uratron of the declared -

; shelter crisis.

Section 01 12:2 Flre Separatlon Dlstance, Buildings on the Same Lot is

: added as follows

‘ 01 12. 2 Flre Separatlon Distance, Bulldmgs on the Same Lot, Bmldmgs or

structures used for emergency housmg, mcludmg sleepmg cabms, shall be.

: ,separated ﬁ'om each other and from other bmldmgs on the same Jot as s set

forth in Sectlon 705 3 of the Caleorma Bm]dmg Code
Sectlon Ol112. 3 Means of Egress is added as follows
0112.3 Means of egress Bulldmgs or. structures used for emergency

housmg shall be provided with means of egress in comphance w1th

- Chapter 10 of the California Building Code.

-PAGE 34 OF 66-




@)

®

©®

(b

(0-2020-82)

Section O112.4 Emergency Escape .alid Rescue is added as follows:

0112.4 Emergency Escape and Réscue. Each area of a building or

structure used for sleeping accommodations in emergency housing shall

contain an emergency escape and rescue opening in accordance with’

. Section 1030 of the California Building Code. -

Section 0112.5 Smoke Alarms is added as foilows' : o
01125 Smoke Alarms. Buildings or structures with sleepmg

accommodatlons used for emergency housmg shalt be equlpped with

. single stanon stoke alarms mstalled in accordance with the reqmrements :

A of Section 907 2.11 and Sectlon 1103 8 3 of the California Flre Code

| SectlonOl 12.6 Carbon Monorude Alar_ms is added as follows: |

| - 61 12.6 Carbon Monoxide Alarms Bmldmgs or structoré with sle'eping ‘
aooohxinoddtiqns used for emergency hou'din‘g gnd‘ eqtdpped with fuelj—

bﬁniing dpoliances shall be provided with carbon mionoxide detection in

accordance w1th Sectron 915 of the California Fire Code and the
Cahforma Building Code. |

Secnon 01127 F1re Alarm is added as follows:

' Ol 12.7 Fire Alarm A manual ﬁre alarm system oapable of arousmg

sleeping occupants desxgned and constructed in comphance with Sectmn A

907.2.10.1 of the Cahforma Fire Code and the Cahforma Bmldmg Code "
shall be installed in buildings, structures, or groups of bulldmgs or
stmctures, used for emergency housmg and havmg a gross ﬂoor area of

more than 2,500 square feet or havmg the capacnty for more than 49

_ sleeping occupants.

-PAGE 35 OF 66-




RO

0

@

(0-2020-82) -

‘Exception:.lndivi‘dual buildings or structutes in a‘group of Q
Buildings or structures witli sufficient sepatation distances to allow
. | each building or structure to function mdependently in case of a.
ﬁre shall have their own 1nd1v1dual fire alarm systems as approved
:by the Fire Code Official,

Secnon 01128 Automatlc Fire Spnnklers is added as follows

0112.8 Automatnc Fire Sprmklers Fire sprmklers shall be prowded for
. new and ex1st1ng buildings or structures used for emergency housmg that

. 'prov1de sleepmg accomrnodatlons, as required by Sectlon 903 3 of the :

California Fire Code and the California Bulldmg Code. '

_Section 0112.9 Fire Exﬁnguisﬁers is added as follows:
01 12 9 Fu‘e Extmgulshers Portable ﬁre extmgmshers shall be prowded in

_ aceordance w1th Sectxon 906 1 of the Cahforma Flre Code and the

California Bulldmg Code.

Sectlon 0112 10 Flammable or Combustible quulds is added as follows: .

-0112.10 Flammable or Combustible qulllds The possess1on or storage of

any ﬂammable or combustible hqulds or gases shall not be penmtted
except for mtact 01ga.rette llghters The use of any type of open ﬂame

indoors is prol11b1ted unless each separate use is approved by the Fxre )

Code Ofﬁcial'

~Sectlon 0112.11 Storage is added as follows

o1 12 11 Storage Flammable matenals, mcludtng the possessmns of

qccupants, users, and staff, shall not obstruct required aisle widths

_ between beds or otlterv furnishings and shall not be stored in attlcs, under-

-PAGE 36 OF 66-




§145.3806

@)

(0-2020-82)

floor spaces, or within other concealed spaces of buildings or structures-

“with sleeping accomrnodations used- for emergency hoUsing

Section 0112, 12 Fire Depamnent Access’is added as follows
01 12 12 Fire. Department Acoess Fire Department access to bmldmgs and
prem:ses used for emergency housmg shall be in comphance w1th

Secnon 503, Se'ctl'on 504, and Appendxx D of the Oallforma Fire Code,

" and approved by the Fire Oode Ofﬁclal

()

- Section 01 12.13 Water Supply is added as follows

0112.13 Water Supp_ly. An approved.ﬁre protection water supply
complying with §ecﬁon 507 of the California Fire Code, or as approyed -
by the Fire Code Official, shall bc prowded for each building or structure, .

group of structures or premzses used for emergcncy housmg

Local Addltion of Section Ol 13 “Emergency Housing Alternatlves and

®

Modifications” to the California Building Code

(2)

Section Ol 13 Emergency Housmg Alternatlves and Modlﬁcauons is

~ added pursuant to Section 145.0106 of the Land Development Code

Sectxon 01 13 1 Altemat:ves and Mod1ﬁcat10ns is added as follows

) [8) 13.1 Alternatwes and Modxﬁcatlons Alternatlves and/or modxﬁcatwns

_that are reasonably equlvalent to the reqmrements in Append1x 0 and tlns

Dmsxon may be granted by the Bulldmg 0fﬁc1a1 and Fn-e Cocle Oﬁic;al

f‘or individual bulldmgs or structures used for emergency housmg

Sectlon 19, That Chapter 14, Article 5, D1v1s1on 39 of the San Diego Mumclpal Code is -

amended by amendmg section 145.3905 and,qmendlng and retitling sectlon 145.3910, to read as

follows:.

-PAGE 37 OF 66-




§145.3905

§145.3910

" (0-2020-82)

Definitions

Except as otherw1se prowded for the purposes of this Dmsxon

Autonfated Extemal Deﬁbrzllator or-AED [No change in text ]

. Alteration means a tenant nnprovement or renovatlon to an existing bmldmg A

change of oqcupancy shall not be pons1dered an alteratlon for purppses of this

Dmsxon

()

©

New Construction and Alteratlons Requiring AEDs

(@ [No change in text.]

Pnor to approval of ﬁnal mspectlon AEDs shall be placed in all existing '

bui_ldings qndergomg qltgrat;qn when the any of the followmg apply:

(1)  The building undergoing alteration was cpnsh_'unted prior to ‘

- January 1, 2017;.

. (2) The accumulated value of the altgraifans within the building within

one calendar year is $100,000 or more; or

3) The altera}ions dre within a public assembly occupancy use,

| including auditoriums and performing arts and movie théatcrs.
The reqmrements in Section 145. 3910(b) shall not apply to the followmg
1 A general acute care hospital, acutc psychlatnc hospital, skilled -
nursing facility or special hospital 'hcensed under Section 1250(a),

(b), (c), or (f) of the California Health and Safety Code, and’

2 An exxstmg AED that is located within a common area of the

bulldmg descnbed in subdivision (b) such as the mam entry lobby

or similar location.

_PAGE 38 OF 66-




(0-2020-82) -

@ AEDs shall be conspicuously placed and readily accessible in the event of
an emergency. AEDs shall be mounted such that the top of the AED is no

more than five (5) feet above ﬂoor Ievel -

Table 145-3910
Occupancy Group Occupant Load :
Group A “Assembly” _ 300 ..
. Group B “Business” F. 200
- Group E “Educational” ) 200
Group F.“Factory” | 200
Group I “Institutional” | = 200
Group M “Mercantile” ’ 200
" Group R “Residential”* - |- . 200

1 No chnnge in toxt] |
Sectnon 20. .That Chapter 14 Artwle 5 Division 40 of the San Diego Mumc1pal Code is
: amended by amendmg section 145.4005, to read as follows
§145 4005 R Tier II-Vlsitable Umt Desngn Standardq
- (8) through (d) [No change in text.] |
(e)  Atleast one interior acqessfblg;, route of trgvél shall be provided in
o c.ornplviance with California Building Code Section 1119A as may be
amended The interior route of travel shall connect an accessible m_&é.nce
_ td the following rooms locatgd on the ;;rimz;ry entt;y level: |
(1) through (3) [No change n text.]
(9 through () [No change intext} = |
Section 21. That Chapter 14' Article 6, Divisisn 1 of the San [Siego Mﬁnicipal Code is’
amended by amcndmg sectlons 146. 0103 146.0104, 146.0105, 146 0106 and 146 0107 to read .

as follows

 -PAGE 39 OF 66-




'§146.0103

§146.0104

§146.0105

(0-2020-82)

Interpretation of the Electrical Regulations

()

- (b)

The language used in this Atticle and in the 2019 California Electrical

- Code whlch is made a part of this Article by reference, s mtended to

eonvey the common and accepted meamng fannhar to the electrical
mdushy. _ .

[No change in text.}

Adoptnon of the Californla Electrical Code -

@

®)

© |
Portions. of the California Electrical Code Not Adopted

The 2019 California Electncal Code publlshed by the Callforma Buxldmg

Standards COInmlSSIOIl (BSC), as amended by the Cahforma Department

“of Housmg and Commumty Development (HCD); the Dmston of the

State Archltect—Access Comphance (DSA/AC) the State Ofﬁce of

: Statew1de Planmng and Development (OSHPD3), and the State Fire -

Marshnl (SFM), is adopted by feferénce and made & part of this Article as .

if fully set forth, exeept as othemse prowded in thls Artlcle The

-regulations referenced are the standard for electrlcal mstallatlons regulated A

. by tlns Atticle. A copy of the 2019 Callforma Electrical Code is on ﬁle in -

the ofﬁce of the Cxty Clerk as Document No 00-’ 2 1 1 8 1

When reference is made to the Cahforma Electrical Code, it shall be the
2019 California Electnca.l Code, Cahforma Code of Regulatlons Title 24
Pert 3, as published by the Cal_lforma Building Standards Commission. -

[No change in text.]

. 'The following Sections or Subséctions of the 2019 California Electrical Code are

~ not adopted by the Cit}} of San Diego:

-PAGE 40 OF 66-




(a)

(b)'

. (0-2020-82) -

Artlele 230, Servnces, Sectton 230.43, Wmng Methods for 1000 Volts,

. Normnal or Less numbers (l) “Open Wmng on Insulators” and (7)

“Semce-entmnee Cables” are not adopted

[No change in text ] -

§146.Qlod Portions of the Cahforma Electncal Code Adopted With Modlficaﬁons

The following Sectlons of the 201 9 Callfoxma Electneal Code are adopted by the .

Clty of San Dlego with mod:ﬁcatlons

The 2019 Cahforma Electrlcal Code is adopted without modlﬁcatlons

§146.0107 Portions of the Callfornia Electrical Code Adopted With Additions

" The followmg Sectlons of the 2019 Cahforma Electrical Code are adopted by the

.Cxty of San Dlego ‘with addltlons

. The 2019 Cahforma Electncal Code is adopted w1thout a.ddmons

Sectlon 22 That Chapter 14, Artlcle 6, vaxsron 2 of the San D1ego Mum01pal Code 1s

amended by repealmg sectlons 146 0208 and 146.0209.

Sectlon 23, That Chapter 14, Artlcle 7, Dmswn 1 of the San Diego Mumclpal Code is .

amended by amendlng sectlons 147.0103, 147. 0104 147. 0105 and 147. 0106 to read as follows

§147.0103  Adoption of the California Plumbing Code

@

Except as prowded in Sectlons 147. 0104 through 147. 0108 the 2019

: Cahforma Plumbmg Code, pubhshed by the Cahforma Bulldmg- Standards -

Commlsswn (BSC), and as amended by the California Department of

Housing and Oommumty Development (HCD), the Dtvxsnon of the State
Archltect-Aceess Comphanee (DSA/AC); the State Ofﬁee of Statew1de

Health Planmng and Development (OSHPD3), and the State Fire Marshal

-PAGE 41 OF 66-




§147.0104

. §147.0105 .

§147.0106

(0-2020-82) |

" (SFM); a copy of which is on file in the office of the City Clerk as

Docu;ileht’OO- 2 1181 _, is adopted by roferonc_:ez
(b) *. When teferenco is fnado to the California Plumbing Code, it shali be the
2019 Cahfomla Plumbmg Code, Cahforma Code of Regu]atlons Title 24,

"~ Part5as pubhshed by the California Bmldmg Standards Commlsswn

.. © [No change in text.]

Modlf cations to the California Plumbing Code Adopted by the Clty of San
Diego ,

The followmg Sectlons of the 2019 Callforma P]umbmg Code are modlﬁed by the '

| "Clty of San Dlego )

"(a). - Chapter4, Plumbmg Fixtures and Fitings, Section 42221 1 Single User -

N 'T01let Faclhty Identlﬁcatlon

(b) Chaptcr 11, Storm Dramage Sectlon 1101 .2. Where Requlred Sectlon '

| 110161 Discharge.

Addiﬁons to the California Plumbmg Code Adopted by the City of San Diego -

- The followmg Sectmns or Subsectlons of the 2019 California Plumbmg Code are _' :

" added by the .Clty of San Diego:

(a) [No change in te){t.]

(). Cﬁépter 12, Section'1208.8.2.1 Gas Pressure Re'golétolfs, Location.

Adoption of Appendices to California' Plumbixig Code -

_The followmg Appendtx Chapters of the 2019 Cahforma Plumbmg Code not

adopted by a State agency as 1dent1ﬁed in Land Development Code Section

147. 0103 and in the adoptlon matnces of the 2019 Cahforma Plumbmg Code are

'not adopted by the Ctty of San Dlego .

(1) through (7) [No change in text.]

- -PAGE 42 OF 66--




®)

(0-2020-82)

Appendix M ~ Peak Water Demand Calculator

Section 24. That Chapter 14, Article 7, Dmswn 2 of the San Diego Mumclpal Code is

amended by adding new sectlon 147 0203 renumbermg section 147. 0213 to sectlon 147, 0211

and amendmg and retltlmg sectlon 147 0212, to read as follows

§147.0203 Local Modifications to Sectlon 422.2 “Separate Faclhtles” of the o
- ‘California Plumbing Code

‘(8)_

®»

Sectlon 422, 2 of the California Plumbmg Code is adopted w1th

‘modifications pursuant to Sectlon 147.0104 of the Land Development '
. Code. o
-Section 422.2.1 of the California P]umbiné Code is modified as follows:
A 422.221 S__inélé-ﬁser Toilet FacilitiesAIder_)tiﬁcation. Family. or assisted use

toilet facilities shall be identiﬁed with signage indicating use by either sex.

All single-user toilet facilities in any business establishment, place of

- . public accommodation, or state or local government dgency shall be .

identified as all-gender toilet facilities by signage that comiplies with

Section 11B-703.7.2.6 of the California Building Code and designated for

use by no more than one occupant at a time or for family or assisted use.

" For the burposeé of Section 422.2.1, “single-'user toilet facility” means a

toilet facility with no more than one water closet and"cme-urinél witha

locking mechanism 'controlled by the user.

§147.0211  Local Modifications and Additions to Section 1101 “General” Storm
Drainage Regulatlons of the California Plumbing Code

(a) through (c) [No change in text. ]

PAGE 43 OF 66-




(0-2020-82)

' §147.0212  Local additions to Section 1208.8 “Gas Pressure Regulators” of the
" California Plumbing Code '

Section 1208. 8 2.1 of the Cahforma Plumbmg Code is added as follows
' 1208 82. 1 Approved gas pressure regulators shall be mstalled and used in
locatlons approved by the Bulldmg Official. - '
Sectlon 25. That Chapter 14 Artlele 7, D1v1sron 4 of the San D1ego Mummpal Code is
amended by retltlmg and amendmg section 147.0405, to read as follows : .

§147.0405 , .Retrofit upon Alteration

“When a responszble person proposes to replaee plumbmg ﬁxtures, t.he responszble

person shall replace plumbmg ﬁxtures with water-eonservmg plumbmg ﬁxtures

complymg w1th the prevailing edrtxon of the Cahforma Plumbing Code and

iSectwns 147 0304 and 147.0305 of the Addmonal Plumbmg Regulauons for i

Water and Energy Conservatlon ' . '

Sectron 26. That Chapter 14 Arucle 8, Division 1 of the San Dlego Mumc:pa.l Code is

amended by amendmg secttons 148. 0103 148.0104, 148 0105, 148. 0106 and 148. 0107 to read
‘a8 follows

§148 0103 Adoptlon of the Callforma Mechanical Code
. (a) . Exeept as prowded in Land Development Code Sectlon 148 0104, the

- 2019 Cahforma Mechamcal Code published by.the Cahforma Bmldtng .
Standards Comrmssmn (BSC); and as amended by the Cahfonna
Department of Housmg and Commumty Development (HCD), the

- Division of the State Archrteet~Aeeees Comphance (DSA/AC), the State

Office of Statewide Health Plann.ing and Development (OSHPD3); and |

the State Fire Marshal (SFM); & copy of w_hieh is on file.in the office of -

-PAGE 44 OF 66-




§148.0104
§148.0105
§148.0106

. §148.0107

(0-2020-82)

“the City Clerk as Document No. 00- 21181 , is adopted by

reference.

' (b):  When reference is made to the California Mechanical Code, it shall be the ‘

2019 California Mechanical Code, California Code of Regulatiods Title

24, Part 4 as published by the California Building Standards Commission.

(c) ' [No change in text.]

"Portions of the California Mechamcal Code Not Adopted

B The followmg portlons of the 2019 California Mechamcal Code are not adopted

Chapter] - Dmsnon II, Admlmstratxon :

Modnﬁcations to the Cahforma Mechanical Code Adopted by the City of San
Diego . .

The 2019‘Calif01.:nia Mechanical Code is adopted with no modiﬁcations :

Additions to the California Mechanical Code Adopted by the Clty of San -
Diego- .

" The 2019 Cahforma Mechanical Code is adopted w1th no addmons

Adoption of Appendices to Cahfornla Mechanical Code:

’ Appendlx Chapters of the 2019 Cahforma Mechanical Code are not. adopted

. Section 27 ’I‘hat Chapter 14, Amcle 9, Dlvxsxon 1 of the San Diego Mumcxpal Code s

amended by amendmg sectlons 149. 0103 149.0104, 149.0105, 149 0406, 149.0107, and

149, 0108 to read as follows

§149.0103

Adoptlon of the Callforma Residential Code

| (@) The2019 Cahforma Residential Code, pubhshed by the Callforma

Bmldmg Standards Commission (BSC), and as amended by the State
ADepartment of Housmg and Commumty Development (HCD 1, HCD

1/AC) and the State Fire Marshal (SFM), is adopted by reference, except

-PAGE 45 OF 66-




§149.0104

®)

©

@

' Artlele is cross referenced to Secnons in the 2019 Callfomla Resndentlal

©

,<f)'

© (0-2020-82)

as othervxtise provided in this Article of the Land Development Code,

Divisions 2 through 45. A eopy of the 2019 California Residential Codeis

on ﬁ]e in the office of the Clty Clerk as Document No 00- 2 11 8 l.

When reference is made to the Cahforma Res1dent1al Oode, it shall be the

- 2019 Cahforma RemdentlalACode, California Code of Regulatxons Title

' 24, Part 2.5, as published by the California Building Standards ~ .

Commission

.Each of the regulatxons, prov1s1ons, condmons, and telms of the 201 9

' Cahforma Res1dentlal Code is made a part of this Article as if fully set

foth in thls Artlcle except as otherw1se pr0v1ded in va1s1ons 2 through

. 45.

.Numbenng of Seetlons and Subsectlons in Dmsmns 2 through 45 of this

Code

The adoptxon of the 2019 Cahforma Re31dent1al Code shall in 0o way :

. limit, pI‘Ohlblt, impede, or prevent the City Council from adoptmg

ordinances limiting or preventmg the issuance of any type, number, or

~ geographical distribution of permits for construction 5; demolition of ariy '

facility for which a permit is required.

fNo change in text ]

Portions of the Cahfornia Residential Code Not Adopted by the City of San
Diego - Lo , ..

The following Sectioﬂs or Subsectioné of the 2019 California Residential Code -

‘ have not been adopted by the City of San Dlego

(8) through (b) [No change in text. ]

-PAGE 46 OF 66-




" §149.0105

'§149.0106

(O-2020~82) '

~ Modifications to the Cahforma Residential Code Adopted by the Clty of San

Diego
The following Sections o Subeections of the 2019 California Residential Code B

" are modified by the Clty of San Diego:

(a) Chapter 3, Sectlon R301 2 Chmatlc and Geograplno Des1gn Cntena

, Section R319 1, Address Identlﬁcatlon; R322, Flood Resistant ™ -
- Consu'uctlon, Secnon R324 4 2, Fire Clasmﬁcatwn Sectlon R324 5.2,.
-Fire Clasmﬁcatlon, Section R337 1.3.1, Apphcatlon Date and Where
., Requlred Section R337 2, Definitions;’ Sectlon R337 5. 4 Roof Gutters

| and Downspouts Sectlon R337. 8 Extenor Wmdows and Doors

® Chapter 9, Sectxon 902. 1 5, Roof Covermg Materlals, Sectlon R902.2. 1

Wood Shmgles Sect:on R902 2.2, Wood Shakes, Section R902 A4,
| Photovoltaw Panels and Roof Modules; Section R905 1.3, Roof Coveﬁng
attachment ‘Section R908 l 1, Replacement Roof Covenng, Class A;
Section R908 1.2, Replacement Roof Covermg, Class A, Addluons, _

| Sectlon R908.1.3, Wood Shake Shmgles Reroof; Section R908 1.4, Wood
.Shake, Shmgles, Historical Bulldmgs; Section R908.1.5, Rerooﬁng Over

Wood Roofs

Additions to the Callforma Residential Code Adopted by the City of San

Diego

The following Seetions and Subsections are added to the 2019 Ca!ifonna
Residential Code by the City of San Diego: |

(a) - [No change in text] _ . ‘

(b).  Chapter 3 Sectlon R309 4.1 Backup Power for Automatic Ga:age Door

" Openers, Sectlon R320.2 Voluntary_ Acoesmbmty program; Section R329,

- -PAGE 47 OF 66-




§149.0107

© -
Geotechmcal Reports; Section.R401 7 Notice of Geologlc Hazards

(@

. (0-2020-32)

Structural Tests and Speclal Inspecttons Sectmn R332, Encroachments

_into the: Pubhc nght-of ~Way; Section R333 Safeguards Durmg

Constructton; Sectxon R337 1 3 1 Exceptlon 2.3; Section R337.2 Local

Very ngh Fire Hazard Seventy Zone, Section R337.3.6.1, Altematwe

Materials, Des1gns or Methods of Constructlon Sectlon R337.3.6.2,

Modiﬁcatiqns; ‘Section R33~7.S.4, Roof Gutters and D_ownspouts; Sectth

R337.5.5, Drip Edge Flashing; Section R337.8.2.1.1, Vinyi Windows;

Section R337.11, Spark Arrester;‘ Section R341, Sound Transmission
Conti*ol . |

Chapter4 Sectlon R401 5, Geotechnical Investigations; Sectton R401.6,

. [No change in text ]

. Adoptxon of Appendlces to.the California Residential Code

The followmg Appendxx Chapters of the 2019 _Cahforma Remdentia_.l Code are -

ad(;pted by the City of San Diego:

(a) 'Appendix Chapter ﬁ, Patio Covers.

(b) | Appendix éhgpter Q, Tiny Houses.

(¢) = Appendix Chapter S, Straw Bale Construction. .

@)

" Appendix V, Swimming Pool-Saf‘ety Act.

-PAGE 48 OF 66-




§149.0108

(0-2020-82)

Applicabihty of the California Building Code to Exrstmg Bluldmgs and
Structures Regulated by the California Residentral Code

@® .

®) .

©.

The legal occupancy of any burldmg or structure extsnng on the date of "
adoption of the 2019 Cahforma Res:dentlal Code shall be permltted to’
contmue w1thout change except as is speclﬁcally regulated by Chapters 3,
4, and 5 of the 2019 Callforma Exrstmg Burldmg Code the California Frre
Code or as i§ deemed necessary by the Bmldmg Official for the general )
safety and welfare of the occupants and the public. . .

[No change in text, ] . -

Buﬂdmgs and structures, and parts thereof shall be mamtamed ina safe

‘ . and sanitary condition. Devices or safeguards whmh are req_ulred by the

-

' 2019 California Building Code shall be maintained in conformance with

the code edition under which installed The owner shall be responsible for

the maintenance of buildings and structures To determme comphance '

with thlS Subsectlon the Building Ofﬁcxal shall have the authority to

" require a bmldmg.or;s‘tructure to be re-inspected. The requirements of the .

.Building Regulations shall not provide the basis for removal or ,abrogaﬁon '

of fire protection and safety systems and devices in existing building or ?

struchxtes. ’

Section 28. That Chapter 1.4', Article 9, Division 2 of .the San Diego Mu.nic'ipal' Code is

amended by amending section 149.0201 :and repeaiing. eecﬁon 149.0202, to read as foflov@a

§149.0201

Local Additions to Chapter 2 “Deﬁnitlons” of ﬂle California Residential
Code’ .

. -Chapter 2 of the California Resrdentlal Code is adopted by reference w1thout

change pursuant to Section 149 0103 of the Land Development Code.

~PAGE 49 OF 66- -




ﬂ (0-2020-82)

. Section 29. That Chapter 14, Article 9 D1v131on 3 of the San Dnego Mumclpal Code i is |
. amended by amending sections 149. 0301 -and 149.0302, addmg new sectlon 149.0309, amending
and retltlmg sectlon 149.0319, addmg new sectlon 149.0324, repealmg sectlon 149. 0326 and
amendmg sectlon 149 0337, to read as follows ir ‘
. .§149.0301 Local Additions to Chapter 3 “Building Planning of the California
Residential Code )
(@ [No change in text. ]
(b)  Sections R302 through R308,R310 through R318, R32l 'R325 through
. R336, and R338 thxmilgh R340 are adopted by reference wnthout change
| pursdanf to Section 149. '0‘1'03 of the Land Developﬁle'nt'code. -

§149.0SOi -Local Modlﬁcatlons and Additions to Section R301 2 “Climatic and
! Geographic Design Cnteria” ,

: .(a) [No change in text.] ,
®) Sectlon R301 218 adopted w1th mod1ﬁcatxons as follows. Bulldmgs shall
be constructed in accordance thh the prov1s1ons of the California
B Re81dent1a1 Code as limited by the prowswns of Sectlon R301. Addltxonal
cntena are outlmed in Table 149. 0302 of the Land Development Code
@ [No change in text.]- .
| Table 149103'92

[No change in text.]

_PAGE 50 OF 66-




—

'§149.0309

| §149.0319

§149.0324

(0-2020-82)

Local Addltlons to Sectxon R309 “Garages and Carports”

E Secnon R309 4 is adopted w1th additions pursuant to Sechon 149. 0106 of the

Land Development Code Section R309.4. 1is added as follows R309.4. 1

Backup power for automatic garage door openers. Where residential garages are
eqmpped mth automatlc. garage door openers, the. remdentnalauton;aﬂe garage

door opener slialf include a battery baekup function that is designed to Operate ina |

‘manner so that the automatic garage door opener is operatlonal without

: mterruptxon dunng an eIectncal outage.

Local Modiﬁcaﬁons to Section R31_9 1“Address ldenﬁﬁcation” of the

) California Residential Code ;

3 Secnon R319. 1 of the Ca]lforma Re31dent1a1 Code is adopted as amended in San :

Diego Municipal Code Section 95.0209 for building addressmg requirements for

- the City of San Diego

Local Modiﬁcations and Additlons to Section R324 “Solar Energy Systems”

* of the California Resndential Code

(gi) . Section R324 4.2 is modlﬁed as fallows pursuant to Sectlon 149. 0105 of
" the Land Development Code R324 4.2, Fire classxﬁcanon Rooﬂop— . '
mounted photovolta.tc panel systems shall have the same ﬁre ciasmﬁcanon
| reqmred in Sectxon 149 0902(a) |
()  SectionR324.5.2 is rhodified as follows pursuant to Section 149.0105 of
- the Land Development Code: R324 5. 2 Fire classification. Bmldmg-
;mtegrated photovoltmc systems shall have the same ﬁre cIassxﬁcanon .

_required in Section 149,0902(a).

~PAGE 51 OF 66-




| §149.0337

" (0-2020382) _

Local Additions and Modiﬂcations to Section R337 “Materials and Methods
for Exterior Wildfire Exposure” of the California Resxdentml Code

(@ [No change in text ] '
(b): - Section R337 2 is adopted by referenoe w1th ‘modifications and addltlons
pursuant to Secnons 149. 0105 and 149.0106 of the Land Development
Code as follows Local Agency Very High F1re Hazard Severity Zones
. shall mean the Very ngh Fire Hazard Seventy Zones as desxgnated on the '
‘Very ngh Flre Hazard Severity Zone Map Local Rcsponsﬂnhty Areas
adopted pu:suant to Secnon 55.9401 of the Lan_d Development Code. .
()  SectionR337.3.6 io adopted w1th additions pursoant _to_ Section 149.0106
| . of'th'epLand. De\{elopment co&e. 'élections.R337.6._l and R337.3.6.2 are
- added as follows: - | o
O R337 3641, Alternative Matei'ials, Designs or Methods of ‘
o Constmctlon The Bmldmg Ofﬁc1a1 may approve the use of
altematlve matenals, ‘designs or methods ‘of construcnon pursuant
: to. Sectlon 129 0109 of the Land Development Code.
"(2) R337.3.6.2, Modlﬁcanons The Bulldmg Ofﬁclal may modlfy theA
| : provtsxons'of Secnon R337 of the Cahforma Residential Co,de for :
: site-speeiﬁc conditions in accordance with Section 129.0104(a)(5)
. of the Land bevelopment Code. When pequired by the Bmldmg '
. Official, a fire protecﬁon plan shall be submitted in‘_ecco'rdance' 5
with the Califomia Fire Code, C]lepter 49.
(d) Sectlon R337 5is adopted w1th modlﬁcanons and addltlons pursuant to

Sectlons 149.0105 and 149 0106 of the Land Development Code .

' -PAGE 52 OF 66- -




(0-2020-82)

'(1) ! Section R337.5.4 is modiﬁed as follows: R337.5.4, Roof Guttero
" . and Downspouts Roof gutters shall be constructed to prevent the
accumulation of leaves and debns in the gutter All roof gutters
and downspouts shall be 'construoted of noncombustible _mgterials. _ |
© " Section R337.5.5 is added as follows: R3375.5, Drip Bdge
Flashing, When drip edge flashing is used at the free edges of
roofing matertals, it shali oe'non-cornbuétible
()  Section R337. 8 is adopted with modlﬁcatrons and additions pursuant to
- Sectlons 149.0105 and 149.0106 of the Land Developiment Code. Section -
R337.8.2.1 is added as follows: R337.8.2.1.1, Glazing ﬁ'arnes made-of |
| vmyl materials shall have welded corners, metal remforcement in the
. interlock area, and be certlﬁed to the most current edmon of |
ANSI/AAMA/NWWDA 101/1.8.2 structural reqmrements
® Sectlon R337:11 1s added pursuant to Section 149 0106 of the Land
. Development Code‘as t‘ollows: R337. 1 1, Spark Arrester, All structurw
~ having any chirnney, flue, or stovépipe shall be equipped withan -
approyéd spark arrester if the chimney, flue, or'stovepipe is adoched to
any fireplace, stove, barbecue, or other solid or liquid fuél burning
equipment or devwe . | .
Section 30 That C’hapter 14, Atticle 9, Division 9 of the San Diego Municipal Codeis
amended by amending sectlon 149.0902, to read as follows:

§149.0902 Local Additions and Modifications to Section R902.1 “Roof Clnssiﬁcation” of
' the California Residential Code :

" (a) through (c) [No change in text.]

-PAGE 53 OF 66-




Gy

© (0-2020-82)

~ Section R902.4 is"adopted by reference and modlﬁed as follows: R902.4

R‘ooﬁop rnounted‘solar photovoltaic panels and modules. Rooﬁop

' mounted photovoltalc panels and modules 1nstalled on or above the roof -

’ covermgshall be tested listed and 1dent1ﬁed with a ﬁre elassnﬁcauon in

accordance w1th UL 1703 .and UL 2’7 03 Class A Bor C photovoltalc
panel systems and modules shall be mstalled in areas deslgnated by
Section R902 of the Callforma Resrdentml Code, in ]unsdlctlons
des1gnated by law as requmng therr use or where the" edge of the roof i is
less than 3 feet (914 mm) from a lot hne When located in theVery ngh
Fire Hazard Sevemty Zone Map Local Responmbﬂity Area.s adopted
pursuant to Sectron 55. 9401 of the San Dlego Mumclpal Code, roof-top :

mounted photovoltmc panels and modulee shall have a minimum ﬁre

: classrﬁcatlon ratmg of Class A

Sectlon 31. That Chapter 14 Article 10 D1v131on 1 of the San Drego Mumcrpal Code is .

amended by amendmg secuons 1410 0103 and 1410 0107, to read as follows

: §l410.0103. Adoption of the Cahfomla Green Buildmg Standards Code

@

(®)

"The 2019 Cahforma Green Bmldmg Standards Code, pubhshed by the
. Cahforma Btuldmg Standards Commlssnon (BSC), and as amended bythe

' State Department of Housmg and Community Development (HCD), is

adopted by reference except as. otherwrse provrded in thlS Artlcle A copy

’ of the 201 9 California Green Building Standards Code is on file in the

officeof the Clty Clerk as Document No 00-_\ Z l 1 8 1
When reference is made to the Cahforma Green Butldmg Standards Code,'

it shall be the 2019 Cahforma Green Bulldmg Standards Code, Callforma '

_PAGE 54 OF 66-




§1410.0107

| ©

()

©

o

- (0-2020-82)

Code of Regulations Title 24, Part 11, as published by the California

Bmldmg Standards Comrmsswn

: Bach of the regu]atlons, prov1s1ons, condmons, and texms of the 2019

- California Green Buildmg Standards Code is made a part of this Artlcle as ’

if fully set forth in this Article. -

“Numbering of Sections' and_ Subsections in this Article is cross referenced

to Seotions in the 2019 California Green Building 'Standards Code.

The adopuon of the 201 9 California Green Bmldmg Standards Code shall

".inno way lnmt prolnblt, impede, or prevent the City Councﬂ from

adopt;ng ordinances h;rutmg or preventmg the issuance of any type,

number, or geographical distribution of permits for construction or -

demoiition of any facility for wliicﬁ a permit is reqeired,..

[No change in text.]

A’dopti(m of Appendices to the California Green Building Standards Code -

Appendix Chapters o the 2019 California Groen Building Standérds Codeare

adopted as follows: The Residential Voluﬁtafy measures of the California Green

Bulldmg Standards Code,’ Appendlx Chapter A4, Remdentml Voluntaxy Measures, :

Section A4.305.1 “Graywater ”

Sectlon 32. That Chapter 14, Article 10, D1v1s1on 4 of the San Dxego Munigipal Code is

' amended by amendmg section 1410. 0403 to read as follows

§l410 0403 Local Modnﬁcations to Section A4.305 “Water Reuse Systems” of the
California Green 'Building Standards Code -

()
®)

[No change in text.]
. Section A4, 305 1is adopted with the followmg modifications. AII new

re81dent1a1 buildings that are within the scope of the CaliforniaResidential

-PAGE 55 OF 66-




(0-2020-82)

Code shall be constructed to include waste piping to’ discharge gray water

from clothes washers to a place where it may ' be used for outdoor

n'ngatlon in comphanoe with Section 1503 of the Cahforma Plumbmg

Code

Sectton 33 That Chapter 14, Artlcle 11 Division 1 of the San Diego Mumcrpal Code is

amended by amendmgsectlons 1411 0103 1411, 0104 l4ll 0105 1411 0106, and 1411 0107 to

read as follows

§1411 0103 Adoption of the ‘California Existing Bullding Code _

(®

.@

©)

The 2019 Cahforma Exrstmg Buﬂdmg Code publlshed by the California .-

Bulldmg Standards Cormmsswn (BSC), as amended by the State

Department of Housmg and Commumty Development (HCD l HCD

' l/AC) and the State Flre Marshal (SFM) is adopted by reference, except
“ as otherw1se provxded in this Article of the Land- Development Code,
"~ Divisions 2 through 5 and Divisions 17 and 18 A copy of the 2019
.. California Existing Building Code is on file in the office of the City Clerk’

os Doctlment No. 00:__ 21 1 8 1

" When reference is made to the Califorria Exrstmg Bmldmg Code it shall

be the 2019 Cahforma erstmg Bmldmg Code, Cahforma Code of

Regulations Title 24, Part 10, as pubh_shed by the Ca_llforma Bmldtog, ’

_ Standards Commission. o

Each of the regulatrons, provrsrons condltrons, and terms of the 2019
California Existing Buxldmg Code is made a part of this Article as 1f fully -

set forth in this Article except as otherwise provided in Divisions 2 .-

through 5 and Divisions 17 and 18.

-PAGE 56 OF 66-




§1411.0104

@

©

o

- (0-2020-82) -
The numbering of Sections and Subsections in Divisions 2 through 5 and

Divisions 17 and 18 6f this Articlé is crosé-fgferenéed to Sécticms in the .

t

* 2019 California Emsnng Bulldmg Code.

The adOpuon of the 2019 Cahforma Ex1st1ng Bulldmg Code shall in no

way hm1t, proh1b1t impede, or prevent the City Council from adoptmg

ordinances 11m1t1ng or preventmg the i 1ssuanoe of any type, number, or

h geographxcal dlstnbutlon of perrmts for constructnon or demolition of any

facility for which a permit is reqmred

The Bulldmg Oﬁicfal is only authonzed to enforce amendments to the

201 9 Californid Exlstmg Building Code made by the followmg State

i agenclm

(I) through (3) No. change in text ]

Pomons of the Cahfomia Existing Bmlding Code Not Adopted by the Clty of
San Diego ,

The following Sectlons or Subsectlons of the 2019 Cahforma Existing Bmldmg

Code have not been adopted by the Clty of San Dlego
@ |
: " 30133 Performance Compliance Method.

' [No change in text.]

Chapter 3, Section 301.3.2 Work Area. Complianqe Method; Section

Chapters 6 through 13 and Chapter 15. .

-PAGE 57 OF 66-




(0-2020-82)

§1411 0105 Modiﬁcations to the Cahfomia Existing Bmlding Code Adopted by the City
of San Dxego - , )

C©

The followmg Sections or Subsectlons of the 2019 Cahfomla Existing Bmldmg

Code are modified by the City of San Dlego

@
®) .

@

§1411.0106

© -

[No change in- text.]
Chapter 3, Section 301 :1, Genefal; Section 301.3,’ Alteration, Addition or

Change of Occup_anoy, including the exception; Section 302.4; Existing

~ Materials,

Chapter 4, Sectlon 401 3 Repairs, Flood Hazard Areas
Chapter 5, Sechon 502. 3 Flood Hazard Areas; Sect;on 503.2, Flood
Hazard Areas; Sectlon 405.2.5, Flood Hazard Areas.

Appendix, Chapter’ Al, Section A102.1, Scope, Géneral.

Addltions to. the Califomia Existing Buﬂding Code Adopted by the City of

The followmg Sectlons and Subsectlons are added to the 2019 Callforma Bxlstmg

,San Dlego

" Building Code by the Clty of San Dlego.

@
®)

[No change in text 1

.Chapter 3, Sectlon 302.7, Mamtenanoe, Sectlon 302 8, Mandatory
’ regulattons for wall anchorage and parapet bracmg for unremforced

masonry bearing wall bmldmgs, Sectlon 302 8.1, Apphca.bﬂlty, Section .

302.8.2, Compliance Period; Section 302.8.2.1, Removal, Stabilization

. and Bracing Process; Section 302.8.2.2, Historical‘Buildings.

-PAGE 58 OF 66-




(0-2020-82)

§1411.0107 Adoption of Appendices to the Caufomﬁ Exist'ing' euﬂding c}:&e
The followmg Appendxx Chapters of the 2019 Caleorma Bxxstmg Building Code
are adopted by the City of San Diego:
' (a) through (c) [No change in text.]
Section 34. That Chapter 14, Article 1 l Dms:on 3 of the San Dlego Municipal Code is
amended by amendmg sec’oons 141 1 0301 and amendmg and renthng seotlon 1411 0302, to read

as follows. .

'§1411.0301 Locol Modifications and Additions to Chapter 3 “Provisions for All
. Comp]iance Methods” of tlie California Existing BuildingCode

(@ Chapter 3 of the Cahforma Bxlstmg Bmldmg Code is adopted by reference
. with modlﬁcatlons and addmons pursuant to Sectlons 141] 0105 and
141 l 0106 of the Land Development Code | » |
®) Secnon 301 3, mcludmg the exceptlon, ofthe Cahfomla Exxstmg Bmldmg :
" Code is adopted by reference w1th modtﬁcatwns pursuant to Sectlon
s 1411 0105 of the Land Development Code |
(l)_ . Secuon 301 .3 is modified as follows: 301.3, Alteration, edditiod or
cbang'e of oooupancy; The olteraﬁon, addition or chaoge of |
: oecupancy of all exis'ting buildings shall comply witb Section
301.3.1. | _’ |
) The exceptlon to Sectxon 301.3 .is modified as follows: Exception
- Subject to the gpproval of the Bmld_mg Official, alterations »
’ oomplying with the laws in existence at the time the building or the
affected portion of the building was built are in compliance with |
the ; prov1sxons of the cmrent California Extstmg Building Code.

New structural members a.dded as pan of the alteratlon shall

-PAGB 59 OF 66-




(0-2020-82)
comply wifh the California Eﬁsﬁng Building Code. ThlS exc,eption.
shall not apply to an alterations that constltutes a substantial ‘
unprovement to an existing bmldmg ina ﬂood hazard areas, whlch
alteratlons shall comply w1th Section 1411 0503 of the Land

. Development Code This excepﬁon shall not apply to the struetural

. -"prowswns of Chapter 5 of the California Emstmg Bmldmg Code

§1411 0302 " Local Modxﬁcaﬂons and Additions to Sectlon 302 “General Provisions” ofthe .
California Existmg Building Code .

...(a') |

g reference with modlﬁcatlons and addltlons pursuant to Sechons 141 1.0105

©

Section 302 of the Callforma Exxstmg Building Code is addpted by

- and 1411 0106 of the Land Development Code

®

) 'alneady in use ina bulldmg or structure m eomphance with reqmrements .

fSectxon 302 4is modlﬁed as follows 302 4, Bx1stmg materials. Matenals

or approvals in effect at the ttme of their erection or mstallatmn shall be
permitted to remam in use unless determmed by the Building Ofﬁelal tobe
unsafe pursuant to Sectlon 121 0404 of the Land Developmient Code |
Sectlon 302.7 is added as followsr 302.7 Maintenance. Buildingsand

stmctures, and parts thereof, shall be mamtamed in a safe and sanitary "

.condmon. Devwes or safeguards that are requlred by the Bu1ldmg, )
Eleetncal, Plumbmg, Meehameal, Re31dent1a1, Green Building end

- Existing Building Regulaﬁone of the Land 'Development Code shall be " .

maintained in conformanice with the edition of the CaliforniaBuilding

‘Standards Code‘(Californie Code of Regulaﬁons' Title 24) ixnderwhich the

devices or safeguards were installed. The owner shall be responsxble for

* the mamtenance of bmldmgs and structures. To determine compliance

-PAGE.60 OF 66-




(@).

©

(0-2020-82)

with this Section 302.7, the Building Official sﬁall have the authority to

reinspecta building or‘structure. The requirements of the Existing

Building Regulations shall not provide the basis for removal or abrogation

of fire protection and safety systems and devices in existing buildings or
structures.
Section 302.8 is added as follows: 302.8, Mandatory reguletione for wall

anchorage and parapet bracing for unreinforced masonry bearing wall

* buildings. The provisions of Section 302.8 shall apply to buildings tht
were constructed or that were under construcuonbefore March 24, 1939,
- or for Whlch a Bmldmg Permlt was, lssued before March.24, 1939, and to
.Clty-owned bmlq;ngs deslgrleted pursuant to d City Councll resolunop, )
. which on J amiury ¥, 1994, had at leeet one' umeinforeed m'a's'enrglr beariné
" wall. secﬁon 362 8 shall not epplyto the following; | |

(1 Any detached smgle or two-fa.mxly dwellmg unit-and detached

apartment houses conta:mng five ¢ or fewer umts used solely for
resulentlal purposes and the acccssory bulldmgs for theee .
'occupancles Th,ts exemphon does' not apply to buﬂdmgs or’
| structures contammg mixed or nonres1dent1al occupancles
) ‘ Bmldmgs that have been eompletely seismically retroﬁtted, as )
| ‘ | determmed by the Bmldmg Oﬁiclal to eomp]y with earher )
| editions of the California Existing Building Code, or eqmvalent
l;egulations.. .

Section 302.8.1 s added as follows: 302.8.1, Applicability. The

regulations in Section 302.8.1 shall apply to buildings or structures that

-PAGE 61 OF 66-




@

@

~ (0-2020-82)

 are within the scope of Section 302.8, that aré not classified as Essential or

Hazardous Facilities, and that contam any parapets and other extemal

E hazards attached to or located on the toof stmcture or formmg the exterlor

. faca.de ofa bmldmg or structure that meet both of the followmg cnterla

¢} Critical Placement: The parapets exterior wall, roof appendages, or. | )
any othq extetna] hazards have the potential to gl\{_e way internally

or onto lower adjacent buildings (witha minimum ﬁeight'
.. differential of 6 feet) or property, of opto an adjéeent exit or public

" way;and

i ) Relaﬁve Height. ’I‘ffe parapets and other .‘extemal hazardsor . -

. _ A T
exterior wall or roof appendages that extend above the lower of -

"_either the level of the closestAadjaeeni roofto wall anchors or the
roof élieathing do not meet the fequirements of Section A113 of the

Cahforma Exlstmg Bulldmg Code

. Section 302.8.2 is added as follows 302.8.2, Comphanoe penod The

owner:of abmldmg regulated by Sectxon 302.8 shall, within 5 years after 3

.the date of service of an order to comply, provide partial seismic

mitigationin the form of the removal, stabilization, or bracing of all the

~ - bmldmg elements that meet both of the criteria in Section 302.8.1.

Sectwn 302.8.3 is added as follows 302. 8 3, Removal Stabilization and

: Bracmg Process The owner shall install roof to wall anchors around the

perimeter of the entire bulldmg as part of the removal, stablhzatxon, and

bracmg process E)ustmg roof to wall anchors must meet, or shall be

upgraded to meet, the tmmmum requlrements of Sectxon Al 13. 1 of the

-PAGE 62 OF 66- .




(0-2020-82)

California Bxisting Building Code, or new anchors meeting the minimum
.reqmrements of Section Al 13 1 shall be mstalled |
(h)  Section 302.8.4, is added as follows: 302.8.4, Hlstpncal Bulldmgs If the
| bmldmg is aHlstoncal Buﬂdmg, the installation shall comply with the
reqmrements of the Cahforma Hlstoncal Bmldmg Code and parapet -
rcmoval shall notbe used as a method to mitigate externa.l hazards,
Sectlon 3s. That Chapter 14 Artlcle 11, Dmsmn 4 of the San Diego Municipal-Code is. .
amended by amending gnd retitling section 141 1.0401, repealing sections 141 1.0402, 1411.0403,
and 1411 0404 and s;dding new section 1411 0405, to read as follov:rs* -

§1411 0401 Local Modiﬁcations to Chapter 4 “Repairs” of the Callfornia Existmg
Building Code - '

@ - 'Chapter 4 of the Cahforma Bx1stmg Bulldmg Code is adopted by .|
‘ refcrence with modxﬁcatlons pursuant to Secnon 141 1.0105 of the. Land
: Development Code. | . ‘
® . ' Section 4013 is modified pﬁrSuant to 'Section 1411.0105 of the Laqd
Developmeﬁt Code as follov.vs: 4(?1.3; ﬁlood hazard areas In flood hazard
areas, thetow'ner shall coﬁlply with Sgcﬁon 145.1612.0r Sgctioxi'149.0322 |
of the Land Development Coﬁe, as applicable, when makmg repalrsthat

constitute substantial improvemment.

-PAGE 63 OF 66-




(0-2026-82) .

" . §1411.0405 Local Modifications to Section 405 “Strnetural” of the California Existmg
) . Bmlding Code

" (a) Sectmn 405 of the Cahforma Exlstmg Bu:ldmg Code is adopted by
reference with mod1ﬁcat1ons pursuant to Sechon.141 1.0105 of the Land -
~ Development Code: o o ' 4 |
(b) Sectioh 405. é 5, Repair, is adopted with modifications as follows;: 405.2.5,
. | Flood hazard areas. In ﬂood hdzard areas, buildings that have sustamed .
. substantml damage shall be brought into eomphance w1th Section’
145 1612 or Sectlon 149.0322 of the Land Development Code,
apphcable ‘ . .
' Sectlon 36. That Chapter 14, Article 11 of the San Dlego Mumclpal Code is amended by
adding new wasmn 5 ‘sections 1411 0501, 1411 .0502, and 1411.0503, to read as follows:
Chapter 14. General Regulatlons .
Artxcle 11: Exisiing Building Regulations .

Dlvision 5: Addltlons and Modifications to Chapter 5 of the Cahfornia Existlng Building ‘
: : - Code -

§1411 0501 . Local Modlﬁcatlons and Addltions to Chapter 5 “Prescriptive- Compliance ‘
. Method” of the California Existing Building Code

.Chapter 5 of the Cahforma Exxstlng Buxldmg Codeis adopted byreference with
: mod1ﬁcat1ons and addltlons pursuant to Sections 141 1 0105 and 1411 0106 of the
Land Development Code .

§1411.0502 Local Modificaﬁons to Section 502 “Addltlons” of the Calnfornia Existlng
' " Building Code . ,

(8). -Section soz of the Califomia,Existing Building Codeis adopted by
reference with modiﬁcetio'ns pursuant tojSection 1411.0105 of the Land

Development Code.

-PAGE 64 OF 66-




®)

(0-2020-82)

Section 502.3 is modified as follows: 502.3, Flood Hazard Areas. For

buildings and s&u‘ctm;es in flood hazard areas established in Section
145.1612 or Sectioﬁ 149.0322 of fhe Land Development Code, as
applicable, any addition that wnsﬁtﬁtes substantial improvement of the

existing, strucﬁo‘e shall comply with the flood design fequiremerité for néw ‘

oonstructmn, and all aspects of the existing structure shall be brought mto

. comphance wuh the requlrements for new constructxon for flood dmgn

For bmldmgs &nd structures in ﬂood hazard areas estabhshed in Section

145 1612 or Sectlon 149.0322 of the Land Devclopment Code, as

appllcable ‘any addmons that do not constitute substantlal 1mprovement of
.. ' the existing stiucture are not reqmred to comply with the flood desngn

requirements for new constructxon

§l411 0503 . Local Modifications to Section 503 “Alteratlons” of the Califorma Exlsﬁng
,BmldmgCode ..

@)

®

Section 503 of the Cahforma Exlstmg Bmldmg Code is adopted by
reference Wlth modifications pursuant to Section 1411.0105 pf thg Land o

Development Code.

~ Section 503.2 is modified as follows: 503.2 Floqd hazard areas. For

- buildings and structures in flood hazard areas established in Section :

145.1612 or Section i49.0322 of thc Land Devél;)p;nent. Q(:;de,' as
applicable, any alteration that constitutes substénﬁai improvement of the
existing structu'r‘e shall comply with the flood dwign requireménts for ﬁew
constructxon, and all aspects of the ex1stmg structure shall be brought mto

comphance with the requuements for new constructlon for flood design.

| For.buildings and structures in flood hazard areas estabhshed in Section

-PAGE 65 OF 66-




.(0-2020-82) -

145.1612 of Section 149.0322' of the Land Development Code, as
apphcable, any altemtlons that do not constitute substantial mprovement
of the existing stmcture are not requlred to comply w1th the flood design
~regu1rements for new constructlon. ‘

Section 57‘. That a full réading of tlns Ordinance i§ dispensed with.{)-rior to passage,a
written.copy l{avingvb'een made é_vailéblg fo the Council and the public prior to the day of 1ts
psige, S

" Section 38. Thit this Ordinance shalltake effect afid bo in foroe on the thrtioth day fom
and after its final passage. - , ’ -

APPROVED: MARA W. ELLIOTT, City Attornéy .

By . % m?\‘
S Noah J . Brazie{ J
Deputy C1ty Attorney

.NJB:als-
02/10/2020.
Or.Dept:DSD )
Doc. No.: 2228015 2.

I hereby certify that the foregomg Ordmanoe was passe&‘by the Council of the Clty of
" San Dxego, at this meetmg of 04/07/2020 ‘

BLIZABETH S. MALAND
" Clty Clerk

By /s/ Gil Sanchez

| . ’. . ) * A . . . ” Depu C
o & - '
Approved: ___° dl I %) 0 Z M{( . :
o " (date) . - KBVIN L. FAULCONER, Mayor
Vetoed: _ L o '
: (date) ' " KEVIN L. FAULCONER, Mayor

-PAGE 66 OF 66-



(0-2020-82)

STRIKEOUT ORDINANCE

OLD LANGUAGE: Struck-Out
NEW LANGUAGE: Double Underline

ORDINANCE NUMBER O- (NEW SERIES)

DATE OF FINAL PASSAGE

AN ORDINANCE AMENDING CHAPTER 12, ARTICLE 9,
DIVISION 1 OF THE SAN DIEGO MUNICIPAL CODE BY
AMENDING SECTION 129.0104; AMENDING CHAPTER 12,
ARTICLE 9, DIVISION 2 BY AMENDING SECTIONS
129.0203, 129.0211, 129.0216, AND 129.0218; AMENDING
CHAPTER 12, ARTICLE 9, DIVISION 3 BY AMENDING
SECTION 129.0307, AMENDING AND RETITLING SECTION
129.0309; AMENDING CHAPTER 12, ARTICLE 9, DIVISION 4
BY AMENDING AND RETITLING SECTION 129.0410;
AMENDING CHAPTER 12, ARTICLE 9, DIVISION 9 BY
AMENDING AND RETITLING SECTION 129.0907;
AMENDING CHAPTER 14, ARTICLE 2, DIVISION 12 BY
AMENDING SECTION 142.1210; AMENDING CHAPTER 14,
ARTICLE 5, DIVISION 1 BY AMENDING SECTIONS
145.0101, 145.0103, 145.0104, 145.0105, 145.0106, AND
145.0107; AMENDING CHAPTER 14, ARTICLE 5, DIVISION 2
BY AMENDING SECTION 145.0201 AND REPEALING
SECTION 145.0202; AMENDING CHAPTER 14, ARTICLE 5,
DIVISION 4 BY AMENDING SECTION 145.0401 AND

. ADDING NEW SECTION 145.0406; AMENDING CHAPTER
14, ARTICLE 5, DIVISION 7 BY REPEALING SECTION
145.0702 AND AMENDING SECTION 145.0711; AMENDING
CHAPTER 14, ARTICLE 5, DIVISION 12 BY RENUMBERING
AND RETITLING SECTION 145.1207 TO SECTION 145.1206
AND ADDING NEW SECTION 145.1207; AMENDING
CHAPTER 14, ARTICLE 5, DIVISION 15 BY AMENDING
SECTIONS 145.1501, 145.1505 AND 145.1507, ADDING NEW
SECTION 145.1510, AND RENUMBERING AND RETITLING
CURRENT SECTION 145.1510 TO SECTION 145.1511;
AMENDING CHAPTER 14, ARTICLE §, DIVISION 18 BY
AMENDING SECTION 145.1803; AMENDING CHAPTER 14,
ARTICLE 5, DIVISION 31 BY AMENDING SECTION 145.3101
AND REPEALING SECTION 145.3109; AMENDING
CHAPTER 14, ARTICLE §, DIVISION 32 BY AMENDING
SECTION 145.3203; AMENDING CHAPTER 14, ARTICLE 5,
DIVISION 33 BY AMENDING SECTIONS 145.3301 AND
145.3303; AMENDING CHAPTER 14, ARTICLE 5, DIVISION

-PAGE 1 OF 76-



(0-2020-82)

38 BY RETITLING DIVISION 38 AND BY AMENDING AND
RETITLING SECTIONS 145.3801, 145.3802, 145.3803,
145.3804, 145.3805, AND 145.3806; AMENDING CHAPTER 14,
ARTICLE 5, DIVISION 39 BY AMENDING SECTION 145.3905
AND AMENDING AND RETITLING SECTION 145.3910;
AMENDING CHAPTER 14, ARTICLE 5, DIVISION 40 BY
AMENDING SECTION 145.4005; AMENDING CHAPTER 14,
ARTICLE 6, DIVISION 1 BY AMENDING SECTIONS
146.0103, 146.0104, 146.0105, 146.0106, AND 146.0107,
AMENDING CHAPTER 14, ARTICLE 6, DIVISION 2 BY
REPEALING SECTIONS 146.0208 AND 146.0209; AMENDING
CHAPTER 14, ARTICLE 7, DIVISION 1 BY AMENDING
SECTIONS 147.0103, 147.0104, 147.0105, AND 147.0106;
AMENDING CHAPTER 14, ARTICLE 7, DIVISION 2 BY
ADDING NEW SECTION 147.0203, RENUMBERING
SECTION 147.0213 TO SECTION 147.0211, AND AMENDING
AND RETITLING SECTION 147.0212; AMENDING CHAPTER
14, ARTICLE 7, DIVISION 4 BY AMENDING SECTION
147.0405; AMENDING CHAPTER 14, ARTICLE 8, DIVISION 1
BY AMENDING SECTIONS 148.0103, 148.0104, 148.0105,
148.0106, AND 148.0107; AMENDING CHAPTER 14,
ARTICLE 9, DIVISION 1 BY AMENDING SECTIONS
149.0103, 149.0104, 149.0105, 149.0106, 149.0107, AND
149.0108; AMENDING CHAPTER 14, ARTICLE 9, DIVISION 2
BY AMENDING SECTION 149.0201 AND REPEALING
SECTION 149.0202; AMENDING CHAPTER 14, ARTICLE 9,
DIVISION 3 BY AMENDING SECTIONS 149.0301 AND
149.0302, ADDING NEW SECTION 149.0309, AMENDING
AND RETITLING SECTION 149.0319, ADDING NEW
SECTION 149.0324, REPEALING SECTION 149.0326, AND
AMENDING SECTION 149.0337; AMENDING CHAPTER 14,
ARTICLE 9, DIVISION 9 BY AMENDING SECTION 149.0902;
AMENDING CHAPTER 14, ARTICLE 10, DIVISION 1 BY
AMENDING SECTIONS 1410.0103 AND 1410.0107;
AMENDING.CHAPTER 14, ARTICLE 10, DIVISION 4 BY
AMENDING SECTION 1410.0403; AMENDING CHAPTER 14,
ARTICLE 11, DIVISION 1 BY AMENDING SECTIONS
1411.0103, 1411.0104, 1411.0105, 1411.0106, AND 1411.0107;
AMENDING CHAPTER 14, ARTICLE 11, DIVISION 3 BY
AMENDING SECTION 1411.0301 AND AMENDING AND
RETITLING SECTION 1411.0302; AMENDING CHAPTER 14,
ARTICLE 11, DIVISION 4 BY AMENDING AND RETITLING
SECTION 1411.0401, REPEALING SECTIONS 1411.0402,
1411.0403, AND 1411.0404, AND ADDING NEW SECTION
1411.0405; AMENDING CHAPTER 14, ARTICLE 11, BY
ADDING NEW DIVISION 5, SECTIONS 1411.0501, 1411.0502,

-PAGE 2 OF 76-



(0-2020-82)

AND 1411.0503, RELAI‘ ING TO THE 2019 CALIFORNIA
BUILDING STANDARDS CODE. .

§129.0104  Construction Permit Authorities
() - The powers and duiies of the Building Official are as follows:

(1) through (13) [No change in text.]

(14) To review applications for Grading Permits for, and to inspect
grading on, residential private lots thatdo not include public rights
of way, as well as associated plans, specifications, and other data to
determine if an application is in compliance with the grading
regulations in the California Building Code, other adopted City

standards, and engineering standards of practice.

(15) [No change in text.]

(16) Toreview plans and speci ‘ ifications for water and sewer utilities and
installations, and to inspect the utilities and installations, when

(b) through (c) [No change in text.]
§129.0203  Exemptions from a Building Permit
(a) A Building Permit is not required for the following structures and
activities, except when the development would involve alterations, repairs,

or improvements to a historical resource as described in Section

-PAGE 3 OF 76-



(0-2020-82)

143.0220; when development on a premises containing environmentally

sensitive lands requires a development permit in accordance with Section

143.0110; or when a building is constructed with unreinforced masonry

bearing walls or exterior wall parapets:

(1)  [No change in text.] .

(2)  Fences that are 67 feet in height or less;-and-notsupperting-any
other-super-impesedloads.

(3) through (6) [No change in text.]

(7)  Pletferms;walks; Sidewalks and driveways that are 30 inches or

less above adiacent grade, and are not over any basement or story,

and are pot part of an accessible route in accordance with the
California Building Code:

(8) through (9) [No change in text.]

(10) Window awnings supported by an exterior wall of Group R,

Diviston 3, and Greup-M Group U Occupancies when-they that do

not project more than 54 inches from the exterior wall and do not
require additional support.

(11) through (13) [No change in text.]

&35)(14)Electrolier standards, flag poles, and antennas that are 30 feet or

less in height above finish grade when fully extended.

-PAGE 4 OF 76-



(0-2020-82)

AU 6)Renewal of roof coverings on any building permitted by the

California Building Code and the California Residential Code,
where the existing roof structure, including roof diaphragm, is n(.)t
altered.

81 7)Repairs that involve only the replacement of components or
existing work with similar materials for the purpose of
maintenance, that do not have an aggregate valuation of over
$1,000.00, and that do not affect any electrical or mechanical
installations. Repairs exempt from permit requirements shall not
include any addition, change, or modification in construction, exit
facilities, or permanent fixtures or equipment. The following
repairs are exempt from permit requirements without limit to
valuation:

’ (A) through (D) [No change in text.]

-PAGE 5 OF 76-



(0-2020-82)

@9)(18)Structures placed in public streets, alleys and sidewalks, except

| those regulated by Chapter 32 of the California Building Code.
20(19)Work done by employees of the City on City-owned or leased
buildings.

(—2—1—)@1A temporary shed, office or storage building and other structure
incidental to and for work authorized by a valid Grading or
Building Permit. Such structures must be removed upon expiration
of the permit or completion of work covered by the Grading or
Building Permit.

(2 1)Installing replacement windows in existing window openings
where all of the following conditions apply:

(A) The windows are replaced in detached one and two-family
dwellings or townhouses as defined in the California
Résidential Code.

(B)  The proposed window replacement shall not require any
modifications to the weather resistive exterior wall
envelope protecting the structure or the interior of the
structure.

(C)  The existing windows to be replaced are not required to be
fire resistive.

(D)  The proposed work shall not require modifications to the
existing rough openings.

23)(22)New permanent parking and vehicular use areas for less than four

vehicles, including access to the spaces, but excluding parking for

-PAGE 6 OF 76~



(0-2020-82)

“single dwelling unit uses on a single lot in Residential-Single Unit
Zones.
24)(23)Specific structures as determined by the Building Official .for a
particular and justifiablé reason.
25)(24)A sidewalk cafe that is in compliance with Section 141.0621,
unless any one of the following applies:
(A)  The sidewalk cafe would alter or modify the existing
building, building fagade, or any means of building egress;
(B)  The sidewalk cafe would be located on a raised platform or
in a sunken area; or
(C) A barrier consisting of railings, fences, or planter boxes
would be installed to delineate the area of the sidewalk
cafe.
(b) through (c) [No change in fext.]
§129.0211 Closing of Building Permit Application

(a) through (d) [No change in text.]

§129.0216  Initial Utilization of a Building Permit

A Building Permit shall become void if work authorized by the permit is suspended,
ﬂ]g_Murg is abandc substantial work authorized by the permit has not

been completed and validated by an inspection within +86-calendar-days 12

-PAGE 7 OF 76-



§129.0218

§129.0307

§129.0309

(0-2020-82)

months of the date of permit issuance unles$ an extension has been granted

pursuant to Section 129.0219.

Expiration of a Building Permit

(a)
(b)

[No change in text:]

If the building or work authorized by a Building Permit has not receiVed
final inspection approval by the permit expiration date, all work shall stop
until a new permit is issued. All Electrical, Plumbing, e Mechanical
Permits, or Fire Permits associated with a Building permit shall expire

concurrently with the Building Permit.

How to Apply for an Electrical Permit

(a) through (f) [No change in text.]

V-7,
Issuance of an Electrical Permit.and Closing of an Electrical Permit
s pplicati

(a) through (b) [No change in text.]

(©

If one vear has elapsed since the date an Electrical Permit application is

submitted for review ma e 1 destro e
Building Official. To reapply, the applicant shall submit a new Electrical

-PAGE 8 OF 76-



(0-2020-82)
all applicable fees and regulations in effect on the date the new application
is filed.

The Electrical Penmit application file for City projects shall be closed after

two vears have elapsed since the date the Electrical Permit application is
deemed complete, '

§129.0410  Issuance of a Plurhbing/Mechanical Permit_and Closing of a
Plumbing/Mechanical P .I!!..—

(a)

A Plumbing/Mechanical Permit may be issued atter all approvals have

been obtained and the required fees have been paid. A

Plumbine/Mechanical Permit-shall-not-be-issued-foradevel l

issued:
lires a devel rmit unti v
issued,
If one year has elapsed since the date a Plumbing/Mechanical Permit
ication is deemed co e ar icant iested that
Plumbing/Mechanical Permit be issued, the application file shall be
closed. Plans and other data submitted for review may be returned to the
olicant or destroye uildi icia

-PAGE 9 OF 76-



(0-2020-82)

iy §129.0907  Issuance of a Fire Permit_and Closing of a Fire Permit Application

(a)
(b)

[No change in text.]

A Fire Permit shall not be issued until & associated BuildingPermit
permits has bévg been issued.

applicable fees an ; tions in effect on the date the new a

filed.

-PAGE 10 OF 76-



(0-2020-82)

(@)  TheFire Permit apolication file for it projects shall be closed afier two
years have elapsed since the date the Fire Petmit application is deemed
complete,

()  TheBuilding Official exierid a Fire Permit application one time, for a
determines that circumstances beyond the control of the applicant
prevented issuance of the Fire Permit,

§142.1210  General Sign Regulations

This section is divided into subsections for copy regulations, locational

regulations, structural regulations, and sign maintenance regulations.

-(a) through (b) [No change in text.]

(©) Structural Regulations
(1) through (3) [No change in text.]

(4)  When installed on the exterior walls of high-rise buildings as
defined in Chapter 4 of the California Building Code, exterior wall
signs greater than 100 square feet in area or greater than 10 feet in
either dimension shall comply with Section 705.12 of the 2643
2019 California Building Code and Section 705.1 of the 2019
California Fire Code.

(d) [No change in text.]

§145.0101  Purpose of the Building Regulations

(a)  The purpose of the Building Regulations is to establish minimum

standards to safeguard health and safety, property, and public welfare, and

-PAGE 11 OF 76-



(b)

(0-2020-82)

to satisfy the purpose of the 2016 2019 California Building Code as
provided in Section 1.1.2 of the 2646 2019 California Building Code.

[No change in text.]

§145.0103  Adoption of the California Building Code

(a)

(b)

(©)

(d)

The 26+6 2019 California Building Code, published by the California
Building Standards Commission (BSC), and as amended by the State
Department of Housing and Community Development (HCD 1, HCD
1/AC); the Division of the State Architect/Access and Compliance
(DSA/AC); the State Office of Statewide Health Planning and
Development (OSHPD3); and the State Fire Marshal; (SFM), is adopted
by reference, except as otherwise provided in Chapter 14, Article S of the
Land Development Code, Divisions 2 through 36 38. A copy of the 2046
2019 California Building Code is on file in the office of the City Clerk as

Document No. O0O-20897+

When reference is made to the California Building Code, it shall be the
2016 2019 California Building Code, California Code of Regulations Title
24, Part 2, as published by the California Building Standards Commission.
Each of the regulations, provisions, conditions, and terms of the 2016
2019 California Building Code is made a part of Chapter 14, Article 5 as if
fully set forth in this Article, except as otherwise provided in Divisions 2
through 36 38.

Numbering of Sections in Divisions 2 through 36 38 of this Article is

cross referenced to Sections in the 2846 2019 California Building Code.

-PAGE 12 OF 76-



§145.0104

§145.0105

(©)

®

(0-2020-82)

The adoption of the 2046 M béiifomia Building Code shall in no way
limit, prohibit, impede, or prevent the City Council from adopting
ordinances limitil{g or preventing the issuance of any type, number, or
geographical distribution of permits.for construction or demolition of any
facility for which a permit is required.

[No change in text.]

Portions of the California Building Code Not Adopted by the City of San

Diego

The following portions of the 2646 2019 California Building Code are not

adopted by the City of San Diego:

@)

®)

©

Chapter 1, Division + 1l “Scope and Administration,” all portions with
the exception of Section 104.11.

Chapter 15, Roof Assemblies and Reef Rooftop Structures, Section
15164 15114

[No change in text.]

Modifications to the California Building Code Adopted by the City of San

Diego

The following Sections or Subsections of the 2646 2019 California Building Code

are modified by the City of San Diego:

(a)
®)

[No change in text.]

-PAGE 13 OF 76-



§145.0106

(0-2020-82)

(©) , _
General, Section 1505 Fire Classification, Section 1505.8 Buildine:
voltai ucts, Secti >d
photovoltaic panel systems, Section 1510.7.1 Fire classification, Section
1507.8 Wood Shingles, Section 1507, Wood Shakes, and Section 1511.1
General.

(d) through (f) [No change in text.]

(2 Appendix N O, Emergency Housing Section N 0103.2.1 Exception 1, N
0103.6 Lighting, Ventilation, and Heating, N Q106 General, Section N -
Q106.1.1 Tents, and Section N O106.1.2 Membrane Structures.

Additions to the California Building Code Adopted by the City of San Diego

The following Sections and Subsections are added to the 2646 2019 California

Building Code by the City of San Diego:

@ o 2. Definitions, Section 202 Live/Work Dwelling

fa}
(¢
(¢}
(]
I~
(]
(93
(23
(]

€)(b) Chapter 7A, Materials and Construction Methods for Exterior Wildfire
Exposure, Sections HOAI3F01A6; 702A, Definitions, 765A-4;
F95A=4-}; Section 703A.6.1, w
Section 703A.6.2, Modifications, Section 766A<4 705A.4, Roof Gutters,
Section 705A4.1, Drip Edge Flashing, Section 708A.2.2.1, Vinyl Window
Reinforcing, and Section 711A.1, end-7++A-2 Spark Arestors.

{d)(c) Chapter 12, Sound Transmission, Section 42875 1206.0S.

-PAGE 14 OF 76-



te)(d)

(el

Slhi]

th(g)

G

()

63

(0-2020-82)

Chapter 15, Roofing-and Roof Assemblies and Rooftop Structures,

Subsections 1505.1.5 and 1505.1.6, Sections +56%46 1507.1.3 and
Subsections 45104+ 1511.1 through +546-+5 1511.L5.

Chapter 16, Structural Design, Section 1607.2, Fire Trucks and
Emergency Vehicle Live Load and 1612.3, Flood Loads.

Chapter 17, Structural Tests and Special Inspections, Section 7055
1704.3.1 item 6.

Chapter 18, Soils and Foundations, Secﬁon 1803 Geotechnical
Investigations, Subsections 1803 2 exceptions 2 through 4. Sections
1803.2.1, 1803.2.2, 1803.2.3, +803-2-exeeptions-2-threugh4: 1803.5.11.1,
1803.5.11.2, 1803.5.13, 1803.5.13.1, 1803.5.13.2 and Table 145.1803.
Enelesufes-éad—Safeeijeviees;Subseeﬁens%l,—HO%%aﬂd
Chapter 32, Encroachments into the Public Ri ght-of-Way, Section 3203
Entrance Canopies, Subsections 3203.1 through 3203.6.

Chapter 33, Safeguards During Construction, Section 3303.-7 3303.8,
Demolition and Removal Regulations.

Appendix N Q, Emergency Housing, Subsection N Q103.2.1 Exception 2,
Subsections N 0106.2 through N 0106.7, Section N Q111 Emergency
Housing Lighting and Ventilation Requiréments, Subsections N Q111.1
and N 0111.2, Section N Q112 Emergency Housing Fire and Life Safety

Requirements, Subsections N Q112.1 through N 0112.13, and Section N

-PAGE 15 OF 76-



§145.0107

§145.0201

(0-2020-82)

Q113 Emergency Houéing Alternatives and Modifications, Subsection N
O113.1.

Adoption of Appendices to the California Building Code

The following Appendix Chapters of the 2646 2019 California Building Code are
adoptéd by the City of San Diego:
(a) Appendix chapters specifically amended by a State agency iisted in
Section 145.0103 and identified in the adoption matrices of the 2046 2019
_ California Building Code.
(b) through (e) [No change in text.]
® Appendix N Q, Emergency Housing.

Local Modifications and Additions to Chapter 2 Definitions of the California
Building Code

Chapter 2 of the California Building Code is adopted by reference with-additions

without change pursuant to Section +45-8106 145.0103 of the Land Development

Code.

-PAGE 16 OF 76-



(0-2020-82)

1

(@  Section202 of the California Building Code is adopted-with the additi

¢ the definition-of Liveiwork it ALi b i welli

§145.0401  Local Modifications and Additions to Chapter 4 “Special Detailed
Requirements Based on Use and Occupancy” of the California Building
Code
Chapter 4 of the California Building Code is adopted by reference witheut-change
- with additions pursuant to Section +45.0103 145.0106 of the Land Development

Code.

the automatic garage door openers shall include batte
designed to operate in 2 manner so that the automatic garage door openers are
erational without | i i lectri e

-PAGE 17 OF 76-



§145.0711

(0-2020-82)

ey . » g . e ¢ 'y 113
Loeal-Additiensand Meodifieationsto Seetdon 1A Seope; Purpose-and
\polication?of theCaliforniaBuilding-Cod

Local Additions to Section 711A “Additional Building Standards for
Buildings Located in the Local Agency Very High Fire Hazard Severity
Zone” of Chapter 7A of the California Building Code

Sections 711A.1 and-FH-A2-are is added as follows to Chapter 7A pursuant to

Section 145.0106 of the Land Development Code.

711A.1 Spark arrester. All structures having any chimney, flue, or stovepipe shall
be equipped with an approved spark arrester if the chimney, flue, or stovepipe is
attached to any fireplace, stove, barbecue, or other solid or liquid fuel burning

equipment or device.

145.12076 Local Additions and Modifications to Section 1207 1206 “Sound
~ § 6 1206

Transmission” of the California Building Code

(a) Section +267 1206 of the California Building Code is adopted with
additions and modifications pursuant to Sections 145.0105 and 145.0106
of the Land Development Code. Section 4267 1206 is modified by adding

Section 4207-5 1206.5.

-PAGE 18 OF 76-



§145.1207

§145.1501

(b) -

(0-2020-82)

+

Section 12075 1206.5. Additional Noise Regulations. For additional
noise regulations limiting the intrusion of exterior noise into buildings
based on land use standards, see Chapter 13, Article 2, Division 15 of the

Land Developmént Code. For additional noise regulations limiting the

intrusion of exterior noise into non-residential buildings, see Section 5.507

of the California Green Building Standards Code.

! ! ! l!.!. !B! !og !o ! § !0 !ggl“! ! . §
gn . ” £!! g !og » g ¢! !o g !

(a)

Section 1207.4 item 1 is modified as follows: 1. The dwelling unit shall
have a living room of not less than 150 square feet (13.93 m2) of floor
\ditional 100 fect (9.3 m2) of hall
vided for eac} ¢ the dwelli . ¢

Local Modifications and Additions to Chapter 15 “Roof Assemblies and Reef
Teop Rooftop Structures” of the California Building Code '

(a)
(b)

©

[No change in text.]

Sections 1501 through 1504 and Sections +503; 1506, 1508, and 1509 are
adopted by reference without change pursuant to Section 145.0103 of the
La;nd Development Code.

Sections 1505.1, }1505.8, 1505.9, 1507.1, 1507.8, and 1507.9, 1510.7.1,
and 1511 are adopted by reference with modifications and additions
pursuant to Sectiong 145.0105 and 145.0106 of the Land Development

Code.

-PAGE 19 OF 76-



(0-2020-82)

§145.1505  Local Additions and Modifications to Section 1505 “Fire Classification” of
the California Building Code

(a) through (b) [No change in text.]
) Section 1505.8 is modified pursuant to Section 145.0105 of the I.and
Development Code as follows; 1505.8 Building-integrated photovoltaic

(d)  Section 15059 fified Secti 5.0105 of the Land
Development Code as follows: 1505.9 Rooftop mounted photovoltaic
panel systems, Rooftop rack-mounted i hall be
UL 1703 and UL 2703 and Section 145.1505(b).

§145.1507 Local Additions and Modifications to Section 1507 “Requirements for Roof
Coverings” of the California Building Code

(a) [No change in text.]
(b) Section +5071+6 1507.1.3 is added as follows pursuant to Section
145.0106 of the Land Development Code: 4+507446 1507.1.3. Roof

coverings shall be secured or fastened to the supporting roof construction.

§145.1510  Local Additions and Modifications to Section 1510 “Rooftop Structures” of
Section 1510.7.1 is modified pursuant to Section 145.0105 of the Land
Development Code as follows: 1510.7.1 Fire classification. Rooftop-mounted
photovoltaic panels and modules shall have a fire classification in accordance
with Section 145,15085,

-PAGE 20 OF 76-



(0-2020-82)

[N

§145.151811 Local Additions and Modifications to Section 1510 1511 “Reroof'mg” of the
California Building Code

(@

(®)

(©)

Section 546+ 1511.1 is modified pursuant to Section 145.0105 of the
Land Development Code as follows: 1546+ _lij__[_i_ General. Materials
and methods of application used for covering or replacing an existing roof
covering shall comply with the requirements of Chapter 15 of the 2643
California Building Code as adopted and arﬁended by the City of San

Diego.

_ Sections +548-4-+ 1511.1.1 through +540-3-2 1511.1.2 are added pursuant

to Section 145.0106 of the Land Development Code:

(1)  +53644 1511.1.1. All replacements, alterations, or repairs shall be
a Class “A"’ roof assembly:.

(2) 54642 1511.1.2. The entire roof shall be a Class “A” roof
assembly where more than twenty-five percent of the total roof
area is replaced, altered or repaired within any twelve-month
period.

Sections +540-1-3 1511.1.3 through 1546145 1511.1.5 are added pursuant

to Section 145.0106 of the Land Development Code:

(N +540-13 1511.1.3. Wood shakes and shingles are prohibited
throughout the roof where more than twenty-five percent of the |
total roof area is replaced, altered or repaired within any twelve:-
month period.

2) 151014 1511.1.4. Wood shakes and shingles are not permitted,

except as provided in California Historical Building Code Section

-PAGE 21 OF 76-



§145.1803

3

(0-2020-82)
ot

8-408 and Land Development Code Section +45-+516¢e}(H
145.1511(c)(1},
+540-45 1511.1.5. No roof covering shall be applied over any

existing wood shakes or wood shingles.

Local Additions and Modifications to Section 1803 “Geotechnical
Investigations” of the California Building Code

(a) through (e) [No change in teﬁt.]

®

The Geologic Hazard Category and the Building, Structure and Facility

Class must be determined as follows when using Table 145.1803 to

determine whether a geotechnical investigation report is required due to

local geological hazards within the City of San Diego:

0y
)

[No change in text.]

City staff shall assign one of four Building, Structure and Facility
classes to each building, structure, or facility based on their use,
type of occupancy, number of occupants, and whether hazardous-
materials are being used or stored in the building, structure, or
facility to determine whether a Geotechnical Investigation Report
is required.

(A)  [No change in text.]

(B)  Class B includes the following developments, occupancy

groups, and structures provided they are not included in

Class A:
& All-devel - £g
buildi | ot

-PAGE 22 OF 76-



(0-2020-82)

én() All new structures requiring deep foundations, such

as piers or pilings.

aw(inAll structures containing the following occupancies
‘ pursuant to the California Building Code,

Chapter 3:

a. Group A, Divisions 1, 2, 3 and 4;

b. Group E, buildings and other structures
containing elementary school, secondary
school or day care facilities with an
occupant load greater than 250,

c. Group H, Divisions 1, 2, and 3; and

d. Group I, Divisions 2 and 3.

&3(v) All structures with an occupant load of more than
300 occupants as determined by Table 1004.1.2 of
the California Building Code and structures used for
public assembly assigned to Risk Category Il in
Table 1604.5 of the California Building Code.

&(v) Tanks, bins, hoppers, silos, and other storage
structures with more than 20,000-gallon capacity
intended to store toxic, hazardous, or flammable
contents that are not associated with a building,

structure, or facility in Class A.

-PAGE 23 OF 76-



(0-2020-82)

(—\m)QQTanks .'oins, hoppers, silos, and other storage
structures over 35 feet high.

exig(vii)Towers over 35 feet high.

@x)(viii)Retaining walls over the heights listed in the
following Subsections a. and b. with the height
measured from the top of the footing to the top of
the wall:

a. Retaining walls over 12. feet in height; and

b. Retaining walls over 8 feet in height
supporting a surcharge or retaining toxic,
hazardous, or flammable contents.

(C) through (D) [No change in text.]

(g) [No change in text.]

Table 145.1803 (1)
Required Geotechnical Investigation
Type of Hazard Hazard Category Building, Structure,
and Facility Class

Fault Zones/Ground 11,12, 13 A,B,C,D
Rupture

21 through 24,22 A,B,C,D
Landslides/Potential
Slope Instability

-PAGE 24 OF 76-



(0-2020-82)

Liquefacti.on/Potential S R
Ground Failure 31,32 A,B,C,D
4] threugh48,42,43 A,B,C,D
Coastal Bluff Stability
| 44,45, 46,47, 48 A.B
; 54 fwith-slope-greater than or
>4 . A,B,C:D
Variabl equal-to-d:-hor 25%0)
o1
SE 5] ) :S avoras 5.!
SlepingTopegraphy 22,33 A.B
All Other Terrain
51,55 A
25%) #5B€
AL OtherConditi
55255 ABE

Footnotes: {No change in text.]

§145.3101  Local Modifications and Additions to Chapter 31 “Special Construction” of
the California Building Code

@) Chapter 31 of the California Building Code is adopted by reference

without change pursuant to Section 145.0103 of the Land Development

Code.

-PAGE 25 OF 76-



(0-2020-82)

Lecal-Additi 1 Modifications-to-Scetion-3109-“Swimming Pool
Enel 1 Safety-Dovices™of the Californin Buildine Cod

0O 1 ) and N0 4 1 10 g
o1 =ahlo o v o gu wrn w v

hall I with Eisure 31 B-5-of the-CaliforniaBuildine-Code-

-PAGE 26 OF 76-



§145.3203

§145.3301

§145.3303

of ©

s (0-2020-82)

Local Additions to Chapter 32 “Eiiérol‘iclhments Into The Public Right-of-
Way” e

Section 3203 “Entrance Canopies” is added pursuant to Section 145.0106 of the
Land Development Code:
(a) through (b) [No change in>text.]‘“ o
(c) 3203.3. Construction. Entrance canopy frames and supporting structural
members shall be constructed of corrosion-resistant metal designed and
constructed to withstand wind or other lateral loads and live loads as
required by Chapter 16 of the California Building Code. Entrance
canopies shall also meet all of thé following requirements:
: ‘e shall-al 1 of the follow . :
(1)  Canopies shall be covered with an approve& covering that
complies with Section 34854 31053 of the California Building
Code.
(2) through (4) [No change in text.]
(d) through (f) [No change in text.]

Local Modifications and Additions to Chapter 33 “Safeguards During
Construction” of the California Building Code

(a) [No change in text.]

(b)  Sections 3301 through 3302 and 3304 through 3343 3314 are adopted by
reference without change pursuant to Section 145.0103 of the Land
Development Code.

Local Modifications and Additions to Section 3303 “Demolition” of the
California Building Code

Section 33637 3307.8 is added pursuant to Section 145.0106 of the Land

Development Code: 3303-7 3307.8 Additional Demolition Regulations. The

-PAGE 27 OF 76-



§145.3801

§145.3802

(0-2020-82)

following regulations apply to the demolition of a structure or building, in whole

or in part, or the removal of a structure trom a site:

- (a) through (3) [No change in text.]

Division 38: Additions and Modifications to Appendix N Q of the

California Building Code

-Local Modifications and Additions to Appendix N O “Emergency Housing”
of the California Building Code

(@

(b)

(c)

(d)

Appendix N Qof the California Building Code is adopted by reference
with modifications and additions pursuant to Sections 145.0105 and
145.61 06 of the Land Development Code.

[No change in text.]

The régg]ations in this Division and in Appendix N Q shall be applicable V
to emergency housing established pursuant to the declaration of a shelter
crisis under California Government Code Section 8698.4 and located in
new or existing buildings or structures owned, operated, or constructed by,
for, or on behalf of, the City.

The regulations in this Division and in Appendix N Q shall apply to
emergency housing operated during a declaration of a shelter crisis. Other
than the requirements in Appendix NQ, as adopted with modifications
and additions by this Division, the emergency housing need not comply
with the requirements of the California Building Code for Group R

occupancies.

Local Modifications and Additions to Section N Q103 “Emergency Housing”
of the California Building Code

-PAGE 28 OF 76-



§145.3803

(a)

(b)

- ©

(0-2020-82)

Section NQ103 is adopted with modifications and additions pursuant to
. R Tt
Sections 145.0105 and 145.0106 of the Land Development Code.
The existing exception in Section NQ103.2.1 is numbered as Exception 1.

Exception 2 is added to Section NQ103.2.1 as follows:

2. Change in occupancy shall not mandate conformance with new

construction requirements set forth in the California Building Standards
Code, provided such change in occupancy meets the minimum fire and life

safety requirements set forth in Section 145.3805 of the Land

Development Code.

Section NQ103.6 Heating is modified as follows:

NO103.6 Lighting, Ventilation, and Heating. All sleeping areas shall be
provided with adequate lighting, ventilation, and heating as determined by
the Building Official. When required, lighting and ventilation shall

comply with Section 145.3804.

Local Modifications and Additions to Section N Q106 “Tents and Membrane
Structures” of the California Building Code

(a)

(b)

Section NQ106 is adopted with modifications and additions pursuant to

Sections 145.0105 and 145.0106 of the Land Development Code.

Section NO106.1 General is modified as follows:

(1)  Section NQ106.1.1 Tents is modified as follows:
NQ106.1.1 Tents. Tents shall not be used to house occupants for
more than 7 consecutive days unless such tents are maintained with
tight wooden floors raised at least 4 inches (101.6 mm) above the

ground level and are equipped with baseboards on all sides to a

-PAGE 29 OF 76-



(c) .

(0-2020-82)

height of at least 6 inches (152.4 mm). Tents may be maintained
with concrete slabs with the finished surface at least 4 inches
(101.6 mm) above grade and equipped with curbs on all sides at
least 6 inches (152.4 mm) high. A tent shall not be considered a
suitable sleeping place when it is found necessary to provide
heating facilities in order to maintain a minimum temperature of 50
degrees Fahrenheit (10 degrees Celsius) within such tent during the
period of occupancy.

(2) Section NQ106.1.2 Membrane Structures is added with
modification as follows:

NQ106.1.2 Membrane' Structures. Membrane structures installed
and/or- asserﬁbled in accorda_nqe with Chapter 31 of the California
Building Code and the California Fire Code may be permitted to
be used as emergeﬁcy hbusing and emergency housing facilities.

Section };Jg106,2 Membrane Structures In Use for More than 180 Days is

added as follows:

NQ106.2 Membrane Structures In Use for More Than 180 Days.

Membrane stmcﬁres in use for a period of more than 180 calendar days

shall comply with the California Fire Code and with the following:

(1) The membrane structure shall be inspected by a California
registered design professional at least once every 180 calendar
days from the date of final inspection prierte-initial-occupaney to
ensure that the membrane structure continues to perform as

designed and initially erected. The registered design professional

-PAGE 30 OF 76-



(d)

(e)

®

(0-2020-82)

shall certify in writin g that the membrane structure continues to be
in compliance with the appiicable regulations of the California Fire
Code and California Building Code in effect on the date of final
inspection prier-te-initial-eecupaney. Inspection records shall be
kept and shall be made available for verification by the Fire Code
Official and the Building Official.
2) [No change in text.]
Section NQ106.3 Means of Egress is added as follows:
NO106.3 Means of Egress. Means of egress for membrane structures used
as emergency housing shall be determined based on the occupant load
specified in Section NQ103.3.
Section NQ106.4 Storage of Flammable Materials Within Tents or
Membrane Structures is added as follows:
NQ106.4 Storage of Flammable Materials Within Tents or Membrane
Structures. Flammable materials, including the possessions of occupants
and users stored in tents and membrane structures shall not obstruct
required aisle widths between beds or other furnishings. The quantity of
stored flammable materials within a membrane structure not protected
with an automatic fire sprinkler system, or within tents, shall be subject to
the approval of the Fire Code Official.
Section NQ106.5 Flammable or Combustible Liquids is added as follows:
NQ106.5 Flammable or Combustible Liquids. The possession or storage
of any flammable or combustible liquids or gases shall not be permitted

inside a tent or membrane structure except for intact cigarette lighters. The

-PAGE 31 OF 76-



§145.3804

(®

(h)

(0-2020-82)

use of any type oﬂf ,opeﬁ flame inside a tent or membrane structure is
prohibited unless e;10h separate use is approved by the Fire Code Official.
Section NQ106.6 Fire Departmeﬁt Access is added as follows:

NO106.6 Fire Department Access. Fire Department access to tents or
membrane structures used for emergency housing shall be in compliance
with Section 503, Section 504, and Appendix D of the California Fire
Code and approved by the Fire Code Official.

Section NQ106.7 Water Supply is added as follows:

NQ106.7 Water Supply. An approved fire protection water supply
complying with Section 507 of the California Fire Code, or as approved
by the Fire Code Official, shall be provided for each tent or membrane

structure, group of structures, or premises used for emergency housing.

Local Addition of Section N Q111 “Emergency Housing Lighting and
Ventilation Requirements® to the California Building Code

(a)

(b)

Section NQ111 Emergency Housing Lighting and Ventilation
Réquirements i; added pursuant to Section 145.0106 of the Land
Development Code.

Section NQ111.1 Emergency Housing Lighting Requirements is added as
follows:

NQI111.1 Emergency Housing Lighting Requirements. Buildings or
structures used for emergency housing shall either be provided with
natural light by means of exterior glazed openings in accordance with

Section 1205.2 of the California Building Code or shall be provided with

-PAGE 32 OF 76-



.. §145.3805

(c)

(0-2020-82)

artificial light i‘n accordance with Section 1205.3 of the California
Building Code. T

Section NQ111.2 Ventilation is added as follows:

NQI11.2 Ventilation. Buildings or structures used for emergency housing
shall either be provided with naturai ventilation in accordance with

Section 1203.5 of the California Building Code or mechanical ventilation

in accordance with the California Mechanical Code.

Local Addition of Section N Q112 “Emergency Housing Fire and Life Safety
Requirements” to the California Building Code

(2)

(®

(©)

Sectioﬁ NOI112 Emergency Housing Fire and Life Safety Requirements is
added pursuant to Section 145.0106 of the Land Development Code.

Section NQ112.1 Fire Separation Distance is added as follows:

- NOI112.1 Fire Separation Distance. Buildings or structures used for

emergency housing, including slqeping cabins, shall be constructed and
located on a lot in compliance with the regulations in Chapters 6 and 7 of
the California Building Code, based on their fire separation distance.
During a declared shelter crisis, the fire separation distances are permitted
to be measured to the existing buildings on the adjacent parcels rath'er than
to the interior lot lines, pfovidcd the open spaces within the fire separation
distance remain clear and unobstructed for the duration of the declared
shelter crisis.

Section NQ1 12.2 Fire Separation Distance, Buildings on the Same Lot is

added as follows:

-PAGE 33 OF 76-



(d)

(e)

)

(2)

T

(0-2020-82)

S

NQ112:2 Fire Separﬁﬁicixl Distance, Bpildings on the Same Lot. Buildings
or structures L;sed for cmergency housing, including sleeping cabins, shall
be separated from each other and from other buildings on the same lot as
set forth in Section 705.3 of the California Building Code.

Section NO1 12‘3 ‘Means of Bé&ss i§ added as follows:

NOQ112.3 Means of egress. Buildings or structures used for emergency

housing shall be provided with means of egress in compliance with

Chapter 10 of the California Building Code.

Sectior; NQ112.4 Emergency Escape and Rescue is added as follows:
NO1 i2.4 En.mergenc.y Escape and Rescue. Each area of a building or
structure used for s]eéping accommodations in emergency housing shall
contain an emergency escape and rescue opening in accordance with
Section 1030 of the Califoﬁia Building Code.

Section NO112.5 émoke Alarms is added as follows:

NO112.5 Smoke Alarms. Buildings or structures with sleeping

accommodations used for emergency housing shall be equipped with
single station smoke alarms installed in accordance with the requirements
of Sectibn 907.2.11-and Section 1103.8.3 of the California Fire Code.
Section NQ112.6 Carbon Monoxide Alarms is added as follows:
NQ112.6 Carbon Monoxide Alarms. Buildings or structures with sleeping
accommodations used for emergency housing and equipped with fuel-
burning appliances shall be provided with carbon monoxide detection in
accordance with Section 915 of the California Fire Code and the

California Building Code.

-PAGE 34 OF 76-



(h) -

)

1)

(k)

(0-2020-82)

Section NQ112.7 Fire Alarm is added as follows:

‘NQO112.7 Fire Alarm: A manual fire alarm system capable of arousing

sleeping occupants désigned and constructed in compliance with Section
907.2.10.1 of the Califorma Fire Code and the California Building Code
shall be installed in buildihgs, structures, or groups of buildings or
structures, used for emergency housing and having a gross floor area of
more than 2,500 square feet or having the capacity for more than 49
sleeping occupants. |
Exception: Individual buildings or structures in a group of
buildings or structures with sufficient separation distances to allow
each building or structure to function independently in case of a
- fire shall have their own indiQidual fire alarm systems, as approved
by the Fire Code Official.
Section NQO112.8 Automatic Fire Sprinklers is added as follows:
NQ112.8 Automatic Fire Sprinklers. Fire sprinklers shall be provided for
new and existing buildings or structures used for emergency housing that
provide sleeping accommodations, as required by Section 903.3 of the
California Fire Code and the California Building Code.
Section NQ112.9 Fire Extinguishers is added as follows:
NQ112.9 Fire Extinguishers. Portable fire extinguishers shall be provided
in accordance with Section 906.1 of the California Fire Code and the
California Building Code;
Section NQ112.10 Flammable or Combustible Liquids is added as

follows:

-PAGE 35 OF 76-



(0-2020-82)

NO112.10 F l‘ammz}b‘le or Corﬁbu‘stibie Liquids. The possession or storage
of any flammable of combustible liquids or gases shéll not be permitted
except for intact cigarette lighters. The use of any type of open flame
indoors is prohibited unless each separate use is approved by the Fire
Code Official.

(1) Section NQ112.11 Storage is added as follows:

NOQO112.11 Storage. Flammable materials, including the possessions of
occupants, usei's, and staff, shall not obstruct required aisle widths
between beds or other furnishings and shall not be stored in attics, under-
floor spaces, or within other concealed spaces of buildings or structures
with sleeping accommodations used for emergency housing.

(m)  Section NQ112.12 Fire Department Access is added as follows:
NQ112.12 Fire Department Access. Fire Department access to buildings
and premises useci for emergenéy housing shall be in compliance with
Section 503, Section 504, and Appendix D of the California Fire Code,

- and-approved by the Fire Code Official.

(n) Section NQ112.13 Water Supply is added as follows:

NO112.13 Water Supply. An approved fire protection water supply
complying with Section 507 of the California Fire Code, or as approved
by the Fire Code Official, shall be provided for each building or structure,

group of structures or premises used for emergency housing.

-PAGE 36 OF 76-



(0-2020-82)

§145.3806  Local Addition of Section N Q113 ‘%Eine'rgency Housing Alternatives and
Modifications™ to the California Building Code

(a) Section NQ113 Emefgency i;{ousing Alternatives and Modifications is
| " added pursuant to.Scction 145.0106 of the Land Development Code.
(b) Sectioﬁ NQI 13.1 Alternatives and Modifications is added as follows:
NO113.1 Alternatives and Modifications. Alternatives and/or
modifications that are reasonably equivalent to the requirements in
| Appendix NQ aﬁd this Division may be granted by the Building Official
and Fire Code Official for individuali buildings or structures used for
emergency housing.
§145.3905  Definitions
Excctpt as otherwise provided, for the purposes of this Division:
Au}omated External Deﬁbrillator or AED [No change in text.]
w&ww%
change of occupancy shall not be considered an alteration for purposes of this
: - .
§145.3910  New Construction and Alterations Requiring AEDs

(a) [No change in text.]

()  Priorto approval of final inspection, AEDs shall be placed in all existing

(1)  Thebuilding undergoing alteration was constructed prior to
January 1, 2017,
(2)  The accumulated value of the alterations within the building within

-PAGE 37 OF 76-



§145.4005

(0-2020-82)

(1 The alterations are within 2 public assembly occupancy use,
including :gg_djtgriums_gn_d__p:exfg@jgg arts and movie theaters.
()  The requirements in Section 145.3910(b) shall not apply to the following:
() Asencralacute care hospilal, acute psychiatric hospital skilled
nursing facility or special hospital licensed under Section 1250(a),
(b). (€}, . (£ of the California Health and Safety Code; and
(2)  Anexisting AED that is located within a common area of the
building described in subdivision (b), such as the main entry lobby
)(d) AEDs shall be conspicuously placed and readily accessible in the event of
an emergency. AEDs shall be mounted such that the top of the AED is no
more than five (5) feet above floor level.

Table 145-3910

= Occupancy Group Occupant Load

Group A “Assembly” 300
Group B “Business” 200
Group E “Educational” 200
Group F “Factory” 200

13 M 39 299
Group [ “Institutional” 200
Group M “Mercantile” 200
Group R “Residential™! 200

l [Nb change in text.]

2
Exeluding-parking-garages
Tier 11-Visitable Uﬁit Design Standards
(a) through (d) [No change in text.]
(e) At least one interior accessible route of travel shall be provided in

compliance with California Building Code Section H20-A-} 11]19A as

-PAGE 38 OF 76-



§146.0103

§146.0104

(0-2020-82)

!

may be amended. The interior route of travel shall connect an accessible

entrance to the following rooms located on the primary entry level:

(1) through (3) [No change in text.)

(f) through (i) [No change in text.]

Interpretation of the Electrical Regulations

(a)

(b)

The language used in this Article and in the 2846 2019 Califomia

~ Electrical Code which is made a part of this Article by reference, is

intended to convey the common and accepted meaning familiar to the
electrical industry.

[No change in text.]

Adoption of the California Electrical Code’

(a)

(b)

The 20+6 2019 California Electrical Code published by the California
Building Standards Commission (BSC), as amended by the Califormia
Department of Housing and CoMunity Development (HCD); the
Division of the State Architect-Access Compliance (DSA/AC); the State
Office of Statewide Planning and Development (OSHPD?3); and the State
Fire Marshal (SFM), is adopted by reference and made a part of this
Article as if fully set forth, except as otherwise provided in this Article.
The regulations se referenced are the standard for electrical installations
regulated by this Article. A copy of the 2046 2019 California Electrical
Code is on file in the office of the City Clerk as Document No.
00-20897-2

When reference is made to the California Electrical Code, it shall be the

2016 2019 California Electrical Code, California Code of Regulations

-PAGE 39 OF 76-



§146.0105

§146.0106

§146.0107

; (0-2020-82)

Title 24, Part 3, as published by the California Building Standards

Commission. -

"(¢) [No change in text.]

Portions of the California Electricai Code Not Adopted

The following Sections or Subsections of the 2046 2019 California Electrical

Code are not adopted by the City _of San Diego:

(a) Article 230, Services, Section 43 230,43, Wiring Methods for 660 1000
Volts, Nominal or L;ess, numbers (1) “Open Wiring on Insulators” and (7)
“Service-entrance Cables” are not adopted.

(b) (No change in text.]

Portions of the California Electrical Code Adopted With Modifications

The following Sections of the 2046 2019 California Electrical Code are adopted

by the City of San Diego with modifications:

of P\-Systems-on-Buildings: The 2019 California Electrical Code is adopted

Portions of the California Electrical Code Adopted With Additions

The following Sections of the 20+6 2019 California Electrical Code are adopted

by the City of San Diego with additions:

-PAGE 40 OF 76-



(0-2020-82)

-PAGE 41 OF 76-



(0-2020-82)

e
L

W ! I p! l.ﬁ Il - ~’J .1 ! ]0!. ‘I.' S !0 495.12 “p 3 | FG !l 9
£ the-Calif ia-Electrieal-Cod f

@)

S . ;gs'lgzg;ggg ‘Fl .Ge"g L. o El . l g l . ,l l .l
i L nodifenti Sections146.0106-and-146-0167
ofthe Land DevelopmentCode:

Residential-Cod | the California Building Code:

§147.0103  Adoption of the California Plunibing Code

(a)

(b)

Except as provided in Sections 147.0104 through 147.0108, the 2616 2019
California Plumbing Code, published by the California Bﬁilding Standards
Commission (BSC), and as amended by the California Department of
Housing and Community Development (HCD); the Division of the State
Architect-Access Compliance (DSA/AC); the State Office of Statewide
Health Planning and Development (OSHPD3); and the State Fire Marshal
(SFM); a copy of which is on file in the office of the City Clerk as

_, is adopted by reference.

Document O0O-20897-3____
When reference is made to the California Plumbing Code, it shall be the

2016 2019 California Plumbing Code, California Code of Regulations

-PAGE 42 OF 76-



§147.0104

§147.0105

- §147.0106

(0-2020-82)

Title 24, Part 5 as published by the California Building Standards
Commission. |
(c) [No change in text.]

Modifications to the California Plumbing Code Adopted by the City of
San Diego L

. The following Sections of the 2646 2019 California Plumbing Code are modified

by the City of San Diego:

(a) Chapter6;Seetion-609;Tastallation; Testing, Unionsand Loeation;
422.2.1 Single User Toilet Facility Jdentification,

(b) Chapter 11, Storm Drainage, Section +164-+ 1101,2. Where Required,
Primary-ReofDrainage; Section H64-54 1101.6.1 Discharge.

Additions to the California Plumbing Code Adopted by the City of San Diego

The following Sections or Subsections of the 2046 2019 California Plumbing
Code are added by the City of San Diego:
(a) [No change in text.]

&)
€e)(b) Chapter 12, Section 4208-73-1 1208.8.2.1 Gas Pressure Regulators,

Location.

Adoption of Appendices to California Plumbing Code

@  Thefollowi il the 2016 California Phimbine Cod

-PAGE 43 OF 76-



(0-2020-82)

&

(b) " The following Appendix Chapters of the 2046 2019 California Plumbing
Code not adopted by a State agency as identified in Land Development Code
Section 147.0103 and in the adoption matrices of the 2046 2019 California
Plumbing Code are not adopted by the City of San Diego:

(1) through (7) [No change in text.]

(8)  Appendix M — Peak Water Demand Calculator

California Plumbing Cod

(a)  Section 4222 of the California Plumbing Code is adopted with
modifications pursuant to Section 147.0104 of the Land Development

Code,

-PAGE 44 OF 76-



et

(0-2020-82)

For the purposes of Section 422.2:1, “single-user toilet facility” means a

he user.

§147.021311 Local Modifications and Additions to Section 1101 “General” Storm

§147.0212

§147.0405

Drainage Regulations of the California Plumbing Code

‘(a) through (c) [No change in text.]

Local additions to Section 1208.7 1208.8 “Gas Pressure Regulators” of the

California Plumbing Code

‘Section 1208-73-+ 1208.8.2.1 of the California Plumbing Code is medified added

as follows: 126873+ 1211&&_2_1 Appréired gas pressure regulators shall be
installed and used in locations approved by the Building Official.

Retrofit upon Bathreem Alteration

Sections 147.0304 and 147.0305 of the Additional Plumbing Regulations for
Water and Energy Conservation.

¢

-PAGE 45 OF 76-



(0-2020-82)

-§148.0103°  Adoption of the Califor:tfli'a' Mechanical Code

§148.0104

§148.0105

§148.0106

(a)

(®)

(c)

Except as provided in Land Déi/clopment Code Section 148.0104, the
2046 2019 California Mechanical Code, published by the California
Building Standards Commission (BSC); and as amended by the California
Department of Housing and Community Development (HCD), the
Division of the State Architect-Access Compliance (DSA/AC); the State
Ofﬁce of Statewide Health Planning and Development (OSHPD3); and
the State Fire Marshal (SFM); a copy of which is on file in the office of
the City Clerk as Document No. 00-208974_____ is adopted by
reference.

When reference is made to the California Mechanical Code, it shall be the
2016 2019 éalifomia Mechanical Code, California Code of Regulations
Title 24, Part 4 as published by the California Building Standards
Commission.

[No change in text.]

Portions of the California Mechanical Code Not Adopted

The following portions of the 2646 2019 California Mechanical Code are not

adopted:

Chapter 1 - Division II, Administration.

Modifications to the California Mechanical Code Adopted by the City of San

Diego

The 2046 2019 California Mechanical Code is adopted with no modifications.

Additions to the California Mechanical Code Adopted by the City of San

Diego

The 2046 2019 California Mechanical Code is adopted with no additions.

-PAGE 46 OF 76-



-§148.0107

§149.0103

S (0-2020-82)

Y LAY

Adoption of Appendices to California Mechanical Code
Appendix Chapters of the 2046 2019 California Mechanical Code are not
adopted.

Adoption of the California Residential Code

(a) .The 20646 2019 California Residential Code, published by the California
Building Standards Commission (BSC), and as amended by the State
Department of Housing and Community Development (HCD 1, HCD
1/AC) and the State Fire Marshal (SFM), is adopted by reference, except
as otherwise provided in this Article of the Land Development Code,
Divisions 2 through 45. A copy of the 2046 2019 California Residential
Code is on file in the office of the City Clerk as Document No.
00208975 _ .

(b) When reference is made to the California Residential Code, it shall be the
2046 2019 California Residential Code, California Code of Regﬁlations
Title 24, P"dl‘t 2.5, as published by the California Building Standards

- Commission.

{c) Each of the regulations, provisions, conditions, and terms of the 2046

2019 California Residential Céde is made a part of this Article as if fully
set forth in this Article except as otherwise provided in Divisions 2
through 45.

(A) Numbering of Sections and Subsections in Divisions 2 through 45 of this
Article is cross referenced to Sections in the 2646 2019 California
Residential Code.

(e) The adoption of the 2846 2019 California Residential Code shall in no

-PAGE 47 OF 76-



§149.0104.

§149.0105

(0-2020-82)

way limit: prohﬂ?l* i'g}'pede; oy_;grs:_'vent the City Council from adopting
ordinances lirr;iti'rlx'g‘ (')rj;)revéntin g the issuance ot any type, number, or
geographical diétribution of permits for construction or demolition of any
- ..facility for which a permit is required.
() - [No change in text.]

Portions of the California Residential Code Not Adopted by the City of San
Diego

The following Séctions or Subsections of the 2046 2019 California Residential
Code have not been adopted by the City of San Diego:
(a) through (b) [No change in text.]

Modifications to the California Residential Code Adopted by the City of San
Diego ' .

The following Sections or Subsections of the 2036 2019 California Residential

Code are modified by the City of San Diego:

¢)(a) Chapter 3, Section R301.2, Climatic anci Geographic Design Criteria,
Section R319.1, Address Numbers Jdentification; R322, Flood Resi;tant
Construction; SeetionR326-Swimming Poels-Spas-and-HetTubs;

- Section R324.4.2 Fire Classification; Section R324.5,2 Fire Classification,
Section R337.1.3.1, Application Date and Where required Required;
Section R337.2, Detinitions; Section R337.5.4, Roof Gutters and
Downspouts; Section R337.8, Exterior Windows and Doors.

te)(b) Chapter 9, Section 902.1.5, Roof Covering Materials;; Section R902.2.1,
Wood Shingles;; Section R902.2.2, Wood Shakes, Section R902.4,

Photovoltaic Panels and Roof Modules; Section li905.1.3, Roof Covering

-PAGE 48 OF 76-



§149.0106

(0-2020-82)

1

-Class A; R997-12 Section R908.1.2, Replacement Roof Covering, Class

A, Additions; R997-43-Section R908.1.3, Wood Shake, Shingles Reroof;
R9971-4 Section R908.1.4, Wood Shake, Shingles, Historical Buildings;

R997-1-5 Section R908,1.5, Reroofing Over Wood Roofs.

Additions to the California Residential Code Adopted by the City of San

Diego

The following Sections and Subsections are added to the 2046 2019 California

Residential Code by the City of San Diego:

(a)

o) .

[No change in text.]

Chapter 3, Section R309.4.1 Backup Power for Automatic Garage Door
Qpeners, Sectiqn R}20.2 Voluntary Accessibility program; Seetien
Swimming-Peel-Barrier; Section R329, Structural Tests and Special

Inspectioné; Section R332, Encroachments into the Public Right-of-Way;

Section R333, Safeguards During Construction; Seetion R33743;

. Exeeption-5; Section R337.1.3.1, Exception 2.3; Section R337.2, Local

Very High Fire Hazard Severity Zoné; Section R337.3.6.1, Alternative
Materials, Designs or Methods of Construction; Section R337.3.6.2,
Modifications; Section R337.5.4, Roof Gutters and Downspouts; Section
R337.5.5, Drip Edge i-‘lashing; Section R33748:2:2-1 R337.8.2.1.1, Vinyl

Windows; Section R337.11, Spark Arrester; Section 337-12-Glazing

Materials-in-Sleyhights; R341, Sound Transmission Control.

- -PAGE 49 OF 76-



§149.0107 .

§149.0108

(0-2020-82)

(¢) .Chapter 4, Secnon 49-1-5 m;, Geotechmcal Investigations; Section
R401.6, Geotechnical Reports; Section R401.7, Notice of Geologic
Hazards.

(d) [No change in teXt.] )

Adoption of Appendices to the California Residential Code

The following Appendix Chapters of the 2016 2019 California Residential Code

are adopted by the City of San Diego: |

(a) Appendix Chapter H, Patio Cover.s.

()  Appendix Chapter O, Tiny Houses.

)(c) Appendix Chapter S, Straw Bale Construction.

(d)  Appendix V, Swimming Pool Safety Act,

Applicability of the California Building Code to Existing Buildings and
Structures Regulated by the California Résidential Code

(a) The legal occupancy of any building or structure existing on the date of
adoption of the 2646 2019 California Residential Code shall be permitted
to continue without change, except as is specifically regulated by Chapters
3,4, and 4-5 of the 2046 2019 California Existing Building Code, the
California Fire Code, or as is deemed necessary by the Building Official
for the general safety and welfare of the occupants and the public.

b) [No change in text.]

(c) Buildings and structures, and parts thereof, shall be maintained in a safe
and sanitary condition. Devices or safeguards which are required by the
2016 2019 California Building Code shall be maintained in conformance

with the code edition under which installed. The owner shall be

-PAGE 50 OF 76-



Lud

§149.0201

(0-2020-82)

responsible for the. maintenance of buildings and structures. To determine

UM it

-l -

compliance with this Subseﬁﬁon, iiz‘e Building Official shall have the
authority to require a building or structure to be re-inspected. The
requirements of the Building Regulations shall not provide the basis for
removal or abrogation of fire protection and safety systems and devices in
existing building or structures. -

Local Additions to Chapter 2 “Definitions” of the California Residential
Code

¢a)  Chapter 2 of the California Residential Code is adopted by reference with
additiens without change pursuant to Section 149.0103-and-1+49-0106 of

the Land Development Code.

+H5-04 %MW"M‘W > i icipal-C %

(‘e) S . RQQQ] l ’ l .1 ;i.. S .
] |Q.Q]Q§ F] S E. ;l .. ] g 1 .

l IFI i.ﬁ I. o s I3 ' b2l

-PAGE 51 OF 76-



§149.0301

§149.0302

(0-2020-82)

Code LIVE WORKUNIT A it inshicl ot thounitisused
; » o andcubi e dimitast

33 7 4

ol Live/Work G sefined-and-rerulatod-in St

-
0 0

Local Additions to Chapter 3 “Building Planning” of the California
Residential Code

(@
(b)

[No.change in text.)

Sections R36+ R302 through R308, R310 through R318, R321, R324
through R325:R334 R325 through R336, and R338 through R340 are
adopted by reference without change pursuantto Section

-145:0103149.0103 of the Land Development Code.

Local Modifications and Additions to Section R301.2 “Climaticand
Geographic Design Criteria”

(@)
®)

()’

[No chanée n text.]
Section R301.2 is adopted with modifications as follows. Buildings shall
be constructed in accordance with the provisions of the California
Residential Code as limited by the provisions of Section R301. Additional
criteriaare outlined in Table 149.0302 of the Land Development Code.
[No change in text.]

Table 149.0302

[No change in text.]

-PAGE 52 OF 76-



2

§149.0309

§149.0319

(0-2020-82)

LMMManGmwaM%

Land Development Code. Section R309.4. | is added as follows: R309.4.1,

Backup power for automatic garage door openers. Where residential garages are
equipped with automatic garage door openers, the residential automatic garage
door opener shall include a battery backup function thatis designed to operate in a
manner 5o that the automatic garage door opener is operational without
interruption during an electrical outage,

Local Modifications to Section R319.1 “Address-numbers Identification” of
the California Residential Code

Section R319.1 of the California Residential Code Building-Cede is adopted as
amended in San Diego Municipal Code Section 95.0209 for building addressing
requirements for the City of San Diego.

Local Modifications and -Additions to Section R324 “Solar Energy Systems”
of the California Residential Code

(a)  Section R324.4.2 is modified as follows pursuant to Section 149.0105 of
e - e _._R_&Z 4 . . . ' :
mounted photovoltaic panel systems shall have the same fire classification
required in Section 149.0902(a).
(h)  Section R324.5.2 is modified as follows pursuaat to Section 149.0105 of
the Land Development Code: R324.5.2, Fire classification. Building-
L&@AM@&M&MMLM%M

-PAGE 53 OF 76-



(0-2020-82)

- and%d&ﬁea&m-to Seeﬁen—lB%—Smmmg-Poels—Spm
and-Hot-Tubs?-to-the-California Residential Code ’

)
®
\7)
| ! . irmi LA ’ wimmi |
means-any-strueture-intended-forswimming-orreereational-bathing-that
{é)
©

-PAGE 54 OF 76-



§149.0337

&)

(0-2020-82)

peﬁable—ﬂmh-mn&eade&fer—meemefa&useﬁs—a-swmmmg-peel

4 .., .

by-net—mere—&haa—&ﬁeeewaef-famihes-aﬁé%heﬂ—gue%

Local Additions and Modifications to Section R337 “Materials and Methods
for Exterior Wildfire Exposure” of the California Residential Code

(a)

)b

()

[No change in text.]

Section R337.2 is adopted by reference with modifications and additions

pursuant to Sections 149.0105 and 149.0106 of the Land Development

- Code as follows: Local Agency Very High Fire Hazard Severity Zones

shall mean the Very High Fire Hazard Severity Zones as designated on the
Very High Fire Hazard Severity Zone Map — Local Responsibility Areas
adopted pursuant to.Section 55.9401 of thé Land Development Code.
Section R337.3.6 is adopted with additions pursuant to Section 149.0106
of the Land Development Code. Sections R337.6.1 and R337.3.6.2 are
added as follows:

M R337.3.6.1, Alternative Materials, Designs or Methods of

. Construction. The Building Official may approve the use of

-PAGE 55 OF 76-



(2)

(0-2020-82)

aitematiize‘ materials.,' des1 gn's or methods of construction pursuant
to Secfio,n 12'9.6109 of i];e Land Development Code.

R337.3.6.2, Modifications. The Building Official may modify the
provisions of Section ﬁ337 of the California Residential Code for
site specific conditions in accordance with Section 129.0104(a)(5)
olf the Land Development Code. When required by the Building
Official, a fire protection plan shall be submitted in accordance

with the California Fire Code, ehapter-Chapter 49.

(e)(d) Section R337.5is adopted with modifications and additions pursuant to

RT5)

Sections 149.0105 and 149.0106 of the Land Development Code:

(M

@

Section R337.5.4 is modified as follows: R337.5.4, reef Roof
Gutters; and Downspouts. Roof gutters shall be constructed to
prevént the accumulation of leaves and debris in the gutter. All
roof gutters and downspout's shall be constructed of
noncombustible materials.

Section R3é7.5.5 is added as félléws: R337.5.5, Drip Edge
Flasﬁing. When drip edge flashing is used at the free edges of

~

roofing materials, it shall be non-combustible.

Section R337.8 is adopted with modifications and additions pursuant to

Sections 149.0105 and 149.0106 of the Land Development Code. Section

R337.8.2.1 is added as follows: R337.8.2.1.1, Glazing frames made of

vinyl materials shall have welded comers, metal reinforcement in the

interlock area, and be certified to the most current edition of

ANSIVAAMA/NWWDA 101/1.S.2 structural requirements.

-PAGE 56 OF 76-



§149.0902

(0-2020-82)

() Section R387,};1:is‘ggci¢d pursuait to Section 149.0106 of the Land
- Devclopment C.ode as foliows: R337.11, Spark Arrester. All structures
having any chimney, flue, or stovepipe shall be equipped with an
approved spark arrester if the chimney, flue, or stovepipe is attached to

any fireplace, stove, barbecue, or other.solid or liquid fuel burning

equipment or device.

Local Additions and Modifications to Section R902.1 “Roof Classification” of
the California Residential Code

(a) through (c) [No éhange in text.]

(d) Section R902.4 is adopted by reference and modified as follows: R902.4
Reof-tep Rooftop mounted solar photovoltaic panels and modules. Roof-
top mounted photovoltaic panels and modules installed on or above the
roof coveringshall be tested, listed and identified with a fire classification
in accordance with UL 1703 and UL 2703. Class A, B or C photovoltaic
panels systems and modules shall be installed in areas designated by
Section R902 of the California 'Residential Code, in jurisdictions
designated by law as requiring their use or where the edge ofthe roof is

. less than 3 feet (914 mm) from a lot line. When located in the Very High

-PAGE 57 OF 76-



(0-2020-82)

Fire Hazard Seyerity Zone Map — Local Responsibility Areasadopted

_pursuant to Section 55.9401 of the San Diego Municipal Code, roof-top

-mounted photovoltaic panels and modules shali have a minimum fire

classification rating of Class A.

§1410.0103 ° Adoption of the California Green Building StandardsCode

(@)

- (b)

(©)

(d

(¢)

The 2046 LZ_Q_I_Q' California Green Building Standards Code, published by
the California Building Standards Commission (BSC), and as amended by
the State Department of Housing and Community Development (HCD), is
adopted by reference except as otherwise provided in this Article. A copy
of the 2616 2019 California Green.Building Standards Code is on file in
the officeof the City Clerk as Document No. OO-208976

When reference is made to the California Green Building Standards Code,
it shall be the 28+6 2019 California Green Building Standards Code,
California Code of Regulations Title 24, Part 11, as published by the
California Building Standards Commission.

Each of the 'regulétions, provisions, conditions, and terms of the 2846
2019 California Green Building Standards Code is made a part of this
Article as if fully set forth in this Article.

Numbering of Sections and Subsections in this Article is cross referenced
to Sections in the 2846-2019 California Green Building Standards Code.
The adoption of the 2646 2019 California Green Building Standards Code
shall in no way limit, prohibit, ‘impede, or prevent the City Council from
adopting ordinances limiting or preventing the issuance of any type,

number, or geographical distribution of permits for construction or

-PAGE 58 OF 76-



(0-2020-82)

T

demolition of any facility for ?}_"hi;tha perrﬁit is required.
(f) [No change,in: text.j
§1410.0107 . Adoption of Appendices to the California Green Building Standards Code
Appendix Chapters to the 26+6 2019 Calitornia Greén Building Standards Code
are adopted as follows: The Residential Voluntary measures of the California
Green Building Standards Code, Appendix Chapter A4, Residential Voluntary
Measures, Section A4.305.1 "‘Graywater.”

§1410.0403 Local Modifications to Section A4.305 “Water Reuse Systems” of the
California Green Building Standards Code

(a) [No change in text.]

b) . .4 Section A4.305.1 is adopted with the following modifications. All new
;'esidential buildings that are within the scope of the California Residential
Code shall be construéted tt; include Wwaste piping to discharge gray water
from clothes washers to a piace where it may.be used for outdoor
irrigation, in compliance with Section 562 1503 of the California
Plumbing Code.

§1411.0103 Adoption of the California Existing Building Code

(a) The 2646 M California EXisting Building Code, published by the
California Building Standards Commission (BSC), as amended by the
State Department of Housing and Community Development (HCD 1,
HCD 1/AC) and the State Fire Marshal (SFM), is adopted by reference,
except as otherwise provi;led in this Article of the Land Development

Code, Divisions 2 through 4-3 and Divisions 17 and 18. A copy of the

-PAGE 59 OF 76-



-(b)

O

)

(e)

®

(0-2020-82)

N

- 2046-2019 Cali\forni’a»ﬁxisting‘-Buil‘d‘ing Code is on file in the office of the

City Clerk as Document No. O0-20897-7 .

When reference is made to the California Existing Building Code, it shall

be the 2616 2019 California Existing Building Code, California Code of

Regulations Title 24, Part 10, as i)ublished by the California Building
Standards Commission. . .

Each of the regulations, provisions, conditions, and terms of the 2046

2019 California Existing Building Code is made a part of this Article as if

fully set forth in this Article except as otherwise provided in Divisions 2
through 4-5 and Divisiong 17 and 18.

The numbering of Sections and Subsections in Divisions 2 through 4-3 and

Divisiong 17 M of this Article is cross-referenced to Sections in the
20146 2019 California Existing Building Code.

AThe adoption of the 2646 2019 California Existing Building Code shall in

no way liﬁit, prohibit, impede, or prevent the City Council from adopting

ordinances limiting or preventing the issuance of any type, number, or

gebgfaphical distribution of permits for construction or demolition of any

facility for which a permit is required.

The Building Official is only authorized to enforce amendments to the

2846 2019 California Existing Building Code made by the following State

agencies:

(1) through (3) [No change in text.]

-PAGE 60 OF 76-



(0-2020-82)

’ {

§1411.0104  Portions of the California hxustmg Bmldmg Code Not Adopted by the City of
San Diego

§1411.0105

The following Sections or Subsections ofthe 2946 2019 California Existing

Building Code have not been adoptcd by the C 1ty of San Diego:

(a) [No change in text ]

(b)  Chapter 3, See&e&%@l—-l—Exeepﬂeﬂ+ Section 30442 3013.2 Work
Area. Compliance Method; Section 364+-1-3 301.3.3 Performance
Compliance Method. |

(c) Chapters 56 through M@ 15.

Modifications to the California Exnstmg Bmldmg Code Adopted by the City

of San Diego

The following Sections or Subsections of-the 2646 2019 California Existing

Building Code are modified by the City of San Diego:

(a)

(b)

(o

()

[No change in text.]
Chapter 3, Section 301.1, General; Section 301.3, Alteration, Addition or
Change of Qccupancy, including the exception; Section 302:3 302.4,

Existing Materials.

Chapter 4, Section-404-1Repairs—Generak: Section 4013, Repairs, Flood

Hazard Areas.

Chapter 5, Section 462:2 502.3, Flood Hazard Areas; Section 4832 503.2,

Flood Hazard Areas; Section 4845 405.2.5, Flood Hazard Areas.

t¢d(e) Appendix, Chapter Al, Section A102.1, Scope, General.

-PAGE 61 OF 76-



§1411.0106

(0-2020-82)

i

Additions to the California Existing Building Code Adopted by the City of
San Diego . '

The following Sections and Subsections are added to the 2646 2019 California

. Existing Building-Code by the City of San Diego:

(@) [No change in text.]

)] 1 ; j i Secti .8 dat

§1411.0107

§1411.0301

Adoption of Appendices to the California Existing Building Code

The following Appendix Chapters of the 2046 2019 California Existing Building
Code are adapted by the City of San Diego:

(a) through (c) [No change in text.]

Local Modifications and Additions to Chapter 3 “Provisions for All
Compliance Methods” of the California Existing Building Code

(a) Chapter 3 of the 2046 California Existing Building Code is adopted by
reference with modifications and additions pursuant to Sections 1411.0105
and 1411.0106 of the Land Development Code.

(b)  Section 301.43, including the exception, + of the California Existing
Building Code, is adopted by reference with modifications pursuant to

Section 1411.0105 of the Land Development Code.

-PAGE 62 OF 76-



(0-2020-82)

Sé(;;i;)q 3\0.‘14.-};';?'55 modified as follows: 301.4 3, General—The
repairraAlicration, addition or change of occupancys, The
alteration, addition or change of occupancy feleeaaen of all

| existing buildings shall comply with Section 301.43.1. Where-the -
Colifornia Existing Building Cod . desation ofthe

| seismicf - ¢ istine buildi bi

The exception.to Section 301.3 is modified es follows: Excepfion;
S_gbj:ggugihgagggoxaLQmMgg.gf_ﬁgmlgﬂMQE
complying with the laws in existence at the time the building or the
affected portion of the building was built are in compliance with
the provisj 'Qnmfmg_qmnt_califqmtaﬁxisimg' Building Code,
New structural members added as part of the alteration shall

ly with the California Existing Building Code. Thi .

shall not apply to an alteration that constitutes a substantial
improvement to an existing building in a flood hazard area, which
Devclopmens Code. This exception shall not apply to the structural

provisions of Chapter S of the California Existing Building Code.

-PAGE 63 OF 76-



(0-2020-82)

§1411.0302 Local Modifications. and Deletions-Additions to Section 302 “General
Provisions” ofthe California Existing Building Code

' (@)

(b)

Section 3623 302 of the California Existing Building Code is adopted by

 reference with modifications and additions pursuant to Sectiong 1411.0105

and 1411.0106 of the Land Development Code.

| Section 302:3 302.4 is modified as follows: 362:3 3024, Existing

matérials. Materials already in use in a building or structure in comphance
with reduirements or approval§ in eﬂ';eét at the time of their erection or
installation shall be pelir-mitted to remain in use unless determined by the
Building Official to be unsafe pursuant to Section 121.0404 of the Land

Developmenthdc.

' ieQMJﬂudmm.@le.mAM@@nggm

W&M&meamwfe_md_m&m
condition, Devices or safeguards that are required by the Buildine,
Elecfrical, Plumbing, Mechanical, Residential, Green Building and

E. . E‘.!!- ls l . E] [ !Q. l Q ! l.!l!
maintained in conformance with the edition of the California Building

Standards Code (California Code of Regulations Title 24) under which the
devices or ere installed, The owner shall be responsible for
with this Section 302.7, the Building Official shall have the authority to
reinspecta building or structure. The requirements of the Existing

g l! Ee ] . 4 vi e_th@_ha_s E V! ! ..

-PAGE 64 OF 76-



()

(0-2020-82)

of fire roteciion dnd Safety systems and devices n existing buildings of
structures,

Section 302.8 is added as follows: 302,8, Mandatory resulations for wall
MM&-LM&&L_D_M@MSMAM@
buildings. The provisions of Section 302.8 shall apply to buildings that

| were constructed or that were under constructionbefore March 24,1939

or for which a Building Permit was issued before March 24, 1939, and to
Citv-owned buildings designated pursuant to a City Council resolution,
which on January 1, 1994, had at least one unreinforced masonry bearing

(1) Anydetached single o two-family dwelling unit and detached
apatment houses containing five o fewer units used. solelyfor
mgggciés.lhis&_xgmpﬁgn_dosg not apply to buildings or

structures containing mixed or nonresidential occupancies,

(2)  Buildings that have been completely seismically retrofitted, as
determined by the Building Official, to comply with earlier

Section 302.8.1 is added as follows: 302.8.1, Applicability. The
Legg1@@5iﬁ§ﬁi@@_&&4ﬂﬂb;@%@ﬂdimwmqtuxmh&a.r_e
within the scope of Section 302.8, that are not classified as Essential or
H.aza@s.ﬁadiﬁg,gg_dﬂ&mn@jp any parapets and other external

-PAGE 65 OF 76-



e

(0-2020-82)

h&atmmﬁmwgieimtlxcmwm g the exterior

facade of a building or strucfure that meet both of the following criteria.

(1) Critical Placeme m_;m______ﬁww

any other external hazards have the potential to give way internally
-or-onto Jower adiacent buildings (with a minimum height

differential 0£ ¢ feet) or property, or.onto an adjacent exit or public
-~ exterior wall or roof appendages that extend above the lower of
either the level of the ¢ adj mmmmmm_m@

roof sheathing do not meet { uirements of Section A113 of the
California Existing Building Code.
Section 302.8.2 is added as follows: 302.8.2, Compliance period. The

: wwmwmm@awwﬁq
- the date of service of an order to comply, provide partial seismic

building elements that meet both of the criteria in Section 302.8.1,

Section 302.8.3 is added as follows: 302.8.3, Removal, Stabilization and

perimeter of the entire building as part of the removal, stabilization, and

bracing process, Existing roof to wall anchors must meet, or shall be

upgraded to meet, the mini equirements of Section A113.1 of the

California Existing Building Code, or new anchors meeting the minimum
e ecti all be installed,

-PAGE 66 OF 76-



(0-2020-82)

Section 302.8.4:is adde us follows; 302,84, Historical Buidings. 1 the
MQMS@.&Q&LBQQM@,@&@H&MAR comply. with the
requirements ofthe California Histori cal Building Code and paapet

- removal shall not ggu.s_cg.gs;amguts_xgmgm_;mmazﬂi

§1411.0401 - Local Modifications and-Additions to Chapter 4 “Preseriptive-C janee
Methed Repairs” of the California Existing Building Codc

@

()

Chapter 4 of the California Existing Building Code is adopted by
reference with modifications and-additiens pursuant to Sections 1411.0105
aﬁd—l-4-l—l—9+96 of the Land Development Code. .

. . 1 . ffec-t—é[ ] . g ] . .
installation-shall-be-permitted-te-remain-in-use-unless-determined-by-the

Develepment Code: Section 401.3 is modified pursuant to Section
1411.0105 of the Land Development Code as follows: 401.3, Flood hazard
ars:a&.lnﬂmd_hggui.méag.zth: he owner shall comply with Section
145.1612 or Section 149.0322 of the Land Development Code, as
analicable, when making repaics thet constitute substantial improverent,
Development-Code:

-PAGE 67 OF 76-



(0-2020-82)

-PAGE 68 OF 76-



(0-2020-82)

etached i) oo g ; .

1 -l ;0 ﬁ . l . -:H . l
] ] v.] i. »- .« . . ed..el:
‘ .] . ] . .

-PAGE 69 OF 76-



4

B

Building-Ceode-

-PAGE 70 OF 76-

(0-2020-82)




1

(0-2020-82)

LI

. l*. . ]

1=
A

Building the installation-shall Iwith irerm £the

. California Historical BuildineCod l |

§1411.0402 LoealModifieations to-Seetion 402 “Additions? of the California Existing
BuildineCod

@) Section 4022 of the California Existing Building Code is-adopted by
. a&s&ng%efw—s%mﬁ—c&nplyw%he—ﬂm*#desig&;eq&kemeﬁs—femew

-PAGE 71 OF 76-



(0-2020-82)

he-existi oshall o with the food desi . ;
+4§464-2-er—8eeﬁea449:0322—e¥ﬂae-&t;ad—9evelepmeﬂt—eeée;as
C the existi eauised L with-theflood-desi

-PAGE 72 OF 76-



-

(0-2020-82)

wpwaad—sh&knet—b&subgee%&e—daefeqwemeﬁts&mkefmqﬂ

GhWeﬁhe—G&h&mm—E*w&ag—Buﬂdmg—Gede-&euﬂaem&m&emme

fequﬁemef%sﬂfﬁaeeeféaﬂeewah-sm%%%&eﬁhe-&md

Develepment—@ede—aaé-ab&temen&e@wea;due—te—nemaal—semee

-PAGE 73 OF 76-



T (0-2020-82)
§1411,0405 Local Modificati (0. Secti 105 “Sr I of the California Existi
(@)  Section405 of she California isting Building Code jis adopted by
(b) ‘S_c_c;igg 405.2.5, Repair, is adopt gdﬂ&m@jﬁmmm
" Flood hazard aceas, In flood hazard areas, buildings that have sustained
1451612 or Section 149.0322 of the Land Development Code, as
| ‘(‘ilampter 14: General R;egulations
Amcle 11: Exlstmg Bulldmg Regulanons

Dmmmummmmmwmm_&u;mm@mm_mg

modifications and additions pu rsuant to Section 1411,0105 and 14110106 of the

Land De
§1411.050 Local Modifications to Section 502 “Adkditions” af he Callfornia Exla

reference with modifications pursuant to Section 1411.0105 of the Land
Development Code,
()  Section 502.3 is modified as follows: 502.3, Flood hazard areas. For

-PAGE 74 OF 76-



= §1411.0503

i

- {a)

(0-2020-82)

1451612 or Seefion 149.0322 of the Land Development Code, as

apolicable. any addition that constitutes substantial improvement of the
existing structure shall comply with the flood design requirements for new
compliance with the requirements for new construction for flood design,
For buildines and structures in flood hazard areas established in Section

145.1612 or Section 149,0322 of the Land Development Code, as

applicable, any additions that do not constitute substantial improvement of
the existing structure are pot required to comply with the flood design

requirements for new construction.

BuildingCode -~
 Section 503 of the Califoria Existing Building Code is adopted by
reference with modifications pursuant to Section 1411.,0105 of the Land
Development Code. |
(b)  Section 503.2 is modified as follows: 503.2, Flood hazard areas, For

buildings and structures in flood hazard areas established in Section
145.1612 or Section 149.0322 of the Land Development Code, as
applicable, any alteration that constitutes substantial improvement of the
M§QM%MM&&M
construction, and all aspects of the existing siructure shall be brought into
compliance with the requirements for new construction for flood design.
145.1612 or Section 1490322 of the Land Development Code, as

-PAGE 75 OF 76-



(0-2020-82)

applicable, any alterations that-do not constitute substantial improvement
.of the existing strucnure are not required to comply with the flood design
NJB:als -
02/10/2020
- Or.Dept:DSD -

Doc. No.: 2215938 5

-PAGE 76 OF 76-



Passed by the Council of The City of San Diego on __. -APR 07 2020 , by the following vote:

Councilmembers Yeas ‘ Nays Not Present  Recused
Barbara Bry
Jennifer Campbell
Chris Ward
Monica Montgomery
Mark Kersey
Chris Cate
Scott Sherman

Vivian Moreno

NNONNNERN
o o o o e e
EDQDDQDDD
o o e o s o

Georgette Gomez

Date of final passage APR 09 2020

KEVIN L. FAULCONER
AUTHENTICATED BY: ‘ Mayor of The City of San Diego, California.

: ELIZABETH S. MALAND
(Seal) ' City Clerk of The City of San Diego, California.

By W Deputy
- J’%ﬂcy 7

" | HEREBY CERTIFY that the foregoing ordinance was not finally passed until twelve calendar
days had elapsed between the day of its introduction and the day of its final passage, to wit, on

MAR102020 ,and on APR 09 2020

| FURTHER CERTIFY that said ordinance was read in full prior to passage or that such
reading was dispensed with by a vote of five members of the Council, and that a written copy of
the ordinance was made available to each member of the Council and the public prior to the day
of its passage. ‘

ELIZABETH S. MALAND
(Seal) : City Clerk of The City of San Diego, California.

Office of the City Cvlerk, San Diego, California

Ordinance Number O- 21181




