The City of

SAN DIEGQO)

Code Change Report

# 10 TAC

Amendments to - 2016 California Existing Building
Code

Proposed Existing Building Regulations

The City of San Diego proposes to adopt the 2016 California Existing Building Code (CEBC) with local
amendments codified in chapter 14 in a new Article 11 “Existing Building Regulations”. The proposed
amendments are necessary due to local geological conditions and necessary for consistent code application
as amended:

Issue 1. Update Section 121.0403 for consistency with the IEBC definition for Dangerous Buildings
and re-title the Section “Criteria for Determining That a Structure Is Dangerous”. Also clarify that
an official designated by the City Manager (will be changed to Mayor by City Attorney code wide)
will make the determination that a building is dangerous or unsafe. ( Revised 9-16-16)
Update Sections 121.0308, 129.0104, 129.0105, 129.0109, 129.0110 and 129.011(d) to reference the
Existing Building Regulations. See 2016 Construction Permit Procedures updates.
Modify Section 129.0203 (a) 17 exemption from a building permit for the replacement of roof
coverings to not exempt URM buildings for consistency with IEBC Section 403.5 requiring wall
bracing. See administrative amendments.
Issue 2. Create Article 11 “Existing Building Regulations” and model after format of Article 5
“Building Regulations”. Also do not adopt Sections 403.4.1 and 407.4.1 and adopt Appendix Ch A4.
(Revised 9-22-16)
Issue 3. Modify IEBC definition of Code Official to mean Building Official for consistency with
Section 8129.0104 (a). Also the definitions of Dangerous and Unsafe are aligned with the LDC.
Issue 4. Modify Section 301.1 for consistency with the California Building Standards Commission
decision to not publish IEBC chapters beyond Ch. 4. (added 9-22-16)
Issue 5. Add Section 401.6 to adopt regulations from section 3401.2 of the 2013 CBC that requires
buildings to be maintained. (added 5-4-17)
Issue 6. Modify IEBC Section 404.1 to reference LDC Section 129.0203 since City does not adopt
permit exemption list in CEBC Ch. 1.
Issue 7: Modify the flood hazard area regulations in Section 402.2, 403.2, 404.5 to reference
Building Regulation Section 145.1612 and Residential Building Regulations Section 149.0322 of the
Land Development Code; these Sections reference LDC floor Sections 143.0146 and 143.0145.
Issue 8. Relocate Division 37 in Ch 14 Article 5 to new Article 11 Division 17 and re-title to
"Regulations for the Seismic Strengthening of Unreinforced Masonry Bearing Wall Buildings” and
repeal existing regulations with the exception of the definition for URM and grandfathering prior
retrofits. The renaming is more reflective of the subject and update for consistency with CEBC Ch.
4,



[2016 Code Updates to - Existing Building Regulations]

[June 8, 2017]

For questions or comments regarding the proposed amendments please contact Ali Fattah, Senior Research
Engineer, at 619-446-5092 and via e-mail at afattah@sandiego.gov. The Land Development Code
encompasses chapters 11 through 15 of the San Diego Municipal Code and can be found at
www.sandiego.gov.

Page 2



mailto:afattah@sandiego.gov
http://www.sandiego.gov/

[Updates to - 2016 Existing Building Regulations]
[June 8, 2017]

The proposed amendment to Chapter 14 of the Land Development Code (LDC) adds Article 11
necessary to adopt and amend the 2016 California Existing Building Code (CEBC) for consistency
with existing regulations. Chapter 11 and 12 are updated to reference the Existing Building
Regulations.

1. Issue 1: DETERMINATION WHEN A BUILDING IS UNSAFE OR DANGEROUS (Revised
9-16-16)

Modify Section 121.0403 of the LDC to incorporate criteria contained in the CEBC
defined term Dangerous as well as substantial structural damage.

Text as it would appear in the Land Development Code

§121.0403 Criteria for Determining That a Structure Is Unsafe-Dangerous

The City Manager or designated Code-Enforcement Official may
determine that a structure is unsafe dangerous if any of the following

conditions exists to the extent that it threatens the life, health, safety,

or property efits-occupants-where one or more of the following
apply:

(a) The building contains-one-ormore structuralcomponents that

CodeThe building or structure has collapsed, has partially

collapsed, has moved off its foundation, or lacks the necessary

support of the ground; or

(b) The building contains-one-ormore structuralcomponentsof
hel T . I it g
o . I ke f . b gl

Page 3



[2016 Code Updates to - Existing Building Regulations]
[June 8, 2017]

i liti f the California Building Code: or There

exists a significant risk of collapse, detachment or

dislodgement of any portion, member, appurtenance or

ornamentation of the building or structure under service loads.

§121.0404 Criteria for Determining That a Structure Is Dangerous-Unsafe

The City Manager or designated Code-Enforcement Official may

determine that a structure is dangerous unsafe if any of the following
conditions exists to the extent that it threatens the health, safety, or

property of its occupants or the public:
Remainder of Section no change.

Text as it would appear in CEBC

302.3 Existing materials. Materials already in use in a building in compliance with
requirements or approvals in effect at the time of their erection or installation shall
be permitted to remain in use unless determined by the building official to be
unsafe per Section 121.0404 of the Land Development Code.

401.2.1 Existing materials. Materials already in use in a building in compliance with
requirements or approvals in effect at the time of their erection or installation shall
be permitted to remain in use unless determined by the building official to be
unsafe per Section 345 121.0404 of the Land Development Code.

Text as it would appear in the Land Development Code

Article 11: Existing Building Regulations

Page 4



[2016 Code Updates to - Existing Building Regulations]
[June 8, 2017]

Division 3: Additions and Modifications to Chapter 3 of the

California Existing Building Code

§1411.0301 Local Modifications and Additions to Chapter 3 “Provisions for All

Compliance Methods” of the California Existing Building Code

(@) Chapter 3 of the 2016 California Existing Building Code is

adopted by reference with modifications pursuant to Section

1411.0105 and additions pursuant to Section 1411.0106 of the

Land Development Code.

8§1411.0302 Local Modifications and Deletions to Section 302 “General

Provisions” of the California Existing Building Code

(a) 302.3 Existing materials. Materials already in use in a building

in compliance with requirements or approvals in effect at the

time of their erection or installation shall be permitted to

remain in use unless determined by the building official to be

unsafe per Section 121.0404 of the Land Development Code

Article 11: Building Regulations

Division 4: Additions and Modifications to Chapter 4 of the

California Existing Building Code

8§1411.0401 Local Modifications and Additions to Chapter 4 “Prescriptive

Compliance Method” of the California Existing Building Code

(a) Chapter 4 of the 2016 California Existing Building Code is

adopted by reference with modifications pursuant to Section

Page 5



[2016 Code Updates to - Existing Building Regulations]
[June 8, 2017]

1411.0105 and additions pursuant to Section 1411.0106 of the

Land Development Code.

8§1411.0402 Local Modifications to Section 401 “General” of the California

Existing Building Code

(a) Section 401.2.1.5 Existing Materials is modified pursuant to

Section 1411.0105 of the Land Development Code as follows:

401.2.1 Existing materials. Materials already in use in a building

in compliance with requirements or approvals in effect at the

time of their erection or installation shall be permitted to

remain in use unless determined by the building official to be

unsafe per Section 121.0404 of the Land Development Code.

Reason: Section 121.0403 and Section 121.0404 of the Land Development Code is
being updated to be current with the CEBC. The regulations were initially
developed as amendments to the 1973 UBC that differentiated buildings
constructed prior to and after 1951. Buildings constructed prior to 1951
used the 1949 UBC vertical and lateral loads as a basis of the evaluation.
Upon adoption of the 1988 UBC the distinction no longer appears in the
regulations.

Section 302.3 and 401.2.1 are being modified to reference the definition
for unsafe in the land Development Code.

Page 6



[2016 Code Updates to - Existing Building Regulations]

[June 8, 2017]

2. Issue 2: ADD ARTICLE 11 TO CHAPTER 14 OF LAND DEVELOPMENT CODE (Revised 9-

11-15-16)

Text as it would appear in the Land Development Code

Article 11: Existing Building Regulations

Division 1: Adoption and Applicability of the Existing Building Regulations

§1411.0101 Purpose of the Existing Building Regulations

(@)

(b)

The purpose of the Existing Building Regulations is to

establish minimum standards to safeguard life and limb,

health, property and public welfare and to satisfy the

purpose of the California Existing Code as provided in

Section 1.1.2 of the California Existing Building Code.

The purpose of this Section is not to create or otherwise

establish or designate any particular class or group of

persons who will or should be especially protected or

benefited by the terms of this Section.

§1411.0102 When the Existing Building Regulations Apply

(@)

This article shall be known as the Existing Building

Regulations of the City of San Diego and regulates the

alteration, repair, maintenance, moving, removal, change of

occupancy, and use of any privately owned building or

structure or any appurtenances connected or attached to

such building or structure within the City of San Diego,

except work located primarily in a public right-of-way,

Page 7



[2016 Code Updates to - Existing Building Regulations]

(b)

[June 8, 2017]

public utility towers and poles, mechanical equipment not

specifically regulated in the California Existing Building

Code, and hydraulic flood control structures. The Existing

Building Regulations shall also apply to City-owned

buildings and structures.

Where in any specific case, different Sections of the Existing

Building Regulations specify different materials, methods of

construction, or other requirements, the most restrictive

shall govern. Where there is a conflict between a general

requirement and a specific requirement, the specific

requirement shall apply.

8§1411.0103 Adoption of the 2016 California Existing Building Code

(@)

(b)

The 2016 California Existing Building Code, published and

amended by the State Department of Housing and Community

Development [HCD 1, HCD 1/AC]; and the State Fire Marshal

[SFM] is adopted by reference, except as otherwise provided in

this Article of the San Diego Municipal Code, Divisions 2

through 4 and Division 11. A copy of the 2016 California

Existing Building Code is on file in the office of the City Clerk as

Document No. OO-XXXXX-X

When reference is made to the California Existing Building

Code, it shall be the 2016 California Existing Building Code,

California Code of Regulations Title 24, Part 10, as published by

the California Building Standards Commission.

Page 8



[2016 Code Updates to - Existing Building Regulations]
[June 8, 2017]

(c) Each of the regulations, provisions, conditions, and terms of

the 2016 California Existing Building Code is made a part of this

Article as if fully set forth in this article except as otherwise

provided in Divisions 2 through 4 and Division 17.

(d) Numbering of Sections and Subsections in Divisions 2 through

4 and Division 17 of this Article is cross referenced to Sections

in the 2016 California Existing Building Code.

(e) The adoption of the 2016 California Existing Building Code shall

in no way limit, prohibit, impede, or prevent the City Council

from adopting ordinances limiting or preventing the issuance

of any type, number, or geographical distribution of permits

for construction or demolition of any facility for which a permit

is required.

() The Building Official is only authorized to enforce those

amendments made by the following State agencies:

(1) The Department of Housing and Community
Development for accessibility in privately funded
housing and all housing (HCD 1 and HCD 1/AQ).

(2)  Office of the State Fire Marshal (SFM).

(3) Building Standards Commission (BSC), Appendix Ch. A1
only.

§1411.0104 Portions of the 2016 California Existing Building Code Not

Adopted by the City of San Diego

The following Sections or Subsections of the 2016 California Existing

Building Code have not been adopted by the City of San Diego:

Page 9



[2016 Code Updates to - Existing Building Regulations]

§1411.0105

[June 8, 2017]

Chapter 1, Division Il “Scope and Administration”.

3

(b) Chapter 3, Section 301.1, Exception 1; Section 301.1.2 Work

Area compliance Method; Section 301.1.3 Performance

Compliance Method.)

() Chapter 5 through 15.

Modifications to the 2016 California Existing Building Code

§1411.0106

Adopted by the City of San Diego

The following Sections or Subsections of the 2016 California Existing

Building Code are modified by the City of San Diego:

(a) Chapter 2, Section 202 Definitions for: Code Official;

Dangerous; and Unsafe.

(b) Chapter 4, Section 404.1, Repairs, General; Section 402.2, Flood

Hazard Areas; Section 403.2, Flood Hazard Areas; Section 404.5

, Flood Hazard Areas.

(c) Appendix Chapter A1, Section A102.1, Scope, General.

Additions to the to the 2016 California Existing Building Code

Adopted by the City of San Diego

The following Sections and Subsections are added to the 2016

California Existing Building Code by the City of San Diego:

(a) Chapter 2, Section 202, Definitions; Code Official.

(b) Chapter 4, Section 401.6, Maintenance.

Page 10



[2016 Code Updates to - Existing Building Regulations]
[June 8, 2017]

(c) Appendix Chapter A1, Section A102.3, Previously Conforming

Retrofits; Section A102.3.1 Previously Conforming Existing roof-

to-wall anchors and parapet braces.

81411.0107 Adoption of Appendices to the 2016 California Existing Building

Reason:

Code

The following Appendix Chapters of the 2016 California Existing

Building Code are adopted by the City of San Diego:

(a) Chapter A1, Seismic Strengthening Provisions For

Unreinforced Masonry Bearing Wall Buildings

(b) Chapter A3, Prescriptive Provisions For Seismic Strengthening

Of Cripple Walls and Sill Plate Anchorage of Light, Wood-Frame

Residential Buildings.

(c) Chapter A6, Referenced Standards.

The City does not adopt Chapter 1 Division Il, Section 101.2 of the CBC and
Section 101.2 of the CEBC and by creating a new Article 11 the Existing
Building Regulations it is necessary to provide a road map to applicability of
chapters and requirements and to identify modifications and deletions. This
action is taken in conjunction with the State. Ch 5 through 15 are not
adopted at this time to allow staff time to adjust to the CEBC and to allow
additional revisions to the IEBC to be adopted in future editions of the CEBC
by the State.

Due to the decision by the California State fire Marshal to adopt by Sections
in Chapter 1 Division 2, it is necessary for the references to point to the
applicable Sections in the Land Development Code. Section 107 for
temporary structures is adopted into the Building Regulations since a
Building Permit is issued for such construction.

The proposed amendment in Section 81411.0104 (b) is necessary due to the
decision by the California Department of Housing and Community

Page 11



[2016 Code Updates to - Existing Building Regulations]
[June 8, 2017]

Development to not adopt ASCE 41 as an optional standard during the
evaluation and strengthening of buildings undergoing alterations or a change
in occupancy. Section 403.4 and 407.4 were adopted by HCD with
modifications to preclude the use of ASCE 41 in the seismic evaluation and
strengthening of existing buildings undergoing alterations or a change of
occupancy. During the State code development process the City of San Diego
opposed the action by HCD due to inconsistent application of the standards.
HCD was not aware of requests that Development Services has received to
use ASCE 41 and stated it took its action due to a lack of time and expertise
to technically evaluate the standard. HCD amendments were limited to those
statutorily required and as a consequences Section 403.4.1 and Section
407.4.1 were adopted and have the effect of excluding the use of ASCE 41 for
all housing uses and transient lodging like hotels. The City proposes to not
adopt Sections 403.4.1 407.4.1.

Chapter 15 is not adopted since the City of San Diego adopted Section
8149.0333 in the Residential Building Regulations cross referencing Chapter
33 of the CBC and Section 145.3303 of the Building Regulations.

Page 12



[2016 Code Updates to - Existing Building Regulations]
[June 8, 2017]

3. Issue 3: DEFINITIONS- MODIFY THE TERM CODE OFFICIAL TO BUILDING OFFICIAL
AND DO NOT ADOPT UNSAFE AND DANGEROUS (editorially revised)

Text as it would appear in CEBC

CODE OFFICIAL. Where the term Code Official is used in the California Existing

Building Code it shall mean The-officerorotherdesignated-authority-the Building
Official charged with the administration and enforcement of this-code-the Existing

Building Regulations.

[BS] DANGEROUS. Any building, structure or portion thereof that meets any of the

condltlons descrlbed beiew-sha“—be—deemed—dange#eu&

D a O O ,

that—ls-net—seewed—aga#m—en#y satlsfvmg the criteria in Sectlon 121.0404 of the

Land Development Code shall be deemed unsafe.

Text as it would appear in the Land Development Code

Article 11: Existing Building Regulations

Division 2: Additions and Modifications to Chapter 2 of the

California Building Code

Page 13



[2016 Code Updates to - Existing Building Regulations]

[June 8, 2017]

§1411.0201 Local Modifications to Chapter 2 Definitions of the California

Existing Building Code

Chapter 2 of the California Existing Building Code is adopted by

reference with modifications pursuant to Section 1411.0105 of the

Land Development Code.

§1411.0202 Other Definitions

(a)

Definitions in Chapter 11, Article 3, Division 1 of the Land

(b)

Development Code do not apply to Chapter 14, Article 11,

Divisions 3 through 4 of the Land Development Code where

they conflict with the definitions contained in the California

Existing Building Code.

Italicized text shall have the definitions set forth in Section

(@)}

113.0103 of the Land Development Code, and all other text

shall have the definitions set forth in the California Existing

Building Code.

Chapter 2 of the California Existing Building Code is

adopted by reference with modifications pursuant to

Section 1411.0105 of the Land Development Code. Section

202 is adopted with modifications as follows:

M CODE OFFICIAL. Where the term Code Official is

used in the California Existing Building Code it shall

mean the Building Official charged with the

administration and enforcement of Existing Building

Regulations.

Page 14



Reason:

[2016 Code Updates to - Existing Building Regulations]
[June 8, 2017]

(2) DANGEROUS. Any building, structure or portion

thereof that meets any of the conditions described

in Section 121.0403 of the Land Development Code.

3) UNSAFE. Buildings or structures satisfying the

criteria in Section 121.0404 of the Land

Development Code shall be deemed unsafe.

This clarification is necessary since the CBC uses the term Building Official
however the CEBC uses the more broad term Code Official. The code change
makes the CEBC consistent with the Ch 12 Article 9 Division 1 of the LDC.

The criteria for determining when a building or structure is Unsafe and
Dangerous is detailed in the Chapter 12 of the Land Development Code and
the CEBC is being modified to be consistent. Sections 121.0403 and 121.0404
are being re-titled as well.

Page 15



[2016 Code Updates to - Existing Building Regulations]
[June 8, 2017]

4. Issue 4: MODIFY SCOPE OF 301.1 TO EXCLUDE REFERENCE TO CH 5 THROUGH 14

Text as it would appear in CEBC

301.1 General. The repair, alteration, change of occupancy, addition or relocation of
all existing buildings shall comply with ene-of the-methodslisted-in Sections Section

301.1.1 through 301.1.3 as selected by the applicant-Sections 30111+ through
30113 shallnot be applied-incombinationwith-each-other. Where this code

requires consideration of the seismic force resisting system of an existing building
subject to repair, alteration, change of occupancy, addition or relocation of existing
buildings, the seismic evaluation and design shall be based on Section 301.1.4

¥ E wehic] ' hodi .

Note exception # 1 will not be adopted

Text as it would appear in the Land Development Code

Article 11: Existing Building Regulations

Division 3: Additions and Modifications to Chapter 3 of the

California Existing Building Code

81411.0301 Local Modifications and Additions to Chapter 3 “Provisions for All

Compliance Methods” of the California Existing Building Code

(a) Chapter 3 of the California Existing Building Code is adopted by

reference with modifications pursuant to Section 1411.0105

and additions pursuant to Section 1411.0106 of the Land

Development Code.

Page 16



[2016 Code Updates to - Existing Building Regulations]
[June 8, 2017]

8§1411.0303 Local Modifications and Additions to Section 301 “General” of the

Reason:

California Existing Building Code

(a) Section 301.1 including the exception 1 of the California

Existing Building Code is adopted by reference with

modifications pursuant to Section 1411.0105 of the Land

Development Code.

(1) Section 301.1 is modified as follows: 301.1 General. The

repair, alteration, change of occupancy, addition or

relocation of all existing buildings shall comply with

Section 301.1.1. Where this code requires consideration

of the seismic force resisting system of an existing

building subiject to repair, alteration, change of occupancy,

addition or relocation of existing buildings, the seismic

evaluation and design shall be based on Section

301.1.4.

The proposed amendment is to resolve the decision by the California
Building Standards Commission to not publish chapters 5 through 15 in
the CEBC. Sections in Chapter 3 as published by the State references
Sections in Ch. 7, 8 and 9 that are not adopted and published in the CEBC.
Section 301.1. Exception 1 references Section 907.44 “Limited Structural
alteration” and Section 701.3 “Flood hazard areas” that are not published
in the CEBC. Section 907.4.4 in turn references Section 807.5 “Existing
structural elements resisting lateral loads” which is also not published
Section 807.5 references Section 807.6 “Voluntary lateral force-resisting
system alterations.” which is also not published. The missing regulations
for rules on alterations chapter 7, 8 and 9.

After reviewing the prescriptive compliance method regulations in
chapter 4 we determined that Section 403.4 is equivalent to Section 807.5
that was omitted; that Section 403.9 is equivalent to missing Section
807.6; that Section 402.2, 403.2, 404.5 similarly address regulations in
Section 701.3. As a consequence exception # 1 to Section 301.1 of the

Page 17



[2016 Code Updates to - Existing Building Regulations]
[June 8, 2017]

CEBC is not required for consistent application and enforcement of the
CEBC as published and adopted by the State of California and as a result
will not be adopted.

This approach will not require the purchase of the IEBC for application of
Section 301.1. The California Building Standards Commission does not
intend to publish these missing regulations.

Page 18



[2016 Code Updates to - Existing Building Regulations]
[June 8, 2017]

5. Issue 5: ADD SECTION 401.6 TO ADOPT REGULATIONS FROM SECTION 3401.2 OF
THE 2013 CBC THAT REQUIRES BUILDINGS TO BE MAINTAINED.

Text as it would appear in CEBC

401.6 Maintenance. Buildings and structures, and parts thereof, shall be
maintained in a safe and sanitary condition. Devices or safeguards which are
required by the Building, Electrical, Plumbing, Mechanical, Residential, Green
Building and Existing Building Regulations of the Land Development code shall be
maintained in conformance with the code edition of the California Building
Standards Code (California Code of Regulations Title 24) under which installed. The
owner or the owner's designated agent shall be responsible for the maintenance of
buildings and structures. To determine compliance with this subsection, the
Building Official shall have the authority to require a building or structure to be
reinspected. The requirements of this chapter shall not provide the basis for
removal or abrogation of fire protection and safety systems and devices in existing
structures.

Text as it would appear in the Land Development Code

Article 11: Existing Building Regulations

Division 4: Additions and Modifications to Chapter 4

Of the California Existing Building Code

§1411.0401 Local Modifications and Additions to Chapter 4 “Prescriptive

Compliance Method” of the California Existing Building Code

(a) Chapter 4 of the California Existing Building Code is adopted by

reference with modifications and additions pursuant to Section

1411.0105 and 1411.0106 of the Land Development Code.

Page 19



Reason:

[2016 Code Updates to - Existing Building Regulations]
[June 8, 2017]

(b) Section 401 of the California Existing Building Code is adopted

by reference with additions pursuant to Section 1411.0106 of

the Land Development Code. Section 401.6 is added as follows:

401.6 Maintenance. Buildings and structures, and parts

thereof, shall be maintained in a safe and sanitary condition.

Devices or safeguards which are required by the Building,

Electrical, Plumbing, Mechanical, Residential, Green Building

and Existing Building Regulations of the Land Development

code shall be maintained in conformance with the code edition

of the California Building Standards Code (California Code of

Regulations Title 24) under which installed. The owner or the

owner's designated agent shall be responsible for the

maintenance of buildings and structures. To determine

compliance with this subsection, the Building Official shall have

the authority to require a building or structure to be

reinspected. The requirements of this chapter shall not provide

the basis for removal or abrogation of fire protection and

safety systems and devices in existing structures.

The 2016 CEBC does not include requirements that buildings be maintained
so that required elements remain functional. For example a building
constructed with an elevator required for accessible means of egress or for
an accessible route cannot chose to render the elevator inoperable since the
elevator was required as a condition of approval. Text from Section 3401.2 of
the 2013 CBC Chapter 34, which was repealed by the ICC when the IEBC was
published, is proposed to be adopted to address this issue. The International
Property Maintenance Code is not adopted by the State of California and
addresses such issues as they were addressed in the 2013 CBC. Section
121.0302 clearly address this issue and it is felt that the requirement more
appropriately belongs as a CEBC amendment. (added 5-30-17)

Page 20



[2016 Code Updates to - Existing Building Regulations]
[June 8, 2017]

6. Issue 6: UPDATE REPAIR CRITERIA SECTION 404.1 TO REFERENCE SECTION 129.0203

Text as it would appear in CEBC

404.1 General. Buildings and structures, and parts thereof, shall be repaired in
compliance with Sections 401.2 and 404. Work on nondamaged components that is
necessary for the required repair of damaged components shall be considered part
of the repair and shall not be subject to the requirements for alterations in this
chapter. Routine maintenance required by Section 401.2, ordinary repairs exempt
from permit in accordance with Section405.2 Section 129.0203 of the Land
Development Code, and abatement of wear due to normal service conditions shall
not be subject to the requirements for repairs in this section.

Text as it would appear in the Land Development Code

§1411.0404 Local Modifications and Additions to Section 404 “Repairs” of the

California Existing Building Code

(a) Section 404 of the California Existing Building Code is adopted

by reference with modifications pursuant to Section 1411.0105

of the Land Development Code.

(b) Section 404.1 is adopted with modifications as follows:

General. Buildings and structures, and parts thereof, shall be

repaired in compliance with Sections 401.2 and 404. Work on

non-damaged components that is necessary for the required

repair of damaged components shall be considered part of the

repair and shall not be subject to the requirements for

alterations in this chapter. Routine maintenance required by

Section 401.2, ordinary repairs exempt from permit in

accordance with Section 129.0203 of the Land Development

Page 21



[2016 Code Updates to - Existing Building Regulations]
[June 8, 2017]

Code, and abatement of wear due to normal service conditions

shall not be subject to the requirements for repairs in this

section.

Reason: Section 404.1 is revised as follows to correctly reference the building
permit exemptions in Section 129.0203 since Section 105.2 is not
adopted.

Page 22



[2016 Code Updates to - Existing Building Regulations]
[June 8, 2017]

7. Issue 7: MODIFY THE FLOOD HAZARD AREA REGULATIONS IN SECTION 402.2, 403.2,
404.5 FOR CONSISTENCY WITH THE LAND DEVELOPMENT CODE

Text as it would appear in CEBC

[BS] 402.2 Flood hazard areas. For buildings and structures in flood hazard areas
established in Section1612.3-of the California-Building Code-Section 145.1612 of the
Land Development Code, or SectionR322 of the California-Residential Code Section
149.0322 of the Land Development Code, as applicable, any addition that constitutes
substantial improvement of the existing structure shall comply with the flood design
requirements for new construction, and all aspects of the existing structure shall be
brought into compliance with the requirements for new construction for flood
design.

For buildings and structures in flood hazard areas established in Section1612.3-of
the California-Building Code-Section 145.1612 of the Land Development Code, or
Section-R322 of the California-Residential Code Section 149.0322 of the Land
Development Code, as applicable, any additions that do not constitute substantial
improvement of the existing structure are not required to comply with the flood
design requirements for new construction.

[BS] 403.2 Flood hazard areas. For buildings and structures in flood hazard areas
established in Section-16123-of the California-Building Code-Section 145.1612 of the
Land Development Code, or SectionR322 of the California-Residential Code Section
149.0322 of the Land Development Code, as applicable, any alteration that
constitutes substantial improvement of the existing structure shall comply with the
flood design requirements for new construction, and all aspects of the existing
structure shall be brought into compliance with the requirements for new
construction for flood design.

[BS] 404.5 Flood hazard areas. For buildings and structures in flood hazard areas
established in Section1612.3-of the California-Building Code-Section 145.1612 of the
Land Development Code, or Section-R322-of the California-Residential Code-Section
149.0322 of the Land Development Code, as applicable, any repair that constitutes
substantial improvement or repair of substantial damage of the existing structure
shall comply with the flood design requirements for new construction, and all
aspects of the existing structure shall be brought into compliance with the
requirements for new construction for flood design.

For buildings and structures in flood hazard areas established in-Section-1612.3-of
the California-Building Code Section 145.1612 of the Land Development Code, or

Page 23




[2016 Code Updates to - Existing Building Regulations]

[June 8, 2017]

Section-R322 of the California-Residential Code Section 149.0322 of the Land
Development Code, as applicable, any repairs that do not constitute substantial

improvement or repair of substantial damage of the existing structure are not
required to comply with the flood design requirements for new construction.

Article 11: Existing Building Regulations

Division 4: Additions and Modifications to Chapter 4 of the

California Existing Building Code

8§1411.0402 Local Modifications to Section 402 “Additions” of the California

Existing Building Code

(a)

Section 402.2 of the California Existing Building Code is

adopted by reference with modifications pursuant to Section

1411.0105 of the Land Development Code.

Section 402.2 is adopted with modifications as follows: 402.2

Flood hazard areas. For buildings and structures in flood

hazard areas established in Section 145.1612 of the Land

Development Code, or Section 149.0322 of the Land

Development Code, as applicable, any addition that constitutes

substantial improvement of the existing structure shall comply

with the flood design requirements for new construction, and

all aspects of the existing structure shall be brought into

compliance with the requirements for new construction for

flood design. For buildings and structures in flood hazard areas

established in Section 145.1612 of the Land Development

Code, or Section 149.0322 of the Land Development Code, as

applicable, any additions that do not constitute substantial

improvement of the existing structure are not required to

Page 24



[2016 Code Updates to - Existing Building Regulations]

[June 8, 2017]

comply with the flood design requirements for new

construction.

§1411.0403 Local Modifications and Additions to Section 403 “Alterations” of

the California Existing Building Code

(a)

Section 403 of the California Existing Building Code is adopted

by reference with modifications pursuant to Section 1411.0105

of the Land Development Code.

Section 403.2 is adopted with modifications as follows: 403.2

Flood hazard areas. For buildings and structures in flood

hazard areas established in Section 145.1612 of the Land

Development Code, or Section 149.0322 of the Land

Development Code, as applicable, any alteration that

constitutes substantial improvement of the existing structure

shall comply with the flood design requirements for new

construction, and all aspects of the existing structure shall be

brought into compliance with the requirements for new

construction for flood design.

Note: See Issue 6 for Section §1411.0404 (a) and (b)

(Q)

Section 404.5 is adopted with modifications as follows: 404.5

Flood hazard areas. For buildings and structures in flood

hazard areas established in Section 145.1612 of the Land

Development Code, or Section 149.0322 of the Land

Development Code, as applicable, any repair that constitutes

substantial improvement or repair of substantial damage of

the existing structure shall comply with the flood design

requirements for new construction, and all aspects of the

Page 25



Reason:

[2016 Code Updates to - Existing Building Regulations]
[June 8, 2017]

existing structure shall be brought into compliance with the

requirements for new construction for flood design. For

buildings and structures in flood hazard areas established in

Section 145.1612 of the Land Development Code, or Section

149.0322 of the Land Development Code, as applicable, any

repairs that do not constitute substantial improvement or

repair of substantial damage of the existing structure are not

required to comply with the flood design requirements for new

construction.

Section 402.2, Section 403.2 and Section 404.5 address additions, alterations
and repairs to buildings and structures in flood hazard areas, respectively,
that do or that do not constitute a substantial improvement are either
required to comply with requirements as new structures or not. The
modification references adopted amendments to Section 1612.3 of the CBC
and R322 of the CRC. The City of San Diego adopts local flood regulations in
Sections 143.0145 and 143.0146 of the Land Development Code. The
proposed modification is editorial in nature and seeks to link the State and
local regulations. Subsection (d) in the proposed LDC update is added for
clarity and is not directly related to flood regulations.

Page 26



[2016 Code Updates to - Existing Building Regulations]
[June 8, 2017]

8. Issue 8: RELOCATE CH14 ART 05 DIVISION 37, ADDITIONAL BUILDING REGULATIONS
FOR ARCHAIC MATERIALS AND METHODS OF CONSTRUCTION AND REPEAL
REGULATIONS AND REPEAL REDUNDANT REGULATIONS

Text as it would appear in CEBC

[BS] A102.1 General. The provisions of this chapter shall apply to all existing
buildings, that were constructed or were under construction before March 24, 1939,
or for which a Building Permit was issued before March 24, 1939, and to City-owned
buildings designated pursuant to Council resolution, which on January 1, 1994,
having had at least one unreinforced masonry bearing wall. The elements regulated
by this chapter shall be determined in accordance with Table A1-A. Except as
provided herein, other structural provisions of the building code shall apply. This
chapter does not apply to the alteration of existing electrical, plumbing, mechanical
or fire safety systems.

A102.3 Previously Conforming Retrofits. Buildings that have been completely
seismically retrofitted to comply with earlier editions of these regulations as
provided in San Diego Municipal Code Chapter 9, Division 88, (Archaic Materials and
Method of Construction), or equivalent, Chapter 14, Article 5, Division 4 (Additional
Building Regulations for Archaic Materials and Methods of Construction) before
lanuary 1, 2008 or Chapter 14, Article 5, Division 37 before January 2017. Complete
seismic retrofit shall be as determined by the Building Official.

A102.3.1 Previously Conforming Existing roof-to-wall anchors and parapet
braces. Existing roof-to-wall and parapet braces installed and approved to comply
with earlier editions of these regulations shall be deemed to comply with the
California Existing Building Code Sections 403.5, 403.6 and 403.7 if provided on all
exterior walls of buildings that are within the scope of this division.

Add a new Division 17 in Chapter 14 Article 11 and relocate the existing regulations
triggering requirements for URM buildings.

Page 27



[2016 Code Updates to - Existing Building Regulations]
[June 8, 2017]

Text as it would appear in the Land Development Code

Article 11: Existing Building Regulations

Division 17: Additions and Modifications to Appendix Chapter A1 of the

California Building Code

Page 28



[2016 Code Updates to - Existing Building Regulations]
[June 8, 2017]

1411.1701

Local Modifications and Additions to Appendix Chapter A1

1411.1702

“Seismic Strengthening Provisions for Unreinforced Masonry

Bearing Wall Buildings” of the California Existing Building Code

(a)

Appendix Chapter A1 of the California Building Code is

adopted by reference with modifications and additions

pursuant to Sections 1411.0105 and 1411.0106 of the Land

Development Code.

Local Modifications and Additions to Section A102 “Scope” of the

California Existing Building Code

(a)

Section A102 is adopted by reference with modifications and

additions pursuant to Section 145.0105 and 145.0106 of the

Land Development Code.

Section A102.1 is adopted with modifications as follows:

A102.1 General. The provisions of this chapter shall apply to all

existing buildings, that were constructed or were under

construction before March 24, 1939, or for which a Building

Permit was issued before March 24, 1939, and to City-owned

buildings designated pursuant to Council resolution, which on

lanuary 1, 1994, having had at least one unreinforced masonry

bearing wall. The elements regulated by this chapter shall be

determined in accordance with Table A1-A. Except as provided

herein, other structural provisions of the building code shall

apply. This chapter does not apply to the alteration of existing

electrical, plumbing, mechanical or fire safety systems.

Page 29



[2016 Code Updates to - Existing Building Regulations]
[June 8, 2017]

(b) Section A102.3 is added to Section A102 as follows: A102.3

Previously Conforming Retrofits. Buildings that have been

completely seismically retrofitted to comply with earlier

editions of these regulations as provided in San Diego

Municipal Code Chapter 9, Division 88, (Archaic Materials and

Method of Construction), or equivalent, Chapter 14, Article 5,

Division 4 (Additional Building Regulations for Archaic Materials

and Methods of Construction) before January 1, 2008 or

Chapter 14, Article 5, Division 37 before January 2017.

Complete seismic retrofit shall be as determined by the

Building Official.

Q) Subsection A102.3.1 is added to Section A102.3 as follows:

A102.3.1 Previously Conforming Existing roof-to-wall anchors

and parapet braces. Existing roof-to-wall and parapet braces

installed and approved to comply with earlier editions of these

regulations shall be deemed to comply with the California

Existing Building Code Sections 403.5, 403.6 and 403.7 if

provided on all exterior walls of buildings that are within the

scope of this division.




[2016 Code Updates to - Existing Building Regulations]
[June 8, 2017]

8145.3703  Exemptions from the Archaic Material and Methods of

Page 31



[2016 Code Updates to - Existing Building Regulations]
[June 8, 2017]




[2016 Code Updates to - Existing Building Regulations]
[June 8, 2017]




[2016 Code Updates to - Existing Building Regulations]
[June 8, 2017]

Page 34



[2016 Code Updates to - Existing Building Regulations]
[June 8, 2017]

Page 35



[2016 Code Updates to - Existing Building Regulations]
[June 8, 2017]

; Wi | caicrni o . L
I . ded.the building el I ,
vision shall be those listed in Table No. Al-Aof the Californi

Page 36



[2016 Code Updates to - Existing Building Regulations]
[June 8, 2017]




[2016 Code Updates to - Existing Building Regulations]
[June 8, 2017]

livision i ith Secti 145.3713_145.3744._and
1453745

o T tor chall reaui o ofas '

Page 38



[2016 Code Updates to - Existing Building Regulations]
[June 8, 2017]

(A)——The 100 percent value shallexclude the value of
any-nonstructural tenantimprovements-made or
‘ | after the.d buildi

Page 39



[2016 Code Updates to - Existing Building Regulations]
[June 8, 2017]

Page 40



[2016 Code Updates to - Existing Building Regulations]
[June 8, 2017]

Page 41



[2016 Code Updates to - Existing Building Regulations]
[June 8, 2017]

; f the buildina is dec] | o d ,
| el ‘ i b initiated.i




[2016 Code Updates to - Existing Building Regulations]
[June 8, 2017]




[2016 Code Updates to - Existing Building Regulations]
[June 8, 2017]

Page 44



[2016 Code Updates to - Existing Building Regulations]
[June 8, 2017]

buildi luati hedul - |
building official & , sdditions.
terations inoff e of "y ’

Page 45



[2016 Code Updates to - Existing Building Regulations]
[June 8, 2017]

o) T , i this Secti L bei L
, in Section 403.5 and 403.6.of the Californi
Existing Building Cod . licable.

Page 46



[2016 Code Updates to - Existing Building Regulations]
[June 8, 2017]

Page 47



[2016 Code Updates to - Existing Building Regulations]
[June 8, 2017]

Page 48



[2016 Code Updates to - Existing Building Regulations]
[June 8, 2017]

Page 49



[2016 Code Updates to - Existing Building Regulations]
[June 8, 2017]

Page 50



[2016 Code Updates to - Existing Building Regulations]
[June 8, 2017]

B w red aS . | Ercineering b
hall be-subrai he Building Official within120.cal

Page 51



[2016 Code Updates to - Existing Building Regulations]
[June 8, 2017]

@ - Linf ion A i f the building including:
a4 Street address.
@) : ¢ . indicating
footage of eachuse.

Page 52



[2016 Code Updates to - Existing Building Regulations]
[June 8, 2017]

Page 53



[2016 Code Updates to - Existing Building Regulations]
[June 8, 2017]

Page 54



[2016 Code Updates to - Existing Building Regulations]
[June 8, 2017]

masonry-shallnotexceed the height orlength-to-
hicl . ifiodin Table No. A1-G.of t
- slifornia Existing Building Code. T} lls challt



[2016 Code Updates to - Existing Building Regulations]
[June 8, 2017]




[2016 Code Updates to - Existing Building Regulations]
[June 8, 2017]

Page 57




[2016 Code Updates to - Existing Building Regulations]

[June 8, 2017]

S-2 Low hazard storage

M-Gas-stations

{Lowest Hazard)

5

Reason:

This repeal of existing regulations is necessary due to adoption of
regulations in Chapter 4 of the CEBC that make the local regulations
redundant. The mandatory portions of the existing regulations have
been satisfied and property owners that are in non-compliance are
being addressed through code enforcement action.

e The CEBC addresses changes of occupancies and additions and
triggers roof to wall ties and parapet braces based on scopes of
alterations.

e Valuation based triggers proposed to be repealed in the current
regulations have generally proved ineffective.

e Change of occupancy triggers based on change of hazard category
in the current regulations is more restrictive than the CEBC
however when viewed in conjunction with provisions for phased
retrofitting or hazard reduction through occupant load reduction
as presently permitted are considered equivalent.

What has been retained from the existing regulations facilitates
identification of URM buildings based on the date of construction and
also address previously conforming rights to approved retrofits
performed under prior regulations.

The CEBC triggers for seismic retrofits based on risk category are
equivalent to the hazard category method in the LDC when the
following factors are considered. No significant change in regulatory
effect is expected after implementation of the proposed modifications
to the LDC:

Page 58




[2016 Code Updates to - Existing Building Regulations]
[June 8, 2017]

e The current standards proposed for repeal permit non-compliance
when a change of occupancy to a higher hazard category is proposed
if the occupant load is reduced.

e Retrofit work is permitted by the LDC to be phased over a 10 year
period.

e The LDC permits up to 33% of the floor area of the building to be
changed to a higher hazard category.

Page 59



