Bid Tabulation Summary for Bid No. 10054793-15-J

Vender Total Section A [Total Section B |Total Section A and B |Total Section A and B with Tax
Ad Art Sign Company $ 80,740.00 | $ 17,210.00 | $ 97,950.00 | $ 105,786.00
Daktronics, Inc. $ 126,747.00 | $ 24,255.00 | $ 151,002.00 | $ 163,082.16
SWARCO Traffic Americas, LLC $ 134,334.00 | $ 28,591.00 | $ 162,925.00 | $ 175,959.00
SES America $ 178,200.00 | $ 43,750.00 | $ 221,950.00 | $ 239,706.00




Bid Tabulation for
10054793-15-J

Vendor: Ad Art Sign Company
Section | Item No. Qty U/M |Description Unit Cost Extension
A 1 EA |Dynamic Message Sign (DMS) $ 14,570.00 $ 58,280.00
A 2 EA |DMS Field Controller $ - $ -
A 3 EA [DMS Field Controller Cabinet No Bid No Bid
120 feet of cable (fiber optic cable or CAT 5 cable) per DMS
manufacture’s requirement with all necessary connectors (field
A 4 4 EA |controller to sign) $ 15.00 $ 60.00
DMS Professional Control/Management Software for Central
A 5 1 EA |Computer Server $ 1,500.00 $ 1,500.00
DMS Professional Control/Management Software for Client
A 6 1 EA |Installation $ 1,500.00 $ 1,500.00
A 7 1 EA |DMS Central Control Server $ 1,200.00 $ 1,200.00
A 8 1 EA |DMS PC/Desktop Computer $ 1,200.00 $ 1,200.00
A 9 4 EA [Five (5) years DMS parts/components full coverage plan $ 2,500.00 $ 10,000.00
A 10 2 Day |On-Site DMS Installation Support (8 Full Hours Per Day) $ 1,500.00 $ 3,000.00
A 11 2 Day |On-Site Training and Commissioning (8 Full Hours Per Day) $ 1,500.00 $ 3,000.00
DMS Mounting Hardware (complete) to mount new DMS signs onto
A 12 4 EA |existing sign structures $ - $ -
A 13 4 EA |DMS Power cabling to control cabinet $ 125.00 $ 500.00
A 14 1 EA |DMS Manuals Including: $ 500.00 $ 500.00
e 5 software operator’s manuals
e 3 each software installation instructions for DMS server and
PC system
e 5 each sign description & General Maintenance Manual
e 1 set OEM Manuals for PC Equipment
e 3sets AC, DC Schematic blueprints for signs
3 sets cabinet drawings of designs showing mountain hole locations
Total Section A: $  80,740.00
B 1 EA [Dynamic Message Sign (DMS) $ 14,570.00 $  14,570.00
B EA [DMS Field Controller $ - $ -
B EA |DMS Field Controller Cabinet $ - $ -
120 feet of cable (fiber optic cable or CAT 5 cable) per DMS
manufacture’s requirement with all necessary connectors (field
B EA |controller to sign) $ 15.00 $ 15.00
B EA [Five (5) years DMS parts/components full coverage plan $ 2,500.00 $ 2,500.00
DMS Mounting Hardware (complete) to mount new DMS signs onto
B EA [existing sign structures $ - $ -
B EA |DMS Power cabling to control cabinet $ 125.00 $ 125.00
Total Section B: $  17,210.00
Total Section A and B: $  97,950.00
Sales Tax (8%0): $ 7,836.00
Total Section A and B with Tax: $ 105,786.00

Vendor Notes:
* Vendor wrote, "Included".




Bid Tabulation for
10054793-15-J

Vendor: Daktronics, Inc.

Section | Item No. Qty U/M |Description Unit Cost Extension
A 1 EA |Dynamic Message Sign (DMS) $ 19,882.00 $ 79,528.00
A 2 EA |DMS Field Controller $ 2,597.00 $  10,388.00
A 3 EA |DMS Field Controller Cabinet $ 260.00 $ 1,040.00

120 feet of cable (fiber optic cable or CAT 5 cable) per DMS
manufacture’s requirement with all necessary connectors (field
A 4 4 EA |controller to sign) $ 75.00 $ 300.00
DMS Professional Control/Management Software for Central
A 5 1 EA |Computer Server $ 1,000.00 $ 1,000.00
DMS Professional Control/Management Software for Client
A 6 1 EA |Installation $ 100.00 $ 100.00
A 7 1 EA |DMS Central Control Server $ 19,695.00 $  19,695.00
A 8 1 EA |DMS PC/Desktop Computer $ 2,320.00 $ 2,320.00
A 9 4 EA [Five (5) years DMS parts/components full coverage plan $ 400.00 $ 1,600.00
A 10 2 Day |On-Site DMS Installation Support (8 Full Hours Per Day) 3 1,487.00 $ 2,974.00
A 11 2 Day |On-Site Training and Commissioning (8 Full Hours Per Day) $ 1,487.00 $ 2,974.00
DMS Mounting Hardware (complete) to mount new DMS signs onto
A 12 4 EA |existing sign structures $ 974.00 $ 3,896.00
A 13 4 EA |DMS Power cabling to control cabinet $ 67.00 $ 268.00
A 14 1 EA |DMS Manuals Including: $ 664.00 $ 664.00
e 5 software operator’s manuals
e 3 each software installation instructions for DMS server and
PC system
e 5 each sign description & General Maintenance Manual
e 1 set OEM Manuals for PC Equipment
e 3sets AC, DC Schematic blueprints for signs
3 sets cabinet drawings of designs showing mountain hole locations
Total Section A: $  126,747.00
B 1 EA [Dynamic Message Sign (DMS) $ 19,882.00 $  19,882.00
B EA |DMS Field Controller $ 2,597.00 $ 2,597.00
B EA [DMS Field Controller Cabinet $ 260.00 $ 260.00
120 feet of cable (fiber optic cable or CAT 5 cable) per DMS
manufacture’s requirement with all necessary connectors (field
B EA |controller to sign) $ 75.00 $ 75.00
B EA [Five (5) years DMS parts/components full coverage plan $ 400.00 $ 400.00
DMS Mounting Hardware (complete) to mount new DMS signs onto
B EA [existing sign structures $ 974.00 $ 974.00
B EA |DMS Power cabling to control cabinet $ 67.00 $ 67.00
Total Section B: $  24,255.00
Total Section A and B: $ 151,002.00
Sales Tax (8%b): $  12,080.16
Total Section A and B with Tax: $ 163,082.16

Vendor Notes:

None.




Bid Tabulation for
10054793-15-J

Vendor: SES America
Section | Item No. Qty U/M |Description Unit Cost Extension
A 1 EA |Dynamic Message Sign (DMS) $ 37,400.00 $  149,600.00
A 2 EA |DMS Field Controller $ - $ -
A 3 EA |DMS Field Controller Cabinet $ 1,200.00 $ 4,800.00
120 feet of cable (fiber optic cable or CAT 5 cable) per DMS
manufacture’s requirement with all necessary connectors (field
A 4 4 EA |controller to sign) $ 300.00 $ 1,200.00
DMS Professional Control/Management Software for Central
A 5 1 EA |Computer Server No Bid No Bid
DMS Professional Control/Management Software for Client
A 6 1 EA [Installation No Bid No Bid
A 7 1 EA |DMS Central Control Server No Bid No Bid
A 8 1 EA |DMS PC/Desktop Computer No Bid No Bid
A 9 4 EA [Five (5) years DMS parts/components full coverage plan $ 3,650.00 $ 14,600.00
A 10 2 Day |On-Site DMS Installation Support (8 Full Hours Per Day) $ 1,100.00 $ 2,200.00
A 11 2 Day |On-Site Training and Commissioning (8 Full Hours Per Day) $ 500.00 $ 1,000.00
DMS Mounting Hardware (complete) to mount new DMS signs onto
A 12 4 EA |existing sign structures $ 1,000.00 $ 4,000.00
A 13 4 EA |DMS Power cabling to control cabinet $ 200.00 $ 800.00
A 14 1 EA |DMS Manuals Including: $ - $ -
e 5 software operator’s manuals
e 3 each software installation instructions for DMS server and
PC system
e 5 each sign description & General Maintenance Manual
e 1 set OEM Manuals for PC Equipment
e 3sets AC, DC Schematic blueprints for signs
3 sets cabinet drawings of designs showing mountain hole locations
Total Section A: $ 178,200.00
B 1 EA [Dynamic Message Sign (DMS) $ 37,400.00 $  37,400.00
B EA [DMS Field Controller $ - $ -
B EA [DMS Field Controller Cabinet $ 1,200.00 $ 1,200.00
120 feet of cable (fiber optic cable or CAT 5 cable) per DMS
manufacture’s requirement with all necessary connectors (field
B EA |controller to sign) $ 300.00 $ 300.00
B EA [Five (5) years DMS parts/components full coverage plan $ 3,650.00 $ 3,650.00
DMS Mounting Hardware (complete) to mount new DMS signs onto
B EA |existing sign structures $ 1,000.00 $ 1,000.00
B EA |DMS Power cabling to control cabinet $ 200.00 $ 200.00
Total Section B: $  43,750.00
Total Section A and B: $ 221,950.00
Sales Tax (8%b): $  17,756.00
Total Section A and B with Tax: $ 239,706.00

Vendor Notes:
*Vendor wrotes, "Incl".




Bid Tabulation for
10054793-15-J

Vendor: SWARCO Traffic Americas, LLC
Section | Item No. Qty U/M |Description Unit Cost Extension
A 1 EA |Dynamic Message Sign (DMS) $ 17,176.00 $ 68,704.00
A 2 EA |DMS Field Controller $ 3,447.00 $  13,788.00
A 3 EA |DMS Field Controller Cabinet $ 1,472.00 $ 5,888.00
120 feet of cable (fiber optic cable or CAT 5 cable) per DMS
manufacture’s requirement with all necessary connectors (field
A 4 4 EA |controller to sign) $ 445.00 $ 1,780.00
DMS Professional Control/Management Software for Central
A 5 1 EA |Computer Server $ 2,500.00 $ 2,500.00
DMS Professional Control/Management Software for Client
A 6 1 EA |Installation $ 4,000.00 $ 4,000.00
A 7 1 EA |DMS Central Control Server $ 5,049.00 $ 5,049.00
A 8 1 EA |DMS PC/Desktop Computer $ 1,701.00 $ 1,701.00
A 9 4 EA [Five (5) years DMS parts/components full coverage plan $ 2,100.00 $ 8,400.00
A 10 2 Day |On-Site DMS Installation Support (8 Full Hours Per Day) $ 1,635.00 $ 3,270.00
A 11 2 Day |On-Site Training and Commissioning (8 Full Hours Per Day) $ 1,475.00 $ 2,950.00
DMS Mounting Hardware (complete) to mount new DMS signs onto
A 12 4 EA |existing sign structures $ 3,890.00 $ 15,560.00
A 13 4 EA |DMS Power cabling to control cabinet $ 61.00 $ 244.00
A 14 1 EA |DMS Manuals Including: $ 500.00 $ 500.00
e 5 software operator’s manuals
e 3 each software installation instructions for DMS server and
PC system
e 5 each sign description & General Maintenance Manual
e 1 set OEM Manuals for PC Equipment
e 3sets AC, DC Schematic blueprints for signs
3 sets cabinet drawings of designs showing mountain hole locations
Total Section A: $  134,334.00
B 1 EA [Dynamic Message Sign (DMS) $ 17,176.00 $  17,176.00
B EA |DMS Field Controller $ 3,447.00 $ 3,447.00
B EA [DMS Field Controller Cabinet $ 1,472.00 $ 1,472.00
120 feet of cable (fiber optic cable or CAT 5 cable) per DMS
manufacture’s requirement with all necessary connectors (field
B EA |controller to sign) $ 445.00 $ 445.00
B EA [Five (5) years DMS parts/components full coverage plan $ 2,100.00 $ 2,100.00
DMS Mounting Hardware (complete) to mount new DMS signs onto
B EA |existing sign structures $ 3,890.00 $ 3,890.00
B EA |DMS Power cabling to control cabinet $ 61.00 $ 61.00
Total Section B: $  28,591.00
Total Section A and B: $ 162,925.00
Sales Tax (8%0): $  13,034.00
Total Section A and B with Tax: $ 175,959.00

Vendor Notes:

None.




