Summary Bid Tab

10055752-15-L

Total Ann Cost

Total Ann Cost

Total Ann Cost

Total Ann Cost

Total Ann Cost

Item No. |Vendor Schedule A Schedule B Schedule C Schedule D Schedules A-D
1|Aztec Janitorial Services S 23,430.34 | S 15,822.04 | S 24,788.96 | S 29,699.78 | S 93,741.12
2|Commercial Cleaning Systems S 32,957.66 | $ 16,141.76 | S 28,966.88 | S 27,737.30 | $ 105,803.60
3|HD Cleaning S 18,596.02 | $ 12,701.56 | $ 26,333.40 | $ 22,598.78 | S 80,229.76
4 /NMS Management, Inc S 43,400.90 | $ 21,862.32 | S 42,914.40|$ 47,123.52 | $ 155,301.14
5|Property Building Maintenance Services, Inc. | $ 25,478.78 | S 14,501.00 | S 20,358.60 | S 19,512.60 | $ 79,850.98
6|Prizm Janitorial Services, Inc. S 14,686.50 | S 9,815.64 | § 19,189.44 | S 21,249.98 | S 64,941.56
7|T & T Janitorial, Inc.* S - S 18,363.24 | S 20,080.20 | S 28,508.20 | S 66,951.64
8|Tom Van Duong S 32,268.00 | $ 24,308.00 | S 37,100.00 | $ 31,320.00 | S 124,996.00
9|TP Janitorial Services, Inc S 18,109.84 | S 12,702.70 | S 26,206.90 | S 21,442.16 | S 78,461.60

Non-Responsive: 1

*SLBE/ELBE 2% Discount Included in Calculation for Evaluation for Award Only

Note: T and T No Bid Schedule A




Bid Tabulation
10055752-15-L
Janitorial Maintenance Service at Various City Facilities

Aztec Janitorial Services

Est Ann

Schedule | Section |Location/Facility Description Item No.| Freq |U/M| Description
A 1 Household Hazardous Waste Transfer Facility 1 254| DY |Daily Task
A 1 Trailer 1: Admininstration Facility No. 10333 2 52| WK |Weekly Task
A 1 3 12| MO |Monthly Task
A 2 Household Hazardous Waste Transfer Facility 1 254| DY |Daily Task
A 2 Trailer 2: Restroom/Locker Facility No 10332 2 52| WK |Weekly Task
A 2 3 12| MO |Monthly Task
A 3 Household Hazardous Waste Transfer Facility 1 254| DY |Daily Task
A 3 Trailer 3: Mobile Mini Trailer Facility No. 210447 2 52| WK |Weekly Task
A 3 3 12| MO |Monthly Task
A 4 Field Operations/Mini-OPS 1 254| DY |Daily Task
A 4 Trailer 1: Administration Trailer Facility No. 10328 2 52| WK |Weekly Task
A 4 3 12| MO |Monthly Task
A 5 Field Operations/Mini-OPS 1 254| DY |Daily Task
A 5 Trailer 2: Conf Rm/Restrm/Locker Fac. No. 10327 2 52| WK |Weekly Task
A 5 3 12| MO |Monthly Task
A 6 Disposal Operations Facility 1 254| DY |Daily Task
A 6 Trailer 1: Administration Facility No. 9814 2 52| WK |Weekly Task
A 6 3 12| MO |Monthly Task
A 7 Disposal Operations Facility 1 254| DY |Daily Task
A 7 Restroom/Locker - Women Facility No. 9828 2 52| WK |Weekly Task
A 7 3 12| MO |Monthly Task
A 8 Disposal Operations Facility 1 254| DY |Daily Task
A 8 Restroom/Locker - Men Facility No. 9829 2 52| WK |Weekly Task
A 8 3 12| MO |Monthly Task
A 9 Disposal Operations Facility 1 254| DY |Daily Task
A 9 Trailer 4: Lunchroom Facility No. 9817 2 52| WK |Weekly Task
A 9 3 12| MO |Monthly Task
A 10 |Disposal Operations Facility 1 254| DY |Daily Task
A 10 |Engineer Offices Facility No. 1002 2 52| WK |Weekly Task
A 10 3 12| MO |Monthly Task
A 11 |Disposal Operations Facility 1 254| DY |Daily Task
A 11 |Gas Technician Offices Facility No. 1242 2 52| WK |Weekly Task
A 11 3 12| MO |Monthly Task
A 12 |Fee Booth Facility 1 254| DY |Daily Task
A 12 |Administration Facility No. 9814 North 2 52| WK |Weekly Task
A 12 3 12| MO |Monthly Task
A 13  |Fee Booth Facility 1 254| DY |Daily Task
A 13 |Administration Facility No. 9814 South 2 52| WK |Weekly Task
A 13 3 12| MO |Monthly Task
A 14 |Fee Booth Facility 1 254| DY |Daily Task
A 14  |Restroom - Men/Women Facility No. 9816 2 52| WK |Weekly Task
A 14 3 12| MO |Monthly Task
A 15 |Fee Booth Facility 1 254| DY |Daily Task
A 15 |Fee Booth | Facility No. 10078 2 52| WK |Weekly Task
A 15 3 12| MO |Monthly Task
A 16 |Fee Booth Facility 1 254| DY |Daily Task
A 16 |Fee Booth Il Facility No. 10491 2 52| WK |Weekly Task
A 16 3 12| MO |Monthly Task
A 17 |Fee Booth Facility 1 254| DY |Daily Task
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Bid Tabulation
10055752-15-L
Janitorial Maintenance Service at Various City Facilities

Aztec Janitorial Services
Not Part of Evaluation for Award
Est Ann Total Ann Cost |Total Ann Cost |Other Services Performed at
Schedule | Section | Location/Facility Description Item No.| Freq |U/M| Description Unit Cost Ann Cost By Section By Schedule Discretion of the City
A 17 |Fee Booth Il Facility No. 10492 2 52| WK |Weekly Task  $ 200 $ 104.00
A 17 3 12| MO |Monthly Task $ 399 S 47.88 | $ 659.88
A 18 |Fee Booth Facility 1 254| DY |Daily Task S 200 $ 508.00
A 18 |Fee Booth IV Facility No. 10366 2 52| WK |Weekly Task  $ 200 $ 104.00
A 18 3 12| MO |Monthly Task $ 399 S 47.88 | $ 659.88
A 19 |Fee Booth Facility 1 254| DY |Daily Task S 200 $ 508.00 Carpet Cleaning, Steam $ 0.11 persq ft
A 19 |Entrance Gate Guard Booth Facility no 10493 2 52| WK |Weekly Task  $ 200 $ 104.00 Tile/Ceramic - Strip, Wax, and Buff $ 0.12 per sq ft
A 19 3 12| MO |Monthly Task $ 200 $ 24.00 | $ 636.00 Rubber - Strip and Wax $ 0.12 persqft
A 20 |As Neeed Extra Cleaning Services 50| HR [XtraCleanSvc $ 21.50 S 1,075.00 | $ 1,075.00 | $ 23,430.34
B 1 Engineering Department, Field Division 1 104| DY |Daily Task S 57.73 S 6,003.92
B 1 Field Division, 9485 Aero Drive 2 52| WK |Weekly Task S 4791 $ 2,491.32
B 1 3 12| MO |Monthly Task $ 4791 S 57492 | $ 9,070.16
B 2 Field Division, 9491 Aero Drive 1 104| DY |Daily Task S 2395 $ 2,490.80
B 2 2 52| WK |Weekly Task S 11.98 $ 622.96
B 2 3 12| MO |Monthly Task $ 3593 S 431.16 | $ 3,544.92
Field Div, Office & Restrms, Mat. Test Lab, Back

B 3 |Office, 9491 Aero Dr 1 104| DY |Daily Task S 4.07 S 423.28
B 3 2 52| WK |Weekly Task S 1.92 $ 99.84
B 3 3 12| MO |Monthly Task $ 599 $ 7188 | $ 595.00
B 4 Field Division, Major Bldg. Trailer, 9515 Aero Dr 1 104| DY |Daily Task S 9.98 $ 1,037.92
B 4 2 52| WK |Weekly Task  $ 407 S 211.64 Carpet Cleaning, Steam $ 0.11 persq ft
B 4 3 12| MO |Monthly Task $ 2395 $ 287.40 | $ 1,536.96 Tile/Ceramic - Strip, Wax, and Buff $ 0.12 per sq ft
B 5 As Neeed Extra Cleaning Services 50| HR [XtraCleanSvc $ 21.50 S 1,075.00 | $ 1,075.00 | $ 15,822.04
C 1 Environmental Services Dept - Operations Station 1 260| DY |Daily Task S 71.86 S 18,683.60

2 52| WK |Weekly Task  $ 3593 S 1,868.36 Carpet Cleaning, Steam $ 0.11 persq ft

3 12| MO |Monthly Task $  263.50 $ 3,162.00 | $ 23,713.96 Tile/Ceramic - Strip, Wax, and Buff $ 0.12 per sq ft
C 2 As Neeed Extra Cleaning Services 50| HR [XtraCleanSvc $ 21.50 S 1,075.00 | $ 1,075.00 | $ 24,788.96
D 1 Fire Communications Building 1 364| DY |Daily Task S 4791 S 17,439.24
D 1 2 52| WK |Weekly Task S 11.98 $ 622.96
D 1 3 12| MO |Monthly Task $ 59.89 S 718.68 | $ 18,780.88
D 2 Fire Repair Facility 1 354| DY |Daily Task S 2395 S 8,478.30 Carpet Cleaning, Steam $ 0.11 persq ft
D 2 2 52| WK |Weekly Task  $ 17.97 $ 934.44 Carpet Cleaning, Dry $ 0.10 persq ft
D 2 3 12| MO |Monthly Task $ 3593 § 431.16 | $ 9,843.90 Tile/Ceramic - Strip, Wax, and Buff $ 0.12 per sq ft
D 3 As Neeed Extra Cleaning Services 50| HR [Xtra CleanSvc $ 2150 S 1,075.00 | $ 1,075.00 | $ 29,699.78

Total Bid Ann Cost, Schedules (A-D): | $ 93,741.12
\
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Bid Tabulation
10055752-15-L
Janitorial Maintenance Service at Various City Facilities

Commercial Cleaning Systems

Est Ann

Schedule | Section |Location/Facility Description Item No.| Freq |U/M| Description
A 1 Household Hazardous Waste Transfer Facility 1 254| DY |Daily Task
A 1 Trailer 1: Admininstration Facility No. 10333 2 52| WK |Weekly Task
A 1 3 12| MO |Monthly Task
A 2 Household Hazardous Waste Transfer Facility 1 254| DY |Daily Task
A 2 Trailer 2: Restroom/Locker Facility No 10332 2 52| WK |Weekly Task
A 2 3 12| MO |[Monthly Task
A 3 Household Hazardous Waste Transfer Facility 1 254| DY |Daily Task
A 3 Trailer 3: Mobile Mini Trailer Facility No. 210447 2 52| WK |Weekly Task
A 3 3 12| MO |Monthly Task
A 4 Field Operations/Mini-OPS 1 254| DY |Daily Task
A 4 Trailer 1: Administration Trailer Facility No. 10328 2 52| WK |Weekly Task
A 4 3 12| MO |[Monthly Task
A 5 Field Operations/Mini-OPS 1 254| DY |Daily Task
A 5 Trailer 2: Conf Rm/Restrm/Locker Fac. No. 10327 2 52| WK |Weekly Task
A 5 3 12| MO |Monthly Task
A 6 Disposal Operations Facility 1 254| DY |Daily Task
A 6 Trailer 1: Administration Facility No. 9814 2 52| WK |Weekly Task
A 6 3 12| MO |[Monthly Task
A 7 Disposal Operations Facility 1 254| DY |Daily Task
A 7 Restroom/Locker - Women Facility No. 9828 2 52| WK |Weekly Task
A 7 3 12| MO |Monthly Task
A 8 Disposal Operations Facility 1 254| DY |Daily Task
A 8 Restroom/Locker - Men Facility No. 9829 2 52| WK |Weekly Task
A 8 3 12| MO |[Monthly Task
A 9 Disposal Operations Facility 1 254| DY |Daily Task
A 9 Trailer 4: Lunchroom Facility No. 9817 2 52| WK |Weekly Task
A 9 3 12| MO |Monthly Task
A 10 |Disposal Operations Facility 1 254| DY |Daily Task
A 10 |Engineer Offices Facility No. 1002 2 52| WK |Weekly Task
A 10 3 12| MO |[Monthly Task
A 11 |Disposal Operations Facility 1 254| DY |Daily Task
A 11 |Gas Technician Offices Facility No. 1242 2 52| WK |Weekly Task
A 11 3 12| MO |[Monthly Task
A 12 |Fee Booth Facility 1 254| DY |Daily Task
A 12 |Administration Facility No. 9814 North 2 52| WK |Weekly Task
A 12 3 12| MO |[Monthly Task
A 13 |Fee Booth Facility 1 254| DY |Daily Task
A 13 |Administration Facility No. 9814 South 2 52| WK |Weekly Task
A 13 3 12| MO |[Monthly Task
A 14 |Fee Booth Facility 1 254| DY |Daily Task
A 14  |Restroom - Men/Women Facility No. 9816 2 52| WK |Weekly Task
A 14 3 12| MO |[Monthly Task
A 15 |Fee Booth Facility 1 254| DY |Daily Task
A 15 |Fee Booth I Facility No. 10078 2 52| WK |Weekly Task
A 15 3 12| MO |[Monthly Task
A 16 |Fee Booth Facility 1 254| DY |Daily Task
A 16 |Fee Booth Il Facility No. 10491 2 52| WK |Weekly Task
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Bid Tabulation
10055752-15-L
Janitorial Maintenance Service at Various City Facilities

Commercial Cleaning Systems
Total Ann Not Part of Evaluation for Award
Est Ann Total Ann Cost |Cost By Other Services Performed at
Schedule | Section |Location/Facility Description Item No.| Freq |U/M| Description Unit Cost Ann Cost By Section Schedule Discretion of the City
A 16 3 12| MO |Monthly Task  $ 1.70 $ 2040 | $ 251.82
A 17 |Fee Booth Facility 1 254| DY |Daily Task S 069 $ 175.26
A 17 |Fee Booth Ill Facility No. 10492 2 52| WK |Weekly Task S 1.08 S 56.16
A 17 3 12| MO |Monthly Task  $ 1.70 $ 20.40 | $ 251.82
A 18 |Fee Booth Facility 1 254| DY |Daily Task S 0.69 $ 175.26
A 18 |Fee Booth IV Facility No. 10366 2 52| WK |Weekly Task S 1.08 $ 56.16
A 18 3 12| MO [Monthly Task  $ 1.70 $ 20.40 | $ 251.82
A 19 |Fee Booth Facility 1 254| DY |Daily Task S 032 $ 81.28 Carpet Cleaning, Steam $ 0.10 persq ft
A 19 |Entrance Gate Guard Booth Facility no 10493 2 52| WK |Weekly Task S 0.51 $ 26.52 Tile/Ceramic - Strip, Wax, and Buff $ 0.32 persq ft
A 19 3 12| MO |Monthly Task  $ 081 $ 972 (S 117.52 Rubber - Strip and Wax S 0.25 persqft
A 20 |As Neeed Extra Cleaning Services 50| HR |[XtraCleanSvc $ 2350 $ 1,175.00 | $ 1,175.00 | $ 32,957.66
B 1  |Engineering Department, Field Division 1 104| DY |Daily Task S 66.88 S 6,955.52
B 1 Field Division, 9485 Aero Drive 2 52| WK |WeeklyTask S 42.04 $ 2,186.08
B 1 3 12| MO |MonthlyTask $ 66.49 $ 797.88 | $ 9,939.48
B 2 Field Division, 9491 Aero Drive 1 104| DY |Daily Task $ 1839 $ 1,912.56
B 2 2 52| WK |Weekly Task S 1156 S 601.12
B 2 3 12| MO |MonthlyTask $ 1828 $ 219.36 | $ 2,733.04
Field Div, Office & Restrms, Mat. Test Lab, Back

B 3 |Office, 9491 Aero Dr 1 104| DY |Daily Task S 584 S 607.36
B 3 2 52| WK |Weekly Task S 367 $ 190.84
B 3 3 12| MO |Monthly Task  $ 580 $ 69.60 | $ 867.80
B 4 |Field Division, Major Bldg. Trailer, 9515 Aero Dr 1 104| DY |Daily Task S 9.60 $  998.40
B 4 2 52| WK |Weekly Task S 6.03 $ 313.56 Carpet Cleaning, Steam $ 0.10 persq ft
B 4 3 12| MO |Monthly Task  $ 954 $ 11448 | S 1,426.44 Tile/Ceramic - Strip, Wax, and Buff $ 0.32 persq ft
B 5 As Neeed Extra Cleaning Services 50| HR |XtraCleanSvc $ 2350 $ 1,175.00 | $ 1,175.00 | $ 16,141.76
C 1 Environmental Services Dept - Operations Station 1 260| DY |Daily Task S 74.80 $ 19,448.00

2 52| WK |Weekly Task $ 117.55 $ 6,112.60 Carpet Cleaning, Steam $ 0.10 persq ft

3 12| MO |Monthly Task $ 18594 $ 2,231.28 | $ 27,791.88 Tile/Ceramic - Strip, Wax, and Buff $ 0.32 persq ft
C 2 As Neeed Extra Cleaning Services 50| HR |XtraCleanSvc $ 2350 $ 1,175.00 | $ 1,175.00 | $ 28,966.88
D 1 Fire Communications Building 1 364| DY |Daily Task S 3523 $12,823.72
D 1 2 52| WK |Weekly Task S 76.62 S 3,984.24
D 1 3 12| MO |Monthly Task $ 121.19 $ 1,454.28 | $ 18,262.24
D 2 Fire Repair Facility 1 354| DY |Daily Task S 1783 S 6,311.82 Carpet Cleaning, Steam $ 0.10 per sq ft
D 2 2 52| WK |WeeklyTask $ 28.01 $ 1,456.52 Carpet Cleaning, Dry S  0.32 persq ft
D 2 3 12| MO |MonthlyTask $ 4431 $ 531.72 | $ 8,300.06 Tile/Ceramic - Strip, Wax, and Buff $ 0.32 persq ft
D 3 As Neeed Extra Cleaning Services 50| HR |XtraCleanSvc $ 2350 $ 1,175.00 | $ 1,175.00 | $ 27,737.30

Total Bid Ann Cost, Schedules (A-D): | $ 105,803.60
[
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Bid Tabulation
10055752-15-L
Janitorial Maintenance Service at Various City Facilities

HD Cleaning
Est Ann

Schedule | Section |Location/Facility Description Item No.| Freq |U/M| Description
A 1 Household Hazardous Waste Transfer Facility 1 254| DY |Daily Task
A 1 Trailer 1: Admininstration Facility No. 10333 2 52| WK |Weekly Task
A 1 3 12| MO |Monthly Task
A 2 Household Hazardous Waste Transfer Facility 1 254| DY |Daily Task
A 2 Trailer 2: Restroom/Locker Facility No 10332 2 52| WK |Weekly Task
A 2 3 12| MO |[Monthly Task
A 3 Household Hazardous Waste Transfer Facility 1 254| DY |Daily Task
A 3 Trailer 3: Mobile Mini Trailer Facility No. 210447 2 52| WK |Weekly Task
A 3 3 12| MO |Monthly Task
A 4 Field Operations/Mini-OPS 1 254| DY |Daily Task
A 4 Trailer 1: Administration Trailer Facility No. 10328 2 52| WK |Weekly Task
A 4 3 12| MO |[Monthly Task
A 5 Field Operations/Mini-OPS 1 254| DY |Daily Task
A 5 Trailer 2: Conf Rm/Restrm/Locker Fac. No. 10327 2 52| WK |Weekly Task
A 5 3 12| MO |Monthly Task
A 6 Disposal Operations Facility 1 254| DY |Daily Task
A 6 Trailer 1: Administration Facility No. 9814 2 52| WK |Weekly Task
A 6 3 12| MO |[Monthly Task
A 7 Disposal Operations Facility 1 254| DY |Daily Task
A 7 Restroom/Locker - Women Facility No. 9828 2 52| WK |Weekly Task
A 7 3 12| MO |Monthly Task
A 8 Disposal Operations Facility 1 254| DY |Daily Task
A 8 Restroom/Locker - Men Facility No. 9829 2 52| WK |Weekly Task
A 8 3 12| MO |[Monthly Task
A 9 Disposal Operations Facility 1 254| DY |Daily Task
A 9 Trailer 4: Lunchroom Facility No. 9817 2 52| WK |Weekly Task
A 9 3 12| MO |Monthly Task
A 10 |Disposal Operations Facility 1 254| DY |Daily Task
A 10 |Engineer Offices Facility No. 1002 2 52| WK |Weekly Task
A 10 3 12| MO |[Monthly Task
A 11 |Disposal Operations Facility 1 254| DY |Daily Task
A 11 |Gas Technician Offices Facility No. 1242 2 52| WK |Weekly Task
A 11 3 12| MO |[Monthly Task
A 12 |Fee Booth Facility 1 254| DY |Daily Task
A 12 |Administration Facility No. 9814 North 2 52| WK |Weekly Task
A 12 3 12| MO |[Monthly Task
A 13 |Fee Booth Facility 1 254| DY |Daily Task
A 13 |Administration Facility No. 9814 South 2 52| WK |Weekly Task
A 13 3 12| MO |[Monthly Task
A 14 |Fee Booth Facility 1 254| DY |Daily Task
A 14  |Restroom - Men/Women Facility No. 9816 2 52| WK |Weekly Task
A 14 3 12| MO |[Monthly Task
A 15 |Fee Booth Facility 1 254| DY |Daily Task
A 15 |Fee Booth I Facility No. 10078 2 52| WK |Weekly Task
A 15 3 12| MO |[Monthly Task
A 16 |Fee Booth Facility 1 254| DY |Daily Task
A 16 |Fee Booth Il Facility No. 10491 2 52| WK |Weekly Task
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Bid Tabulation
10055752-15-L
Janitorial Maintenance Service at Various City Facilities

HD Cleaning
Total Ann Not Part of Evaluation for Award
Est Ann Total Ann Cost |Cost By Other Services Performed at
Schedule | Section |Location/Facility Description Item No.| Freq |U/M| Description Unit Cost Ann Cost By Section Schedule Discretion of the City
A 16 3 12| MO |Monthly Task  $ 0.65 $ 7.80 | $ 264.58
A 17 |Fee Booth Facility 1 254| DY |Daily Task S 097 $ 246.38
A 17 |Fee Booth Ill Facility No. 10492 2 52| WK |Weekly Task S 0.20 $ 10.40
A 17 3 12| MO |Monthly Task  $ 065 $ 7.80 | $ 264.58
A 18 |Fee Booth Facility 1 254| DY |Daily Task S 097 $ 246.38
A 18 |Fee Booth IV Facility No. 10366 2 52| WK |Weekly Task S 020 $ 10.40
A 18 3 12| MO [Monthly Task  $ 0.65 $ 7.80 | $ 264.58
A 19 |Fee Booth Facility 1 254| DY |Daily Task S 065 $ 165.10 Carpet Cleaning, Steam $  0.18 persq ft
A 19 |Entrance Gate Guard Booth Facility no 10493 2 52| WK |Weekly Task S 0.15 $ 7.80 Tile/Ceramic - Strip, Wax, and Buff $ 0.18 persq ft
A 19 3 12| MO |Monthly Task  $ 058 $ 6.96 | $ 179.86 Rubber - Strip and Wax S 0.18 persqft
A 20 |As Neeed Extra Cleaning Services 50| HR |XtraCleanSvc S 20.00 $ 1,000.00 | $ 1,000.00 | $ 18,596.02
B 1  |Engineering Department, Field Division 1 104| DY |Daily Task S 6833 S 7,106.32
B 1 Field Division, 9485 Aero Drive 2 52| WK |WeeklyTask $ 13.85 S 720.20
B 1 3 12| MO |Monthly Task  $ 985 $ 118.20 | $ 7,944.72
B 2 Field Division, 9491 Aero Drive 1 104| DY |Daily Task $ 1785 § 1,856.40
B 2 2 52| WK |Weekly Task S 685 $ 356.20
B 2 3 12| MO |Monthly Task  $ 822 § 98.64 | $ 2,311.24
Field Div, Office & Restrms, Mat. Test Lab, Back

B 3 |Office, 9491 Aero Dr 1 104| DY |Daily Task S 425 S 442.00
B 3 2 52| WK |Weekly Task S 285 § 148.20
B 3 3 12| MO |Monthly Task  $ 1.95 $ 23.40 | $ 613.60
B 4 Field Division, Major Bldg. Trailer, 9515 Aero Dr 1 104| DY |Daily Task S 6.15 $ 639.60
B 4 2 52| WK |Weekly Task S 325 §$ 169.00 Carpet Cleaning, Steam $ 0.18 persq ft
B 4 3 12| MO |Monthly Task  $ 1.95 $ 23.40 | $ 832.00 Tile/Ceramic - Strip, Wax, and Buff $ 0.18 per sq ft
B 5 As Neeed Extra Cleaning Services 50| HR |XtraCleanSvc $ 20.00 $ 1,000.00 | $ 1,000.00 | $ 12,701.56
C 1 Environmental Services Dept - Operations Station 1 260| DY |Daily Task $ 8095 $ 21,047.00

2 52| WK |WeeklyTask $ 60.15 S 3,127.80 Carpet Cleaning, Steam $ 0.18 persq ft

3 12| MO |MonthlyTask $ 96,55 $ 1,158.60 | $ 25,333.40 Tile/Ceramic - Strip, Wax, and Buff $ 0.18 per sq ft
C 2 |As Neeed Extra Cleaning Services 50| HR |XtraCleanSvc $ 20.00 $ 1,000.00 | $ 1,000.00 | $ 26,333.40
D 1 Fire Communications Building 1 364| DY |Daily Task S 3855 § 14,032.20
D 1 2 52| WK |Weekly Task S 533 § 277.16
D 1 3 12| MO |Monthly Task $ 4955 $ 594.60 | $ 14,903.96
D 2 Fire Repair Facility 1 354| DY |Daily Task S 1733 § 6,134.82 Carpet Cleaning, Steam $ 0.18 persq ft
D 2 2 52| WK |Weekly Task S 6.05 $ 314.60 Carpet Cleaning, Dry $ 0.18 persq ft
D 2 3 12| MO |Monthly Task $ 20.45 $ 24540 | S 6,694.82 Tile/Ceramic - Strip, Wax, and Buff $ 0.18 persq ft
D 3 As Neeed Extra Cleaning Services 50| HR |XtraCleanSvc $ 20.00 $ 1,000.00 | $ 1,000.00 | § 22,598.78

Total Bid Ann Cost, Schedules (A-D): | $ 80,229.76
[
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Bid Tabulation
10055752-15-L
Janitorial Maintenance Service at Various City Facilities

NMS Management, Inc

Est Ann

Schedule | Section |Location/Facility Description Item No.| Freq |U/M| Description
A 1 Household Hazardous Waste Transfer Facility 1 254| DY |Daily Task
A 1 Trailer 1: Admininstration Facility No. 10333 2 52| WK |Weekly Task
A 1 3 12| MO |Monthly Task
A 2 Household Hazardous Waste Transfer Facility 1 254| DY |Daily Task
A 2 Trailer 2: Restroom/Locker Facility No 10332 2 52| WK |Weekly Task
A 2 3 12| MO |[Monthly Task
A 3 Household Hazardous Waste Transfer Facility 1 254| DY |Daily Task
A 3 Trailer 3: Mobile Mini Trailer Facility No. 210447 2 52| WK |Weekly Task
A 3 3 12| MO |Monthly Task
A 4 Field Operations/Mini-OPS 1 254| DY |Daily Task
A 4 Trailer 1: Administration Trailer Facility No. 10328 2 52| WK |Weekly Task
A 4 3 12| MO |[Monthly Task
A 5 Field Operations/Mini-OPS 1 254| DY |Daily Task
A 5 Trailer 2: Conf Rm/Restrm/Locker Fac. No. 10327 2 52| WK |Weekly Task
A 5 3 12| MO |Monthly Task
A 6 Disposal Operations Facility 1 254| DY |Daily Task
A 6 Trailer 1: Administration Facility No. 9814 2 52| WK |Weekly Task
A 6 3 12| MO |[Monthly Task
A 7 Disposal Operations Facility 1 254| DY |Daily Task
A 7 Restroom/Locker - Women Facility No. 9828 2 52| WK |Weekly Task
A 7 3 12| MO |Monthly Task
A 8 Disposal Operations Facility 1 254| DY |Daily Task
A 8 Restroom/Locker - Men Facility No. 9829 2 52| WK |Weekly Task
A 8 3 12| MO |[Monthly Task
A 9 Disposal Operations Facility 1 254| DY |Daily Task
A 9 Trailer 4: Lunchroom Facility No. 9817 2 52| WK |Weekly Task
A 9 3 12| MO |Monthly Task
A 10 |Disposal Operations Facility 1 254| DY |Daily Task
A 10 |Engineer Offices Facility No. 1002 2 52| WK |Weekly Task
A 10 3 12| MO |[Monthly Task
A 11 |Disposal Operations Facility 1 254| DY |Daily Task
A 11 |Gas Technician Offices Facility No. 1242 2 52| WK |Weekly Task
A 11 3 12| MO |[Monthly Task
A 12 |Fee Booth Facility 1 254| DY |Daily Task
A 12 |Administration Facility No. 9814 North 2 52| WK |Weekly Task
A 12 3 12| MO |[Monthly Task
A 13 |Fee Booth Facility 1 254| DY |Daily Task
A 13 |Administration Facility No. 9814 South 2 52| WK |Weekly Task
A 13 3 12| MO |[Monthly Task
A 14 |Fee Booth Facility 1 254| DY |Daily Task
A 14  |Restroom - Men/Women Facility No. 9816 2 52| WK |Weekly Task
A 14 3 12| MO |[Monthly Task
A 15 |Fee Booth Facility 1 254| DY |Daily Task
A 15 |Fee Booth I Facility No. 10078 2 52| WK |Weekly Task
A 15 3 12| MO |[Monthly Task
A 16 |Fee Booth Facility 1 254| DY |Daily Task
A 16 |Fee Booth Il Facility No. 10491 2 52| WK |Weekly Task
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Ann Cost

Total Ann Cost
By Section

Total Ann
Cost By
Schedule

Not Part of Evaluation for Award
Other Services Performed at
Discretion of the City

2,509.52

205.40

379.32

$ 3,094.24

1,864.36
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281.64

S 2,298.36
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579.00

S 4,722.88

3,830.32

313.56

579.00
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Bid Tabulation
10055752-15-L
Janitorial Maintenance Service at Various City Facilities

NMS Management, Inc
Total Ann Not Part of Evaluation for Award
Est Ann Total Ann Cost |Cost By Other Services Performed at
Schedule | Section |Location/Facility Description Item No.| Freq |U/M| Description Unit Cost Ann Cost By Section Schedule Discretion of the City
A 16 3 12| MO |Monthly Task  $ 398 § 47.76 | S 388.72
A 17 |Fee Booth Facility 1 254| DY |Daily Task S 1.24 S 314.96
A 17 |Fee Booth Ill Facility No. 10492 2 52| WK |Weekly Task S 0.50 $ 26.00
A 17 3 12| MO |Monthly Task  $ 398 $ 47.76 | $ 388.72
A 18 |Fee Booth Facility 1 254| DY |Daily Task S 124 S 314.96
A 18 |Fee Booth IV Facility No. 10366 2 52| WK |Weekly Task S 050 $ 26.00
A 18 3 12| MO [Monthly Task  $ 398 § 47.76 | S 388.72
A 19 |Fee Booth Facility 1 254| DY |Daily Task S 059 $ 149.86 Carpet Cleaning, Steam $ 0.16 persq ft
A 19 |Entrance Gate Guard Booth Facility no 10493 2 52| WK |Weekly Task S 024 $ 12.48 Tile/Ceramic - Strip, Wax, and Buff $  0.20 persq ft
A 19 3 12| MO |Monthly Task  $ 1.88 $ 2256 | $ 184.90 Rubber - Strip and Wax S 0.20 persqft
A 20 |As Neeed Extra Cleaning Services 50| HR [XtraCleanSvc $ 22.68 $ 1,134.00|$ 1,134.00 | S 43,400.90
B 1  |Engineering Department, Field Division 1 104| DY |Daily Task S 93.07 $ 9,679.28
B 1 Field Division, 9485 Aero Drive 2 52| WK |WeeklyTask $ 3723 $ 1,935.96
B 1 3 12| MO |Monthly Task $ 22338 $ 2,680.56 | $ 14,295.80
B 2 Field Division, 9491 Aero Drive 1 104| DY |Daily Task S 2844 S 2,957.76
B 2 2 52| WK |Weekly Task S 1137 S 591.24
B 2 3 12| MO |MonthlyTask $ 6825 $ 819.00 | $ 4,368.00
Field Div, Office & Restrms, Mat. Test Lab, Back

B 3 |Office, 9491 Aero Dr 1 104| DY |Daily Task S 274 S 284.96
B 3 2 52| WK |Weekly Task S 1.10 $ 57.20
B 3 3 12| MO |Monthly Task  $ 6.57 $ 78.84 | $ 421.00
B 4 Field Division, Major Bldg. Trailer, 9515 Aero Dr 1 104| DY |Daily Task $ 1070 $ 1,112.80
B 4 2 52| WK |Weekly Task S 428 S 222.56 Carpet Cleaning, Steam $ 0.16 persq ft
B 4 3 12| MO |MonthlyTask $ 2568 $ 308.16 | $ 1,643.52 Tile/Ceramic - Strip, Wax, and Buff $ 0.20 per sq ft
B 5 As Neeed Extra Cleaning Services 50| HR [XtraCleanSvc $ 22.68 $ 1,134.00|$ 1,134.00 | $ 21,862.32
C 1 Environmental Services Dept - Operations Station 1 260| DY |Daily Task $ 13495 $ 35,087.00

2 52| WK |WeeklyTask $ 5398 $ 2,806.96 Carpet Cleaning, Steam $ 0.16 persq ft

3 12| MO |Monthly Task $ 323.87 $ 3,886.44 | $ 41,780.40 Tile/Ceramic - Strip, Wax, and Buff $ 0.20 per sq ft
C 2 As Neeed Extra Cleaning Services 50| HR |XtraCleanSvc $ 22.68 $ 1,134.00 | $ 1,134.00 | $ 42,914.40
D 1 Fire Communications Building 1 364| DY |Daily Task S 7172 $ 26,106.08
D 1 2 52| WK |Weekly Task S 3586 $ 1,864.72
D 1 3 12| MO |Monthly Task $ 215.16 $ 2,581.92 | $ 30,552.72
D 2 Fire Repair Facility 1 354| DY |Daily Task S 3726 $ 13,190.04 Carpet Cleaning, Steam $ 0.16 persq ft
D 2 2 52| WK |Weekly Task $ 18.12 S 942.24 Carpet Cleaning, Dry $ 0.20 persq ft
D 2 3 12| MO |MonthlyTask $ 108.71 $ 1,304.52 | $ 15,436.80 Tile/Ceramic - Strip, Wax, and Buff $ 0.20 per sq ft
D 3 As Neeed Extra Cleaning Services 50| HR |XtraCleanSvc $ 22.68 $ 1,134.00 | S 1,134.00 | $ 47,123.52

Total Bid Ann Cost, Schedules (A-D): | $ 155,301.14
[
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Bid Tabulation
10055752-15-L
Janitorial Maintenance Service at Various City Facilities

Property Building Maintenance Services, Inc.

Est Ann

Schedule | Section |Location/Facility Description Item No.| Freq |U/M| Description
A 1 Household Hazardous Waste Transfer Facility 1 254| DY |Daily Task
A 1 Trailer 1: Admininstration Facility No. 10333 2 52| WK |Weekly Task
A 1 3 12| MO |Monthly Task
A 2 Household Hazardous Waste Transfer Facility 1 254| DY |Daily Task
A 2 Trailer 2: Restroom/Locker Facility No 10332 2 52| WK |Weekly Task
A 2 3 12| MO |[Monthly Task
A 3 Household Hazardous Waste Transfer Facility 1 254| DY |Daily Task
A 3 Trailer 3: Mobile Mini Trailer Facility No. 210447 2 52| WK |Weekly Task
A 3 3 12| MO |Monthly Task
A 4 Field Operations/Mini-OPS 1 254| DY |Daily Task
A 4 Trailer 1: Administration Trailer Facility No. 10328 2 52| WK |Weekly Task
A 4 3 12| MO |[Monthly Task
A 5 Field Operations/Mini-OPS 1 254| DY |Daily Task
A 5 Trailer 2: Conf Rm/Restrm/Locker Fac. No. 10327 2 52| WK |Weekly Task
A 5 3 12| MO |Monthly Task
A 6 Disposal Operations Facility 1 254| DY |Daily Task
A 6 Trailer 1: Administration Facility No. 9814 2 52| WK |Weekly Task
A 6 3 12| MO |[Monthly Task
A 7 Disposal Operations Facility 1 254| DY |Daily Task
A 7 Restroom/Locker - Women Facility No. 9828 2 52| WK |Weekly Task
A 7 3 12| MO |Monthly Task
A 8 Disposal Operations Facility 1 254| DY |Daily Task
A 8 Restroom/Locker - Men Facility No. 9829 2 52| WK |Weekly Task
A 8 3 12| MO |[Monthly Task
A 9 Disposal Operations Facility 1 254| DY |Daily Task
A 9 Trailer 4: Lunchroom Facility No. 9817 2 52| WK |Weekly Task
A 9 3 12| MO |Monthly Task
A 10 |Disposal Operations Facility 1 254| DY |Daily Task
A 10 |Engineer Offices Facility No. 1002 2 52| WK |Weekly Task
A 10 3 12| MO |[Monthly Task
A 11 |Disposal Operations Facility 1 254| DY |Daily Task
A 11 |Gas Technician Offices Facility No. 1242 2 52| WK |Weekly Task
A 11 3 12| MO |[Monthly Task
A 12 |Fee Booth Facility 1 254| DY |Daily Task
A 12 |Administration Facility No. 9814 North 2 52| WK |Weekly Task
A 12 3 12| MO |[Monthly Task
A 13 |Fee Booth Facility 1 254| DY |Daily Task
A 13 |Administration Facility No. 9814 South 2 52| WK |Weekly Task
A 13 3 12| MO |[Monthly Task
A 14 |Fee Booth Facility 1 254| DY |Daily Task
A 14  |Restroom - Men/Women Facility No. 9816 2 52| WK |Weekly Task
A 14 3 12| MO |[Monthly Task
A 15 |Fee Booth Facility 1 254| DY |Daily Task
A 15 |Fee Booth I Facility No. 10078 2 52| WK |Weekly Task
A 15 3 12| MO |[Monthly Task
A 16 |Fee Booth Facility 1 254| DY |Daily Task
A 16 |Fee Booth Il Facility No. 10491 2 52| WK |Weekly Task
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Cost By
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Other Services Performed at
Discretion of the City
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1,295.40

62.40

61.20

1,419.00

1,219.20

41.60
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41.60
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20.80

26.40
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41.60
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Bid Tabulation
10055752-15-L
Janitorial Maintenance Service at Various City Facilities

Property Building Maintenance Services, Inc.
Total Ann Not Part of Evaluation for Award
Est Ann Total Ann Cost |Cost By Other Services Performed at
Schedule | Section |Location/Facility Description Item No.| Freq |U/M| Description Unit Cost Ann Cost By Section Schedule Discretion of the City
A 16 3 12| MO |Monthly Task  $ 210 $ 2520 | $ 604.80
A 17 |Fee Booth Facility 1 254| DY |Daily Task S 220 $ 558.80
A 17 |Fee Booth Ill Facility No. 10492 2 52| WK |Weekly Task S 044 S 22.88
A 17 3 12| MO |Monthly Task  $ 210 $ 2520 | $ 606.88
A 18 |Fee Booth Facility 1 254| DY |Daily Task S 220 $§ 558.80
A 18 |Fee Booth IV Facility No. 10366 2 52| WK |Weekly Task S 0.40 $ 20.80
A 18 3 12| MO [Monthly Task  $ 210 $ 2520 | $ 604.80
A 19 |Fee Booth Facility 1 254| DY |Daily Task S 1.80 $ 457.20 Carpet Cleaning, Steam $ 0.16 persq ft
A 19 |Entrance Gate Guard Booth Facility no 10493 2 52| WK |Weekly Task S 040 $ 20.80 Tile/Ceramic - Strip, Wax, and Buff $ 0.21 per sq ft
A 19 3 12| MO |Monthly Task  $ 200 $ 24.00 | $ 502.00 Rubber - Strip and Wax S 0.21 persqft
A 20 |As Neeed Extra Cleaning Services 50| HR |[XtraCleanSvc $ 3250 $ 1,625.00 | $ 1,625.00 | $ 25,478.78
B 1  |Engineering Department, Field Division 1 104| DY |Daily Task S 65.00 S$ 6,760.00
B 1  |Field Division, 9485 Aero Drive 2 52| WK |WeeklyTask $ 1550 $  806.00
B 1 3 12| MO |MonthlyTask $ 2050 $ 246.00 | $ 7,812.00
B 2 Field Division, 9491 Aero Drive 1 104| DY |Daily Task $ 1950 $ 2,028.00
B 2 2 52| WK |WeeklyTask $ 1020 $  530.40
B 2 3 12| MO |Monthly Task  $ 950 $ 114.00 | $ 2,672.40
Field Div, Office & Restrms, Mat. Test Lab, Back

B 3 |Office, 9491 Aero Dr 1 104| DY |Daily Task S 825 S  858.00
B 3 2 52| WK |Weekly Task S 510 $ 265.20
B 3 3 12| MO |Monthly Task  $ 540 $ 64.80 | $ 1,188.00
B 4 Field Division, Major Bldg. Trailer, 9515 Aero Dr 1 104| DY |Daily Task S 8.40 S 873.60
B 4 2 52| WK |Weekly Task S 510 $  265.20 Carpet Cleaning, Steam $ 0.16 persq ft
B 4 3 12| MO |Monthly Task  $ 5.40 $ 64.80 | $ 1,203.60 Tile/Ceramic - Strip, Wax, and Buff $ 0.21 persq ft
B 5 As Neeed Extra Cleaning Services 50| HR |[XtraCleanSvc $ 3250 $ 1,625.00 | $ 1,625.00 | $ 14,501.00
C 1 |Environmental Services Dept - Operations Station 1 260| DY |Daily Task S 61.80 $ 16,068.00

2 52| WK |WeeklyTask $ 35.80 $ 1,861.60 Carpet Cleaning, Steam $ 0.16 persq ft

3 12| MO |MonthlyTask $ 67.00 $  804.00 | $ 18,733.60 Tile/Ceramic - Strip, Wax, and Buff $ 0.21 persq ft
C 2 As Neeed Extra Cleaning Services 50| HR |[XtraCleanSvc $ 3250 $ 1,625.00 | $ 1,625.00 | $ 20,358.60
D 1 Fire Communications Building 1 364| DY |Daily Task $ 29.50 $ 10,738.00
D 1 2 52| WK |Weekly Task S 510 $ 265.20
D 1 3 12| MO |MonthlyTask $ 3750 $ 450.00 | $ 11,453.20
D 2 Fire Repair Facility 1 354| DY |Daily Task S 16.80 $ 5,947.20 Carpet Cleaning, Steam $ 0.12 persq ft
D 2 2 52| WK |Weekly Task S 510 $  265.20 Carpet Cleaning, Dry S 0.12 persq ft
D 2 3 12| MO |MonthlyTask $ 1850 $  222.00 | $ 6,434.40 Tile/Ceramic - Strip, Wax, and Buff $ 0.21 per sq ft
D 3 As Neeed Extra Cleaning Services 50| HR |XtraCleanSvc $ 3250 $ 1,625.00 | $ 1,625.00 | $ 19,512.60

Total Bid Ann Cost, Schedules (A-D): | $ 79,850.98
[
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Bid Tabulation
10055752-15-L
Janitorial Maintenance Service at Various City Facilities

Prizm Janitorial Services, Inc.

Est Ann

Schedule | Section |Location/Facility Description Item No.| Freq |U/M| Description
A 1 Household Hazardous Waste Transfer Facility 1 254| DY |Daily Task
A 1 Trailer 1: Admininstration Facility No. 10333 2 52| WK |Weekly Task
A 1 3 12| MO |Monthly Task
A 2 Household Hazardous Waste Transfer Facility 1 254| DY |Daily Task
A 2 Trailer 2: Restroom/Locker Facility No 10332 2 52| WK |Weekly Task
A 2 3 12| MO |Monthly Task
A 3 Household Hazardous Waste Transfer Facility 1 254| DY |Daily Task
A 3 Trailer 3: Mobile Mini Trailer Facility No. 210447 2 52| WK |Weekly Task
A 3 3 12| MO |Monthly Task
A 4 Field Operations/Mini-OPS 1 254| DY |Daily Task
A 4 Trailer 1: Administration Trailer Facility No. 10328 2 52| WK |Weekly Task
A 4 3 12| MO |Monthly Task
A 5 Field Operations/Mini-OPS 1 254| DY |Daily Task
A 5 Trailer 2: Conf Rm/Restrm/Locker Fac. No. 10327 2 52| WK |Weekly Task
A 5 3 12| MO |Monthly Task
A 6 Disposal Operations Facility 1 254| DY |Daily Task
A 6 Trailer 1: Administration Facility No. 9814 2 52| WK |Weekly Task
A 6 3 12| MO |Monthly Task
A 7 Disposal Operations Facility 1 254| DY |Daily Task
A 7 Restroom/Locker - Women Facility No. 9828 2 52| WK |Weekly Task
A 7 3 12| MO |Monthly Task
A 8 Disposal Operations Facility 1 254| DY |Daily Task
A 8 Restroom/Locker - Men Facility No. 9829 2 52| WK |Weekly Task
A 8 3 12| MO |Monthly Task
A 9 Disposal Operations Facility 1 254| DY |Daily Task
A 9 Trailer 4: Lunchroom Facility No. 9817 2 52| WK |Weekly Task
A 9 3 12| MO |Monthly Task
A 10 |Disposal Operations Facility 1 254| DY |Daily Task
A 10 |Engineer Offices Facility No. 1002 2 52| WK |Weekly Task
A 10 3 12| MO |[Monthly Task
A 11 |Disposal Operations Facility 1 254| DY |Daily Task
A 11  |Gas Technician Offices Facility No. 1242 2 52| WK |Weekly Task
A 11 3 12| MO |[Monthly Task
A 12 |Fee Booth Facility 1 254| DY |Daily Task
A 12 |Administration Facility No. 9814 North 2 52| WK |Weekly Task
A 12 3 12| MO |[Monthly Task
A 13 |Fee Booth Facility 1 254| DY |Daily Task
A 13 |Administration Facility No. 9814 South 2 52| WK |Weekly Task
A 13 3 12| MO |[Monthly Task
A 14  |Fee Booth Facility 1 254| DY |Daily Task
A 14  |Restroom - Men/Women Facility No. 9816 2 52| WK |Weekly Task
A 14 3 12| MO |[Monthly Task
A 15 |Fee Booth Facility 1 254| DY |Daily Task
A 15 |Fee Booth | Facility No. 10078 2 52| WK |Weekly Task
A 15 3 12| MO |[Monthly Task
A 16 |Fee Booth Facility 1 254| DY |Daily Task
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13.82
1.57
3.19
13.82
1.57
3.19
13.82
1.57
3.19
13.82
1.57
3.19
13.82
1.57
3.19
13.82
1.57
3.19
13.82
1.57
3.19
13.82
1.57
3.19
13.82
1.57
3.19
13.82
1.57
3.19
13.82
1.57

Ann Cost

Total Ann Cost
By Section

Total Ann
Cost By
Schedule

Not Part of Evaluation for Award
Other Services Performed at
Discretion of the City

398.78

165.88

165.84

S 730.50

398.78

165.88

165.84

S 730.50

398.78

165.88

165.84

S 730.50

398.78

165.88

165.84

s 730.50

398.78

165.88

165.84

s 730.50

398.78

165.88

165.84

s 730.50

398.78

165.88

165.84

s 730.50

398.78

165.88

165.84

s 730.50

398.78

165.88

165.84

s 730.50

398.78

165.88

165.84

s 730.50

398.78

165.88

165.84

s 730.50

398.78

165.88

165.84

$ 730.50

398.78

165.88

165.84

$ 730.50

398.78

165.88

165.84

$ 730.50

398.78

165.88

165.84

$ 730.50
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Bid Tabulation
10055752-15-L
Janitorial Maintenance Service at Various City Facilities

Prizm Janitorial Services, Inc.
Total Ann Not Part of Evaluation for Award
Est Ann Total Ann Cost |Cost By Other Services Performed at
Schedule | Section |Location/Facility Description Item No.| Freq |U/M| Description Unit Cost Ann Cost By Section Schedule Discretion of the City
A 16 Fee Booth Il Facility No. 10491 2 52| WK |Weekly Task S 3.19 $ 165.88
A 16 3 12| MO [Monthly Task $ 13.82 $ 165.84 | $ 730.50
A 17  |Fee Booth Facility 1 254| DY |Daily Task S 1.57 S 398.78
A 17 Fee Booth Ill Facility No. 10492 2 52| WK |Weekly Task S 3.19 $ 165.88
A 17 3 12| MO [Monthly Task $ 13.82 $ 165.84 | $ 730.50
A 18 |Fee Booth Facility 1 254| DY |Daily Task S 1.57 S 398.78
A 18 Fee Booth IV Facility No. 10366 2 52| WK |Weekly Task S 3.19 $ 165.88
A 18 3 12| MO [Monthly Task $ 13.82 $ 165.84 | $ 730.50
A 19 |Fee Booth Facility 1 254| DY |Daily Task S 1.57 $ 398.78 Carpet Cleaning, Steam $ 0.35 persq ft
A 19 Entrance Gate Guard Booth Facility no 10493 2 52| WK |Weekly Task S 3.19 $ 165.88 Tile/Ceramic - Strip, Wax, and Buff $  0.35 persq ft
A 19 3 12| MO [Monthly Task $ 13.82 $ 165.84 | $ 730.50 Rubber - Strip and Wax S 035 persqft
A 20 |As Neeed Extra Cleaning Services 50| HR |XtraCleanSvc $ 16.14 $ 807.00 | $ 807.00 | $ 14,686.50
B 1 Engineering Department, Field Division 1 104| DY |Daily Task S 17.23 $1,791.92
B 1 Field Division, 9485 Aero Drive 2 52| WK |WeeklyTask S 34.45 $1,791.40
B 1 3 12| MO |Monthly Task $ 149.30 $1,791.60 | $ 5,374.92
B 2 Field Division, 9491 Aero Drive 1 104| DY |Daily Task 5 5.77 $ 600.08
B 2 2 52| WK |WeeklyTask S 11.54 $ 600.08
B 2 3 12| MO |Monthly Task $ 50.00 $ 600.00 | $ 1,800.16
Field Div, Office & Restrms, Mat. Test Lab, Back

B 3 Office, 9491 Aero Dr 1 104| DY |Daily Task S 337 S 350.48
B 3 2 52| WK |Weekly Task S 6.73 $ 349.96
B 3 3 12| MO |Monthly Task $ 29.16 $ 34992 | $ 1,050.36
B 4 Field Division, Major Bldg. Trailer, 9515 Aero Dr 1 104| DY |Daily Task S 251 $ 261.04
B 4 2 52| WK |Weekly Task S 502 $ 261.04 Carpet Cleaning, Steam $ 0.35 persqft
B 4 3 12| MO |Monthly Task $ 21.76 $ 261.12 | $ 783.20 Tile/Ceramic - Strip, Wax, and Buff $  0.35 persq ft
B 5 As Neeed Extra Cleaning Services 50| HR |XtraCleanSvc $ 16.14 $ 807.00 | $ 807.00 | $ 9,815.64
C 1 Environmental Services Dept - Operations Station 1 260| DY |Daily Task $ 2357 $6,128.20

2 52| WK |WeeklyTask $ 117.83 $6,127.16 Carpet Cleaning, Steam $  0.35 persqft

3 12| MO |Monthly Task $ 510.59 $6,127.08 | $ 18,382.44 Tile/Ceramic - Strip, Wax, and Buff $  0.35 persq ft
C 2 |As Neeed Extra Cleaning Services 50| HR |XtraCleanSvc $ 16.14 $ 807.00 | $ 807.00 | $ 19,189.44
D 1 Fire Communications Building 1 364| DY |Daily Task S 12.27 $4,466.28
D 1 2 52| WK |Weekly Task S 8590 $4,466.80
D 1 3 12| MO [Monthly Task $ 372.20 $4,466.40 | $ 13,399.48
D 2 Fire Repair Facility 1 354| DY |Daily Task S 6.63 $2,347.02 Carpet Cleaning, Steam $ 0.35 persq ft
D 2 2 52| WK |Weekly Task S 45.16 $2,348.32 Carpet Cleaning, Dry $ 0.20 per sq ft
D 2 3 12| MO [Monthly Task $ 195.68 $2,348.16 | $ 7,043.50 Tile/Ceramic - Strip, Wax, and Buff $  0.35 persq ft
D 3 As Neeed Extra Cleaning Services 50| HR |XtraCleanSvc $§ 16.14 $ 807.00 | $ 807.00 | S 21,249.98

Total Bid Ann Cost, Schedules (A-D): | $ 64,941.56
[
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Bid Tabulation
10055752-15-L
Janitorial Maintenance Service at Various City Facilities

T & T Janitorial, Inc.*

Est Ann

Schedule | Section |Location/Facility Description Item No.| Freq |U/M| Description
A 1 Household Hazardous Waste Transfer Facility 1 254| DY |Daily Task
A 1 Trailer 1: Admininstration Facility No. 10333 2 52| WK |Weekly Task
A 1 3 12| MO |Monthly Task
A 2 Household Hazardous Waste Transfer Facility 1 254| DY |Daily Task
A 2 Trailer 2: Restroom/Locker Facility No 10332 2 52| WK |Weekly Task
A 2 3 12| MO |Monthly Task
A 3 Household Hazardous Waste Transfer Facility 1 254| DY |Daily Task
A 3 Trailer 3: Mobile Mini Trailer Facility No. 210447 2 52| WK |Weekly Task
A 3 3 12| MO |Monthly Task
A 4 Field Operations/Mini-OPS 1 254| DY |Daily Task
A 4 Trailer 1: Administration Trailer Facility No. 10328 2 52| WK |Weekly Task
A 4 3 12| MO |Monthly Task
A 5 Field Operations/Mini-OPS 1 254| DY |Daily Task
A 5 Trailer 2: Conf Rm/Restrm/Locker Fac. No. 10327 2 52| WK |Weekly Task
A 5 3 12| MO |Monthly Task
A 6 Disposal Operations Facility 1 254| DY |Daily Task
A 6 Trailer 1: Administration Facility No. 9814 2 52| WK |Weekly Task
A 6 3 12| MO |Monthly Task
A 7 Disposal Operations Facility 1 254| DY |Daily Task
A 7 Restroom/Locker - Women Facility No. 9828 2 52| WK |Weekly Task
A 7 3 12| MO |Monthly Task
A 8 Disposal Operations Facility 1 254| DY |Daily Task
A 8 Restroom/Locker - Men Facility No. 9829 2 52| WK |Weekly Task
A 8 3 12| MO |Monthly Task
A 9 Disposal Operations Facility 1 254| DY |Daily Task
A 9 Trailer 4: Lunchroom Facility No. 9817 2 52| WK |Weekly Task
A 9 3 12| MO |Monthly Task
A 10 |Disposal Operations Facility 1 254| DY |Daily Task
A 10 |Engineer Offices Facility No. 1002 2 52| WK |Weekly Task
A 10 3 12| MO |Monthly Task
A 11 |Disposal Operations Facility 1 254| DY |Daily Task
A 11  |Gas Technician Offices Facility No. 1242 2 52| WK |Weekly Task
A 11 3 12| MO |Monthly Task
A 12 |Fee Booth Facility 1 254| DY |Daily Task
A 12 |Administration Facility No. 9814 North 2 52| WK |Weekly Task
A 12 3 12| MO |Monthly Task
A 13 |Fee Booth Facility 1 254| DY |Daily Task
A 13 |Administration Facility No. 9814 South 2 52| WK |Weekly Task
A 13 3 12| MO |Monthly Task
A 14 |Fee Booth Facility 1 254| DY |Daily Task
A 14  |Restroom - Men/Women Facility No. 9816 2 52| WK |Weekly Task
A 14 3 12| MO |Monthly Task
A 15 |Fee Booth Facility 1 254| DY |Daily Task
A 15 |Fee Booth | Facility No. 10078 2 52| WK |Weekly Task
A 15 3 12| MO |Monthly Task
A 16 |Fee Booth Facility 1 254| DY |Daily Task
A 16 |Fee Booth Il Facility No. 10491 2 52| WK |Weekly Task
A 16 3 12| MO |Monthly Task
A 17 |Fee Booth Facility 1 254| DY |Daily Task
A 17  |Fee Booth IIl Facility No. 10492 2 52| WK |Weekly Task

Unit Cost

Ann Cost

Total Ann Cost
By Section

Total Ann
Cost By
Schedule

Includes
SLBE/ELBE 2%
Discount

Not Part of Evaluation for Award
Other Services Performed at
Discretion of the City

No Bid Schedule A
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Bid Tabulation
10055752-15-L
Janitorial Maintenance Service at Various City Facilities

T & T Janitorial, Inc.*
Total Ann Includes Not Part of Evaluation for Award
Est Ann Total Ann Cost |Cost By SLBE/ELBE 2% |Other Services Performed at
Schedule | Section |Location/Facility Description Item No.| Freq |U/M| Description  Unit Cost Ann Cost By Section Schedule Discount Discretion of the City
A 17 3 12| MO |Monthly Task S - S -
A 18 |Fee Booth Facility 1 254| DY |Daily Task S -
A 18 |Fee Booth IV Facility No. 10366 2 52| WK |Weekly Task S -
A 18 3 12| MO |Monthly Task S - S -
A 19 |Fee Booth Facility 1 254| DY |Daily Task S - Carpet Cleaning, Steam per sq ft
A 19 |Entrance Gate Guard Booth Facility no 10493 2 52| WK |Weekly Task S - Tile/Ceramic - Strip, Wax, and Buff per sq ft
A 19 3 12| MO |Monthly Task S - S - Rubber - Strip and Wax per sq ft
A 20 |As Neeed Extra Cleaning Services 50| HR [Xtra Clean Svc S - S - S - No Bid Schedule A
B 1 Engineering Department, Field Division 1 104| DY |Daily Task $ 100.00 $ 10,400.00
B 1 Field Division, 9485 Aero Drive 2 52| WK |Weekly Task $ 25.00 $ 1,300.00
B 1 3 12| MO |Monthly Task $ 50.00 $ 600.00 | $ 12,300.00
B 2 Field Division, 9491 Aero Drive 1 104| DY |Daily Task $ 22.00 $ 2,288.00
B 2 2 52| WK |Weekly Task $ 1500 S 780.00
B 2 3 12| MO |Monthly Task  $ 20.00 $ 240.00 | $ 3,308.00
Field Div, Office & Restrms, Mat. Test Lab, Back
B 3 Office, 9491 Aero Dr 1 104| DY |Daily Task S 2.00 $ 208.00
B 3 2 52| WK |Weekly Task S 400 $ 208.00
B 3 3 12| MO |Monthly Task  $ 500 $ 60.00 | $ 476.00
B 4 Field Division, Major Bldg. Trailer, 9515 Aero Dr 1 104| DY |Daily Task $ 10.00 $ 1,040.00
B 4 2 52| WK |WeeklyTask $ 12.00 $ 624.00 Carpet Cleaning, Steam $ 0.95 per sq ft
B 4 3 12| MO |MonthlyTask $ 2000 $ 240.00 | $ 1,904.00 Tile/Ceramic - Strip, Wax, and Buff $  1.50 per sq ft
B 5 As Neeed Extra Cleaning Services 50| HR |XtraCleanSvc $ 15.00 $  750.00 | $ 750.00 | $ 18,738.00 | $ 18,363.24
C 1 |Environmental Services Dept - Operations Station 1 260| DY |Daily Task S 55.00 $ 14,300.00
2 52| WK |WeeklyTask $ 70.00 $ 3,640.00 Carpet Cleaning, Steam $ 0.95 per sq ft
3 12| MO |Monthly Task $ 150.00 $ 1,800.00 | $ 19,740.00 Tile/Ceramic - Strip, Wax, and Buff $ 1.50 per sq ft
C 2 |As Neeed Extra Cleaning Services 50| HR |XtraCleanSvc $ 15.00 $  750.00 | $ 750.00 | S 20,490.00 | $ 20,080.20
D 1 Fire Communications Building 1 364| DY |Daily Task $  40.00 $ 14,560.00
D 1 2 52| WK |Weekly Task $ 50.00 $ 2,600.00
D 1 3 12| MO |Monthly Task $  75.00 $ 900.00 | $ 18,060.00
D 2 Fire Repair Facility 1 354| DY |Daily Task $ 20.00 $ 7,080.00 Carpet Cleaning, Steam $ 0.95 per sq ft
D 2 2 52| WK |WeeklyTask $ 50.00 $ 2,600.00 Carpet Cleaning, Dry $ 0.85 per sq ft
D 2 3 12| MO |Monthly Task $ 50.00 $ 600.00 | $ 10,280.00 Tile/Ceramic - Strip, Wax, and Buff $  1.50 per sq ft
D 3 As Neeed Extra Cleaning Services 50| HR [XtraCleanSvc $ 15.00 $ 750.00 | $ 750.00 | $ 29,090.00 | $ 28,508.20
Total Bid Ann Cost, Schedules (A-D): | $ 68,318.00 | $ 66,951.64
* Qualified SLBE/ELBE
Note: T and T No Bid Schedule A
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Bid Tabulation
10055752-15-L
Janitorial Maintenance Service at Various City Facilities

Tom Van Duong

Est Ann

Schedule | Section |Location/Facility Description Item No.| Freq |U/M| Description
A 1 Household Hazardous Waste Transfer Facility 1 254| DY |Daily Task
A 1 Trailer 1: Admininstration Facility No. 10333 2 52| WK |Weekly Task
A 1 3 12| MO |Monthly Task
A 2 Household Hazardous Waste Transfer Facility 1 254| DY |Daily Task
A 2 Trailer 2: Restroom/Locker Facility No 10332 2 52| WK |Weekly Task
A 2 3 12| MO |[Monthly Task
A 3 Household Hazardous Waste Transfer Facility 1 254| DY |Daily Task
A 3 Trailer 3: Mobile Mini Trailer Facility No. 210447 2 52| WK |Weekly Task
A 3 3 12| MO |Monthly Task
A 4 Field Operations/Mini-OPS 1 254| DY |Daily Task
A 4 Trailer 1: Administration Trailer Facility No. 10328 2 52| WK |Weekly Task
A 4 3 12| MO |[Monthly Task
A 5 Field Operations/Mini-OPS 1 254| DY |Daily Task
A 5 Trailer 2: Conf Rm/Restrm/Locker Fac. No. 10327 2 52| WK |Weekly Task
A 5 3 12| MO |Monthly Task
A 6 Disposal Operations Facility 1 254| DY |Daily Task
A 6 Trailer 1: Administration Facility No. 9814 2 52| WK |Weekly Task
A 6 3 12| MO |[Monthly Task
A 7 Disposal Operations Facility 1 254| DY |Daily Task
A 7 Restroom/Locker - Women Facility No. 9828 2 52| WK |Weekly Task
A 7 3 12| MO |Monthly Task
A 8 Disposal Operations Facility 1 254| DY |Daily Task
A 8 Restroom/Locker - Men Facility No. 9829 2 52| WK |Weekly Task
A 8 3 12| MO |[Monthly Task
A 9 Disposal Operations Facility 1 254| DY |Daily Task
A 9 Trailer 4: Lunchroom Facility No. 9817 2 52| WK |Weekly Task
A 9 3 12| MO |Monthly Task
A 10 |Disposal Operations Facility 1 254| DY |Daily Task
A 10 |Engineer Offices Facility No. 1002 2 52| WK |Weekly Task
A 10 3 12| MO |[Monthly Task
A 11 |Disposal Operations Facility 1 254| DY |Daily Task
A 11 |Gas Technician Offices Facility No. 1242 2 52| WK |Weekly Task
A 11 3 12| MO |[Monthly Task
A 12 |Fee Booth Facility 1 254| DY |Daily Task
A 12 |Administration Facility No. 9814 North 2 52| WK |Weekly Task
A 12 3 12| MO |[Monthly Task
A 13 |Fee Booth Facility 1 254| DY |Daily Task
A 13 |Administration Facility No. 9814 South 2 52| WK |Weekly Task
A 13 3 12| MO |[Monthly Task
A 14 |Fee Booth Facility 1 254| DY |Daily Task
A 14  |Restroom - Men/Women Facility No. 9816 2 52| WK |Weekly Task
A 14 3 12| MO |[Monthly Task
A 15 |Fee Booth Facility 1 254| DY |Daily Task
A 15 |Fee Booth I Facility No. 10078 2 52| WK |Weekly Task
A 15 3 12| MO |[Monthly Task
A 16 |Fee Booth Facility 1 254| DY |Daily Task
A 16 |Fee Booth Il Facility No. 10491 2 52| WK |Weekly Task
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Ann Cost

Total Ann Cost
By Section

Total Ann
Cost By
Schedule

Not Part of Evaluation for Award
Other Services Performed at
Discretion of the City

1,651.00

338.00

84.00

S 2,073.00

1,651.00

338.00

84.00

S 2,073.00

1,270.00

208.00

84.00

S 1,562.00

2,159.00

364.00

120.00

S 2,643.00

2,159.00

364.00

120.00

S 2,643.00

2,159.00

364.00

120.00

S 2,643.00

762.00

130.00

60.00

$ 952.00

762.00

130.00

60.00

S 952.00

762.00

130.00

60.00

$ 952.00

3,048.00

468.00

120.00

S 3,636.00

762.00

130.00

60.00

$ 952.00

2,159.00

364.00

120.00

S 2,643.00

2,159.00

468.00

120.00

S 2,747.00

762.00

130.00

60.00

S 952.00

762.00

130.00

60.00

$ 952.00

762.00

130.00
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Bid Tabulation
10055752-15-L
Janitorial Maintenance Service at Various City Facilities

Tom Van Duong
Total Ann Not Part of Evaluation for Award
Est Ann Total Ann Cost |Cost By Other Services Performed at
Schedule | Section |Location/Facility Description Item No.| Freq |U/M| Description Unit Cost Ann Cost By Section Schedule Discretion of the City
A 16 3 12| MO |Monthly Task  $ 5.00 $ 60.00 | $ 952.00
A 17 |Fee Booth Facility 1 254| DY |Daily Task S 200 $ 508.00
A 17 |Fee Booth Ill Facility No. 10492 2 52| WK |Weekly Task S 250 $ 130.00
A 17 3 12| MO |Monthly Task  $ 500 $ 60.00 | $ 698.00
A 18 |Fee Booth Facility 1 254| DY |Daily Task S 2.00 $ 508.00
A 18 |Fee Booth IV Facility No. 10366 2 52| WK |Weekly Task S 250 $  130.00
A 18 3 12| MO [Monthly Task  $ 5.00 $ 60.00 | $ 698.00
A 19 |Fee Booth Facility 1 254| DY |Daily Task S 1.50 $  381.00 Carpet Cleaning, Steam $ 0.35 persq ft
A 19 |Entrance Gate Guard Booth Facility no 10493 2 52| WK |Weekly Task S 2.00 $ 104.00 Tile/Ceramic - Strip, Wax, and Buff $ 0.30 per sq ft
A 19 3 12| MO |Monthly Task  $ 500 $ 60.00 | $ 545.00 Rubber - Strip and Wax S 0.25 persqft
A 20 |As Neeed Extra Cleaning Services 50| HR |[XtraCleanSvc $ 20.00 $ 1,000.00 | $ 1,000.00 | $ 32,268.00
B 1  |Engineering Department, Field Division 1 104| DY |Daily Task $ 130.00 S 13,520.00
B 1  |Field Division, 9485 Aero Drive 2 52| WK |WeeklyTask $ 30.50 $ 1,586.00
B 1 3 12| MO |MonthlyTask $ 50.00 $ 600.00 | $ 15,706.00
B 2 |Field Division, 9491 Aero Drive 1 104| DY |Daily Task S 45.00 $ 4,680.00
B 2 2 52| WK |WeeklyTask $ 1550 $  806.00
B 2 3 12| MO |MonthlyTask $ 12.00 $ 144.00 | $ 5,630.00
Field Div, Office & Restrms, Mat. Test Lab, Back

B 3 |Office, 9491 Aero Dr 1 104| DY |Daily Task S 450 $  468.00
B 3 2 52| WK |Weekly Task S 4.00 S 208.00
B 3 3 12| MO |Monthly Task  $ 500 $ 60.00 | $ 736.00
B 4 Field Division, Major Bldg. Trailer, 9515 Aero Dr 1 104| DY |Daily Task S 550 $ 572.00
B 4 2 52| WK |WeeklyTask $ 10.00 $  520.00 Carpet Cleaning, Steam $ 0.35 persq ft
B 4 3 12| MO |MonthlyTask $ 12.00 $  144.00 | $ 1,236.00 Tile/Ceramic - Strip, Wax, and Buff $ 0.30 persq ft
B 5 As Neeed Extra Cleaning Services 50| HR |XtraCleanSvc $ 20.00 $ 1,000.00 | $ 1,000.00 | $ 24,308.00
C 1 Environmental Services Dept - Operations Station 1 260| DY |Daily Task $ 130.00 $ 33,800.00

2 52| WK |WeeklyTask $ 35.00 $ 1,820.00 Carpet Cleaning, Steam $ 0.35 persq ft

3 12| MO |MonthlyTask $ 40.00 $  480.00 | $ 36,100.00 Tile/Ceramic - Strip, Wax, and Buff $ 0.30 persq ft
C 2 |As Neeed Extra Cleaning Services 50| HR |XtraCleanSvc $ 20.00 $ 1,000.00 | $ 1,000.00 | $ 37,100.00
D 1 Fire Communications Building 1 364| DY |Daily Task S 45,00 $ 16,380.00
D 1 2 52| WK |Weekly Task $ 25.00 $ 1,300.00
D 1 3 12| MO |MonthlyTask $ 30.00 $ 360.00 | $ 18,040.00
D 2 Fire Repair Facility 1 354| DY |Daily Task S 30.00 $ 10,620.00 Carpet Cleaning, Steam $ 0.35 persq ft
D 2 2 52| WK |WeeklyTask $ 25.00 $ 1,300.00 Carpet Cleaning, Dry S 0.20 persq ft
D 2 3 12| MO |MonthlyTask $ 30.00 $ 360.00 | $ 12,280.00 Tile/Ceramic - Strip, Wax, and Buff $ 0.30 per sq ft
D 3 As Neeed Extra Cleaning Services 50| HR |XtraCleanSvc $ 20.00 $ 1,000.00 | $ 1,000.00 | $ 31,320.00

Total Bid Ann Cost, Schedules (A-D): | $ 124,996.00
[
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Bid Tabulation
10055752-15-L
Janitorial Maintenance Service at Various City Facilities

TP Janitorial Services, Inc

Est Ann

Schedule | Section |Location/Facility Description Item No.| Freq |U/M| Description
A 1 Household Hazardous Waste Transfer Facility 1 254| DY |Daily Task
A 1 Trailer 1: Admininstration Facility No. 10333 2 52| WK |Weekly Task
A 1 3 12| MO |Monthly Task
A 2 Household Hazardous Waste Transfer Facility 1 254| DY |Daily Task
A 2 Trailer 2: Restroom/Locker Facility No 10332 2 52| WK |Weekly Task
A 2 3 12| MO |Monthly Task
A 3 Household Hazardous Waste Transfer Facility 1 254| DY |Daily Task
A 3 Trailer 3: Mobile Mini Trailer Facility No. 210447 2 52| WK |Weekly Task
A 3 3 12| MO |Monthly Task
A 4 Field Operations/Mini-OPS 1 254| DY |Daily Task
A 4 Trailer 1: Administration Trailer Facility No. 10328 2 52| WK |Weekly Task
A 4 3 12| MO |Monthly Task
A 5 Field Operations/Mini-OPS 1 254| DY |Daily Task
A 5 Trailer 2: Conf Rm/Restrm/Locker Fac. No. 10327 2 52| WK |Weekly Task
A 5 3 12| MO |Monthly Task
A 6 Disposal Operations Facility 1 254| DY |Daily Task
A 6 Trailer 1: Administration Facility No. 9814 2 52| WK |Weekly Task
A 6 3 12| MO |Monthly Task
A 7 Disposal Operations Facility 1 254| DY |Daily Task
A 7 Restroom/Locker - Women Facility No. 9828 2 52| WK |Weekly Task
A 7 3 12| MO |Monthly Task
A 8 Disposal Operations Facility 1 254| DY |Daily Task
A 8 Restroom/Locker - Men Facility No. 9829 2 52| WK |Weekly Task
A 8 3 12| MO |Monthly Task
A 9 Disposal Operations Facility 1 254| DY |Daily Task
A 9 Trailer 4: Lunchroom Facility No. 9817 2 52| WK |Weekly Task
A 9 3 12| MO |Monthly Task
A 10 |Disposal Operations Facility 1 254| DY |Daily Task
A 10 |Engineer Offices Facility No. 1002 2 52| WK |Weekly Task
A 10 3 12| MO |[Monthly Task
A 11 |Disposal Operations Facility 1 254| DY |Daily Task
A 11  |Gas Technician Offices Facility No. 1242 2 52| WK |Weekly Task
A 11 3 12| MO |[Monthly Task
A 12 |Fee Booth Facility 1 254| DY |Daily Task
A 12 |Administration Facility No. 9814 North 2 52| WK |Weekly Task
A 12 3 12| MO |[Monthly Task
A 13 |Fee Booth Facility 1 254| DY |Daily Task
A 13 |Administration Facility No. 9814 South 2 52| WK |Weekly Task
A 13 3 12| MO |[Monthly Task
A 14  |Fee Booth Facility 1 254| DY |Daily Task
A 14  |Restroom - Men/Women Facility No. 9816 2 52| WK |Weekly Task
A 14 3 12| MO |[Monthly Task
A 15 |Fee Booth Facility 1 254| DY |Daily Task
A 15 |Fee Booth | Facility No. 10078 2 52| WK |Weekly Task
A 15 3 12| MO |[Monthly Task
A 16 |Fee Booth Facility 1 254| DY |Daily Task

Unit Cost

$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$

3.45
1.25
3.55
3.15
0.92
4.63
0.75
0.20
0.65
6.76
1.06
8.89
6.76
1.06
8.89
6.75
113
9.21
1.60
0.40
1.71
1.60
0.40
1.71
1.65
0.83
3.03
6.75
1.13
9.21
2.05
0.52
1.83
6.75
1.13
9.21
6.75
1.13
9.21
1.65
0.45
1.75
0.97
0.20
0.65
0.97

Ann Cost

Total Ann Cost
By Section

Total Ann
Cost By
Schedule

Not Part of Evaluation for Award
Other Services Performed at
Discretion of the City

876.30

65.00

42.60

S 983.90

800.10

47.84

55.56

S 903.50

190.50

10.40

7.80

S 208.70

1,717.04

55.12

106.68

$ 1,878.84

1,717.04

55.12

106.68

$ 1,878.84

1,714.50

58.76

110.52

s 1,883.78

406.40

20.80

20.52

S 447.72

406.40

20.80

20.52

S 447.72

419.10

43.16

36.36

$ 498.62

1,714.50

58.76

110.52

s 1,883.78

520.70

27.04

21.96

$ 569.70

1,714.50

58.76

110.52

$ 1,883.78

1,714.50

58.76

110.52

$ 1,883.78

419.10

23.40

21.00

$ 463.50

246.38

10.40

7.80

$ 264.58

R R A R R T RV RV N Y N Y A R Y T S RV RN Y N R A R A RV Y S RV R N N R A RV N RV R S RV S R N R N R A RV RV RV S RV S VN RV S RV RV RV ARV S RV S RV RV A RV SRV ARV S

246.38
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Bid Tabulation
10055752-15-L
Janitorial Maintenance Service at Various City Facilities

TP Janitorial Services, Inc
Total Ann Not Part of Evaluation for Award
Est Ann Total Ann Cost |Cost By Other Services Performed at
Schedule | Section |Location/Facility Description Item No.| Freq |U/M| Description Unit Cost Ann Cost By Section Schedule Discretion of the City
A 16 Fee Booth Il Facility No. 10491 2 52| WK |Weekly Task S 020 §$ 10.40
A 16 3 12| MO [Monthly Task $ 0.65 $ 7.80 | $ 264.58
A 17  |Fee Booth Facility 1 254| DY |Daily Task S 0.97 $ 246.38
A 17 Fee Booth Ill Facility No. 10492 2 52| WK |Weekly Task S 020 §$ 10.40
A 17 3 12| MO [Monthly Task $ 0.65 $ 7.80 | $ 264.58
A 18 |Fee Booth Facility 1 254| DY |Daily Task S 0.97 $ 246.38
A 18 Fee Booth IV Facility No. 10366 2 52| WK |Weekly Task S 020 §$ 10.40
A 18 3 12| MO [Monthly Task $ 0.65 $ 7.80 | $ 264.58
A 19 |Fee Booth Facility 1 254| DY |Daily Task S 0.65 $ 165.10 Carpet Cleaning, Steam $ 0.25 per sq ft
A 19 Entrance Gate Guard Booth Facility no 10493 2 52| WK |Weekly Task S 0.15 §$ 7.80 Tile/Ceramic - Strip, Wax, and Buff $  0.25 persq ft
A 19 3 12| MO [Monthly Task $ 0.58 §$ 6.96 | $ 179.86 Rubber - Strip and Wax S 0.25 persqft
A 20 |As Neeed Extra Cleaning Services 50| HR |XtraCleanSvc $ 21.11 $ 1,055.50 | $ 1,055.50 | $ 18,109.84
B 1 Engineering Department, Field Division 1 104| DY |Daily Task S 67.55 $ 7,025.20
B 1 Field Division, 9485 Aero Drive 2 52| WK |WeeklyTask S 1322 S 687.44
B 1 3 12| MO |Monthly Task $ 985 S 11820 | $ 7,830.84
B 2 Field Division, 9491 Aero Drive 1 104| DY |Daily Task S 17.22 $ 1,790.88
B 2 2 52| WK |Weekly Task S 6.85 $ 356.20
B 2 3 12| MO |Monthly Task S 7.98 $ 95.76 | $ 2,242.84
Field Div, Office & Restrms, Mat. Test Lab, Back

B 3 Office, 9491 Aero Dr 1 104| DY |Daily Task S 5.65 $ 587.60
B 3 2 52| WK |Weekly Task S 3.05 $ 158.60
B 3 3 12| MO |Monthly Task  $ 1.95 S 2340 | $ 769.60
B 4 Field Division, Major Bldg. Trailer, 9515 Aero Dr 1 104| DY |Daily Task S 588 $ 611.52
B 4 2 52| WK |Weekly Task S 3.25 $  169.00 Carpet Cleaning, Steam $  0.25 persq ft
B 4 3 12| MO |Monthly Task  $ 1.95 S 2340 | $ 803.92 Tile/Ceramic - Strip, Wax, and Buff $  0.25 persq ft
B 5 As Neeed Extra Cleaning Services 50| HR |XtraCleanSvc $ 21.11 $ 1,055.50 | $ 1,055.50 | $ 12,702.70
C 1 Environmental Services Dept - Operations Station 1 260| DY |Daily Task $ 80.55 $20,943.00

2 52| WK |WeeklyTask $ 58.65 $ 3,049.80 Carpet Cleaning, Steam $  0.25 persq ft

3 12| MO |Monthly Task $ 96.55 $ 1,158.60 | $ 25,151.40 Tile/Ceramic - Strip, Wax, and Buff $  0.25 persq ft
C 2 As Neeed Extra Cleaning Services 50| HR |[XtraCleanSvc $ 21.11 $ 1,055.50 | $ 1,055.50 | $ 26,206.90
D 1 Fire Communications Building 1 364| DY |Daily Task S 3522 $12,820.08
D 1 2 52| WK |Weekly Task S 533 $ 277.16
D 1 3 12| MO [Monthly Task $ 49.55 $ 594.60 | $ 13,691.84
D 2 Fire Repair Facility 1 354| DY |Daily Task S 1733 $ 6,134.82 Carpet Cleaning, Steam $ 0.25 per sq ft
D 2 2 52| WK |Weekly Task  $ 6.05 $ 314.60 Carpet Cleaning, Dry $ 0.25 per sq ft
D 2 3 12| MO [Monthly Task $ 20.45 $ 24540 | $ 6,694.82 Tile/Ceramic - Strip, Wax, and Buff $  0.25 persq ft
D 3 As Neeed Extra Cleaning Services 50| HR |XtraCleanSvc $§ 21.11 $ 1,055.50 | $ 1,055.50 | $ 21,442.16

Total Bid Ann Cost, Schedules (A-D): | $ 78,461.60
[
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