
2

2

.

 

2

.

2

3

 

#

5

3

(O-202

3-103)

(COR. COPY)

ORDINANCE NUMBER 0-

 

21614 

(N

EW SERIES

)

DATE oF FINAL PASSA

GE 

MAR 0 

7 2023

AN ORDINANCE AMENDING THE SAN DIEGO MUNICIPAL

CODE BY AMENDING CHAPTER 5, ARTICLE 11, DIVISION

1, BY RETITLING DIVISION 1, BY AMENDING AND

RETITLING SECTIONS 511.0101, 511.0102, 511.0103, AND

511.0104, BY AMENDING SECTION 511.0105, BY

AMENDING CHAPTER 5, ARTICLE 11, DIVISION 2, BY

RETITLING DIVISION 2, BY AMENDING, RETITLING AND

RENUMBERING SECTION 511.0201 TO 511.0202, BY

REPEALING CHAPTER 5, ARTICLE 11, DIVISION 3,

SECTIONS 511.0301 AND 511.0307, BY AMENDING

SECTION 511.0304, BY REPEALING SECTION 511.0319, BY

AMENDING CHAPTER 5, ARTICLE 11, DIVISION 4, BY

AMENDING SECTIONS 511.0401, 511.0403, 511.0404, BY

REPEALING SECTION 511.0405, BY AMENDING CHAPTER

5, ARTICLE 11, DIVISION 5, BY ADDING SECTION 511.0503,

BY REPEALING SECTION 511.0510, BY AMENDING

CHAPTER 5, ARTICLE 11, DIVISION 11, BY AMENDING

SECTIONS 511.1103 AND 511.1104, BY AMENDING

CHAPTER 5, ARTICLE 11, DIVISION 49, BY RETITLING

DIVISION 49, BY AMENDING, RETITLING AND

RENUMBERING SECTION 511.4901 TO 511.4904, BY

ADDING SECTIONS 511.4906 AND 511.4907, BY AMENDING

CHAPTER 5, ARTICLE 11, DIVISON 50, BY AMENDING

SECTIONS 511.5001, BY AMENDING CHAPTER 5, ARTICLE

11, DIVISION 56, BY AMENDING SECTION 511.5601, BY

AMENDING CHAPTER 5, ARTICLE 11, DIVISION 82, BY

AMENDING AND RETITLING DIVISION 82, BY AMENDING

SECTION 511.8201, BY AMENDING CHAPTER 5, ARTICLE

11, DIVISION 83, BY AMENDING SECTION 511.8302, ALL

RELATING TO FIRE REGULATIONS AND THE ADOPTION

OF THE 2022 CALIFORNIA FIRE CODE.

WHEREAS, the State of California (State) updates the California Building Standards

Code, which includes the California Fire Code, every three years; and

WHEREAS, updates to the California Fire Code are based upon the International Fire

Code, which is issued every three years; and

-PAGE 1 OF 33-

i,



-2023-103)

(COR. COPY)

WHEREAS, the City of San Diego (City) follows the same review and adoption schedule

as the State and, as such, is also updating the San Diego Municipal Code to reflect changes to the

California Fire Code and portions of the latest edition of the International Fire Code not included

in the California Building Standards Code; and

WHEREAS, the proposed amendments to the Municipal Code shall be deemed effective

as ofJanuary 1, 2023; and

WHEREAS, this Ordinance supplements state law and protects the health and safety of

the residents of the City; NOW, THEREFORE,

BE IT ORDAINED, by the Council of the City of San Diego, as follows:

Section 1. That the California Fire Code, designated in Title 24, Part 9 of the California

Code of Regulations (2022 Edition) published by the International Code Council and the

California Building Standards Commission, together with those portions of the

2021 Edition of the International Fire Code, including Appendices B, C, and D published by the

International Code Council not included in the California Building Standards Code, as adopted

and modified in San Diego Municipal Code, Chapter 5, Article 11, shall be known as the

San Diego Fire Code for the purpose of safeguarding life, property, and public welfare to a

reasonable degree from the hazards of fire, hazardous materials release, and explosion arising

from the storage, use, and handling of dangerous and hazardous materials, substances, and

devices; conditions hazardous to life or property in the occupancy and use ofbuildings and

premises; the operation, installation, construction, location, safeguarding and maintenance of

attendant equipment; providing for the issuance of permits and collection of fees therefore; and

providing penalties for violation of such code.

-PAGE 2 OF 33-



(O-2023-103)

(COR. COPY)

Section 2. That Chapter 5, Article 11, Division 1 is amended by retitling Division 1, by

amending and retitling sectióñs 511.0101, 511.0102, 511.0103, 511.0104, and amending section

511.0105.

Article 11: Fire Protection and Prevention

Division 1: Adoption of the 2022 California Fire Code

§511.0101 Adoption of the 2022 California Fire Code, Purpose and Intent and

Administrative Provisions

Portions of the California Fire Code, 2022 Edition, adopted.

Except as otherwise provided in this Article, the California Fire Code, designated

in Title 24, Part 9 of the California Code of Regulations (2022 Edition) published

by the International Code Council and the California Building Standards

Commission, together with those portions of the 2021 Edition of the International

Fire Code, including Appendices B, C, and D, published by the International

Code Council not included in the California Building Standards Code are hereby

adopted as the San Diego Fire Code and shall be in full force and effect. A copy

of the California Fire Code (2022 Edition) and the International Fire Code (2021

Edition) is on file in the office of the City Clerk as Document No. OO-21409.

(a) Collectively, the California Fire Code (2022 Edition), and the International

Fire Code (2021) Edition are referred to in this Article as the 2022 California

Fire Code.

(b) Relationship of the San Diego Municipal Code section numbers to the

2022 California Fire Code section numbers.

-PAGE 3 OF 33-



-2023-103

)

(COR. COPY)

This Chapter of the San Diego Municipal Code sets forth (1) the portions

ofthe 2022 California Fire Code that the City has not adopted in the

San Diego Fire Code, (2) the portions of the 2022 California Fire Code

that the City has amended and adopted in the San Diego Fire Code, and

(3) the portions ofthe San Diego Fire Code that were adopted as Local

Additions that augment the 2022 California Fire Code. Text is included

within this Chapter of the San Diego Municipal Code only where the

City has not adopted or has amended the 2022 California Fire Code, or has

adopted Local Additions that augment the 2022 California Fire Code.

Otherwise, as set forth above, all portions of the 2022 California Fire Code

are adopted in full.

In order to easily locate the corresponding sections of the 2022 California

Fire Code within this Chapter of the San Diego Municipal Code, the

numbering system of the Divisions within Chapter 5, Article 11 reflects

the coresponding numbering system of the 2022 California Fire Code.

For example, section 304.1.2 of the 2022 California Fire Code is reflected

in Chapter 5, Article 11, Division 3, as section 511.0304. Also, sections

within the 2022 California Fire Code retain those same section numbers

when referred to within the text of the San Diego Municipal Code. For

example, section 308.1.4 of the 2022 California Fire Code will also be

cited as California Fire Code section 308.1.4 within the text of the

San Diego Municipal Code.

PAGE 4 OF 33-



(O

-2023-

103)

(COR. COPY)

(c) Where the City has adopted an entire Chapter of the 2022 California Fire

Code, the corresponding Division number within this Chapter is

"reserved."

(d) Effective Date. Unless otherwise stated in a specific San Diego Municipal

Code section or 2022 California Fire Code section adopted by the City, the

effective date ofthe City's Adoption/Local Amendment/Local Additions

to the 2022 California Fire Code shall be January 1,2023.

(e) Reference to the California Building Code. Any reference within the

San Diego Fire Code to the "C.B.C." or "California Building Code" shall

refer to those provisions of the California Building Code as adopted by

Chapter 14 ofthe San Diego Municipal Code.

§511.0102

 

Portions of the 2022 California Fire Code Not Adopted

The following sections of the 2022 California Fire Code are not adopted:

(a) Section 308.1.4

(b) Sections 403.3

(c) Sections 403.5 through 403.9.2.1

(d) Sections 403.9.2.1.2 through 403.10.1.6

(e) Sections 403.10.3 through 403.10.5

(f) Sections 404.2.3 through 404.2.3.2

(g) Sections 406.1 through 406.3.4

(h) Sections 1103.1 through 1103.3.2

(i) 

Sections 1103.4 through 1103.6.2

(j) Sections 1103.7.1 through 1103.7.2

-PAGE 5 OF 33-



(O-2023-103)

(COR. COPY)

00 

Sections 1103.7.4 through 1103.7.6

(1) 

Section 1103.9 (adopting 1103.9.1)

(n)

 Section 1103.10

(n) Sections 1104.1 through 1104.2

(0) Sections 1104.6 through 1104.23

(p) Sections 1105.1 through 1105.11.2

(q) APPENDIX A

(r) Section D104.1 only ofAPPENDIX D

(s) APPENDIX E through APPENDIX P

§511.0103

 

Local Amendments to the 2022 California Fire Code Adopted by the City of

San Diego

The following sections or sub-sections of the 2022 California Fire Code are

amended by this Article:

(a) Chapter 1, Section 111.1, "Board of Appeals"

(b) Chapter 2, Section 202, "General Definitions"

(c) Chapter 3, Section 304.1.2, "Vegetation"

(d) Chapter 3, Section 307.4.1, "Bonfires"

(e) Chapter 3, Section 307.4.3, "Portable Outdoor Fireplaces"

(f) Chapter 4, Section 401.2, "Approval"

(g) Chapter 4, Section 401.4, "Required Plan Implementation"

(h) Chapter 4, Section 403.2, "Group A Occupancies"

(i) Chapter 5, Section 505.1, "Address Identification"

(j) Chapter 49, Section 4906.3.1, "Contents"

-PAGE 6 OF 33-



(O

-202

3-103)

(COR. COPY)

(k) 

Chapter 49, Section 4907.3, "Requirements"

(1) Appendix B, Table B105.1(1), "Required Fire Flow for One-and

Two-Family Dwellings, Group R-3 and R-4 Buildings and Townhouses"

(m) Appendix C, Table C102.1, "Required Number and Spacing of

 Fire

Hydrants"

(n) Appendix D, Section D103.5, "Fire Apparatus Access Road Gates"

(0) Appendix D, Section D103.6, "Signs"

(p) Appendix D, Section D107.1, "One- or Two-Family Dwelling Residential

Developments"

§511.0104 . Local Additions to the 2022 California Fire Code Adopted by the City

The following sections are adopted as Local Additions to the 2022 California Fire

Code:

(a) Chapter 3, Section 304.1.2.1, "Clearance of Brush and Vegetative Growth

from Roadways"

(b) Chapter 3, Section 304.1.2.2, "Waste Material"

(c) Chapter 3, Section 307.4.4, "Red-flag and other high fire risk conditions"

(d) Chapter 4, Section 403.11.1.3, "Standby Fire Department Personnel"

(e) Chapter 5, Section 503.3.1, "Street Parking Prohibited"

(f) Chapter 5, Section 507.5.7, "Identification"

(g) Chapter 49, Sectión 4904.3.1.1, Adoption of Fire Hazard Severity Zones"

(h) Chapter 50, Section 5001.1.2, "Hazardous Materials HAZMAT Program

Legislative Declaration and Findings"

(i) Chapter 50, Section 5001.1.3, "Purpose of HAZMAT Program"

-PAGE 7 OF 33-



(O-2023-103)

(COR. COPY)

) 

Chapter 50, Section 5001.1.4, "HAZMAT Inspections"

(k) 

Chapter 56, Section 5601.1.3.1, "Where Prohibited"

(1) Chapter 56, Section 5601.2.4.2.1, "Liability Insurance"

m)

 

Appendix D, Section D106.2.1, "Multiple-Family Residential

Developments with Significant Fire Risk"

§511.0105

 

California Fire Code, Chapter 1 - Scope and Administration

(a) Local Amendment. Section 111.1, Board of Appeals, is amended to read

as follows:

When a question involving interpretation of the intent and purpose of any

provision of the San Diego Fire Code or the suitability of alternate

materials and types of construction is presented to the Fire Code Oicial,

the Fire Code Q#îcial may request the Board of Building Appeals and

Advisors (Board) to investigate such matters under the procedures

established in section 111.0207 of the San Diego Municipal Code

regarding building inspection. The request for Board action may come

from any citizen affected by the San Diego Fire Code.

Section 3. That Chapter 5, Article 11, Division 2 is amended by retitling Division 2, by

amending, retitling and renumbering section 511.0201 to 511.0202.

-PAGE 8 OF 33-



(O-2023-103)

(COR. COPY)

Article 11: Fire Protection and Prevention

Division 2: Definitions

§511.0202

General Definitions

(a) Local Amendment. The following terms and their definitions are amended

to read as follows:

(1) Fire Code Ocial. The Fire-Rescue Chief of the City of

San Diego, or any member of the Fire-Rescue Department

designated by the Fire-Rescue Chief to carry out the provisions of

this Article.

(2) Jurisdiction. The City of San Diego.

(3) Wildland-Urban Interface Fire Area. Å geographic area

identified by the State as a "Fire Hazard Severity Zone" in

accordance with Public Resources Code sections 4201 through

4204 and Government Code sections 51175 through 51189, or

other areas designated by the City of San Diego Fire-Rescue

Department to be at significant risk from wildfires.

(b) Local Addition. The following term and its definition is added as follows:

Ç Fire Department Standby Personnel. City of San Diego Fire-

Rescue Personnel who are employed to prevent and mitigate any

hazards associated with large public assemblies, events or

activities where their presence has been deemed necessary by the

Fire Code Olficial.

-PAGE 9 OF 33-



(O-2023-103)

(COR. COPY)

Section 4. That Chapter 5, Article 11, Division 3 is amended by repealing section

511.0301, by amending sections 511.0304 and 511.0307 and by repealing section 511.0319.

Article 11: Fire Protection and Prevention

Division 3: General Precautions Against Fire

§511.0304

 Combustible Waste Material

(a) [No change in text.]

(b) Local Addition. Section 304.1.2.1, Clearance ofbrush and vegetative

growth from roadways, is added as follows:

The Fire Code Q#icial is authorized to require areas within 10 feet

(3048 mm) on each side of portions of fire apparatus access roads and

driveways to be cleared of non-fire-resistive vegetation growth.

Exception:

(1) Single specimens of trees, ornamental vegetative fuels, or

cultivated ground cover, such as green grass, ivy, succulents,

or similar plants used for ground cover, provided they do not

form a means of readily transmitting fire.

(c) [No change in text.]

§511.0307

 

Open Burning, Recreational Fires, and Portable Outdoor Fireplaces

(a) [No change in text.]

(b) Local Amendment. Section 307.4.3, Portable outdoor fireplaces, is

amended to read as follows:

-PAGE 10 OF 33-



(O-2023-103)

(COR. COPY)

Portable outdoor fireplaces shall be used in accordance with the

manufacturer's instructions, provided with a spark arrestor, and shall

not be operated within 15 feet (3048 mm) of a structure or

combustible material.

Exceptions:

(1) Portable outdoor fireplaces used at one and two-family dwellings

located outside of a wildland-urban interface area, when used in

accordance with the manufacturer's instructions.

(2) Portable outdoor fireplaces used at one and two-family dwellings

located within a wildland-urban in

terface fire area, whe

n such

portable outdoor fireplaces are located at least 15 feet (3048 mm)

from a structure, combustible material or vegetation. Such outdoor

fireplaces shall be used in accordance with the manufacturer's

instructions.

(c) Local Addition. Section 307.4.4, "Red-flag" and other high fire risk

cond

ition

s, is a

dded 

as fo

llows:

Open burning including recreational fires and fires within portable outdoor

fireplaces, shall not be permitted when a red-flag warning or a fire weather

watch condition has been issued by the National Weather Service.

Exception:

(1) Fires in beach areas complying with San Diego Municipal Code

section 63.20.5.

-PAGE 11 OF 33-



(O-2023-103)

(COR. COPY)

§511.0308

 

Open Flames

(a) [No change in text.]

Section 5. That Chapter 5, Article 11, Division 4 is amended by amending Sections

511.0401, 511.0403, 511.0404, and by repealing Section 511.0405.

§511.0401

Article 11: Fire Protection and Prevention

Division 4: Emergency Planning and Preparedness

General

(a) Local Amendment. Section 401.2, Approval, is amended to read as

follows:

Where required by this Code, fire safety plans, emergency procedures, and

employee training programs shall be maintained on site and subject to

review and approval by the Fire Code Oîcial. Emergency plans and

procedures must be developed by a person having sufficient knowledge of

the building, life safety systems and any special hazards. The Fire Code

Oîcial is authorized to require a qualified engineer, specialist, or fire

safety specialty organization to develop fire safety plans and emergency

procedures.

(b) Local Amendment. Section 401.4, Required Plan Implementation, is

amended to read as follows:

In the event an unwanted fire is detected in a building or a fire alarm

activates, the emergency plan shall be implemented unless otherwise

directed by a fire department official assuming command of the incident.

-PAGE 12 OF 33-



(O-2023-103)

(COR. COPY)

§511.0403

 

Emergency Preparedness Requirements

(a) Local Amendment. Section 403.2, Group A Occupancies, is amended to

read as follows:

An approved fire safety and evacuation plan in accordance with section 404

shall be prepared and maintained for Group A occupancies with an occupant

load exceeding 500 and for buildings containing both a Group A occupancy

and an atrium. Group A occupancies shall comply with Sections 403.2.1

through 403.2.4.

Exceptions:

(1) Group A occupancies used exclusively for religious worship with an

occupant load less than 2,000.

(a) Not Adopted. Section 403.3 is not adopted.

(b) Not Adopted. Sections 403.5 through 403.2.1 are not

adopted.

(c) Not Adoted. Sections 403.9.2.1.2 through 403.10.1.6 are

not adopted.

(d) Not Adoted. Section 403.10.3 through 403.10.5 are not

adopted.

(e) Local Addition. Section 403.11.1.3, Standby Fire

Department Personneis added as follows:

(1) When, in the opinion ofthe Fire Code Oîcial,

it is essential for public safety in a place of

assembly or any other place where people

-PAGE 13 OF 33-



(O-2023-103)

(COR. COPY)

congregate, due to the number of persons, or the

nature of the performance, exhibition, display,

contest or activity, the owner, agent or lessee shall

employ one or more qualified persons, as required

and approved, to be on duty at such place.

Such individuals shall be subject to the Fire Code

îcial' s orders at all times when so employed and

shall be in uniform and remain on duty during the

times such places are open to the public, or when

such activity is being conducted.

(2) Before each performance or the start of such

activity, such individuals shall:

(A) inspect the required fire appliances

provided to see that they are in proper place

and in good working order;

(B) keep diligent watch for fires,

obstructions to means of egress or other

hazards; and

(C) take prompt measures for remediation of

hazards and extinguishment of fires that

may occur; and

(D) take prompt measures to assist in the

evacuation of the public from the structures.

-PAGE 1

4 O

F 3

3-



(O-2023-103)

(CO

R. 

CO

PY

)

(3) Such individuals shall not, while on duty,

perform

 any other

 duties t

han those

 here

in speci

fied

unlešs otherwise directed by the

Fire Code Ojìcial.

(4) The City shall charge the permittee the cost of

such services. The cost shall be computed by the

Fire Department using accepted cost accounting

methods including but not limited to the cost of

salary, fringe benefits and general overhead.

(5) Time cards of the assigned personnel shall be

submitted by the

 Fire Code Oîcial to the Au

ditor

and Comptroller and s

hall be prima fac

ie evidence

of the expended work hours.

§511.0404

 

Fire safety, eva

cuation and

 lockdown plans

Not Adopted. Sections 404.2.3 through 404.2.3.2 are not adopted.

§511.0406

 

Employee Training and Response 

Procedures

(a) [No change in text.]

Section

 6. That C

hapter 5

, Article 1

1, Division 5

 is amended by amending

Secti

on 51

1.0503, a

nd by repe

aling

 Secti

on 51

1.0510.

-PAGE 15 OF 33-



(O-2023-103)

(COR. COPY)

§511.0503

Article 11: Fire Protection and Prevention

Division 5: Fire Service Features

Fire Apparatus Access Roads

Local Addition. Section 503.3.1, Street Parking Prohibited, is added as follows:

During "red-flag" warnings or fire weather watch conditions, street parking may

be prohibited in areas determined to be at significant risk from wildfires,

including areas identified as a fire hazard severity zone, so a wider pathway is

available to support rapid evacuation when side-street parking narrows the road to

a smaller width than the standards in Title 14, section 1273.01 of the California

Code of Regulations. Such areas will be marked with signs approved by the Fire

Code Ocial.

§511.0505

 Premises Identification

(a) [No change in text.]

§511.0507

 

Fire Protection Water Supplies

(a) [No change in text.]

Section 7. That Chapter 5, Article 11, Division 11 is amended by amending

Sections 511.1103 and 511.1104.

-PAGE 16 OF 33-



(O-2023-103)

(COR. COPY)

Article 11: Fire Protection and Prevention

Division 11

: Constructi

on Requirements for

 Existing

 Buildings

§511.1103

 

Fire Safety Requirements for Existing Buildings

(a) Not Adopted. Sections 1103.1 through 1103.3.2 are not ado

pted.

(b) Not Adopted. Sections 110

3.4 through 1103.6.2 are not adopted.

(c) Not Adoted. Sections 1103.7.1 through 1103.7.2 arenot adopted.

(d) Not Adopted. Sections 110

3.7.4 through 1103

.7.6 are not adopted.

(e) Not Adopted. Section 

1103.9 is not ad

opted (adopt

ing section 1

103.9.1).

(f) Not Adopted

. Section

 1103.10 

is not ado

pted.

§511.1104

Means of Egress for Existing Buildings

(a) Not Adoted. Sections1104. l through 1104.2 arenot adopted.

(b) Not Adopted. Sections 1

104.6 through 1104.23 are not adopted.

§511.1105

 

Construction Requirements for Existing Groups I-2

(a) [No change in text.]

Section 8. That Chapt

er 5, Article 11, D

ivision 49 is amended by amending and

renumbering Section 5

11.4901 to 511.4904 and by amending Sect

ions 511.4906 an

d 511.4907.

-PAGE 17 OF 33-



(O-2

023-1

03)

(COR. COPY

)

Article 11: Fire Protect

ion and Preve

ntion

Division 4

9: Requirements for 

Wildlan

d Urba

n

Interface Fire Areas

§511.4904

Fire Hazard Severity Zones

(a) Local Addition. Sectio

n 4904.3.1

.1, Adoption of Fire Hazard Severit

y

Zones, is added as follows:

The Council of the City of San Diego adopts the Very High Fire Hazard

Severity Zones as recommended by the Director of

 the Californ

ia

Department of Forestry and F

ire Protection, and

 adopts the

 Brush

Management Zones

, as defin

ed in San

 Diego Municipal C

ode sectio

n

142.0412, as Very High Fire Hazard Severity Zones, as designa

ted on a

map titled, "Very High Fire Hazard Severity

 Zone Map - Local

Responsib

ility Areas", date

d July 21,2009, on fi

le with the City Clerk as

Docum

ent N

o. 00

-198

84.

§511.4906

 

Vegetat

ion Managem

ent

(a) Local Amendment. Section 4906.3.1, Contents, is amended to read as

follows:

Landscape p

lans shall con

tain the foll

owing;

(1) delineation of the 35-foot and 1

00-foot fuel m

anagement zones

from all structures;

(2) identification of existing vegetation

 to remain and proposed new

vegetation;

-PAGE 18 OF 33-



-

20

2

3-

10

3)

(COR. COPY)

(3) identification of irrigated areas;

(4) a plant legend with both botanical and common areas, and

identifi

cation

 of all plan

t material 

symbols; an

d

(5) identification of ground coverings within the 3 5-foot zone.

§511.4907

 

De

fen

sib

le S

pa

ce

(a) Local Amendment. Section 4907.3, Requirements, is amended to read as

follows:

Hazardous v

egetation and fuel

s around all

 buildings a

nd structure

s shall be

maintained in accordance with the following laws and regulat

ions;

(1) San Diego Municipal Code Section 142.0412;

(2) Public Resources Code, Section 4291;

(3) California Code of Regulations, 

Title 14, Division 1.5,

Chapter 7, Subchapter 3, Article 3, Section 1299.03;

(4) California Government Code, Section 51182;

(5) Cali fornia Code of Regulations, Title 19, Division 1,

Chapter 7, Subchapter 1, Section 3.07.

Section 

9. That 

Chapter 5

, Article 

11, Division 

50 is amended by am

ending S

ection

511.5001.

-PAGE 19 OF 33-



(O-2023-103)

(COR. COPY)

Article 11: Fire Protection and Prevention

Division 50: Hazardous Materials - General Provisions

§511.5001

 Hazardous Materials - General Provisions

(a) Local Addition. Section 5001.1.2, Hazardous Materials HAZMAT

Program Legislative Declaration and Findings, is added as follows:

(1) [No change in text.]

(2) [No change in text.]

(b) Local Addition. Section 5001.1.3, Purpose ofHAZMAT Program, is

added as follows:

The purpose ofthe HAZMAT Inspection Program is to:

(1) Inspect occupan

cies, as defined in the Fire Code, within the

City of San Diego, to determine the type, quantity and location

of hazardous materials which may be present, and the scope of

risk presented by the presence of such materials.

(2) [No change in text.]

(3) [No change in text.]

(c) Local Addition. Section 5001.1.4, HAZMAT Inspection

s, is added as

follows:

(1) [No change in text.]

(2) During any inspection, t

he Fire Code Oîcial or authorized

representative may request the following information from the

owner, or other persons having charge or control of any

-PAGE 20 OF 33-



(O-2023-103)

(COR. COPY)

building, structur

e or insta

llation:

 (1) a listing ofany

 hazardous

material, as defin

ed in the California Fire Code by either its

chemical or c

ommon name or by descript

ion of the re

levant

chemical p

ropertie

s which ren

der it haz

ardous;

 (2) a

description of where such hazardous materials are n

ormally

located in the building, structure or installation.

The owner, or other persons having charge or control of the

premises shall provide information requested under this

section within 15 days.

(3) It shall be unlawful for the owner, or other perso

ns having charge

or contro

l ofthe

 premises to r

efuse to p

rovide infon

nation

requested pursuant to this section, to provide false information, or

to refuse entry

 to the Fire Code Q#îcial or authorize

d

represent

ative when presente

d with a legal

ly issued 

inspection

warrant af

ter not

ice is pr

ovided a

s required by law

.

Section 10. That Chapter 5, 

Article 11, Division 56 is amended by amending

Section 511.5601.

-PAGE 21 OF 33-



(O-2023-103)

(COR. COPY)

Article 11: Fire Protection and Prevention

Division 56: Explosives and Fireworks

§511.5601

 

Explosives and Fireworks

(a) Local Addition. Section 5601.1.3.1, Where Prohibited, is added as

follows:

Except as provided in this ection, it sha

ll be unlawful for any person to

possess, store, manufacture, offer 

for sale, expose for sa

le, sell at retail,

or use or explode any

 fireworks within the incorporated

 City limits, or

the territ

ory outside the City over wh

ich the City has juri

sdiction or

control by virtue of the Constitution, Charter 

or any law, or by reason of

ownership or co

ntrol of proper

ty.

Exception:

(1) [No change in text.]

(b) Local Addition. Section 5601.2.4.2.1, Liability Insurance, is added as

follows:

(1) Before a permit is issued pursuant to this section, th

e applicant

shall file with the City a $2 million combined single 

limit

comprehensive gener

al liability insurance

 policy, nam

ing the City

of San Diego as an additional insured

, for the purpo

se of the

payment of all damages to persons or property which arise from,

or are caused by, the conduct of any act authorized by the permit.

(2) The Fire Code Otlìcial may specify a greater or lesser amount

when, in the Fire Code Oîcial's opinion, application of

-PAGE 22 OF 33-



(O-2023-103)

(COR. COPY)

recognized risk management standards and conditions at the

location requires a different amount.

(3) Public agencies shall be exempt from the requirement of the

issuing of an insurance policy naming The City of San Diego as

an additional insured.

Section 11. That Chapter 5, Article 11, Division 82 is amended by amending

Section 511.8201.

§511.8201

Article 11: Fire Protection and Prevention

Division 82: Appendix A through Appendix P

Adoption, Non-Adoption or Local Amendment to California Fire Code

Appendix A through Appendix P

The California Fire Code, Appendix A through Appendix P, are hereby adopted,

not adopted, or amended as follows:

(a) ppendír A: Not Adopted

(b) ppendi B: is adopted with modifications as follows:

-PAGE 23 OF 33-



(O-2023-103)

(COR. COPY)

TABLE 105.1(1)

REQUIRED FIRE FLOW FOR ONE- AND TWO-FAMILY DWELLINGS, GROUP R-3

AND R-4 BUILDINGS AND TOWNHOUSES

Fire-Flow Automatic Minimum Fire Flow Duration

Calculation Area 

Sprin

kler S

ystem

s

 Flow

 

(hours)

(squ

are 

feet

)

 

(Design-Standard)

 

(gallons per minute)'

0-3,600

 No automatic 

Value in Table

 

Duration in Table

sprinkler system

 

B105.1(2)

 

B105.1(2) atthe

required fire-flow

rate

3,601 and greater

 

No automatic

 

Value in Table

 

Duration in Table

sprinkler system

 

B105.1(2)

 

B105.1(2) at the

required fire-flow

rate

0-3,600

 

Section 903.3.1.3

 

1

,0

0

0

 

Duration in Table

of the California

 

B105.1(2) at the

Fire Code or

 

required fire-fow

Section 313.3 of

 

rate

the California

Residential Code

3,601 and greater

 

Section 903.3.1.3

 

50% ofthe value in Duration in Table

of the California

 

Table B105.1(2)

 

B105

.1 (2) at

 the

Fire Code or 

original fire-flow

Section 313.3 of

 

rate

the California

Residential Code

For S. 1 square foot = 0.0929 m,1 gallon per minute = 3.785 Um.

a. The reduced fire-flow rate shall not be less than 1,000 gallons per minute.

-PAGE 24 OF 33-



(O-2023-103)

(COR. COPY)

TABLE B105.2

TABLE B105.2 REQUIRED FIRE FLOW FOR BUILDINGS OTHER THAN ONE- AND

TWO-FAMILY DWELLINGS, GROUP R-3 AND R-4 BUILDINGS AND

TOWNHOUSES

Automatic Sprinkler Systems

(design-standard)

No automatic sprinkler system

Section 903.3.1.1 ofthe

California Fire Code

Section 903.3.1.2 ofthe

California Fire Code

Minimum Fire-Flow

(gallons per minute)

Value in Table

B105.1(2)

50% of the value in

Table 105.1(2)

50% of the value in

Table 105.12

Flow Duration

(hours)

Duration in Table

B105.12)

Duration in Table

B105.1(2) at the original

flow rate

Duration in Table

B105.1(2) at the original

flow rate

For SI: 1 gallon per minute = 3.785 m

a. The reduced fi re-flow rate shall not be less than 1,500 gallons per minute.

(c) ppendx BB: Adopted

(d) ppendx C is adopted with modifications as follows:

-PAGE 25 OF 33-



(O-2023-103)

(COR. COPY)

TABL  C102.1

REQUIRED NUMBER AND PACING OF FIRE HYDRANTS

AVERAGE

MAXIMUM DISTANCE FROM

MINIMUM SPACING

FIRE-FLOW 

ANY POINT ON STREET OR

NUMBER OF

 BETWEEN

REQUIREMENT(gpm)

 HYDRANTS

 HYDRANTSa, b, c.

ROAD FRONTAGE TO A

HYDRANT

(feet)

1,7500rless 1 500

 250

1,751-2,250 2 450

 225

2,251-2,750 3 450

 225

2,751-3,250 3 400

 225

3,251-4,000 4 350

 210

4,001-5,000 5 300

 180

5,001-5,500 6 300

 180

5,501-6,000 6 250

 150

6,001-7,000 7 250

 150

7,001 or more

 

8 or more

For S: 1 foot = 304.8 mm, 1 gallon per minute = 3.785 L/m.

a. Reduce by 100 feet for dead-end streets or roads.

200

1

2

0

b. Where streets are provided with median dividers that cannot be crossed by fire fighters pulling hose lines, or where arterial

streets are provided with four or more traffic lanes and have a traffic count of more than 30,000 vehicles per day, hydrant spacing

shall average 500 feet on each side of the street and be arranged on an alternating basis.

c. Where new water mains are extended along streets where hydrants are not needed for protection of structures or similar fire

problems, firehydrants shall bé provided at spacing not to exceed 1,000 feet to provide for transpor'tation hazards.

d. Reduce by 50 feet for dead-end streets or roads.

e. One hydrant for each 1,000 gallons per minute or fraction thereof.

f. The fire code official is authorized to modi fy the location, number and distribution of fire hydrants based on site-specific

constraints and hazards.

(e) Appendix CC: Adopted

(f) Appendix D is adopted with modifications as follows:

(1) Local Amendment: Section D103.5, Fire Apparatus Access

Road Gates, is amended to read follows:

Gates securing the fire apparatus access roads shall comply with all of

the following criteria:

(a) The minimum gate width shall be 13 feet (3964 mm)

-PAGE 26 OF 33-



-2023-103)

(COR. COPY)

(b) Gates shall be of the horizontal swing, horizontal slide,

vertical lift or vertical pivot type.

(c) [No change in text.]

(d) [No change in text.]

(e) [No change in text.]

(f) [No change in text.]

(g) [No change in text.]

(h) [No change in text.]

(2) Local Amendment. Section D103.6, Signs, is amended to read as

follows:

Where required by the Fire Code Žîcial, fire apparatus access

roads shall be marked with permanent NO PARKING-FIRE

LANE signs complying with California Vehicle Code

Section 22500.1.Signs shall be posted on one or both sides of

the fire apparatus road as required by Section D 103.6.1 or

D103.6.2.

(3) Not Adopted. California Fire Code, Appendix D, section D104.1,

Buildings Exceeding Three Stories or 30 Feet in Height, is not

adopted.

(4) Local Addition. Appendix D, section D 106.2.1, Multiple-Family

Residential Developments with significant fire risk, is added as

follows:

-PAGE 27 OF 33-



(O-2023-103)

(COR. COPY)

Residential developments of more than 30 dwelling units

located in a state responsibility area (SRA) or a Very High Fire

Hazard Severity Zone, shall be provided with two separate and

approved fire apparatus access roads regardless of whether they

are equipped with an approved automatic sprinkler system.

(5) Adopted. Local Amendment. Section D 107.1, One or two-

family dwelling residential developments, is amended to read as

follows:

Developments of one or two-family dwellings where the number

of dwelling units exceeds 30 shall be provided with two separate

and approved fire apparatus access roads.

Exceptions:

(1) Where there are more than 30 dwelling units, not located

in a state responsibility area (SRA) or a Very High Fire

Hazard Severity Zone, accessed from a single public or

private fire apparatus access road and all dwelling units

are equipped throughout with an approved automatic

sprinkler system in accordance with section 903.3.1.1,

903.3.1.2 or 903.3.1.3, access from two directions shall

not be required.

(2) The number of dwelling units accessed from a single fire

apparatus access road shall not be increased unless fire

-PAGE 28 OF 33-



(O-2023-103)

(COR. COPY)

apparatus access roads will connect with future

development, as determined by the Fire Code Oicial.

(A) Appendix E: Not Adopted

B) Appendix F· Not

 

Adopted

(C) Appendix G: Not Adopted

(D)

 

ppendix H: Not Adopted

(E) 

Appendx I:

 Not Adopted

(F) ppendx J: Not Adopted

(G) Appendix K: Not Adopted

(H) Appendx L: Not Adopted

(I) Appendix M: Not Adopted

(J) Appendi N: Not Adopted

(K)

 

ppendr O: Not Adopted

(L) ppendix P: Not Adopted

Section 12. That Chapter 5, Article 11, Division 83 is amended by amending Section

511.8302.

Article 11: Fire Protection and Prevention

Division 83: Fire and Harmful Gas Emergency Alarms

§511.8300

 

Purpose and Intent

[No change in text.]

-PAGE 29 OF 33-



(O-2023-103)

(COR. COPY)

§511.8301

 

Definitions

Defined terms appear in italics. The following definitions apply in this Division:

Alarm agent through Takeover [No change in text.]

§511.8302

 

Fire-Harmful Gas Alarm Business Requirements and Responsibilities

(a) through (b) [No change in text.]

(c) Any fire-harmful gas alarm business that sells any fire-harmful gas

alarm system shall do the following:

(1) through (2) [No change in text.]

(3) Complete online, mail, or hand deliver the completed alarm user

permit application and permit fee to the alarm system ocial

before putting theßre-harmul gas alarm system into service.

(d) [No change in text.]

§511.8303

 

Alarm Agent Responsibilities

[No change in text.]

§511.8304

 

Fire-Harmful Gas Alarm System Conversion

(a) through (b) [No change in text.]

§511.8305

 

Fire-Harmful Gas Alarm System Takeover

(a) through (c) [ No change in text.]

§511.8306

 

Alarm User Permit Required; Violation

(a) through (b) [No change in text.]

§511.8307

 

Application for Alarm User Permit

(a) through (e) [No change in text.]

-PAGE 30 OF 33-



(O-2023-103)

(COR. COPY)

§511.8308

 

Expiration of Alarm User Permits

(a) through (c) [No change in text.]

§511.8309

 Alarm User Permits Not Transferable

[No change in text.]

§511.8310

 Fees and Penalties for Alarm User Permit

(a) through (b) [No change in text.]

§511.8311

 

Responsibility for Fire-Harmful Gas Alarm Systems in Apartments

(a) through (d) [No change in text.]

§511.8312

 

Fire-Harmful Gas Alarm System Direct Dial Prohibition

[No change in text.]

§511.8313

 

Procedures for Alarm Verification

[No change in text.]

§511.8314

 

Revocation of an Alarm User Permit

(a) through (g) [ No change in text.]

§511.8315

 

Penalties for Alarm User Permit Revocations

(a) through (b) [No change in text.]

§511.8316

 

Reinstatement of Revoked Permit; Alarm User Permit Appeal

(a) through (c) [No change in text.]

§5

11.8317

 

Use of Fire-Harmful Gas Alarm System after Permit Revocation as

Public Nuisance

(a) through (b) [No change in text.]

-PAGE 31 OF 33-



(O-2023-103)

(COR. COPY)

§511.8318

 

Posting a Fire Watch

[No change in text.]

§511.8319

 

Exceptions

[No change in text.]

§511.8320

 

Confidentiality of Records

[No change in text.]

§511.8321

 

Enforcement Authority

[No change in text.]

§511.8322

 Enforcement Remedies

[No change in text.]

Section 13. That any previous adoption or modification of the California Fire Code or

International Fire Code which are inconsistent with the terms of the San Diego Fire Code

currently set forth in San Diego Municipal Code Chapter 5, Article 11, Divisions 1 through 83

shall be deemed rescinded.

Section 14. That a full reading of this Ordinance is dispensed with prior to passage, a

written copy having been made available to the Council and the public prior to the day of its

passage.

-PAGE 32 OF 33-



(O-2023-103)

(COR. COPY)

Section 15. That this Ordinance shall take effect and be in force on the thirtieth day

from and after its final passage.

APPROVED: MARA W. ELLIOTT, City Attorney

By-

_hura M. DePoister

Deputy City Attorney

LMD:sc

01/05/2023

03/14/2023 COR. COPY

Or.Dept: Fire-Rescue Department

Doc. No.: 3183237_2

I hereby certify.that the foregoing Ordinance was passed by the Council of the City of

San Diego, at this meeting of

 

F

F

R

 

2

 

8

 

2

(12

3

DIANA J.S. FUEN

City Clerk 

Deputy City Clerk

Approved:

/

(

ã

t

e

)

 

TODD GLORIA, Mayor

ed:

(date)

 

TODD GLORIA Mayor

(NOTE: See memo and signature page.)

-PAGE 33 OF 33-



Office of

The City Attorney

City of San Diego

MEMORANDUM

MS 59

(619) 533-5800

DATE:

 

March 14, 2023

TO: 

Matthew Hilario, L

egislative

 Recor

der, City Clerk

FROM:

 

City Attorney

SUBJECT:

 O-2023-103 COR. COPY

Ordinance N

o. O-2023-10

3 amending the S

an Diego Munic

ipal Code by

 amending Se

ctions

511.0101,511.0102,511.0103,511.0104,511.0105,511.0201 511.0202,5

11.0301,511.0304,

511.0319,511.0401,511.0403,51

1.0404,5

11.0405,5

11.0503,5

11.0510,511.1103,511.

1104,

511.4901,511.4904,511.4906,5

11.4907,

511.5001,511.5601,511.8201, an

d 511.8302

relating 

to Fire Regulatio

ns and the Adoption of the 202

2 Califo

rnia Fire C

ode.

Pursuant

 to the San

 Diego City Charte

r, section

 275(a):

An alterat

ion necessar

y only to correct

 a typog

raphical or cl

erical err

or or o

mission may

be perf

ormed by the City Clerk with the w

ritten appro

val and

 concu

rrence 

of

 the City Attorn

ey,

so long a

s the alte

ration does not

 materially 

or substan

tially al

ter the c

ontents,

 requirements,

rights, resp

onsibilities, co

nditions, or

 prescript

ions con

tained in the or

iginal text

 of the ord

inance.

A typograp

hical or cle

rical erro

r shall inc

lude, but 

is not lim

ited to, incorre

ct spell

ing, gra

mmar,

numbering, p

unctuat

ion transpo

sed words or

 number

s, and duplica

te words

 or nu

mbers.

The chan

ges in fo

rmatting and a co

rrection of a misspelled

 word "though

" to "throu

gh" in

Section 

511.8302 (c)(1) are pro

vided in strikeo

ut format conta

ined in

 Attachment 1. Thank you.

LMD:sc

Doc. No. 3248611

cc: Gilbert San

chez, Associate M

anagement Analyst, City Clerk

Sonia 

Pickens

, Administrati

ve Aide II

, City Clerk



(O-2023-103)

I héreb

y certify

 that t

he fore

going O

rdinance

 was pass

ed by the Counc

il of t

he City

 of

San Diego

, at th

is m

eetin

g of

 

FEB ·2 8 2023

ANA 3 .

ty C

ler

eputy

FUENTES

By

W

Approved:

r

ity Clerk

(date)

TODD GLORIA, Mayor

Vetoed:

(date)

 

TODD GLORIA, Mayo

r

(The date of final passage is March 7, 2023, which represents the day this ordinance

waš reürñed·to the Office of the City Clerk with the Mayor' s signature of approval.)

-PAGE 32 OF 32-



(O-2023-103)

(COR. COPY)

STRIKEOUT ORDINANCE

OLD LANGUAGE: Suel t

NEW LANGUAGE: Double Underline

ORDINANCE NUMBER O- 

(NEW SERIES)

DATE OF FINAL PASSAGE

AN ORDINANCE AMENDING THE SAN DIEGO MUNICIPAL

CODE BY AMENDING CHAPTER 5, ARTICLE 11, DIVISION

1, BY RETITLING DIVISION 1, BY AMENDING AND

RETITLING SECTIONS 511.0101,511.0102,511.0103, AND

511.0104, BY AMENDING SECTION 511.0105, BY

AMENDING CHAPTER 5, ARTICLE 11, DIVISION 2, BY

RETITLING DIVISION 2, BY AMENDING, RETITLING AND

RENUMBERING SECTION 511.0201 TO 511.0202, BY

REPEALING CHAPTER 5, ARTICLE 11, DIVISION 3,

SECTIONS 511.0301 AND 511.0307, BY AMENDING

SECTION 511.0304, BY REPEALING SECTION 511.0319, BY

AMENDING CHAPTER 5, ARTICLE 11, DIVISION 4, BY

AMENDING SECTIONS 511.0401, 511.0403, 511.0404, BY

REPEALING SECTION 511.0405, BY AMENDING CHAPTER

5, ARTICLE 11, DIVISION 5, BY ADDING SECTION 511.0503,

BY REPEALING SECTION 511.0510, BY AMENDING

CHAPTER 5, ARTICLE 11, DIVISION 11, BY AMENDING

SECTIONS 511.1103 AND 511.1104, BY AMENDING

CHAPTER 5, ARTICLE 11, DIVISION 49, BY RETITLING

DIVISION 49, BY AMENDING, RETITLING AND

RENUMBERING SECTION 511.4901 TO 511.4904, BY

ADDING SECTIONS 511.4906 AND 511.4907, BY AMENDING

CHAPTER 5, ARTICLE 11, DIVISON 50, BY AMENDING

SECTION 511.5001, BY AMENDING CHAPTER 5, ARTICLE

11, DIVISION 56, BY AMENDING SECTION 511.5601, BY

AMENDING CHAPTER 5, ARTICLE 11, DIVISION 82, BY

AMENDING AND RETITLING SECTION 511.8201, BY

AMENDING CHAPTER 5, ARTICLE 11, DIVISION 83, BY

AMENDING SECTION 511.8302, ALL RELATING TO FIRE

REGULATIONS AND THE ADOPTION OF THE 2022

CALIFORNIA FIRE CODE.

-PAGE 1 OF 33-



(O-2023-103)

(COR. COPY)

Article 11: Fire Protectio

n and Preventio

n

Division 1: Adoption of the 209 2 California Fire Code

§511.0101

Adoption of the 209 222 California Fire Code, Pur

pose and 

Intent and

Administrative Provisions:

a Portions of the California Fire Code, 204) 222 Edition, adopted.

Except a

s otherwise provided in this Article, the C

alifornia Fire Code, 201-

Edition), which incorp

orates and

 amends the I

nternatio

nal Fire Code (2019

Edition), including adopte

d append

ices, is des

ignated in Title 24 Part 9,

 of

the California Code of Regulatio

ns, (2022_Edition

) publishe

d by the

Internation

al Code Council and 

the California

 Building Standard

s

Commissin, tgether with those portions of the 2021 Edition ofthe

International Fire Code, including_Apendices B, C, and D, published

 by the

International Code Council not included in the California Building Standards

Code are

 hereby

 adopte

d as the

 San D

iego F

ire Code and

 shall be

 in full

force and ef

fect. A copy of the Cali

fornia Fire Code (209

2022 Edition) an

the Internat

ional Fire Code (202

1 Edition is on f

ile in the of

fice of the

City Clerk as Document No. OO-21409.

íä Collectively, he California Fire Code (209 2022 Edition), and the

Internatinal Fire Code (2021 Edition) arerireferred to in this Article as the

29 2022 California Fire Code.

-PAGE 2 OF 33-



(O-2023-103)

(COR. COPY)

(b) Relationship of the San Diego Municipal Code section numbers to the @,9

222 California Fire Code section numbers.

This Chapt

er of the San Diego Municipal C

ode sets fort

h (1) the portions 

of

the 209-2022 California Fire Code that the City has not adopted

 in the

San Diego Muicipa Fire Code, (2) the port

ions ofthe 209 2022 California

Fire Code that the

 City has amended and 

adopted in the San Diego Micipa

fir Code, and (3) the portions o

f the San 

Diego Muicipa Fire Code that

were adopted as Loc

al Additions that augment the 209 2022 California Fire

Code. Text is included

 within this Chapter of the San Diego Municipal Code

only w

here th

e City has n

ot adop

ted or ha

s amended the 209 2022

California Fire Code, or has a

dopted Local Additions that

 augment the

 209

2022 California

 Fire Code. Otherwise, purs

uant to paragrap

h (a) abov

e, all

portions of the 2019 2022 California Fire Code are adopted in full.

In order to ea

sily locate v

arious sectio

ns of the 9 2022 California Fire

Code contained within this Chapter ofth

e San Diego Municipal Code, the

numbering

 syst

em of the D

ivision

s within Ch

apter

 5, Articl

e 11 re

flects t

he

correspondin

g numbering system of the 209 2022 California Fire Code. 

For

example, section

 304.1.2 of the 209 2Q22 California Fire Code is 

reflected

in Chapter 5, Art

icle 11, Division 3, as secti

on 511.0304. Also, sections

within the 29 2022 California Fire Code retain those same section numbers

when referred to within the text of the San Diego Municipal Code. For

example, section 308.1.4 of the 2019 2022 California Fire Code will also be

-PAGE 3 OF 33-



(O-2023-103)

(COR. COPY)

cited as California Fire Code section 308.1.4 within the text of the San Diego

Municipal Code.

(c) Where the City has adopted an entire Chapter of the 201,9 222 California

Fire Code, the corresponding Division number within this Chapter is

"reserved."

(e Definitions. Whenever the following terms appear within tho text ofthe 2019

California Fire Code, they shall have the following definitions:

Fire Code cial mcns tho Fire Rescue Chief of th City of San Diego, or

any member of the Fire Rescue Department designated by the Fire Rescue

Chiefto carry out the provisions of this Article.

Municiality or Jurisdiction means the City of San Diego.

(d) Effective Date. Unless otherwise stated in a specific San Diego Municipal

Code section or 29 2022 California Fire Code section adopted by the City,

the effective date of the City's Adoption/Local Amendment/Local Additions

to the 209 2022 California Fire Code shall be January 1,20422.

(e) Reference to California Building Code. Any reference within the San Diego

Fire Code to the "C.B.C." or "California Building Code" shall refer to those

provisions of the California Building Code as adopted by Chapter 14 of the

San Diego Municipal Code.

§511.0102

Portions of the 201,9 22 California Fire Code Not Adopted

The following sections of the 29 222 California Fire Code are not adopted:

(a) Section 105.6.30

í Section 308.1.4

-PAGE 4 OF 33-



O

-2023-103)

(COR. COPY)

(c) Socions 319.1 throgh 319.10.3

( Seetien 101.2

(e) Seotien 401.

0(12 Sections 403.3 through 103.4

£ Sections 403.éž through 403.402.2.1

hí Sections 403.402.2.1.2 through 403.44=510.1.6

£ 

Sections 403.10.3 through 403.10,5

0£ Sections 404.2 -1- through 404.4+U.2

) 

Sectios 405.1 threugh 406.3.4

0 Section 510.2

íg Sections 406.1 through 406.3.4

(h) Sections 1103.1 through 1103.3.2

fm*i) Sections 1103.4 through 1103.6.2

il Sections 1103.7.1 through 1103.7.2

eík Sections 1103.7.4 through 1103.7.6

íl 

Sec

tion

 110

3.9 (a

dop

ting

 110

3.9

. lì

ínú Section 1103.10

pí)Sections 1

104.10 through 1

104.24

íg Sections 1104. through 1104.23

(r} Sectien 1104.25

sDj Sec

tions 1

105.1 thro

ugh 1

105.11.2

íg APPENDIX A

-PAGE 5 OF 33-



(O-2023-103)

(COR. COPY)

r Section Dl 04,1 only of APPENDIX D

69£§ APPENDIX E through APPENDIX @£

§511.0103

 

Local Amendments to the 29 2022 California Fire Code Adopted by the

City of San Diego

The following sections or sub-sections of the 1 2Q22 California Fire Code are

amended by this Article:

(a) Chapter 1, Section 1119.1, "Board of Appeals"

£1 Chapter 3, Section 3.1.2, "V  ." Chapter 2, Section 202, "General

Definitions"

ébí Chapter 3, Section 304.1.2, "Vegetation"

í(e Chapter 3, Section 307.4.1, "Bonfires"

í Chapter 3, Section 307.4.3, "Portable Outdoor Fireplaces"

ííl Chapter 4, Section 401.2, "Approval"

íg Chapter 4, Secion 401,4, Required Plan Implementation"

í 

Chapter 4. Section 403.2, "Group A Occupancies"

íi Chapter 5, Section 505.1, "Addressidentification"

íi 

Chapter 49, Section 4906.3.1, "Contents"

£ 

Chapter 49, Section 4907.3, "Requirements"

í Appendix B, Table B 105.1(1), "Required Fire Flow for One-and

Two-Family Dwellings, Group R-3 and R-4 Buildings and Townhouses"

ímì Appendix C, Table C102.1, "Required Number and Spacin of Fire

Hydrants"

-PAGE 6 OF 33-



-2023-103)

(COR. COPY)

e Appendix Ghape, D, Section D103.5, "Fire apparatus access lìoad

g

a

t

e

s

"

1 Appendix Ghapte D, Section D103.6, "Signs"

 Appendix Chapter D, Section D106.2.1, "Multiple Family Residential

Devopmen"

£1 Appendix D, Section D107.1, "One- or Two-Family Dwelling Residential

Developm

ents"

§511.0104

 

Local Additions to the 209 2022 California Fire Code Adopted by the City

The following sections are adopted as Local Additions to the 0

2Q22 California Fire Code:

(a) Chapter 3, Section 301.1.1, "Very High Fire Hazard Severity Zones"

*â Chapter 3, Section 304.1.2.1, "Clearance of Brush and Vegetative Growth

from Roadways"

eb Chapter 3, Section 304.1.2.2, Waste Material".

í Chapter 3, Section 307.4.4, Red-flag and other hih fire risk conditions"

(d) Chapter 4, Section 403.11.1.3, "Standby Fire Department Personnel"

Êl Chapter 5, Section 503.3.1, "Street Parking Prohibited"

f Chapter 5, Section 507.5.7, "Identification"

íg Chapter 49, Section 4904.3.1.1, "Adoption of Fire Hazard Severity Zones"

fØíh Chapter 50, Section 5001.1.2, "Hazardous Materials HAZMAT Program

Legislative Declaration and Findings"

(gi Chapter 50, Section 5001.1.3, "Purpose of HAZMAT Program"

-PAGE 7 OF 33-



(O-2023-103)

(COR. COPY)

h)íi Chapter 50, Section 5001.1.4, "HAZMAT Inspections"

 

Chaptr 5, Sectin 5001.1.5, "Fees"

Øís Chapter 56, Section 5601.1.3.1, "Where Prohibited"

1 Chapter 56, Section 5601.2.4.2.1, "Liability Insurance"

(m Appendix D, Section Dl 06.2.1, "Multiple-Family Residential

Developments With Significant Fire Risk"

§511.0105

 

California Fire Code, Chapter 1 - Scope and Administration

(a) Not Adopted. Section 105.6.30, Mobile food preparation vehicles, is not

íå Local Amendment. Section 40111.1, Board of Appeals, is amended to

read as follows:

When a question involving interpretation of the intent and purpose of any

provision of the San Diego Fire Code or the suitability of alternate

materials and types of construction is presented to the Fire Code (îcial,

the Fire Code Ocial may request the Board of Building Appeals and

Advisors (Board) to investigate such matters under the procedures

established in section 111.0207 ofthe San Diego Municipal Code

regarding building inspection. The request for Board action may come

from any citizen affected by the San Diego Fire Code.

-PAGE 8 OF 33-



-202

3-103)

(COR. COPY)

Article 11: Fire Protection and Prevention

Division 2: RESER¥D-Definitions

§511.020* Diiø-Reseed: Chapter 2 ofthc California Fire Code adopted in full

General Definitions

íâ Local Amendment, The following terms and their definitions are amended

to read as follows:

(1 ) Fire Code O#?cial. The Fire-Rescue Chiefof the City of

San Diego, or any member of the Fire-Rescue Department

designated by the Fire-Rescue Chief to carry out the provisions of

this Article.

2 Jurisdicion. The City of San Die,

il Wildland-Urban Interface Fire Area. Å eoaphical area

identified by the State as a "Fire Hazard Severity Zone" in

accordance with Public Resources Code sections 4201 through

4204 and Government Code sections 51175 through 51189, or

other areas designated by the City of San Diego Fire-Rescue

Deartment to be at significant risk from wildfims.

 Local Addition. The followin

_term and ts definition is added as follows

(1) Fire Department Standb Personnel. City of San Diego Fire-

Rescue Personnel who are employed to prevent and mitigate any

hazards associated with large public assemblies, events, or

-PAGE 9 OF 33-



(O-2023-103)

(COR. COPY)

activities where their presence has been deemed necessary by the

Fire Code Official,

§511.0301

Article 11: Fire Protection and Prevention

Division 3: General Precautions Against Fire

General Precautions Against Fire

(a) Local Additio. Section 301.1.1, Very High Fire Hazard Severity Zones,

is added as follows:

The Council of the City of San Diego adopts the Very HighFire Hazard

Sevrity Zones as recommended by the Director of the California

Department of Forestry ad Fire-Prteetion, and adopts the Brush

Management Zones, as defined in Municipal Code section 112.0412, as

ery High Fire Hazard Severity Zones, as designated on a map titled,

"Very High Fire Hazard Severity Zone Map Local Responsibility

Areas", dated July 21,2009, on fil with the City Clerk as Document

number 00 19881.

§511.0304

 

Combustible Waste Material

(a) [No change in text.]

(b) Local Addition. Section 304.1.2.1, Clearance ofbrush and vegetative

growth from roadways, is added as follows:

The Fire Code Ocial is authorized to require areas within 10 feet

(3048 mm) on each side ofportions of fire apparatus access roads and

driveways to be cleared o f non-fire-resistive vegetation growth.

Exception:

-PAGE 10 OF 33-



(O-2023-103)

(COR. COPY)

(1) Single specimens of tress, ornamental vegetative fuels, or

cultivated ground cover, such as green grass, ivy, succulents,

or similar plants used for ground cover, provided they do not

form a means of readily transmitting fire.

(c) [No change in text.]

§511.0307

 

Open Burning, Recreational Fires, and Portable Outdoor Fireplaces

(a) [No change in text.]

(b) Local Amendment. Section 307.4.3, Portable outdoor fireplaces, is

amended to read as follows:

Portable outdoor fireplaces shall be used in accordance with the

manufacturer's instructions, provided with a spark arrestor, and shall

not be operated within 15 feet (3048 mm) of a structure or

combustible material.

Exceptions:

(1) Portable outdoor fireplaces used at one and two-family dwellings

located outside of a wildland-urban interface area, when used in

accordance with the manufacturer's instructions.

(2) Prtabutdfielasued_neni:failY_dwellings

located within a wildland-urban interface fire area, when such

portable outdoor fireplaces are located at least 15 feet (3048 mm)

from a structure, combustible material or vegetation. Such outdoor

fireplaces shall be used in accordance with the manufacturer's

instructions.

-PAGE 11 OF 33-



(O-2023-103)

(COR. 

COPY)

(c) Local A

ddition. Secti

on 307,4

.4, "Red-

flag" a

nd other 

high fire ri

sk

conditions, is added as follows:

Open burning including recreational fires and fires within portable outdoor

fireplacs, shall not 

be permitted when a red-flag warnin or a fire 

weather

watch condition has been issued by the National Weather Service.

Exception:

£1 Fires in beach areas complyin with San Diego Municipal Code

section 63.20.5.

§511.0308

 

Open Flames

(a) [No change in text.]

§511.0319.

 

Mobile Food P

repar

ation Vehicles.

(a) Not Adopted. Sect

ions 319.1 through 3

19.10.3 are not ad

opted.

§511.0401

Article 11: Fire Protection and Prevention

Division 4: Emergency Pla

nning and Preparedness

General

(a) Ne*-Adeted Local Amendment. Secti

on 401.2 is-et-adepte

é Approval,

is amended to read as follows:

Where re

quired by

 this C

ode, fire

 safety

 plans, 

emergenc

y proced

ures, an

d

employee training programs shall be maintained on s

ite and subject

 to

review and approval by t

he Fire Code O#?cial

. Emergency plans and

procedures 

must be deve

loped by a person

 having suffic

ient know

ledge of

the building, life safety systems, and any special hazards. The Fire Code

-PAGE 12 OF 33-



(O-2023-103)

(COR. COPY)

Oîcial is authorized to 

require a qualified engineer, specialist

, or fire

safety spec

ialty oranizatin-1 develop fir

e safety plans and

 emerency

procedures.

(b) Ne-Adepted. Local Amendment. Section 401.4, ietdepted Required

Plan Implementation, is amnded to read as follows:

In the event

 an unwanted fire 

is detected

 in a building, or

 a fire ala

rm

activates, the emergency plan shall be implemented unless otherwise

directed by a fire d

epartment official assu

ming command of the incid

ent.

§511.0403

Emergency Preparedness Requirements

(aì Local Amendment. Section 403.2, Group A Occupançies, is amended to

read as follows:

An approved fire sa

fety and evacuation plan in accordance with section

404 shall be

 prepared a

nd maintained

 for Group A occupan

cies with an

gçcupant load exceedin 500 and for buildings containing both a Group A

occup

ancy an

d an atrium

. Group A occupa

ncies sh

all com

ply with

Sections 40

3,2,1 throu

gh 403.2.4.

E

x

ce

p

ti

o

n

s:

£11 Group A occupancies used exclusively for religious worship with

an occupant

 load less 

than 2,0

00.

(a) Not Adopted. Sections-40334høugh 403.4-1 e iâ not

adopted.

(b) Not Adoted. Sections 403.éž through 403.402.2.1 are

not adopted.

-PAGE 13 OF 33-



(O-2023-103)

(COR. COPY)

(c) Not Adoted. Sections 403.402.2.1.2 through

403.44.10.1,6 are not adopted.

í Not Adopted. Sections

 403.10.3 throug

h 403.10.5 are

no

t 

ad

op

ted

.

£1 Local A

ddition

. Sectio

n 403.411.1.3, a

dbyFie

epeŸese, Standby Fire Department

Personnel, is added as follows:

(1) When, in the op

inion of the Fire Code Oîcial,

it is essent

ial for publ

ic safety in a place

 of

assembly or any other plac

e where people

congregate, 

due to the num

ber ofpersons, 

or the

nature of the performance, exhibition, display,

contest or activity, the owner, agent or lessee shall

employ one o

r more qual

ified person

s, as req

uired

and a

pproved

, to be o

n duty at su

ch plac

e.

Such 

individuals s

hall be

 subject

 to the Fire Code

îcial's orders at a

ll times when so em

ployed and

shall be in uniform and remain on duty during the

times such places are op

en to the public, o

r when

such activity is being conducted.

(2) Before each

 performance or the

 start of such

activity, such individuals shall (1) inspect the

required fire appl

iances provid

ed to see that th

ey

-PAGE 14 OF 33-



-2023-103)

(COR. COPY)

are in proper place and in good working order; (2)

keep diligent watch for fires, obstructions to means

of egress, or other hazards; dFighe-4ime-eh

plece i opn to the public or such activity is being

eeéeeé- nd (3) take prompt measures for

remediation of hazards and extinguishment of fires

that may occur; and (4) take prompt measures to

assist in the evacuation ofthe public from the

structures.

(3) Such individuals shall not, while on duty,

perform any other duties than those herein

specified unless otherwise directed by the Fire

Code OiciaL

(4) The City shall charg

e the permittee the cost of

such services. The cost shall be computed by the

Fire Department using accepted c

ost accountin

g

methods including but not limited to the cost of

salary, fringe benefits and general overhead.

(5) Time cards of the assigned personnel shall be

submitted by the Fire Code (2#îcial to the Auditor

and Comptroller and shall be prima facie evidence

of the expended work hours.

-PAGE 15 OF 33-



(O-2023-103)

(COR. C

OPY)

§511.0404

 

Fire safety, evacuation and lockdown plans

 Not Adopted. Section 404.4-2.lthrough 404.42.3.2 are not adopted.

§511.005

 

Emergency Evacuation Drills

(a) Not Adopted. Section

s 105.1 throu

gh 105.9 arc no

t adopte

d.

§511.0406

 

Emp

loye

e Tra

ining a

nd Respon

se Pro

cedu

res

(a) [No chang

e in text.]

511 3

Article 1

1: Fire Pro

tection

 and P

revent

ion

Division 5: Fire Se

rvice F

eatur

es

Fire Apparatus Access Roads

Local A

ddition

. Section

 503.3.1, Stre

et Park

ing Prohibited, is

 added as

 follow

s:

During "red-fla

" warnings 

or fire we

ather watch c

onditio

ns, street 

parking

 may

be prohibited in areas d

etermined to be at sign

ificant ri

sk from wildfires.

including areas id

entified 

as a fire

 hazar

d severity

 zone, 

so a wider pa

thway is

available

 to suppor

t rapid evac

uaion when

 side-s

treet p

arking narrows the

 road to

a smaller width than th

e standa

rds in Title 14, 

section 

1273.01 o

f the C

aliforn

ia

Code of Reulation

s. Such

 areas w

ill be marked with sign

s aroved by the

Fire Code Ofßcial.

§511.0505

 

Premises Identification

(a) 

[No cha

nge

 in tex

t.]

§511.0507

 

Fire P

rotec

tion W

ater

 Supp

lies

(a) [No change in text.]

-PAGE 16 OF 33-



O-2023-103)

§511.0510

 

Emergency Rsponder Radio Coverage in Existing Buildings

(a) Not Adopted. Section 510.2 is not adopted.

Article 11: Fire Protection and Prevention

Division 11: Construction Requirements for Existing Buildings

§511.1103

Fire Safety Requirements for Existing Buildings

(a) through (d) [No change in text.]

(e) Not Adopted. Section 1103.9 is not adopted (adopting section 1103,9.1).

(f) Not Adopted. Section 1103,10 is not adopted.

§511.1104

 

Means of Egress for Existing Buildings

(a) Not Adopted. Sectionsl 104.10 through 1104.4 2 are not adopted.

(b) Not Adopted. Sections 1104. á through 1104.23 are not adopted.

(c) Not Adoted. Sctien ·14 04.2-eadeped.

§511.1105

 

Construction Requirements for Existing Groups I-2

(a) [No change in text.]

-PAGE 17 OF 33-



(O-2023-103)

Article 11: Fire Protection and Prevention

Division 49: REER¥ED-Requirements for Wildland-Urban

Interface Fire Areas

§511.490 Division Reserved: Chapter 49 ofthc Californin Fire Code adopted in full

Fire Hazard Severity Zones

í Local Addition. Section 4904.3.1.1  Adoption of Fire Hazard_Severity

Zones. is added as follows:

The Council of the City of San Diego adopts the Very High Fire Hazard

Severity Zones as recommended by the Director ofthe California

Department of Forestry and Fire Protection, and adopts the Brush

Management Zones, as defined in San Diego Municipal Code section

142.0412, as Very High Fire Hazard Severity Zones, as designated on a

map titled, "Very High Fire Hazard Severity Zone Map - Local

Responsibility Areas", dated July 21,2009. on file with the City Clerk as

Document No. 00-19884.

11.12!16 Vegetation Management

ía Lcal Amendment. Section 4906.3.1, Contents, is amended to read as

follows:

Landscape plans shall contain the followin:

£1 Delineation ofthe 35-foot and 100-foot fuel manaement zones

from all structures·

21 

Identification of existing vegetation to remain and proposed new

vegetation;

-PAGE 18 OF 33-



(O-2023-103)

í Identification of irrigated aeas:

íá A plant leed with both botanical and common areas. and

11ÆQZ

identification of all Dlant material symbols;

íl Identification ofround coverins within the 35-foot zone;

Defensible Space

íå Local Amendment. Section 4907.3, Requirements, is amended to read as

fo

llo

w

s

;

Hazardous vegetation and fuels around all buildings and structures shall be

maintained in accordance with the following laws and regulations·

£1 San Diego Municipal Code Section 142.0412;

2 Public Resources Code, Section 4291;

Cali fornia Code of Reulations, Title 14. Division 1.5,

Chapter 7, Subchapter 3, Article 3, Section 1299.03;

íá California Government Code, Section 51182

íál California Code of Regulations, Title 19, Division 1

Chapter 7, Subchapter 1, Section 3.07.

§511.5001

Article 11: Fire Protection and Prevention

Division 50: Hazardous Materials - General Provisions

Hazardous Materials - General Provisions

(a) Local Addition. Section 5001.1.2, Hazardous Materials HAZMAT

Program Legislative Declaration and Findings, is added as follows:

(1) through (2) [No change in text.]

-PAGE 19 OF 33-



(O-202

3-103)

 Definition. The term "Hazardous Materials" or "HAZMAT" shall refer

to all those substances as defined by the California Fire Code, as

adeptedad-nded-by this Article

Ø) 

Local Addition. Section 5001.1.3, Purpose of HAZMAT Program, is

added as follows:

The purpose ofthe HAZMAT Inspection Program is to:

(1) 

Inspect occupancies, as defined in the Fire Code, within the City of

San Diego, to determine the type, quantity, and location of

hazardous materials which may be present, and the scope ofrisk

presented by the presence of such materials.

(2) through (3) [No change in text.]

(c) 

Local Additio. Section 5001.1.4, HAZMAT Inspections, is added as

follows:

(1) [No change in text.]

 Whenever necessary to make an inspection to enforce any of the

provisions of this section, the Fi,·c Cod ?cial or his authorized

representative may enter an occupancy at all reasonable times and

after reasonable notice to inspect the sûme, provided that if such

building or premises be occupied, he shall first present proper

credentials to the occupants and request entry. If such building or

premises is unoccupied, a reasonable effort shall be mad to locate

the owner or other persons having charge or control of the building

or premiss and request entry. If entry is refused, an inspction

-PAGE 20 OF 33-



(O-2023-103)

warrant pursuant to California Code of Civil Procedure section

1822.50 t scq., may bo sought to authorize entry 'without the

consent of owner or other persons having charge or control of the

bu

ilding

 or 

prem

ises

.

21 During any inspection, the Fire Code Otlìcial or his authorized

representative may request the following information from the

owner, or other persons having charge or control of any

building, structure or installation: (1) a listing ofany hazardous

material, as defined in the California Fire Code by either its

chemical or common name or by description of the relevant

chemical properties which render it hazardous; (2) a description

of where such hazardous materials are normally located in the

building, structure or installation.

The owner, or other persons having charge or control of the

premises shall provide information requested under this section

within 15 days.

€3 It shall be unlawful for the owner, or other persons having charge

or control of the premises to refuse to provide information

requested pursuant to this section, to

 provide false infrmation, or

to refuse entry to the Fire Code Oicial or hi authorized

representative when presented with a legally issued inspection

warrant after notice is provided as required by law.

-PAGE 21 OF 33-



(O-2023-103)

(d) Local Addition. Sction 5001.1.5, Fees, is added as follows:

It is the policy of the City of San Diego to impose reasonable fees for fu1

cost recovery for overhad and salaries of Fire Department personnel

pforming inspection sonices of occupancics storing, disponsig, using

and handling hazardous materials. The fees shall be determined by the

Fir: Code Oîcial after consultation with an advisory group appointed by

the Mayor. The advisory group shall include represontaties from the

affcted industrial sector. The fees shall be promulgated in the City

Clerk's Composite Rate Book. Such fees shall be exclusive of any fees for

permits required under any section of the Municipal Code.

§511.5601

Article 11: Fire Protection and Prevention

Division 56: Explosives and Fireworks

Explosives and Fireworks

(a) Local Addition. Section 5601.1.3.1, Where Prohibited, is added as

follows:

Except as heeiaAe provided in this section, it shall be unlawful for

any person to possess, store, manufacture, offer for sale, expose for

sale, sell at retail, or use or explode any fireworks within the

incorporated City limits, or the territory outside the City over which the

City has jisdietie iurisdiction or control by virtue of the Constitution,

Charter or any law, or by reason of ownership or control of property.

Exception:

-PAGE 22 OF 33-



(O-2023-103)

(1) [No change in text.]

(b) Local Addition. Section 5601.2.4.2.1, Liability Insurance, is added as

follows:

LU Before a permit is issued pursuant to this section, the applicant shall

file with the City a $2 million combined single limit comprehensive

general liability insurance policy, naming the City of San Diego as an

additional insured, for the purpose of the payment of all damages to

persons or property which arise from, or are caused by, the conduct of

any act authorized by the permit.

{21 The eGede-e Fire Code Official may specify a greater or

lesser amount when, in the Fire Code (2#îcial' s opinion, application of

recognized risk management standards and conditions at the location

requires a different amount.

í Public agencies shall be exempt from the requirement of the issuing

of an insurance policy naming The City of San Diego as an additional

insured.

-PAGE 23 OF 33-



(O

-2023-10

3)

Article 11: Fire Protection and Prevention

Division 82: Appendix A through Appendix O£

§511.8201 Adoption, Non-Adoption or Local Amendment to California Fire Code

Appendix A through Appendix O

The California Fire Code, Appendix A through Appendix £, are hereby adopted,

not adopted, or amended as follows:

(a) ppendr  : Not Adopted

 Appendix B. Aåe

 

is adopted with modifications as follows:

-PAGE 24 OF 33-



(O-2023-103)

IA

BL

E 

10

5.1(

1)

REQUIRE IRE FLOW FOR ONE- AND TWO-FAMILY DWELLINGS. GROUP R-3

AND R-4 BUILDINGS AND TOWNEOUSES

Fire-Flow

 Automatic Minimum Fire

 Flow Duration

Calcula

tion Area

 Sprink

ler Sy

stems

 Flow

 

(hours)

(square feeO

 

(Design-Standard)

 

(gallons per minute

0-3,600

 No automatic

 Value in Table

 

Duration in Table

sprinkler system

 

B105.1(2)

 

B105.1(2) at the

required fire-flow

rate

3,601 and greater

 No automatic

 Value in Table

 

Duration in Table

sprinkler system

 

B105.1(2)

 

B105.1(2) at the

required fire-flow

rate

0-3,600

 Section 903.3.1.3

 

1,000

 Duration in Table

ofthe California

 

B105.1(2) at the

Fire Code or

 

required fire-flow

Section 313.3 of

 

rate

the California

Residential Code

3,601 and greater

 Section 903.3.1.3

 

50% of the value in Duration in Table

ofthe California

 

Ta

b

le

 B

 1

05

.1

(2

)

 

B 105.1 (2) at the

Fire Code or

 

original fire-flow

Section 313.3 of

 

rate

the California

Residential Code

For SI: 1 squa

re foot

 = 0.0929 m,1 gallo

n per m

inute =

 3.785

 1./m.

a. The reduc

ed fire-flow

 rate shall n

ot beless th

an 1,000 gallons per

 minute.

-PAGE 25 OF 33-



(O-2023-103)

TABLE B105.2

TABLE 105.2 REQUIRED FIRE FLOW FOR BUILDINGS OTHER THAN ONE- AND

TWO-FAMILY DWEI.LINGS, GROUP R-3 AND R-4 BUILDINGS AND

-OWNHOUSES

Automatic Sprinkler Systems

(design-standard)

No automatic sprinkler system

Section 903.3.1.1 ofthe

California Fire Code

Section 903.3.1.2 ofthe

California Fire Code

Minimum Fire-Flow

(gallons per m

inute)

Value in Table

B105.1(2)

50% ofthe value in

Table B 105.1(2a

50% of the value in

Table B 105.1(2)a

Flow Duration

(hours)

Duration in Table

B105.1(2)

Duration in Table

B105.1(2) at the original

now rate

Duration in Table

B105.1(2) at the original

flow rate

For SI: 1 gallon per minute = 3.785 Um

a. The reduced fire-flow rate shall not be less than 1,500 gallons per minute.

(c) 

ppendi BB: Adopted

(d) 

ppend C jíadopted with modifications as follows:

-PAGE 26 OF 33-



TABLE C102.1

REQUIRED NUMBERAND SPACING OF F :

AVERAGE

MINIMUM 

SPACING

FIRE-FLOW

NUMBER OF BETWEEN

REQUIREMENT(gpm)

 

HYDRANTS

 HYDRANTS, b, 

(feet)

1,7500rless 1 500

1,751-2,250 

2 

450

2,251-2,750 

3 

450

2,751-3,250 

3 

400

3,251-4,000 

4 

350

4,001-5,000 

5 

300

5,001-5,500 

6 

300

5,501-6,000 

6 

250

6,001-7,000 

7 

250

7,001 or more

 8 or moree

 200

For Sl: 1 foot = 304.8 mm, 1 gallon per minute= 3.785 L/m.

a. Reduce by 100 feet for dead-end streets or oads.

-2

0

23

-1

0

3)

HYDRANTS

MAXIMUM DISTNCE FROM

ANY POINT ON STREET OR

ROAD FRONTAGE TO A

HYDRANTd

2

5

0

225

225

225

210

180

180

150

150

120

b. Where streets are provided with median dividers that cannot be crossed by fire fighters pulling hose lines, or where arterial

streets are provided with four or more traffic lanes and have a traffic count of more than 30,000 vehicles per day, hydrant spacing

shall average 500 feet on each side of the street and be arranged on an alternating basis.

c. Where new water mains are extended along streets where hydrants are not needed for protection of structures or similar fire

problems, fire hydrants shall be provided at spacing not to exceed 1,000 feet to provide for transportation hazards.

d. Reduce by 50 feet for dead-end streets or roads.

e. One hydrant for each 1,000 gallons per minute or fraction thereof.

f. The fire code official is authorized to modi fy the location, number and distribution of fire hydrants based on site-specific

constraints and hazards.

(e) Appendix CC: Adopted

(f) Appendix D is adopted with modifications as follows:

(1) Adopted: California Fire Code sections D101.1, Scope, through

D103.1, Dead ends, aro adopted without change.

(21) Local Amendment: Section D103.5, Fire Apparatus Access

Road Gates, is amended to read follows:

Gates securing the fire apparatus access roads shall comply with all of

the following criteria:

-PAGE 27 OF 33-



(O-2023-103)

(a) 

[No change in text.]

(b) Gates shall be of the swinging or sliding type horizontal

swing, horizontal slide, vertical lift, or vertical pivot type.

(c) through (h) [No change in text.]

32Local Amendment. Section D103.6, Signs, is amended to read as

follows:

[No change in text.]

(1)-Adeed.-Califernia-Fire·ede, Appendä D, 900ti D103.6.1,

Roads 20 to 26 Feet in Width, through D 103.6.2, Roads More than

26 Foct in Width, aro adopted.

Ul.[No change in text.]

(6AdeptedGalifei Fire Ceéle, Appendi-D, seetiøn D 101.2,

Buildings Exceeding 62,000 Square Feet in Area, through D106.2,

Projects Having More than 200 Dwelling Units, arc adopted.

f

Local Addition. Appendix D, section D106.2.1, Multiple-Family

Residential Developments with significant fire risk, is added as

follows:

Residential developments of more than 30 dwelling units located

in a state responsibility area (SRA) or a Very High Fire Hazard

Severity Zone, shall be provided with two separate and approved

-PAGE 28 OF 33-



(O-2023-103)

fire apparatus access roads regardless ofwhether they are equipped

with an approved automatic sprinkler system.

í Adopted. Local Amendment, Section D 107.1, One-or two-family

dwellingresidential developments. is amended to read as follows:

Developments of one or two- family dwellings where the number

of dwelling units exceeds 30 shall be provided with two separate

and approved fire aparatus access roads.

Exceptions:

£1 Where there are more than30 dwelling units not located in a

state responsibility area (SRA) or a Very High Fire Hazard

Severity Zone, accessed from a single public or private fire

apparatus access road, and all dwelling units are equipped

throughout with an approved automatic sprinkler system in

accordance with section 903.3.1.1.903.3.1.2 or 903.3.1.3.

access from two directions shall not be required.

2 The number of dwelling units accessed from a single fire

apparatus access road shall not be increased unless fire

apparatus access roads will connect with future development.

as determinedby the Fire Code Offcial.

(8) Adoptd. California Fire Code, Appendix sections D106.3,

Remoteness, through D 108 Reference Standards is adopted.

-PAGE 29 OF 33-



-2

0

2

3

-1

0

3

)

(A)

 

Appendix E

: Not Adopted

(B) 

Appendx F: Not Adopted

(C) 

ppendx G: Not Adopted

(D) 

ppendix H: Not Adopted

(E

) 

ppendír  Not Adopted

(F) 

ppendix J

: Not Adopted

(G) 

ppend

 K: Not Adopted

H)

 

ppendx L: Not Adopted

(I) 

ppendx M. Not Adopted

(J) 

ppend

 N

: N

ot A

dopted

(K)

 

ppendx O

: Not Adopted

( 

pendr F: Not Adpted

Article 11: Fire Protection and Prevention

Division 83: Fire and Harmful Gas Emergency Alarms

§511.8300

 

Purpose and Intent

[No change in text.]

§511.8301

 

Definitions

Defined terms appear in italics. The following definitions apply in this Division:

Alarm agent through Takeover [No change in text.]

-PAGE 30 OF 33-



(O

-2023-103)

§511.8302 

Fire-Harmful Gas Alarm Business Requirements and Responsibilities

(a) through (b) [No change in text.]

(c) Any fire-harmful gas alarm business that sells any fire-harmful gas

alarm system shall do the following:

(1) through (2) [No change in text.]

 

Complete online, mMail, or hand deliver the completed

alarm user permit application and permit fee to the alarm system

oíñcialbefore putúngthefire-harmful gas alarm system into

service.

(d) [No change in text.]

§511.8303

 

Alarm Agent Responsibilities

[No change in text.]

§511.8304

 

Fire-Harmful Gas Alarm System Conversion

through (b) [No change in text.]

§511.8305

 

Fire-Harmful Gas Alarm System Takeover

(a) through (c) [No change in text.]

§511.8306

 

Alarm User Permit Required; Violation

(a) through (b) [No change in text.]

§511.8307

 

Application for Alarm User Permit

(a) through (e) [No change in text.]

§511.8308

 

Expiration ofAlarm User Permits

(a) through (c) [No change in text.]

-PAGE 31 OF 33-



(O-2023-103)

§511.8309

 

Alarm User Permits Not Transferable

[No change in text.]

§511.8310

 

Fees and Penalties for Alarm User Permit

(a) through (b) [No change in text.]

§511.8311

 

Responsibility for Fire-Harmful Gas Alarm Systems in Apartments

(a) through (d) [No change in text.]

§511.8312

 

Fire-Harmful Gas Alarm System Direct Dial Prohibition

[No change in text.]

§511.8313

 

Procedures for Alarm Verification

[No change in text.]

§511.8314

 

Revocation of an Alarm User Permit

(a) through (g) [ No change in text.]

§511.8315

 Penalties for Alarm User Permit Revocations

(a) through (b) [No change in text.]

§511.8316

 

Reinstatement of Revoked Permit; Alarm User Permit Appeal

(a) through (c) [No change in text.]

§511.8317

 

Use of Fire-Harmful Gas Alarm System after Permit Revocation as

Public Nuisance

(a) through (b) [No change in text.]

§511.8318

 

Posting a Fire Watch

[No change in text.]

-PAGE 32 OF 33-



(O-2023

-103)

§511.8319

 

Exceptions

[No change in text.]

§511.8320

 

Confidentiality of Records

[No change in text.]

§511.8321

 

Enforcement Authority

[No change in text.]

§511.8322

 

Enforcement Remedies

[No change in text.]

LM

D:sc

01/05/2023

03/14/2023 COR. COPY

Or.Dept: Fire-Rescue

Doc. No.: 3183692_2

-PAGE 33 OF 33-



Passed by the Council of The City of San Diego on

 

February 28.2023 , by the following vote:

Councilmembers

 

Yeas

 

N

a

ys

 

Not Present

 

Recused

Joe LaCava

Jennifer Campbell N u  u

Stephen Whitburn 

N 

 

ü 

Monica Montgomery Steppe N 

 

U

Marni von Wilpert 

Kent Lee l

Raul A. Campillo 

Vivian Moreno 

Sean Elo-Rivera l

N

U

II

Date of final passage

 MAR 0 7 2023

AUTHENTICATED BY:

TODD GLORIA

Mayor of The City of San Diego, California.

(Seal)

City Clerl

DIANA I. S. FUENTES

IThe City of San Diego, California.

, Deputy

1 HEREBY CERTIFY that the foregoing ordinance was not finally passed until twelve calendar

days had elapšed between the day of its introduction and the day of its final passage, to w

it, on

February 7.2023 ,

 

and on

 

M

A

R

 

0

 

7

 

2

0

2

3

1 FURTHER CERTIFY that said ordinance was read in full prior to passage or that such

reading was dispensed with by a vote of five members of the Council, and that a written copy of

the ordinance was made available to each member of the Council and the public prior to the day

of its passage.

.

.

NA I. S. FUENTES

'

'

 

(

S

e

a

)

 

C

ity

 C

 

City of San Diego, California.

DIA

erk

h

e

By 

, Deputy

Office of the City Clerk, San D

iego, California

Ordinance Number 0-

 1 'ž


